

JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY/AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID:	JCPS-8566
APPROVAL DATE:	July 21, 2026
ITEM(S) QUOTED:	Field Trip Bus Service
DATE BIDS RECEIVED:	June 17, 2026
CONTRACT PERIOD:	August 1, 2026 – July 31, 2027 One year renewal option
QUOTED DISCOUNT TERMS:	Net
VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS:	No shipments/services are to be made against the contract. Purchase orders will be issued.
AWARD OF BID:	Awarded to multiple vendors to ensure adequate coverage. An asterisk (*) indicates an award.

FIELD TRIP BUS SERVICE
(JCPS NO. 4600649-1718273)

Part A – In County Trips

Vendor: Howard Miller LLC (Net Terms)

ITEM
NO.

SCHOOL BUS

MOTOR COACH

- | | |
|--|-----------------------|
| 1. Cost for field trip in Jefferson County, pickup and return from one destination, between the hours of 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m. (based on specific school start times), no additional stops included. | Flat rate \$ 345.00 * |
| 2. Cost for field trip in Jefferson County, one-way, between the hours of 8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. (based on specific school start times), no additional stops included. | Flat rate \$ 345.00 * |
| 3. Cost for additional hours outside the 8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. time period, either early or late. | Per Hour \$ 80.00 * |
| 4. Cost for each additional stop: | |
| (a) 1 – 10 miles | Flat rate \$ 80.00 * |
| (b) 11 – 20 miles | Flat rate \$ 80.00 * |
| (c) 21 – 30 miles | Flat rate \$ 80.00 * |
| (d) 31 – 40 miles | Flat rate \$ 80.00 * |
| (e) Over 40 miles | Flat rate \$ 80.00 * |
| 5. Cost for each additional pickup. | Flat rate \$ 80.00 * |
| 6. Fee for bus cancellation. | Flat rate \$ 275.00 * |

Vendor: Miller Transportation (Net Terms)

ITEM
NO.

SCHOOL BUS

MOTOR COACH

- | | | |
|--|-----------------------|------------------------|
| 1. Cost for field trip in Jefferson County, pickup and return from one destination, between the hours of 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m. (based on specific school start times), no additional stops included. | Flat rate \$ 340.00 * | Flat rate \$1200.00 * |
| 2. Cost for field trip in Jefferson County, one-way, between the hours of 8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. (based on specific school start times), no additional stops included. | Flat rate \$ 340.00 * | Flat rate \$ 1200.00 * |
| 3. Cost for additional hours outside the 8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. time period, either early or late. | Per Hour \$ 80.00 * | Per Hour \$ 175.00 * |
| 4. Cost for each additional stop: | | |
| (a) 1 – 10 miles | Flat rate \$ 80.00 * | |
| (b) 11 – 20 miles | Flat rate \$ 80.00 * | |
| (c) 21 – 30 miles | Flat rate \$ 80.00 * | |
| (d) 31 – 40 miles | Flat rate \$ 80.00 * | |
| (e) Over 40 miles | Flat rate \$ 80.00 * | |
| 5. Cost for each additional pickup. | Flat rate \$ 80.00 * | |
| 6. Fee for bus cancellation. | Flat rate \$ 250.00 * | Flat rate \$ 250.00 * |

Vendor: Sandollar (Net Terms)

ITEM
NO.

SCHOOL BUS

MOTOR COACH

1. Cost for field trip in Jefferson County, pickup and return from one destination, between the hours of 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m. (based on specific school start times), no additional stops included.	Flat rate \$ 415.00 *	Flat rate \$ 1050.00 *
2. Cost for field trip in Jefferson County, one-way, between the hours of 8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. (based on specific school start times), no additional stops included.	Flat rate \$ 415.00 *	Flat rate \$ 1050.00 *
3. Cost for additional hours outside the 8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. time period, either early or late.	Per Hour \$ 95.00 *	Per Hour \$ 160.00 *
4. Cost for each additional stop:		
(a) 1 – 10 miles	Flat rate \$ 60.00 *	Flat rate \$ 60.00 *
(b) 11 – 20 miles	Flat rate \$ 60.00 *	Flat rate \$ 60.00 *
(c) 21 – 30 miles	Flat rate \$ 60.00 *	Flat rate \$ 60.00 *
(d) 31 – 40 miles	Flat rate \$ 60.00 *	Flat rate \$ 60.00 *
(e) Over 40 miles	Flat rate \$ 80.00 *	Flat rate \$ 100.00 *
5. Cost for each additional pickup.	Flat rate \$ 100.00 *	Flat rate \$ 100.00 *
6. Fee for bus cancellation.	Flat rate \$ 250.00 *	Flat rate \$ 500.00 *

Vendor: Taylor Motors (Net Terms)

ITEM
NO.

SCHOOL BUS

MOTOR COACH

1. Cost for field trip in Jefferson County, pickup and return from one destination, between the hours of 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m. (based on specific school start times), no additional stops included.	Flat rate \$ 325.00 *	Flat rate \$ 1600.00 *
2. Cost for field trip in Jefferson County, one-way, between the hours of 8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. (based on specific school start times), no additional stops included.	Flat rate \$ 325.00 *	Flat rate \$ 1600.00 *
3. Cost for additional hours outside the 8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. time period, either early or late.	Per Hour \$ 85.00 *	Per Hour \$ 185.00 *
4. Cost for each additional stop:		
(a) 1 – 10 miles	Flat rate \$ 0.00 *	Flat rate \$ 0.00 *
(b) 11 – 20 miles	Flat rate \$ 75.00 *	Flat rate \$ 100.00 *
(c) 21 – 30 miles	Flat rate \$ 85.00 *	Flat rate \$ 100.00 *
(d) 31 – 40 miles	Flat rate \$ 95.00 *	Flat rate \$ 100.00 *
(e) Over 40 miles	Flat rate \$ 100.00 *	Flat rate \$ 150.00 *
5. Cost for each additional pickup.	Flat rate \$ 100.00 *	Flat rate \$ 150.00 *
6. Fee for bus cancellation.	Flat rate \$ 315.00 *	Flat rate \$ 10 % under 30 days / 0 % over 30 days *

Vendor: The Free Enterprise System (2% / 10 Days)

ITEM NO.	SCHOOL BUS	MOTOR COACH
1. Cost for field trip in Jefferson County, pickup and return from one destination, between the hours of 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m. (based on specific school start times), no additional stops included.	NO BID	Flat rate \$ 1575.00 *
2. Cost for field trip in Jefferson County, one-way, between the hours of 8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. (based on specific school start times), no additional stops included.	NO BID	Flat rate \$ 1200.00 *
3. Cost for additional hours outside the 8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. time period, either early or late.	NO BID	Per Hour \$ 114.00 *
4. Cost for each additional stop:		
(a) 1 – 10 miles	Flat rate \$ NO BID	Flat rate \$ 0.00 *
(b) 11 – 20 miles	Flat rate \$ NO BID	Flat rate \$ 0.00 *
(c) 21 – 30 miles	Flat rate \$ NO BID	Flat rate \$ 0.00 *
(d) 31 – 40 miles	Flat rate \$ NO BID	Flat rate \$ 25.00 *
(e) Over 40 miles	Flat rate \$ NO BID	Flat rate \$ 30.00 *
5. Cost for each additional pickup.	Flat rate \$ NO BID	Flat rate \$0.00
6. Fee for bus cancellation.		\$ 0.00 (one month) * 200.00 (2 weeks) 300.00 (3 days) 400.00 (same day)

Part B – Out of County Trips

Vendor: Howard Miller LLC (Net Terms)

		SCHOOL BUS	MOTOR COACH
DAY TRIPS			
1. Less than 400 miles in total	Greater of mileage rate of or hourly rate of Minimum trip charge	\$ 5.10 * \$ 110.00 * \$ 450.00 *	\$ NO BID \$ NO BID \$ NO BID
2. 400-600 miles in total	Mileage rate of	\$ 5.10 *	\$ NO BID
3. Multi Day Trips (shall not include lodging; lodging to be paid by school)	Greater of per day rate or mileage rate of	\$ 1350.00 * \$ 5.10 *	\$ NO BID \$ NO BID
4. Additional cost per driver charge as required By Department of Transportation specifications		\$ 340.00 *	\$ NO BID
5. Fee for bus cancellation	Flat rate	\$ 275.00 *	\$ NO BID

Vendor: Miller Transportation (Net Terms)

		SCHOOL BUS	MOTOR COACH
DAY TRIPS			
1. Less than 400 miles in total	Greater of mileage rate of or hourly rate of Minimum trip charge	\$ 5.00 * \$ 110.00* \$ 440.00 *	\$ 7.00 * \$ 200.00 * \$ 1600.00 *
2. 400-600 miles in total	Mileage rate of	\$ 5.00 *	\$ 7.00 *
3. Multi Day Trips (shall not include lodging; lodging to be paid by school)	Greater of per day rate or mileage rate of	\$ 1300.00 * \$ 5.00 *	\$ 1600.00 * \$ 7.00 *
4. Additional cost per driver charge as required By Department of Transportation specifications		\$ 300.00 *	\$ 600.00 *
5. Fee for bus cancellation	Flat rate	\$ 250.00 *	\$ 250.00 *

Vendor: Sandollar (Net Terms)

		SCHOOL BUS	MOTOR COACH
DAY TRIPS			
1. Less than 400 miles in total	Greater of mileage rate of or hourly rate of Minimum trip charge	\$ 5.00 * \$ 95.00 * \$ 1100.00 *	\$ 6.50 * \$ 160.00 * \$ 1750.00 *
2. 400-600 miles in total	Mileage rate of	\$ 5.00 *	\$ 6.50 *
3. Multi Day Trips (shall not include lodging; lodging to be paid by school)	Greater of per day rate or mileage rate of	\$ 1300.00 * \$ 5.00 *	\$ 1750.00* \$ 6.50*
4. Additional cost per driver charge as required By Department of Transportation specifications		\$ 550.00 *	\$ 750.00*
5. Fee for bus cancellation	Flat rate	\$ 300.00 *	\$ 750.00*

Vendor: Taylor Motors (Net Terms)

		SCHOOL BUS	MOTOR COACH
DAY TRIPS			
1. Less than 400 miles in total	Greater of mileage rate of or hourly rate of Minimum trip charge	\$ 5.50* \$ 125.00* \$ 400.00 *	\$ 6.50 * \$ 225.00 * \$ 1400.00*
2. 400-600 miles in total	Mileage rate of	\$ 5.50 *	\$ 6.50 *
3. Multi Day Trips (shall not include lodging; lodging to be paid by school)	Greater of per day rate or mileage rate of	\$ 1500.00 * \$ 5.50 *	\$ 1800.00* \$ 6.50*
4. Additional cost per driver charge as required By Department of Transportation specifications		\$ 1000.00*	\$ 1000.00*
5. Fee for bus cancellation	Flat rate	\$ 315.00*	\$ 10 % under 30 days 0 % over 30 days *

Vendor: The Free Enterprise System (2% / 10 Days)

		SCHOOL BUS	MOTOR COACH
DAY TRIPS			
1. Less than 400 miles in total	Greater of mileage rate of or hourly rate of Minimum trip charge	\$ NO BID \$ NO BID \$ NO BID	\$ 6.25* \$ 195.00* \$ 2100.00*
2. 400-600 miles in total	Mileage rate of	\$ NO BID	\$ 5.88*
3. Multi Day Trips (shall not include lodging; lodging to be paid by school)	Greater of per day rate or mileage rate of	\$ NO BID \$ NO BID	\$ 2100.00* \$ 5.88 *
4. Additional cost per driver charge as required By Department of Transportation specifications		\$ NO BID	\$ 1172.50*
5. Fee for bus cancellation	Flat rate	\$ NO BID	\$ 0.00 (one month) * 200.00 (2 weeks) 300.00 (3 days) 400.00 (same day)

Full details & specifications can be found in the Vendor Folders in the EVALUATOR folder