
Issue Paper 
Kenlon County School Dis1rict I It'sa6out}l.£L�. 

DATE: 
06/23/2026 

AGENDA ITEM (ACTION ITEM): 

Consider/Approve awarding the Custodial Supplies bid (59-CUST-27) to All Pro Supply, 

Baumann Paper, Interboro Packaging, and Keslan as specified on the Custodial Supplies bid 

tabulation. 

APPLICABLE BOARD POLICY: 
Fiscal Management-04.32 AP.1 

HISTORY/BACKGROUND: 
An advertisement to accept sealed bids for custodial supplies was posted to the district website on 
May 15, 2026. Bids were publicly opened on May 22, 2026. 

FISCAL/BUDGET ARY IMPACT: 
The district will see an estimated decrease of 8% over the previous fiscal year spend for these 
items. 

RECOMMENDATION: 
Approval to award the Custodial Supplies bid (59-CUST-27) to All Pro Supply, Baumann Paper, 
Interboro Packaging, and Keslan as specified on the Custodial Supplies bid tabulation. 

CONT ACT PERSON: 
Jennifer Weis-Smith 

�£� 
District Administrator s -� 11per111te11 ent 

Use this form to submit your request to the Superintendent for items to be added to the Board Meeting Agenda. 
Principal -complete, print, sign and semi to your Director. Director -if approved, sign and put in the Superintendent's mailbox. 



KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID TABULATION 

GENERAL SUPPLIES 

Baumann Paper Kelsan All Pro 

Price Per Each Price Per Each Commodity Description UOM 
Qty Per 

UOM 
Annual Usage Usage Vendor Price Vendor Price 

Vendor 

Price 
Vendor I QTY Per 
UOM UOM 

ES
t
imated l ES

t
imated I Vendor I QTY Perl Price Per ?I Vendor I QTY Per 

I I I lbv UOM\ lbv Eachesl UOM UOM Each UOM UOM 

CU ·l2825 IMulti-fold Paper Towel , White, 9.5"" x 9.125", 4,000/CS l cs_ 4000 I 101 i 404000 $ 25.00 I CS 4008 1 $ 0.0062 $ 19.71 I CS I 4000 I $ 0.0049 $ 21.84 I CS i 4000 I $ 0.0055 

CU-12830 !Roll Paper Towel, 800' x B"W. White, 6 Rolls/CS J CS 6 I 874 I 5244 $ 28.38 i CS 6 S 4.73 $ 39.44 : CS I 6 $ 6.57 $ 26.75 l CS 6 I $ 4.46 

CU-i 2850 jPaperTowels,Sinclefotd, l0.25"lx9.75"W, 250/PK, l6PK/CS j cs j 4000 j" 35 j 140000 _$ __ ~ 3 ! cs 4008 $ 0.0060 $ 20.08 CS I 4008 $ 0.0050 $ 23.15 cs 4000 i s 0 .0058 

CU-16~ 0 _ ,Dispenser, Roll Towel, Mechanical !lands free, Olack I EA j 1 ! 6 J 6 S 35.63 i fA 1 $ 35.65 S I fA I I I S S 68.70 CS I 1 I S 68.70 
CU-18100 Empress'" Twin OispensN For 9" Jumbo Tissue• Olack ! EA 1 __ 1 __ ! ___ 3_1 _ .I. ____]_1 _ _ $ 33. 54 -, EA _ I : $ 33.54 S 18.00 EA 1 I S 18.00 _L 29.43 CS l ! S 29.43 

CU-18200 ,~ ilet Paper, 2-PlY, l000' Rolls. 12 Rol ls/CS i CS I 12 1271 I 15252 $ 24 .66 CS 12 j $ 2_E 6 $ 19.78 CS 12 S 1.65 S 24.96 CS 12 i S 2.08 

CU -13880 Wa stebasket, 41qt , Plastic, Black i EA I 1 38 l 38 S 12.96 I EA I . S 12.96 $ 8.47 EA 1 S 8.47 S 9.96 EA I · S 9.96 

CU-13Jl25 Brute Vented Trash Can, Round, 44gal, Gray i EA l 14 ;_ 14 $ 60.17 1 EA 1 ,_$ 60.17 $ 35.34 EA 1 $ 35.34 $ 54.35 EA 1 ! $ 54 .35 

CU-11075 Brute Round Twist Dolly, 250Ib Capac,ty EA ! 1 25 I 25 $ 54.00 EA 1 $ 54.00 $ 33.30 EA 1 I $ 33.30 $ 32 .94 EA I ' $ 32 .94 

CU-14125 Diversey GP Forward, All -Purpose Cleaner, J-fill, 2-2.Sl/CS -- - I cs I 2 - 43 I 86 $ 67.78 cs 2 $ 33.89 $ 96.05 ! cs 2 I s 48.03 $ 109.32 lcs 2-- 1 s ~ 
CU-14150 Diversey Stride• HC Neutral Cleaner, J-f1II, 2·2.SL/CS I CS 1 2 85 I 170 $ 156.53 I CS I 2 $ 78.27 S 195.50 I CS - 2 S 97.75 $ 222 .SO ! CS 2 S 111.25 

CU-14_155_ Diversey Prominence fill Floor_£1eaner, J-fill, 2.2.5l/CS I CS : ~ 2 ; 14 I 28-- $ 127.85 I CS I 2 $ 63.93 S 150.91 I CS , 2 - $ 75.46 -$- 171.76 , CS 2 _S~ 
CU-14175 D1versey S1> itf1re• J-Fill, 2-2.51/CS I CS 1 2 : 33 , 66 $ 82.95 I CS 2 $ 41.48 $ 107.41 CS 2 S 53.71 $ 12225 I CS 1 2 S 61.13 .1 

~-14200 IDiversey Glance• Gla~s .& Multi -Surface Cleaner, Hill, 2·2,SL/CS j cs 2 ! 105 I 210 $ 60.98 I cs I 2 s 30.49 $ 71.26 cs I 2 $ 35.63 $ 126.93 . cs ! 2 _$~ 1 
CU -14290 D,versey• Neutrahzer/Cond1t1oner D.1.ll s , 90/Tub, 2Tub/CS I CS 180 10 ! 20 S 67.58 I PK 100 I S 0.68 $ 56.43 CS 180 $ 0.31 $ 79.35 CS ! 180 S 0.44 
CU-14375 !DiverseyGlance•,Mult1 -SurfaceCleaner. 32ozSprayllollle, 12/CS ! CS 12 10 I 120 - S 53.32 CS I 12 I $ 4.44 - $--35.80 I CS 12 $ 2.98 S 37.92 C~- i--t -2 - S 3.16 
CU-14425 I Diversey Spitfire• Speed Cleaner RTU, 12oz, 12/CS ; CS 12 11 i 132 $ 40.74 i CS I 12 $ 3.40 S 59.68 i CS 12 S 4.97 S 68.36 I CS I 12 S 5. 70 

CU-14750 i Di.ver, '::! Vir.ex 11• Disinfectant Cleaner. J.fill, 2-2.Sl/CS j _ cs i 2 I 95 · 1 190 $ 58.81 I CS I 2 $ 29.41 S 71.58 ' CS 2 j S 35.Ii_ S 81.47 ! CS j 2 ! S 40.74 
CU -15125 i D1verseyCarefree•MallefloorF111ish, l - SGAL/RX i RX ; 1 _ 130 I 130 S 86.571 CS 1 I S 86.57 S 122.10 , CS 1 $ __ 122.10 S 131.35 llX I I s 13135 

CU -16230 ID1ve. rseyW1waxProxfloorCleaner,1GalBol!le, 4Ga l/CS J CS I 4 I 3 ~I- 12 $ 101.08 CS 4 I S 25.27 $ 128.82 CS 4 i S 32 .21 S 146.62 , CS t 4 S 36.66 

CU-10425 I 10qt Plastic Ut ility Buck: ! w/ Handle : EA I I I 11 _! 11 S 9.49 EA 1 I S 9.49 $ 7.52 EA 1 .. i..~ $ 7.39 EA 1 I $ 7.39 

CU-10725 ISta111Jess Steel Cleaner, 16oz. Aerosol, 12/CT I CS I. 12 7 'j 84 $ 43.88 CS 12 $ 3.66 S __?S.82 CS 12 $ 6.32 $ 3S.36 CS 12 i S 2.95 

CU-10850 !Disinfectant Spray, Aerosol (Kills Cold & Flu Viruses). 12/CS I CS I 12 ,. 37 I 444 S 54.87 CS 12 I $ 4.57 $ 50.73 CS 12 S 4.23 $ 36.98 CS 12 I $ 3.08 

CU-12300 j 1nsecl1c1de Wasp, !lee & Hornet Spray, 16-20~z. 12/CS _ : CS / 12 - 5 I 60 $ 67.75 CS 12 _ _S 5.65 $ 75 .00 CS 12 ! $ 6.25 $ 61.28 CS 12 $ 5.11 

CU-13175 i Laundry Soap Powder, All -Purpose, SOlbs/llX , RX , __ l _ 27 : 27 $ 48.40 EA 1 $ 48.40 $ 63.05 EA 1 $ 63.05 $ 29.98 EA 1 I $ 29.98 

CU-13227 Soft Sc~ub• All-Pu rpose Cleaner, Lemon Scent, 36oz, 6/CT __ I CS i 6 I 13 I 78 S 48.36 CS 6 $ 8.06 NO BID $ 36.96 CS 6 $ 6.16 1 

CU-13228 Gener at Purpose Trigger Sprayer lor 32oz Bellies, 10", While fA ' 1 I 61 I 61 $ 0.84 EA I 1 S 0.84 S 0.39 EA 1 S 0.39 S 0.68 EA 1 S 0.68 ' 

CU-13229 General Purpose Spray Bollie, 32oz (must work with CU-13228) I EA I 1 I 6 I 6 S 0.84 I EA 1 $ 0.84 S 0.75 EA 1 S 0.75 S 0.79 I EA 1 S 0.79 

CU-13430 Vomit Absorption. 12oz Shaker Can, "Soak-II" or Equal. 6EA/llX I llX · 6 i 39 ' 234 $ 41.52 ! CS 6 I S 6.92 S 40.38 l CS 6 S 6.73 $ 69.20 I CS 25 $ 2.77 

CU-14740 Rubbermaid Mulh-Shelf Janitor Cart, 3-Shelf. 20"W x 45~ 38.25"11, Black · ! EA I 5 I S _ S 215 .29 I EA ! 1 j S 215.29 S 133.63 i EA l $ 133.63 $ 119.78 I EA I 1 $ 119.78 

CU-18300 Dispenser, foaming Hand Soap, fuller ; EA 1 20 : 20 NO lllD NO BID No Charge EA 1 No Charge 

M18400 Soap, foaming Hand Soap, Fuller, 1000 ML/llag, 6 llags/CS i CS 6 733 ·: 4398 NO lllD NO BID $ 27.50 I CS I 6 $ 4.58 
CU-10450 Wavebra ke• 3SQT Side Press Buckel and Wringer, Yellow ! EA 1 I 6 i - r,-, -- $ 106.51 EA I 1 i $ 106.51 $ 79.05 1 I $ 79 .05 $ SB.SO I EA I 1 $ 58.50 

CU-12645 Wet Mop End, L;c)"p!'d End, 5" Headband, Green j EA I _ I j _ 115 I 11S S 7.54 i EA i I $ 7.54 $ 5.85 EA I $ 5.85 $ 4.98 EA 1 $ 4.98 

jWet Mop Head, Star-Cut End, 1124, 5" Headband, Collon, While. 2001 ; EA : I I 335 i 335 S 5.06 ! EA I I $ 5.06 S 42.95 CS 12 $ 3.58 $ 3.89 I EA I 1 I $ 3.89 

!Wet Mop Head, Cut -End, 1120, I" Headband, Collon, While 16oz I EA ! 1 ·1- 176 I 176 $ 3.91 ! EA i I S 3.91 S 4.03 EA 1 S 4.03 $ 2.93 I EA I 1 $ 2.93 

] wet Mop Head, Cut End, 1124, l" Headband, Collon, White, 20oz I EA ! - 1 ·1 709 I 709 $ 3.76 i EA l 1 S 3.76 S 4.44 EA i 1 · S 4.44 S 3.15 I EA I 1 I $ 3.15 

CU-12700 j Wel Mop Head, Cut ~End, 1132, I" Headband, Colle~ White, 24oz I EA I 1 i 158--= 158 S 3.92 ; EA I 1 I $ 3.92 _S __ 6.08 EA l 1 $ 6.08 $ 3.94 I EA 1 $ 3.94 

CU-14005 (cau1 1or1 Wet Floor Sign, 11 • 12 • 25, Yello~ EA 1 I 28 !_ 28 $ 12.3~ ! EA I I S 12.39 S 9.36 EA 1 j $ 9.36 $ 6.96 I EA I 1 I $ 6.96 
CU-14850 !Side Latch Wet Mop Handle, 54"", Aluminum, Yellow I EA 1 t 10 I 10 $ 23 .88 j EA 1 $ 23.88 $ 121.09 CS 12 I $ 10.09 $ 9.36 EA 1 $ 9.36 

CU-12650 

CU-12655 

CU-12680 

CU -10525 JAncled l arg!' Broom. l0.5'' , Gray/Yellow I EA I ; 80 -, 80 j __ ~606 I EA II 1 I $ 1606 S 17.31 EA 1 I S 17.31 S 8.16 i EA I 1 I$ 8.16 

CU-12525 !Lobby Oust Pan I EA 1 2S 7 25 $ 16.08 I EA 1 i $ 16.08 $ 10.74 EA 1 $ 10.74 $ 10.43 EA 1 I $ 10.43 
1
CU-14~ !~u! -To -length Oust Mops, Collon, While, 5 x •IOI! - I RX • 1 I - 24 1 -i 241 $ 159.59 llX I S 159.59 $ 103.77 BX _ I ___ s 103.77 . $ 48.88 BX 1 I $ 48.88 

CU -17000 r hp-On Oust Mop Handle. 60", Swivel Head, Natural Wood i EA I 15 i 15 $ 11.11 EA I $ 11.11 $ 8.90 EA I $ 8.90 $ 7.96 EA 1 j $ 7.96 
CU-l71503MEasyTrap0uster,8"xl25'.Whi!e,250Sheels/RL I Rl . I __ 80 ! 80 $ 40.721 CS 1 $ 40.72 $ 50.63 CS 1 $ 50.63 $ S9.45 CS 1 $ 59.45 

CU-17 ~70 !Wire Dust Mop Frame, 5" x 24" __ I EA 1 20 ! 20 $ 5.54 I EA I S 5.54 $ 5.45 EA I $ 5.45 $ 3.86 EA 1 I $ 3.86 

CU-17190 _Wore Dust Mop Frame, 5" x 48" I EA l 1 8 · i 8 $ 10.05 I EA I $ 10.05 S 9.32 EA 1 i S 9.32 $ 6.63 EA 1 I $ 6.63 

CU-17200 Wore Dust Mop Frame, S" x 60"" I EA 1 I 15 ! 15 $ 13.51 . EA 1 S 13.51 $ 11.02 EA 1 1 $ 11.02 S 9.23 EA 1 I $ 9.23 
-------- -- -- - - --- I 

CU-10600 Spartan Xlraction II Carpet Cleaner, I Gal, 4Gal/CS _ j CS 4 10 ! _ 40 S 39.91 CS 4 $ 9.98 $ 63.98 CS 4 I S 16.00 $ 56.84_ EA __ 4 __ L_$ ~~ 
CU-11710 floor Pad, 14" X 28" Buffing, Red, 175-600 RPM (10 EA/CS) , CS 10 10 i 100 $ 50.16 CS 5 $ 10.03 $ 23.51 CS 5 I $ 4.70 $ 34.85 CS 5 1 $ 6.97 

CU-11895 - 3Mf loorPad, Slr ipper, 20",Black, 5/CS I cs i 5 70 I 350 S 14.64 CS 5 $ 2.93 $ 40.63 cs 5 i s 8.13 $ 19.80 cs - 5- - :- s--~ 6 

CU-11925 3Mf loorPad, Ruffing, 20",Red, 5/CS I CS i ' 5 27 I 135 $ 14.64 CS 5 $ 2.93 $ 39.51 CS 5 ! S 7.90 S 19.80 EA 5 i S 3.96 
CU-11975 3M f loor Pad, Scrubbing, 20", ll lue, 5/CS - I CS ! 5 _ 28 - 1- 140 S 14.64 . CS S $ 2.93 $ 39.51 CS S i $ 7.90 $ 19.80 EA 5 : $ 3.96 1 

CU-1363S !Vacuumllags,Windsor VacPacVPIO, lOBags/PK _j PK I 10 34 ! 340 $ 128.0l l CS : 100 i S 1.28 NOlllD $ 21.86 \ EA 10 $ 2.191 

CU-19000 Distilled Waler, Gal, 3/CS _ I CS ; 3 6 I 18 S 7.73 I CS I 6 I $ 1.29 $ 4.85 I CS \ 3 $ 1.62 S 19.74 i CS i 6 $ 3.29 I 
CU -19010 Pro -Link Defoamer, 4gal/CS cs j 4 6 [ 24 $ 99 .64 i cs__ 4 $ 24.91 $ 80.65 I cs 4 i $ 20.16 $ 48.80 BX I 4 $ 12.20 

CU-10010 Tcell Odor NetJtralizer Dispenser, W hite, 12/CS EA I I ! 22 [ 22 $ 11.03 EA 1 S 11.03 $ 8.83 CS I 1 I $ 8.83 $ 10.25 EA I S 10.25 

CU-10015 Tce llOdorNeutral izerRefil l, CucumberMelon, 6/CS i cs I 6 ·1 30 r 180 $ 77.42 cs ___ 6 __ ~~ $ 51.07 cs 6 I $ 8.51 s 66.80 cs 6 I s 11.13 

£U-10225 H1-Gen1c Non-Acid Bowl & Bathroom Cleaner, 32oz, 12/CS_ I CS i 12 22 · 264 $ 32 .8-:_J CS 12 $ 2.74 $ 27.68 j CS 12 I S 2.31 $ 26.40 CS 12 I $ 2.20, 

CU-10325 Toilet Bowl Brush. 10" Handle, White (RUB06301 or Equal) I EA I 1 f_ 20 l 20 S 2.36 i EA_ I I $ 2.36 S 3.82 i EA I I S 3.82 $ 1.92 EA 1 $ 1.92 I 
CU-12750 Bowl Mop, Acid Proof Synthetic Yard & Handle (Johnn ie Mop) ! EA I : 998 1 998 $ 1.06 EA , 1 $ 1.06 $ 0.99 i EA 1 1 $ 0.99 $ 0.89 EA 1 $ 0.89 I 
CU-128~ ,Plung;; r~ O", Wood Handle, 6"Dia, Universal Use in Toilet Bowls j EA ~ 1 I 13 J- 1-3-- S 6.39 j EA I 1 - $ ~ S 3.56 i EA l 1 I$ 3.56 S 5.73 I EA 1 I S 5.73 I 



Commodity I Description UOM 
Estimated I Estimated 

Qty Per 
UOM I Annual Usage _ Usage 

lby UOM) lbv Eachesl 

Baumann Paper 

Vendor Price I Vendor I QTY Per 
UOM UOM 

Price Per 

Each 

Kelsan 

Vendor Prlcel Vendor 
UOM 

QTY Per 

UOM 
Price Per Each 

All Pro 

Vendor I Vendor I QTY Per 
Price UOM UOM 

Price Per Each 

CU-13050 SanitaryNapkinWaxedBags,9.S"x7.5'',250/CS I CS I 250 I 46 11500 $ 22.47 1 CS T ~SCJ0 I$ 0.04 $ 13.64 J CS I ____ 2 __ 50 _-_ j $ 0.05 $ 23.73 I CS ! 250 I$ 0.09 

CU-14985 Urinal Screen, Deodorizing, Red/Cherry, 12/0X I BX 12 I 137 1644_ S 111.25 : CS i 72 $ 1.55 $ 13.56 CS ___ __ !3_ ___ . S 1.13 $ 9.36 BX 12 $ 0.78 
CU-16000 Urinakleen Urinal Cleaner, GAL, 4/CS CS I 4 , 15 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

CU-09010 3M'w Doodlebug Scrub 'n Strop Pad, 4.63" x 10'', Brown, 5/BX, 4BX/CS I CS . 20 I 10 --200-- $ 26.96 I CS I 10 $ 2.70 S 13.14 CS 5 I S 2.63 $ 29.50 J CS j 10 I S 2.95 

CU- U l30 E-Z Grabber, 32". Aluminun I EA I 1 - 13 13 $ 43.39 I EA I I S 43 .39 NO BID $ 11.96 EA 1 S 11.96 I 
CU-12810 Mr. Clean Magic Eraser Pads, 6/PK, 6PK/CS _ _ CS 6 i 117 702 - $ 37.50 i CS · 36 $ 1.04 $ 33.28 I CS 36 $ 0.92 $ 35.92 CS 36 $ 1.00 I 
CU-1281S Medium Scouring Pad, 9", 20/PK _ I CS I 20 1 28 560 $ 6.77 CS I 20 $ 0.34 $ 42.59 i CS 60 $ 0.71 S 3.96 PK 10 S 0.40 

CU-12950 Unger• Replacement Blades for 4" Scrapers, Carbon Steel, 10/PK ~ I PK 10 i 9 90 $ 16.27 PK I 10 $ 1.63 S 92.79 I BX 100 $ 0.93 $ 10.50 PK l 10 $ 1.05 

CU-13125 Scrub Rags, Terry Cloth, 12" x 12", 501bs/CS CS I 1 1 12 12 S 128.97 I CS I 1 S 1~ $ 60.93 CS 0.5 $ 121.86 S 97.85 ! CS I 1 S 97.85 

CU-13410 Unger• Safety Scraper, l.5"W x4" Steel Handle I EA I I i 18 j 18 - S 5.08 j EA 1 I $ 5.08 -$- 3.00 I EA 1 1 $ 3.00 S 4.48 I EA 1 S 4.48 I 
CU ,13675 j Ru~ erma1d Wall Washer Kit (I Handle, 1 Head, 2 Pads) 1 KIT 1· 1 I 3 , 3 $ 81.76 i EA I 1 , $ 81.76 - -- · NO BID S 76.33 KT I 1 S 76.33 I 
CU -13725 1Wall Washer Replacement Pads, 9" x 5", 12/ PK EA I 1 I 20 I 20 $ 15.97 ! EA ! 1 i $ 15.97 $ 11.39 CS I 12 $ 0.95 S 16.32 EA 1 S 16.32 I 

cu-J6190i SwifferDusterRelills, DustlockFiher,light81ue,10/BX,4BX/CS -- , CS I 40 !__ 31 i 1280 $ 41.90 i CS 40 $ 1.05 $ 10.30 _ --~---j__ 10 $ 1.03 $ 40.60 CS 40 $ 1.02' 
CU-16220 ,Swiffer Heavy Duty Dusters Refill, Dust lock fiber, Yellow, 6/BX, 48X/CS CS I 24 I 27 i 648 S 40.40 I CS 40 I $ 1.01 S 37.79 I CS ! 24 S 1.57 S 39.72 I CS 24 i $ 1.66 

CU-10870 :Canvas String Knit Gloves, large, 12/PK DZ ' 12 I 6 72 S 6.74 i DZ 12 I $ 0.56 S 2.79 CS 12 S 0.23 S 9.36 j DZ 12 I $ 0.781 

CEQ-15000 fvacuum Filter Bags for Tennant V-SMU-14-14" Vacuum, 10 Bags/Pack PK i 10 I 26 _ 260 $ 29.31 I PK 10 j $ 2.93 S 24.14 PK 12 S 2.01 ~ 5- J PK 10 j S 1.53 

CEQ-15100 I Vacuum HEPA Motor Intake Filter for a Tennant V-SMU-14-14" Vacuum EA i 1 ! 15 I 15 $ 31.63 EA 1 ; $ 31.63 $ 6.12 EA 1 I $ 6.12 $ 12.99 I EA 1 i $ 12.99 
1 

CEQ-15150 Vacuum Roller Brush for Tennant V-SMU-14·14", Dynamically-balanced, 14" 1 EA I 1 i 10 · - 10 _S 47 .93 EA ____ l __ i,_?_~7.93 S 39.47 EA 1 I S 39.47 T - 59:Ys. EA 1 _ j $ __ - 59.75 

CEQ-15200 Vacuum Belts for Tennant V-SMU-14-14" Vacuum, 6 Belts/Pack I PK 6 ! 7 I 42 $ 26.66 PK 6 i S 4.44 $ 21.95 PK 6 $ 3.66 S 7.20 EA 1 l $ 7.20 

CEQ-153~ \-Vacuum Bag, 6 Quart, for a Tennant V-BP-6 Backpa ck Vacuum, 12 Bags/Case :_c~ j 12 I 10 120 S 20.74 PK 6 $ 3.46 $ 17.22 PK 12 I $ 1.44 $ 17.66 cs 10 . $ 1.77 

CU-19020 ilinatexFront5queegeeBlade,forTennantT300 ! KIT I 1 2 i 2 S 17.23 EA 1 IS 17.23 S 14.61 EA 1 l S 14.61 S 26.36 j EA 1 I $ 26.36 

! != Recommended as the lowest and/or best evaulated bid 

The following companies submitted bids but were deemed non-compllant due to exceptions listed: 

Phillips Supply 

Fastenal 

Hillyard 

Valley Janitor Supply 

Central Poly 

OOP Business Solutions 

The following company submitted a bid but was deemed non-responsive due to no signature under the "Certificaton of Respondent" section of the bid form 

Stigler Supply Company 

The following items were recommended to be awarded in groups: Line 5&7, 8&9, 11& 12, 13-23, 30&31, 34&35, 37-41, 46-47 & 49-51, 53-56, 60&61, 63-65, 73&75, 76&77, 78&79, 80-85 

Line 18 · Requested product has been discontinued by manufacturer. Suggested replacement is accepted. 

Lines 30 & 31 - These items are intended for primary use with lines 13-23. It is recommended to award with that grouping. 

Line 5 7 - Smaller UOM selected based on low annual usage 
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