Jefferson County Public Schools

Bid Tabulation

Event Name: Tires, Tubes, Recapping & Repair

Event ID: JCPS-8493

Approval Date: November 18, 2025

Date Bids Received: October 21, 2025

Contract Period: December 1, 2025 - November 30, 2026
Renewals: No renewal option

Comments: Award Status indicates an award

Item
Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name uom Quantity Manufacturer / Part No. Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes
1 Tire, P205/65R15, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-2012765 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1 Each 5 GOODYEAR 407478374 $69.5300 $347.6500
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Co. Purchase
Michelin.
1 Tire, P205/65R15, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-2012765 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 5 FIRESTONE 004012 $81.2800 $406.4000
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
1 Tire, P205/65R15, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-2012765 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 5 Firestone #004012 All Season $82.2800 $411.4000
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
1 Tire, P205/65R15, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-2012765 Southern Indiana Tire 1 Each 5 FIRESTONE 004012 $82.2800 $411.4000
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Inc. Purchase
Michelin.
1 Tire, P205/65R15, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-2012765 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 5
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Rubber Co. Purchase
Michelin.
2 Tire, P205/75R15, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1503984 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1 Each 1 FIRESTONE 148980 $88.9400 $88.9400
Highway Tread Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Co. Purchase
Michelin.
2 Tire, P205/75R15, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1503984 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 1 Firestone # 148980 Winter $96.8500 $96.8500
Highway Tread Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase force
Michelin.
2 Tire, P205/75R15, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1503984 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 1 N/A No Product Available
Highway Tread Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
2 Tire, P205/75R15, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1503984 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 1
Highway Tread Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Rubber Co. Purchase
Michelin.
2 Tire, P205/75R15, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1503984 Southern Indiana Tire 1 Each 1 NO BID
Highway Tread Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Inc. Purchase
Michelin.




Tire, 215/55R16, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-2013108 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1 Each 10 GOODYEAR 407525374 $80.0000 $800.0000
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Co. Purchase
Michelin.
Tire, 215/55R16, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-2013108 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 10 FIRESTONE 004042 $89.6500 $896.5000
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
Tire, 215/55R16, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-2013108 Southern Indiana Tire 1 Each 10 FIRESTONE 004042 $90.6500 $906.5000
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Inc. Purchase
Michelin.
Tire, 215/55R16, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-2013108 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 10 Firestone # 018975 Affinty $98.0000 $980.0000
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
Tire, 215/55R16, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-2013108 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 10
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Rubber Co. Purchase
Michelin.
Tire, P215/70R15, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1727543 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1Each 5] FIRESTONE 148980 $72.7500 $363.7500 Rejected - item
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Co. Purchase does not meet
Michelin. specifications
Tire, P215/70R15, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1727543 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 5 FIRESTONE 004014 $84.7500 $423.7500
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
Tire, P215/70R15, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1727543 Pomp's Tire Service 1Each 5] Firestone # 004014 All Season $85.7500 $428.7500
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
Tire, P215/70R15, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1727543 Southern Indiana Tire 1Each G FIRESTONE 004014 $85.7500 $428.7500
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Inc. Purchase
Michelin.
Tire, P215/70R15, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1727543 The Goodyear Tire & 1Each 5]
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Rubber Co. Purchase
Michelin.
Tire, 215/85R16, Load Range E, Tubeless. | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1682110 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1Each 1 GOODYEAR 131517875 $115.9600 $115.9600
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Co. Purchase
Michelin.
Tire, 215/85R16, Load Range E, Tubeless. NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1682110 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 1 FIRESTONE 002758 $120.2800 $120.2800
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase

Michelin.




Tire, 215/85R16, Load Range E, Tubeless. NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1682110 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 1 Goodyear 131517875 $120.9600 $120.9600 LT215/85R16 115R E WRL
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Rubber Co. Purchase WORKHORSE HT BSL
Michelin.
Tire, 215/85R16, Load Range E, Tubeless. NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1682110 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 1 Firestone # 002758 Transforce $123.2800 $123.2800
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase HT-2
Michelin.
Tire, 215/85R16, Load Range E, Tubeless. | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1682110 Southern Indiana Tire 1 Each 1 FIRESTONE 013891 $123.2800 $123.2800
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Inc. Purchase
Michelin.
Tire, 225/65R17 All-Season Tread, Load NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1711709 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1 Each 28 GOODYEAR 407285374 $91.0800 $2,550.2400
Range SL are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Co. Purchase
Michelin.
Tire, 225/65R17 All-Season Tread, Load NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1711709 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 28 Goodyear 407285374 $96.0800 $2,690.2400 225/65R17 102T SL ASSURANCE ALL{
Range SL are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Rubber Co. Purchase SEASON
Michelin.
Tire, 225/65R17 All-Season Tread, Load NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1711709 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 28 FIRESTONE 013343 $101.2000 $2,833.6000
Range SL are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
Tire, 225/65R17 All-Season Tread, Load NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1711709 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 28 Firestone # 013343 All Season $102.2000 $2,861.6000
Range SL are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
Tire, 225/65R17 All-Season Tread, Load NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1711709 Southern Indiana Tire 1 Each 28 FIRESTONE 013343 $102.2000 $2,861.6000
Range SL are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Inc. Purchase
Michelin.
Tire, LT225 X 70R, 19.5 Load Range G, All NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1697656 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1 Each 12 FIRESTONE 004196 $287.5900 $3,451.0800
Terrian Tread, Tubeless, 14PLY Transforce are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Co. Purchase
AT2 #004-196 Michelin.
Tire, LT225 X 70R, 19.5 Load Range G, All NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1697656 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 12 FIRESTONE 004196 $315.0000 $3,780.0000
Terrian Tread, Tubeless, 14PLY Transforce | are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
AT2 #004-196 Michelin.
Tire, LT225 X 70R, 19.5 Load Range G, All NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1697656 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 12 Firestone # 004196 Transforce $315.0000 $3,780.0000
Terrian Tread, Tubeless, 14PLY Transforce are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase AT-2
AT2 #004-196 Michelin.
Tire, LT225 X 70R, 19.5 Load Range G, All | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1697656 Southern Indiana Tire 1Each 12 FIRESTONE 004196 $315.0000 $3,780.0000
Terrian Tread, Tubeless, 14PLY Transforce | are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Inc. Purchase

AT2 #004-196

Michelin.




7 Tire, LT225 X 70R, 19.5 Load Range G, All NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1697656 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 12 Goodyear 139005674 $379.3100 $4,551.7200 225/70R19.5 G ENDURANCE RSA
Terrian Tread, Tubeless, 14PLY Transforce | are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Rubber Co. Purchase TL
AT2 #004-196 Michelin.
8 Tire, LT225/75R16, Steel Belted Radial, HT [ NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1718246 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1 Each 1 FIRESTONE 013886 $115.4900 $115.4900
Load Range D, Highway Tread. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Co. Purchase
Michelin.
8 Tire, LT225/75R16, Steel Belted Radial, HT | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1718246 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 1 FIRESTONE 013886 $124.2900 $124.2900
Load Range D, Highway Tread. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
8 Tire, LT225/75R16, Steel Belted Radial, HT | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1718246 Pomp's Tire Service 1Each 1 Firestone # 013886 Transforce $125.2900 $125.2900
Load Range D, Highway Tread. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase HT-3
Michelin.
8 Tire, LT225/75R16, Steel Belted Radial, HT | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1718246 Southern Indiana Tire 1Each 1 FIRESTONE 013886 $125.2900 $125.2900
Load Range D, Highway Tread. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Inc. Purchase
Michelin.
8 Tire, LT225/75R16, Steel Belted Radial, HT [ NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1718246 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 1 Goodyear 139862674 $332.5000 $332.5000 LT225/75R16 E 115/112Q
Load Range D, Highway Tread. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Rubber Co. Purchase ENDURANCE RSA TL
Michelin.
9 Tire, LT235/75R15, Steel Belted Radial, Extra | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1675452 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1Each 3 GOODYEAR 741126681 $73.7200 $442.3200 Rejected - item
Load, Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Co. Purchase does not meet
Michelin. specifications.
9 Tire, LT235/75R15, Steel Belted Radial, Extra | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1675452 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 6 FIRESTONE 005346 $109.8300 $658.9800
Load, Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
9 Tire, LT235/75R15, Steel Belted Radial, Extra | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1675452 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 6 Firestone # 005346 Dest LE3 $110.8300 $664.9800
Load, Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
9 Tire, LT235/75R15, Steel Belted Radial, Extra | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1675452 Southern Indiana Tire 1Each 6 FIRESTONE 005346 $110.8300 $664.9800
Load, Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Inc. Purchase
Michelin.
9 Tire, LT235/75R15, Steel Belted Radial, Extra | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-1675452 The Goodyear Tire & 1Each 3
Load, Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Rubber Co. Purchase
Michelin.
10 Tire, 235/65R16C, Steel Belted Radial, Load | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1663476 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1Each 50 GOODYEAR 131195995 $132.9200 $6,646.0000
Range E, Highway Tread, Tubeless. Firestone | are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Co. Purchase

Transforce CV #004709 or equal.

Michelin.




10 Tire, 235/65R16C, Steel Belted Radial, Load | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1663476 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 50 FIRESTONE 004709 $140.7000 $7,035.0000
Range E, Highway Tread, Tubeless. Firestone | are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Transforce CV #004709 or equal. Michelin.
10 Tire, 235/65R16C, Steel Belted Radial, Load | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1663476 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 50 Firestone # 004709 Transforce $140.7000 $7,035.0000
Range E, Highway Tread, Tubeless. Firestone | are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase cv
Transforce CV #004709 or equal. Michelin.
10 Tire, 235/65R16C, Steel Belted Radial, Load | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1663476 Southern Indiana Tire 1 Each 50 FIRESTONE 013904 $140.7000 $7,035.0000
Range E, Highway Tread, Tubeless. Firestone | are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Inc. Purchase
Transforce CV #004709 or equal. Michelin.
10 Tire, 235/65R16C, Steel Belted Radial, Load | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1663476 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 50 Goodyear 131195995 $140.9200 $7,046.0000 235/65R16C E 121/119R WRL WH
Range E, Highway Tread, Tubeless. Firestone | are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Rubber Co. Purchase HT C-TYPE
Transforce CV #004709 or equal. Michelin.
11 Tire, P235/70R16, Highway Tread. NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-2009594 The Goodyear Tire & 1Each 1 Goodyear 407866374 $99.8500 $99.8500 235/70R16 106T SL ASSURANCE ALL{
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Rubber Co. Purchase SEASON
Michelin.
11 Tire, P235/70R16, Highway Tread. NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-2009594 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1Each 1 FIRESTONE 003024 $103.6500 $103.6500
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
11 Tire, P235/70R16, Highway Tread. NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-2009594 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 1 Firestone # 003024 All Season $104.6500 $104.6500
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
11 Tire, P235/70R16, Highway Tread. NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-2009594 Southern Indiana Tire 1Each 1 FIRESTONE 003024 $104.6500 $104.6500
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Inc. Purchase
Michelin.
11 Tire, P235/70R16, Highway Tread. NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-2009594 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1Each 1 GOODYEAR 116086632 $108.1700 $108.1700
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Co. Purchase
Michelin.
12 Tire, LT235/85R16, Steel Belted Radial, Load [ NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1710090 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1Each 6 GOODYEAR 131745944 $123.5200 $741.1200
Range E, Highway Tread. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Co. Purchase
Michelin.
12 Tire, LT235/85R16, Steel Belted Radial, Load | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1710090 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1Each 6 FIRESTONE 002759 $136.3500 $818.1000
Range E, Highway Tread. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
12 Tire, LT235/85R16, Steel Belted Radial, Load [ NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1710090 Pomp's Tire Service 1Each 6 Firestone # 013892 HT3 $137.3500 $824.1000
Range E, Highway Tread. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase

Michelin.




12 Tire, LT235/85R16, Steel Belted Radial, Load | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1710090 Southern Indiana Tire 1 Each 6 FIRESTONE 013892 $137.3500 $824.1000
Range E, Highway Tread. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Inc. Purchase
Michelin.
12 Tire, LT235/85R16, Steel Belted Radial, Load | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1710090 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 6
Range E, Highway Tread. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Rubber Co. Purchase
Michelin.
13 Tire, LT245/75R16, Steel Belted Radial, Load | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1705813 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1 Each 65 GOODYEAR 131747875 $123.5200 $8,028.8000
Range E, Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Co. Purchase
Michelin.
13 Tire, LT245/75R16, Steel Belted Radial, Load | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1705813 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 65 FIRESTONE 002761 $131.3200 $8,535.8000
Range E, Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
13 Tire, LT245/75R16, Steel Belted Radial, Load | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1705813 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 65 Firestone # 013887 HT3 $131.3200 $8,535.8000
Range E, Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
13 Tire, LT245/75R16, Steel Belted Radial, Load | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1705813 Southern Indiana Tire 1 Each 65 FIRESTONE 013887 $131.3200 $8,535.8000
Range E, Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Inc. Purchase
Michelin.
13 Tire, LT245/75R16, Steel Belted Radial, Load | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1705813 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 65 Goodyear 139715674 $361.4000 $23,491.0000 LT245/75R16 E 120/116Q
Range E, Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Rubber Co. Purchase ENDURANCE RSA TL
Michelin.
14 Tire, 245/75R17LT All Terrain NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1026438 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1 Each 16 FIRESTONE 000184 $146.5200 $2,344.3200
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Co. Purchase
Michelin.
14 Tire, 245/75R17LT All Terrain NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1026438 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 16 Firestone # 013889 Transforce $154.7700 $2,476.3200
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase HT3
Michelin.
14 Tire, 245/75R17LT All Terrain NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1026438 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 16 Goodyear 481104855 $165.3600 $2,645.7600 LT245/75R17 E 121S WRL
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Rubber Co. Purchase WORKHORSE AT BSL
Michelin.
14 Tire, 245/75R17LT All Terrain NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1026438 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 16 FIRESTONE 000184 $166.1600 $2,658.5600
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
14 Tire, 245/75R17LT All Terrain NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1026438 Southern Indiana Tire 1 Each 16 FIRESTONE 000184 $166.1600 $2,658.5600
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Inc. Purchase

Michelin.




15 Tire, P265/70R17, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1683456 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 6 BRIDGESTONE 148002 $107.8200 $646.9200
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
15 Tire, P265/70R17, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1683456 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1 Each 6 GOODYEAR 183106436 $122.7200 $736.3200
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Co. Purchase
Michelin.
15 Tire, P265/70R17, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1683456 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 6 Firestone # 014434 Dest AT-2 $152.7500 $916.5000
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
15 Tire, P265/70R17, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1683456 Southern Indiana Tire 1 Each 6 FIRESTONE 013894 $180.9000 $1,085.4000
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Inc. Purchase
Michelin.
15 Tire, P265/70R17, Steel Belted Radial, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1683456 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 6
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Rubber Co. Purchase
Michelin.
16 Tire, P225/60R16, 1 Speed Ratings H, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-2000082 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1Each 1 FIRESTONE 018980 $76.0000 $76.0000
Highway Tread. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Co. Purchase
Michelin.
16 Tire, P225/60R16, 1 Speed Ratings H, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-2000082 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 1 FIRESTONE 018980 $95.4300 $95.4300
Highway Tread. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
16 Tire, P225/60R16, 1 Speed Ratings H, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-2000082 Pomp's Tire Service 1Each 1 Firestone # 018980 Affinity AS $96.4300 $96.4300
Highway Tread. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
16 Tire, P225/60R16, 1 Speed Ratings H, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-2000082 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 1 Goodyear 110407545 $101.2800 $101.2800 225/60R16 98H SL ASSURANCE
Highway Tread. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Rubber Co. Purchase MAX FE VSB
Michelin.
16 Tire, P225/60R16, 1 Speed Ratings H, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-2000082 Southern Indiana Tire 1Each 1 BRIDGESTONE 006023 $107.6300 $107.6300 V SPEED RATED WHICH IS HIGHER
Highway Tread. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Inc. Purchase THAN H
Michelin.
17 Tire, 10 x 16.5, 6 Ply, Tubeless, NHS. 1360600-1721301 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 10 Westlake # TH12365 EL78 $124.9000 $1,249.0000
Purchase
17 Tire, 10 x 16.5, 6 Ply, Tubeless, NHS. 1360600-1721301 Southern Indiana Tire 1Each 10 WESTLAKE TH12365 $125.0000 $1,250.0000

Inc.

Purchase




17 Tire, 10 x 16.5, 6 Ply, Tubeless, NHS. 1360600-1721301 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1 Each 10 MAXDURA 060115-625 $140.0000 $1,400.0000
Co. Purchase
17 Tire, 10 x 16.5, 6 Ply, Tubeless, NHS. 1360600-1721301 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1Each 10 CARLSTAR 5153D1 $148.3600 $1,483.6000
Purchase
17 Tire, 10 x 16.5, 6 Ply, Tubeless, NHS. 1360600-1721301 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 10
Rubber Co. Purchase
18 Tube, 24/26 x 12.00 x 12. 1360600-1676678 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1Each 1 FIRESTONE 542954 $22.0000 $22.0000
Co. Purchase
18 Tube, 24/26 x 12.00 x 12. 1360600-1676678 Southern Indiana Tire 1Each 1 CARLISE CAR321051 $28.0000 $28.0000
Inc. Purchase
18 Tube, 24/26 x 12.00 x 12. 1360600-1676678 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 1 Carlisle # 321051 Tube $39.9000 $39.9000
Purchase
18 Tube, 24/26 x 12.00 x 12. 1360600-1676678 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1Each 1 CARLSTAR 5114091 $109.0900 $109.0900
Purchase
18 Tube, 24/26 x 12.00 x 12. 1360600-1676678 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 1
Rubber Co. Purchase
19 Tire, P235/55R17 Speed Rating H (130 MPH). | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-2010408 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1 Each 10 GOODYEAR 732002500 $100.0000 $1,000.0000
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Co. Purchase
Michelin.
19 Tire, P235/55R17 Speed Rating H (130 MPH). | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-2010408 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 10 Goodyear 732002500 $116.0000 $1,160.0000 P235/55R17 98W S2 EAG RS-A
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Rubber Co. Purchase VSBRPTL
Michelin.
19 Tire, P235/55R17 Speed Rating H (130 MPH). | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-2010408 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 10 FIRESTONE 005368 $131.2800 $1,312.8000
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
19 Tire, P235/55R17 Speed Rating H (130 MPH). | NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-2010408 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 10 Firestone # 005368 Dest LE3 $132.2800 $1,322.8000
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase

Michelin.




19 Tire, P235/55R17 Speed Rating H (130 MPH).| NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360550-2010408 Southern Indiana Tire 1 Each 10 FIRESTONE 005368 $132.2800 $1,322.8000
are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Inc. Purchase
Michelin.
20 Tire, ST205/75R15, Steel Belted Radial NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360600-2002281 Southern Indiana Tire 1 Each 20 ROADMAX NRM49 $87.0000 $1,740.0000 Rejected -
(Trailer), Load Range C, 8 Ply. Goodyear are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Inc. Purchase alternate bid not
Endurance #724861519 or equal. Michelin. acceptable.
20 Tire, ST205/75R15, Steel Belted Radial NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360600-2002281 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1 Each 20 GOODYEAR 724961519 $97.9300 $1,958.6000
(Trailer), Load Range C, 8 Ply. Goodyear are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Co. Purchase
Endurance #724861519 or equal. Michelin.
20 Tire, ST205/75R15, Steel Belted Radial NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360600-2002281 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 20 GOODYEAR 724861519 $102.9300 $2,058.6000
(Trailer), Load Range C, 8 Ply. Goodyear are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Endurance #724861519 or equal. Michelin.
20 Tire, ST205/75R15, Steel Belted Radial NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360600-2002281 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 20 Goodyear 724861519 $102.9300 $2,058.6000 ST205/75R15 107N LR-D
(Trailer), Load Range C, 8 Ply. Goodyear are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Rubber Co. Purchase ENDURANCE BSW TL
Endurance #724861519 or equal. Michelin.
20 Tire, ST205/75R15, Steel Belted Radial NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360600-2002281 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 20 Good Year # 724861519 $185.9900 $3,719.8000 Good Year Tire will not support any
(Trailer), Load Range C, 8 Ply. Goodyear are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase special pricing to Pomp's tire
Endurance #724861519 or equal. Michelin. because another GY Dealer is in the
area.
21 Tire, 225/75R15 10 Ply (Trailer). 1360625-1717051 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1 Each 22 TRAVEL STAR HFST66N $78.0000 $1,716.0000
Co. Purchase
21 Tire, 225/75R15 10 Ply (Trailer). 1360625-1717051 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 22 ADVANTA 1954052250 $79.3500 $1,745.7000
Purchase
21 Tire, 225/75R15 10 Ply (Trailer). 1360625-1717051 Southern Indiana Tire 1Each 22 AMERICUS AMCAMG0638 $90.0000 $1,980.0000
Inc. Purchase
21 Tire, 225/75R15 10 Ply (Trailer). 1360625-1717051 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 22 Goodyear 724857519 $116.3300 $2,559.2600 ST225/75R15 117N LR-E
Rubber Co. Purchase ENDURANCE BSW TL
21 Tire, 225/75R15 10 Ply (Trailer). 1360625-1717051 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 22 Good Year # 724857519 $206.9900 $4,553.7800 Good Year Tire will not support any
Purchase special pricing to Pomp's tire
because another GY Dealer is in the
area.
22 Tire, ST225/90D16, Load Range D, Tubeless. [ Highway Tread (Trailer). Carlisle Sport Trail LH. NO 1360400-1258375 Southern Indiana Tire 1Each 5] DEESTONE DS1285 $135.0000 $675.0000 CARLISLE IS NOW CARLSTAR(MADE Rejected -
SUBSTITUTE. Inc. Purchase IN CHINA) alternate bid not
acceptable.




22 Tire, ST225/90D16, Load Range D, Tubeless. Highway Tread (Trailer). Carlisle Sport Trail LH. NO 1360400-1258375 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 5 CARLSTAR 6H01431 $177.2900 $886.4500
SUBSTITUTE. Purchase
22 Tire, ST225/90D16, Load Range D, Tubeless. | Highway Tread (Trailer). Carlisle Sport Trail LH. NO 1360400-1258375 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1 Each 5 CARLISLE 6H01431 $192.7500 $963.7500
SUBSTITUTE. Co. Purchase
22 Tire, ST225/90D16, Load Range D, Tubeless. Highway Tread (Trailer). Carlisle Sport Trail LH. NO 1360400-1258375 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 5 Carlisle # 6HO1431 Sport Trailer| $200.0000 $1,000.0000
SUBSTITUTE. Purchase
22 Tire, ST225/90D16, Load Range D, Tubeless. | Highway Tread (Trailer). Carlisle Sport Trail LH. NO 1360400-1258375 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 5
SUBSTITUTE. Rubber Co. Purchase
23 Tire, LT225 x 70R, 19.5, Load Range F, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1723439 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1 Each 10 GOODYEAR 139172053 $283.8100 $2,838.1000
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Co. Purchase
Michelin.
23 Tire, LT225 x 70R, 19.5, Load Range F, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1723439 The Goodyear Tire & 1Each 10 Goodyear 139172053 $293.2700 $2,932.7000 225/70R195 G G647 RSS TL
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Rubber Co. Purchase
Michelin.
23 Tire, LT225 x 70R, 19.5, Load Range F, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1723439 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 10 FIRESTONE 004195 $315.0000 $3,150.0000
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
23 Tire, LT225 x 70R, 19.5, Load Range F, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1723439 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 10 Firestone # 248409 FS561 $315.0000 $3,150.0000
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Purchase
Michelin.
23 Tire, LT225 x 70R, 19.5, Load Range F, NOTE: Only these nationally recognized name brands 1360650-1723439 Southern Indiana Tire 1 Each 10 FIRESTONE 248409 $315.0000 $3,150.0000
Highway Tread, Tubeless. are acceptable: Bridgestone, Firestone, Goodyear or Inc. Purchase
Michelin.
24 Tire, 11R, 22.5, Lug Type, Load Range H. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1360650-1729116 Southern Indiana Tire 1Each 5 FIRESTONE 211206 $345.0000 $1,725.0000
Goodyear Unisteel #G182, #138802111, Inc. Purchase
Dunlop or Firestone ONLY.
24 Tire, 11R, 22.5, Lug Type, Load Range H. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1360650-1729116 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1Each 5 FIRESTONE 211206 $355.6500 $1,778.2500
Goodyear Unisteel #G182, #138802111, Co. Purchase
Dunlop or Firestone ONLY.
24 Tire, 11R, 22.5, Lug Type, Load Range H. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1360650-1729116 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 5 Firestone FS663 # 281042 $360.0000 $1,800.0000 Good Year Tire will not support any
Goodyear Unisteel #G182, #138802111, Purchase special pricing to Pomp's tire

Dunlop or Firestone ONLY.

because another GY Dealer is in the
area.




24 Tire, 11R, 22.5, Lug Type, Load Range H. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1360650-1729116 The Goodyear Tire & 1Each 5 Goodyear 138803185 $468.4400 $2,342.2000 11R225 H G182RSD  TL
Goodyear Unisteel #G182, #138802111, Rubber Co. Purchase
Dunlop or Firestone ONLY.
24 Tire, 11R, 22.5, Lug Type, Load Range H. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1360650-1729116 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1Each 5 GOODYEAR 138802111 $532.7800 $2,663.9000
Goodyear Unisteel #G182, #138802111, Purchase
Dunlop or Firestone ONLY.
25 Tire, 26 x 12 x 12 Turf Tread, Rear, Turn Turf. 1360600-1579224 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 10 Deestone #DS5252 D405 $83.0000 $830.0000
Purchase
25 Tire, 26 x 12 x 12 Turf Tread, Rear, Turn Turf. 1360600-1579224 Southern Indiana Tire 1Each 10 DEESTONE DS7085 $95.0000 $950.0000
Inc. Purchase
25 Tire, 26 x 12 x 12 Turf Tread, Rear, Turn Turf. 1360600-1579224 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1Each 10 DEESTONR DS7085 $101.1500 $1,011.5000
Co. Purchase
25 Tire, 26 x 12 x 12 Turf Tread, Rear, Turn Turf. 1360600-1579224 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1Each 10 CARLSTAR 5743611 $132.6800 $1,326.8000
Purchase
25 Tire, 26 x 12 x 12 Turf Tread, Rear, Turn Turf. 1360600-1579224 The Goodyear Tire & 1Each 10
Rubber Co. Purchase
26 Tire, 295/75R, 22.5 Load Range H, 16 PLY BW NO SUBSTITUTE. 1360400-2000088 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1Each 200 GOODYEAR 756809647 $415.0100 $83,002.0000
TL Goodyear Fuel Max RSA Co. Purchase
#75680964700000
26 Tire, 295/75R, 22.5 Load Range H, 16 PLY BW NO SUBSTITUTE. 1360400-2000088 The Goodyear Tire & 1Each 200 Goodyear 756809647 $504.2100 $100,842.0000 295/75R225 149/146L H FUELMAX
TL Goodyear Fuel Max RSA Rubber Co. Purchase RSA
#75680964700000
26 Tire, 295/75R, 22.5 Load Range H, 16 PLY BW NO SUBSTITUTE. 1360400-2000088 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1Each 200 GOODYEAR 756809647 $584.1500 $116,830.0000
TL Goodyear Fuel Max RSA Purchase
#75680964700000
26 Tire, 295/75R, 22.5 Load Range H, 16 PLY BW NO SUBSTITUTE. 1360400-2000088 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 200 GY # 756809647 $898.1600 $179,632.0000 Good Year Tire will not support any
TL Goodyear Fuel Max RSA Purchase special pricing to Pomp's tire
#75680964700000 because another GY Dealer is in the
area.
26 Tire, 295/75R, 22.5 Load Range H, 16 PLY BW NO SUBSTITUTE. 1360400-2000088 Southern Indiana Tire 1Each 200 NO BID
TL Goodyear Fuel Max RSA Inc. Purchase

#75680964700000




27 Tire, 295/75R, 22.5, Load Range G, Highway | Goodyear #Endurance RSA series #756817674. NO 1360400-2010863 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1Each 500 GOODYEAR 756817674 $393.3600 $196,680.0000
Tread. SUBSTITUTE. Co. Purchase
27 Tire, 295/75R, 22.5, Load Range G, Highway Goodyear #Endurance RSA series #756817674. NO 1360400-2010863 The Goodyear Tire & 1Each 500 Goodyear 756817674 $403.3600 $201,680.0000 295/75R225 G ENDURANCE RSA
Tread. SUBSTITUTE. Rubber Co. Purchase TL
27 Tire, 295/75R, 22.5, Load Range G, Highway | Goodyear #Endurance RSA series #756817674. NO 1360400-2010863 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1Each 500 GOODYEAR 756817674 $563.1200 $281,560.0000
Tread. SUBSTITUTE. Purchase
27 Tire, 295/75R, 22.5, Load Range G, Highway | Goodyear #Endurance RSA series #756817674. NO 1360400-2010863 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 500 Gy #756817674 $882.9100 $441,455.0000 Good Year Tire will not support any
Tread. SUBSTITUTE. Purchase special pricing to Pomp's tire
because another GY Dealer is in the
area.
27 Tire, 295/75R, 22.5, Load Range G, Highway | Goodyear #Endurance RSA series #756817674. NO 1360400-2010863 Southern Indiana Tire 1 Each 500 NO BID
Tread. SUBSTITUTE. Inc. Purchase
28 Tire, 275/80R, 22.5 Load Range H, 16 PLY BW NO SUBSTITUTE. 1360400-1709891 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1Each 200 MICHELIN 01637 $480.0000 $96,000.0000
TL Michelin XZE #01637. Co. Purchase
28 Tire, 275/80R, 22.5 Load Range H, 16 PLY BW NO SUBSTITUTE. 1360400-1709891 Pomp's Tire Service 1Each 200 Michelin # 01637 XZE $535.0000 $107,000.0000
TL Michelin XZE #01637. Purchase
28 Tire, 275/80R, 22.5 Load Range H, 16 PLY BW NO SUBSTITUTE. 1360400-1709891 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1Each 200 MICHELIN 01637 $540.5400 $108,108.0000
TL Michelin XZE #01637. Purchase
28 Tire, 275/80R, 22.5 Load Range H, 16 PLY BW NO SUBSTITUTE. 1360400-1709891 The Goodyear Tire & 1Each 200
TL Michelin XZE #01637. Rubber Co. Purchase
28 Tire, 275/80R, 22.5 Load Range H, 16 PLY BW NO SUBSTITUTE. 1360400-1709891 Southern Indiana Tire 1Each 200 NO BID TIRE IS DISCONTINUED
TL Michelin XZE #01637. Inc. Purchase
29 Service, Reconditioning of 22.5 Bus (steel) Include pickup and delivery to any location within 4600649-2012219 Southern Indiana Tire 1Each 350 RECON WHEEL CONDITIONING $27.0000 $9,450.0000 THERMO CLEAN, BLAST, ZINC
wheel. Jefferson County, Kentucky in your price. PLEASE Inc. Purchase COAT,POWDER COAT
PRICE PER WHEEL.
29 Service, Reconditioning of 22.5 Bus (steel) Include pickup and delivery to any location within 4600649-2012219 The Goodyear Tire & 1Each 350 $30.0000 $10,500.0000
wheel. Jefferson County, Kentucky in your price. PLEASE Rubber Co. Purchase

PRICE PER WHEEL.




29 Service, Reconditioning of 22.5 Bus (steel) Include pickup and delivery to any location within 4600649-2012219 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1 Each 350 ZIEGLER RIMCZ $30.0000 $10,500.0000
wheel. Jefferson County, Kentucky in your price. PLEASE Co. Purchase
PRICE PER WHEEL.
29 Service, Reconditioning of 22.5 Bus (steel) Include pickup and delivery to any location within 4600649-2012219 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 350 Recon $34.0000 $11,900.0000
wheel. Jefferson County, Kentucky in your price. PLEASE Purchase
PRICE PER WHEEL.
29 Service, Reconditioning of 22.5 Bus (steel) Include pickup and delivery to any location within 4600649-2012219 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 350 RWPC $38.0000 $13,300.0000
wheel. Jefferson County, Kentucky in your price. PLEASE Purchase
PRICE PER WHEEL.
30 Tire, Recapping of Bus Tires, 265/70R, 19.5, Include pickup and delivery in your price. Please 1360575-2014728 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1 Each 20 GOODYEAR 254634707 $98.3300 $1,966.6000
Load Range G, Tubeless. respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE Co. Purchase
ITEM NOTES field: 1.) Indicate process to be used. 2.)
Please state number of days recapping of tire can be
made from date of pickup.
30 Tire, Recapping of Bus Tires, 265/70R, 19.5, Include pickup and delivery in your price. Please 1360575-2014728 The Goodyear Tire & 1 Each 20 Goodyear 254634027 $110.4300 $2,208.6000 108382 - 265/70R195 PC G159 16
Load Range G, Tubeless. respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE Rubber Co. Purchase 1.) Goodyear Pre Cure System
ITEM NOTES field: 1.) Indicate process to be used. 2.) retreading process 2.) 7-10 Days for
Please state number of days recapping of tire can be Delivery
made from date of pickup.
30 Tire, Recapping of Bus Tires, 265/70R, 19.5, Include pickup and delivery in your price. Please 1360575-2014728 Southern Indiana Tire 1Each 20 BANDAG UAP2 $111.0000 $2,220.0000 1.BANDAG/PRECURE 2. STANDARD
Load Range G, Tubeless. respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE Inc. Purchase 5 WORKING DAYS
ITEM NOTES field: 1.) Indicate process to be used. 2.)
Please state number of days recapping of tire can be
made from date of pickup.
30 Tire, Recapping of Bus Tires, 265/70R, 19.5, Include pickup and delivery in your price. Please 1360575-2014728 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1Each 20 BANDAG 005790 $138.5000 $2,770.0000 BANDAG Retread Process, Turn
Load Range G, Tubeless. respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE Purchase around 7 days
ITEM NOTES field: 1.) Indicate process to be used. 2.)
Please state number of days recapping of tire can be
made from date of pickup.
30 Tire, Recapping of Bus Tires, 265/70R, 19.5, Include pickup and delivery in your price. Please 1360575-2014728 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 20 Bandag UAP2 $138.9000 $2,778.0000 Bandag UAP2 10 Working day turn
Load Range G, Tubeless. respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE Purchase around
ITEM NOTES field: 1.) Indicate process to be used. 2.)
Please state number of days recapping of tire can be
made from date of pickup.
31 Service, Tire Repair. Include pickup and delivery to any location within 4600649-1715836 Southern Indiana Tire 1Each 1 REPAIR FLAT $30.0000 $30.0000
Jefferson County, Kentucky in your price. PLEASE Inc. Purchase
PRICE PER HOUR.
31 Service, Tire Repair. Include pickup and delivery to any location within 4600649-1715836 Ziegler Tire & Supply 1Each 1 ZIEGLER 665178 $35.0000 $35.0000
Jefferson County, Kentucky in your price. PLEASE Co. Purchase
PRICE PER HOUR.
31 Service, Tire Repair. Include pickup and delivery to any location within 4600649-1715836 Pomp's Tire Service 1 Each 1 RS $75.0000 $75.0000 This is for Road service only.
Jefferson County, Kentucky in your price. PLEASE Purchase
PRICE PER HOUR.
31 Service, Tire Repair. Include pickup and delivery to any location within 4600649-1715836 Bob Sumerel Tire Co. 1 Each 1 SVCHR $109.0000 $109.0000 Hourly rate for Yard Service at any
Jefferson County, Kentucky in your price. PLEASE Purchase JCPS location, or Emergency Road

PRICE PER HOUR.

Service




31

Service, Tire Repair.

Include pickup and delivery to any location within
Jefferson County, Kentucky in your price. PLEASE
PRICE PER HOUR.

4600649-1715836

The Goodyear Tire &
Rubber Co.

1Each
Purchase

$125.0000

$125.0000

Emergency after hours service is a
two hour minimum.
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