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1 1
PlusOptix Vision 
Screener 1201S-01H-38217693Not Working Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2 1
60" Exmark Zero Turn 
Mower Blown engine Maintenance Department NO BID 358.00 NO BID NO BID 165.00

3 1
HP Color Laserjet Pro 
M452nw Unknown Maintenance Department NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4 1 HP LaserJet P2055dn CNB9963483 Unknown Maintenance Department NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5 1
Beltone Model 119 
Audiometer Not Working John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

6 1 Skutt Electric Kiln 031089 (inv tag 10229)working Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 18.50

7

11 
(CORR
ECTE
D 15 
QTY)

CORRECTED 1st 
Generation Model # 
A1474 Ipads (NOT 9th 
Gen)

working Transformational Learning 
Center 25.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 11  IPad 2's working Transformational Learning CenterNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 12 Dell E2015HV Mointors working Transformational Learning CenterNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 1 Optiplex 3020 Working Transformational Learning CenterNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 1 Optiplex 3020 Working Transformational Learning CenterNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 1 Optiplex 3020 Working Transformational Learning CenterNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 1 Optiplex 3020 Working Transformational Learning CenterNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
14 1 Optiplex 3020 Working Transformational Learning CenterNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 1 Optiplex 3020 Working Transformational Learning CenterNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 1 Optiplex 3020 Working Transformational Learning CenterNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
17 1 Optiplex 3020 Working Transformational Learning CenterNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 1 Optiplex 3020 Working Transformational Learning CenterNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
19 1 Optiplex 3020 Working Transformational Learning CenterNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 1 Optiplex 5040 Working Transformational Learning CenterNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
21 1 MagiCard Badge Maker Working Transformational Learning CenterNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
22 1 Optiplex 3010 3453 Working Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
23 1 Optiplex 390 4328 Working Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 1 Optiplex 7010 HV0RNW1 Working Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
25 1 Optiplex 7010 3486 Working Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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26 1 Optiplex 790 4301 Working Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
27 1 Optiplex 790 2885 Working Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
28 1 Optiplex 3010 3V24CZ1 Working Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
29 1 Optiplex 760 2574 Working Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 1 Optiplex 3020 6165 Working Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
31 1 Optiplex 3020 6137 Working Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
32 1 Optiplex 3020 6160 Working Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
33 1 Optiplex 7449 AIO CG7V382 Working Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
34 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9495 Not FunctionalHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
35 1 A1893 Apple iPad 7278 Not FunctionalHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9982 Not FunctionalHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
37 1 A1893 Apple iPad 7215 Not FunctionalHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
38 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9508 Not FunctionalHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
39 1 A1893 Apple iPad DMPWMHY0JF8J Not FunctionalHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
40 1 A1893 Apple iPad 7354 Not FunctionalHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
41 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9580 Not FunctionalHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
42 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9585 Broken ScreenHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
43 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9263 Broken ScreenHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
44 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9257 Not FunctionalHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
45 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9836 Not FunctionalHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
46 1 A1893 Apple iPad 7382 Not FunctionalHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
47 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9526 Not FunctionalHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
48 1 A1893 Apple iPad 7269 Not FunctionalHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
49 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9571 Not FunctionalHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
50 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9876 Not FunctionalHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
51 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9297 Not FunctionalHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
52 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9838 Broken ScreenHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
53 1 A1893 Apple iPad 7343 Broken ScreenHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9316 Not FunctionalHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 1 A1395 Apple iPad 4832 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
56 1 A1395 Apple iPad 3441 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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57 1 A1395 Apple iPad 4361 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
58 1 A1395 Apple iPad 1061 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
59 1 A1395 Apple iPad 1060 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
60 1 A1395 Apple iPad 5090 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
61 1 A1395 Apple iPad 3324 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
62 1 A1395 Apple iPad 1538 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
63 1 A1395 Apple iPad 5111 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
64 1 A1395 Apple iPad 3344 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
65 1 A1395 Apple iPad 3444 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
66 1 A1395 Apple iPad 5610 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
67 1 A1219 Apple iPad 3931 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
68 1 A1219 Apple iPad 3928 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
69 1 A1395 Apple iPad 5611 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
70 1 iPad 9th Gen 18619 Screen BrokenHolmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
71 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9352 Wont Charge Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
72 1 iPad 9th Gen 18512 Wont Charge Holmes Middle School NO BID 1.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID
73 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9586 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
74 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9463 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
75 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9339 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
76 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9455 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
77 1 iPad 9th Gen 15118 Screen BrokenHolmes Middle School NO BID 1.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID
78 1 A1893 Apple iPad dmtpdj5cfk10 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
79 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9306 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
80 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9302 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
81 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9375 Not FunctionalHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
82 1 Dell Lattitude 3340 643y732 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
83 1 Dell Lattitude 3340 5140 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
84 1 Dell Lattitude 3340 6026 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
85 1 Dell Latitude E5430 3466 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
86 1 Dell Lattitude 3340 5154 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
87 1 Dell Lattitude 3340 j43y732 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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88 1 Dell Lattitude 3340 253y732 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
89 1 Dell Lattitude 3340 5171 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
90 1 Dell Lattitude 3340 h23y732 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
91 1 Dell Lattitude 3340 8xsvb32 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
92 1 Dell Lattitude 3340 933y732 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
93 1 Dell Lattitude 3340 5181 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
94 1 Dell Lattitude 3340 5167 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
95 1 Dell Lattitude 3340 5157 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
96 1 LG19LG30 807AMJM03420 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
97 1 LG19LG30 807AMZV03429 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
98 1 LG19LG30 807AMGP03431 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
99 1 LG19LG30 807AMDH03434 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

100 1
Dell Laptop Charging 
Cart BCFR5X1 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

101 1
Black Charging Cart No 
Power Strips N/A Door Missing Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

102 1 A1893 Apple iPad 7355 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
103 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9450 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
104 1 A1893 Apple iPad 8515 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
105 1 A1893 Apple iPad 7232 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
106 1 A1566 Apple iPad 7291 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
107 1 A1395 Apple iPad 2743 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
108 1 A1395 Apple iPad 2741 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
109 1 A1395 Apple iPad 2734 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
110 1 A1395 Apple iPad 2735 Unknown Holmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
111 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9511 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
112 1 A1893 Apple iPad 7306 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
113 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9846 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
114 1 A1893 Apple iPad 7274 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
115 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9372 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
116 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9928 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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117 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9181 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
118 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9940 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
119 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9865 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
120 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9437 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
121 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9584 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
122 1 A1893 Apple iPad DMPT6FKNHG5D Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
123 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9442 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
124 1 A1893 Apple iPad 7352 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
125 1 A1893 Apple iPad 7238 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
126 1 A1893 Apple iPad DMPT67RYHG5D Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
127 1 A1893 Apple iPad DMPWKFZ5JF8J Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
128 1 A1893 Apple iPad 8573 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
129 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9961 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
130 1 A1893 Apple iPad 7246 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
131 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9975 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
132 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9862 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
133 1 A1893 Apple iPad 7359 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
134 1 A1893 Apple iPad DMPTM1JAHLF9 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
135 1 A1893 Apple iPad 7267 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
136 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9187 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
137 1 A1395 Apple iPad DN6H13FCDFJ0 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
138 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9349 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
139 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9576 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
140 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9491 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
141 1 A1893 Apple iPad 7220 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
142 1 A1893 Apple iPad 9537 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
143 1 A1893 Apple iPad 7240 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
144 1 A1893 Apple iPad 8572 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
145 1 A1395 Apple iPad 2798 Unknown Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
146 1 2011 Thomas built bus4UZABRDT6BCAT2569 Not functional Transportation Department NO BID 20.00 NO BID NO BID 125.00
147 1 2011 Thomas built bus4UZADADT8BCAX9663 Not FunctionalTransportation Department NO BID 20.00 NO BID NO BID 125.00
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148 1 2005 Ford F250 1FTSF21P85EB31492 Poor Transportation Department NO BID 3,305.25 NO BID NO BID 635.00

149 4
WS-AP3710i (Requires 
License) 1745Y-15407 Functional Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

150 4
WS-AP3710i (Requires 
License) 1745Y-14960 Functional Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

151 4
WS-AP3710i (Requires 
License) 1745Y-14000 Functional Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

152 4
WS-AP3710i (Requires 
License) 1745Y-13938 Functional Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

153 4
WS-AP3710i (Requires 
License) 1745Y-13202 Functional Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

154 4
WS-AP3710i (Requires 
License) 1745Y-12946 Functional Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

155 4
WS-AP3710i (Requires 
License) 1745Y-13749 Functional Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

156 4
WS-AP3710i (Requires 
License) 1745Y-15292 Functional Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

157 4
WS-AP3710i (Requires 
License) 644728310128 Functional Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

158 4
WS-AP3710i (Requires 
License) 1745Y-13442 Functional Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

159 4
WS-AP3710i (Requires 
License) 1745Y-13930 Functional Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

160 4
WS-AP3710i (Requires 
License) 644728310128 Functional Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

161 4
WS-AP3710i (Requires 
License) 1745Y-15312 Functional Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

162 4
WS-AP3710i (Requires 
License) 1745Y-13567 Functional Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

163 4
WS-AP3710i (Requires 
License) 1745Y-13397 Functional Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

164 4
WS-AP3710i (Requires 
License) 908422-10-5L Functional Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

165 4
WS-AP3710i (Requires 
License) 644728310128 Functional Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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166 4
WS-AP3710i (Requires 
License) 644728310128 Functional Holmes Middle School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

167 1 MacBook Air CO2X23EVGFWM Broken ScreenTransformational Learning CenterNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
168 8 convection ovens not calaberated spuratically workHolmes High School NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.50

169 28
WS-AP3935i (Requires 
License) Functional Latonia Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

170 1 iPad 2nd Gen 3218 Unknown Latonia Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
171 1 iPad 2nd Gen 4793 Unknown Latonia Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
172 1 iPad 2nd Gen 8978 Unknown Latonia Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
173 1 iPad 2nd Gen 1353 Unknown Latonia Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
174 1 iPad 2nd Gen 2598 Unknown Latonia Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
175 1 iPad 2nd Gen 2596 Unknown Latonia Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
176 1 iPad 2nd Gen 4352 Unknown Latonia Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
177 1 iPad 2nd Gen 2599 Unknown Latonia Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
178 1 iPad 2nd Gen 2323 Unknown Latonia Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
179 1 iPad 2nd Gen 4355 Unknown Latonia Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
180 1 iPad 2nd Gen 4833 Unknown Latonia Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
181 1 iPad 2nd Gen 1004 Unknown Latonia Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
182 1 iPad 2nd Gen 4372 Unknown Latonia Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

183 6
Dell Streak 7 - Home 
Audio Video Dock New Latonia Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

184 2
Dell Compact Charging 
Cart 9DWJVG2 Working Latonia Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

185 1
ERGOTRON Device 
Charging Cart 24-302-085 Unknown Latonia Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

186 4 Dell KB216 Keyboard Unknown John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
187 5 Dell Monitor E170Sb Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
188 1 Dell Monitor E170Sc Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

189 1
Dell Optiplex 3040 
Tower 9106 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

190 1
Dell Optiplex 3040 
Tower 9115 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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191 1
Dell Optiplex 3040 
Tower 9148 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

192 1
Dell Optiplex 3040 
Tower 9163 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

193 1
Dell Optiplex 5050 
Tower 7721 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

194 1
Dell Optiplex 5050 
Tower 7727 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

195 1
Dell Optiplex 5050 
Tower 7735 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

196 1
Dell Optiplex 960 
Tower 4002 Unknown John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

197 1 iPad Air A1458 5564 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
198 1 iPad Air 1 A1474 7490 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
199 1 iPad Air A1474 8501 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
200 1 iPad Air a1474 8504 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
201 1 iPad Air A1474 8507 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
201 1 iPad Air A1474 8508 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
201 1 iPad Air A1474 8509 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
202 1 iPad Air A1474 8510 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
203 1 iPad Air A1474 8511 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
204 1 iPad Air A1474 8514 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
205 1 iPad Air A1474 8515 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
206 1 iPad Air A1474 8519 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
207 1 iPad Air A1474 8520 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
208 1 iPad Air A1474 8522 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
209 1 iPad Air A1474 8560 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
210 1 iPad Air 2 A1566 8798 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
211 1 iPad Air 2 A1566 8799 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
212 1 iPad Air 2 A1566 8802 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
213 1 iPad Air 2 A1566 8804 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
214 1 iPad Air 2 A1566 8806 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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215 1 iPad Air 2 A1566 8807 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
216 1 iPad Air 2 A1566 8808 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
217 1 iPad Air 2 A1566 8809 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
218 1 iPad Air 2 A1566 8810 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
219 1 iPad Air 2 A1566 8812 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
220 1 iPad Air 2 A1566 8813 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID 5.00 NO BID NO BID
221 1 iPad Air A1566 8815 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
222 1 iPad Air 2 A1566 8816 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
223 1 iPad Air 2 A1566 8818 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID 5.00 NO BID
224 1 iPad Air 2 A1566 8819 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
225 1 iPad Air 2 A1566 8820 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
226 1 iPad Air 2 A1566 8918 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
227 1 iPad Air 2 A1566 8920 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
228 1 iPad 6 A1893 10141 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID 1.01 7.00 NO BID NO BID
229 1 iPad 6 A1893 10143 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID 1.01 7.00 NO BID NO BID
230 1 iPad 6 A1893 10148 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID 1.01 7.00 NO BID NO BID
231 1 iPad 6 A1893 10150 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID 1.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID
232 1 iPad 6 A1893 10176 Powers on John G. Carlisle Elementary NO BID 1.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID

233 112
WS-AP3935i (Requires 
License) Functional Central Office NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

234 17
WS-AP3710i (Requires 
License) Functional Central Office NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

235 1

HP Lazer Jet P3015 
Printer Lines when PrintsCentral Office

$ Sent to 
Another 
Location


