JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY/AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION
BID ID: JCPS-8481
APPROVAL DATE: September 16, 2025
ITEM(S) QUOTED: Laminators, Film & Repair Service
DATE BIDS RECEIVED: August 13, 2025
CONTRACT PERIOD: October 24, 2025 through October 23, 2026 with

two (2) annual renewal options
QUOTED DISCOUNT TERMS:  Net

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: No shipments/services are to be made against the contract.
Purchase orders will be issued.

AWARD OF BID: An * indicates an award



Laminators, Film, & Repair Service

Line 1: Film, laminating, 1.5 mil. to fit all 12” laminating machines. Clear 1.5 mil. 12”
x 500° roll w/1” core, 2 rolls per box, standard roll laminating film for use with hot roll and heat
shoe laminators (5690370-2013560)

Vendor Price Per 2 Count Box
School Specialty $21.68 *

ACCO Brands $ NO BID

Pyramid School Products $31.98

Scott Electric $46.00

Line 2: Film, laminating, 1.5 mil. to fit all 25” laminating machines. Clear 1.5 mil. 25”
x 500’ roll w/1” core, 2 rolls per box, standard roll laminating film for use with hot roll and heat

shoe laminators. (5690370-2013562)

Vendor Price Per 2 Count Box
School Specialty $39.98 *

ACCO Brands $ NO BID

Pyramid School Product $51.96

Scott Electric $ 58.00

Line 3: Film, laminating. Clear 1.5 mil. 25” x 500’ roll w/2.25” core, 2 rolls per box,
standard roll laminating film for use with hot roll and heat shoe laminators. (5690370-2013563)

Vendor Price Per 2 Count Box
School Specialty $50.00 *

ACCO Brands $ NO BID

Pyramid School Product $60.98

Scott Electric $ 78.00

Line 4: Film, laminating, 3.0 mil. to fit all 12” laminating machines. Clear 3.0 mil. 12”
x 250° roll w/1” core, 2 rolls per box, standard roll laminating film for use with hot roll and heat
shoe laminators. (5690370-2013564)

Vendor Price Per 2 Count Box

Scott Electric $48.00 *

ACCO Brands $ NO BID

Pyramid School Product $ 33.98 Rejected — did not submit

samples for evaluation
School Specialty $ NO BID



Line 5: Film, laminating, 3.0 mil. to fit all 18” laminating machines. Clear 3.0 mil. 18”
x 250° roll w/1” core, 2 rolls per box, standard roll laminating film for use with hot roll and heat
shoe laminators. (5690370-2013565)

Vendor Price Per 2 Count Box

Scott Electric $58.00 *

ACCO Brands $ NO BID

Pyramid School Product $ 39.96 Rejected — did not submit
samples for evaluation

School Specialty $ NO BID

Line 6: Film, laminating, 3.0 mil. to fit all 25” laminating machines. Clear 3.0 mil. 25”
x 250’ roll w/1” core, 2 rolls per box, standard roll laminating film for use with hot roll and heat
shoe laminators. (5690370-2013566)

Vendor Price Per 2 Count Box

Scott Electric $62.00 *

ACCO Brands $ NO BID

Pyramid School Product $ 49.78 Rejected — did not submit
samples for evaluation

School Specialty $ NO BID

Line 7: Film, laminating, 3.0 mil. to fit all 27” laminating machines. Clear 3.0 mil. 27”
x 250° roll w/1” core, 2 rolls per box, standard roll laminating film for use with hot roll and heat
shoe laminators. (5690370-2013567)

Vendor Price Per 2 Count Box

Scott Electric $ 68.00 *

ACCO Brands $ NO BID

Pyramid School Product $ 53.98 Rejected — did not submit
samples for evaluation

School Specialty $ NO BID

Line 8: Film, laminating, 1.5 mil. to fit all 12” laminating machines. Clear 1.5 mil. 12”
x 500’ roll w/1” core, 2 rolls per box, standard roll laminating film for use with hot roll and heat
shoe laminators. (5690370-1422991)

Vendor Price Per 2 Count Box
ACCO Brands $39.54 *

Pyramid School Product $ NO BID

School Specialty $ NO BID

Scott Electric $ NO BID



Line 9: Film, laminating, 1.5 mil. to fit all 25” laminating machines. Clear 1.5 mil. 25”
x 500° roll w/1” core, 2 rolls per box, standard roll laminating film for use with hot roll and heat
shoe laminators. (5690370-1371813)

Vendor Price Per 2 Count Box
ACCO Brands $52.78 *

Pyramid School Product $57.98

School Specialty $ NO BID

Scott Electric $ NO BID

Line 10: Film, laminating. Clear 1.5 mil. 25” x 500’ roll w/2.25” core, 2 rolls per box,
standard roll laminating film for use with hot roll and heat shoe laminators. (5690370-1714943)

Vendor Price Per 2 Count Box
ACCO Brands $ Discontinued
Pyramid School Product $ NO BID

School Specialty $ NO BID

Scott Electric $ NO BID

Line 11: Film, laminating, 3.0 mil. to fit all 12” laminating machines. Clear 3.0 mil.
12” x 500’ roll w/1” core, 2 rolls per box, standard roll laminating film for use with hot roll and
heat shoe laminators. (5690370-1423007)

Vendor Price Per 2 Count Box
ACCO Brands $53.80 *

Pyramid School Product $ NO BID

School Specialty $ NO BID

Scott Electric $ NO BID

Line 12: Film, laminating, 3.0 mil. to fit all 25” laminating machines. Clear 3.0 mil.
25” x 250’ roll w/1” core, 2 rolls per box, standard roll laminating film for use with hot roll and
heat shoe laminators. (5690370-1371831)

Vendor Price Per 2 Count Box
ACCO Brands $72.72 *

Pyramid School Product $ 139.96

School Specialty $ NO BID

Scott Electric $ NO BID



Line 13: Film, laminating, 3.0 mil. to fit all 27” laminating machines. Clear 3.0 mil.
27” x 250’ roll w/1” core, 2 rolls per box, standard roll laminating film for use with hot roll and
heat shoe laminators. (5690370-2013109)

Vendor Price Per 2 Count Box
ACCO Brands $74.16 *

Pyramid School Product $ NO BID

School Specialty $ NO BID

Scott Electric $ NO BID

Line 14: Film, laminating, EZload, clear 1.5 mil. 25” x 500’ roll w/1” core, 2 rolls per
box. EZload roll laminating film for use with GBC Ultima 65 and Pinnacle 27 EZload laminators.
ACCO. (5690370-2014842)

Vendor Price Per 2 Count Box
ACCO Brands $43.68 *

Pyramid School Product $87.98

School Specialty $ NO BID

Scott Electric $ NO BID

Line 15: Film, laminating, EZload, clear 3.0 mil. 25” x 250’ roll w/1” core, 2 rolls per
box. EZload roll laminating film for use with GBC Ultima 65 and Pinnacle 27 EZload laminators.
ACCO. (5690370-2014843)

Vendor Price Per 2 Count Box
ACCO Brands $72.72 *

Pyramid School Product $ NO BID

School Specialty $ NO BID

Scott Electric $ NO BID

Line 16: Laminator, EZload roll 27” wide. GBC Ultima 65. (5780590-1445967)

Vendor Price Per Each
ACCO Brands $1775.62 *
Pyramid School Product $2289.98
School Specialty $ NO BID
Scott Electric $ NO BID

Line 17: Laminator, EZload roll 27” wide. GBC Pinnacle 27. (5780590-2014844.)

Vendor Price Per Each
ACCO Brands $1583.63 *
Pyramid School Product $2399.95
School Specialty $ NO BID

Scott Electric $ NO BID



Line 18: Service, laminator repair, (as per specifications) cost per hour. (4600649-2013588)

Vendor Cost Per Hour / Percentage off
List Price

ACCO Brands $ 205/ 0% * Includes zone
breakdown for travel fee per
submission

Pyramid School Product $ NO BID

School Specialty $ NO BID

Scott Electric $ NO BID



