HENDERSON COUNTY SCHOOLS
1805 Second Street, Henderson, Kentucky 42420
(270) 831-5000 | Fax: (270) 831-5009
www.henderson.kyschools.us

Dr. Bob Lawson, Superintendent

To: Bob Lawson, Superintendent
And School Board Members

From: Cindy Cloutier W
Director of Finance
Date: July 21, 2025

Re: Bid Recommendations

Bid Recommendation:

Surplus Buses & Vans Bid # 9-25-5-7

Information regarding the bid was paced in the newspaper and on our website. Bid
invitations were sent to five previous buyers. We received two bids, one from Glenn
Powell and one from Dennis Sauer. Glenn Powell had the highest bid on five buses and
2 cargo vans, and Dennis Sauer had the highest bid on three buses. We recommend the
Board award the bid to both bidders as highlighted on the Bid Tabulation.

The mission of Henderson County Schools is to provide extraordinary educational opportunities for every student.
Equal Educational and Employment Institution



HENDERSON COUNTY SCHOOLS
1805 SECOND STREET
HENDERSON, KY 42420

Surplus Buses & Vans Tabulation Sheet

Bid # 9-25-5-7

Unit # Bus Mileage Deandra Lane Daniel Hanson S & S Coatings Dirty Diesel Repair Glenn Powell
150 2007 [INTERNATIONAL I/C VIN# 4DRBUAAN49B046277 146,840 $301.00 $1,020.00
70 2007 [INTERNATIONAL I/C VIN# 4DRBUAAN29B046276 154,784 $301.00 $1,020.00
77 2008 [INTERNATIONAL I/C VIN# 4DRBUAAN06A208410 200,954 $301.00 $1,020.00
15 2007 |BLUE BIRD VIN# 1BAKGCPA2AF269999 146,002 $301.00 $500.00
135 2008 |THOMAS VIN# 4UZABRDT4BCAU3974 136,988
No Bid No Bid 301,00 No Bid $500.00
5 2006 |MIDBUS VIN# 1FDWE35F43HB43206 149,660 $301.00 No Bid
17 2006 [AMTRAM VIN# 4DRBWAAR77A356519 177,744 $301.00 No Bid
79 2006 |AMTRAM VIN# 4DRBWAAR57A356521 168,792 $301.00 ! No Bid
5032 1994 |DODGE CARGO VAN - WHITE VIN# 2B7HB21Y1RK104702 155,073 $201.00 $250.00
7003 2008 |FORD E350 VAN -GREY VIN# 1FDSE35S78DA69516 147,504 $301.00 $1,050.00
Contact Information:
—
Name Deandra Lane Daniel Hanson Dennis Sauer Scott, Smith Glenn Powell
Address 707 Interstate 35 4177 Brisco Benton Rd. 644 7th St. 4151 ST. Rd 416 West
Pearsall, TX 78061 Henderson, KY 42420 Corydon, KY 42406 Robards, KY 42452
Phone number 210-380-2226 513-305-8500 270-577-7868 270-454-4261
Email|deandra.lane@gmail.con] danhan101@yahoo.com sscoatings@yahoo.com |dirtydieselrepair@gmail.cor nvfd153@live.com




