FORT THOMAS INDEPENDENT SCHOOLS - BID RESULTS FOR 07/01/23 - 06/30/24

Hillside Maintenance

Peak Supply Solutions
($250.00 min. order for free

Pyramid School Products

Unified Purchasing

Central Poly-Bag Corp

Interboro

Supply freight) (+$100 40924C(FTTHOMAS) on all (see packet for vendor (ref #193701) delivery w/in
Item Name All Pro Supply Baumann HP/Ferguson (min. $250 order/$25deliv.) Mailender Murphy Supply for liftgate) Phillips Supply orders Quill specifics) 30dys Packaging UniPak
Zep Break-Away Enzymatic R .
Carpet Spotter Franklin 12qts/cs Spartan 12qts/cs Spartan 200z/12/cs Majestic Triple Action Victoria Bay 12 D00007 WePak 320z GreenLink 12/32 oz g;ﬁg;?)lgzgns $;C25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
#F374012 $33.26 650-104 $27.59 S637400  $56.99 12qts/cs 152660 $86.76 $27.84 MSC $4.00 #78009 $98.59 :
Pyramid School Products
Lysol disinfectant spray - Lysol 190z/12/cs 190z/12/cs REC4675
Lyy:ol Only Prey Lysol 12cans/cs Spartan NO BID NO BID Reckitt 12  CV748286 lysol  190z/12/cs NOBID si\AR|T4e75gs / $152.15 Chase 16.50z/12/cs NO BID $149/_ 98/ NO BID NO BID NO BID
RB308124 $83.76 $114.00 RAC4675 $114.00 433.4104 $50.69 #485-141-11925
Lysol Disinfecting Wipes  [Lysol 6canisters/cs Lysol ~ Bcanister/cs Lysol  80/tub NO BID Reckitt 6 RB- Lysol  80/tub/6tubs/cs NO BID NO BID Lysol  80/tub;6/cs Lysol  80/tub NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
RB77182 $31.50 RAC-77182  $29.99 RAC77182EA  $5.97 77182 $29.76 RAC77183CT $28.50 RAC77182CT  $30.98 901-89346 $5.52
Stigler Supply  1G/6/cs
Bleach - 6% Prime Source 6G/cs Pure Bright 1G/4/cs  [Clorox 1210z NO BID KK 6  Purebrightgl Austin  1G/6/cs NO BID Clorox  16G/4/cs NO BID NO BID CPDIAR110001 MC- NO BID NO BID NO BID
KK11008  $22.56  |620408 $23.25 CLO30966EA  $10.51 $20.22 KIK $18.74 LAGCLOBS97S  $104.43 0036:CS_ $21.74
Pyramid School Products
Big D 1lb cn/6/cs Tolco260106 1724483
Absorbent Powder Voban 24 (1lb pks/cs) Super-Sorb 120z cn/24/cs [Hospeco 160z Voban 1lb/bg, 24/cs Banner Chem. 24 Voban 1lb bx/24/cs NO BID Bélse $61.7/2 ! Tolco (Soak-it) 1lb/25/cs NO BID 1lb/25/cs $71.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
FM-VOBAN $58.70 968-647 $38.73 HOS08160 $7.69 222929 $74.88 ODOR20RB  $48.99 FM-Voban $98.00 260099 $67.98 #485-174-10300
Phillips Suppl 36/cs
Mr.. _c'ea" Magic Eraser - |pe 36/cs Mr. Clean 36/cs Mr. Clean  36/cs P&G Mr. Clean 6/bx, 6bx/cs |[P&G 36 PG79009 P&G  36/cs NO BID Mr.Clean  30/cs Mr. Clean  6/6/cs Mr. Clean  6/pk;6pks/ct |_A(58p20277vr|’g|5p $53/_41 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Original PG79009 $34.86 543-203 $35.09 PGC79009 $43.44 117139-CS $34.80 $30.96 PGC79009 $34.00 SP*002830  $69.91 PGC79009  $35.08 901-24393653 $42.99 #485-115-11935
Pyramid School Products
Chewing Gum Remover ) o NO BID Diversey - 6.50z/12/cs Misty Il Gum & Candlewax |5.50z/12/cs  ~ Chase4107- NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chase 12/cs Spartan 12/cs Spartan  6.50z/12/cs Prolink 12cns/cs 106795 |Victoria Bay 12 FO0177 |Chase 12/cs SCJ4198  $66.85 Chase 5.50z/12/cs  433- 60z/12/ctn 901{12 $45.98 #485-115-
CHA4334107  $31.68  |601.306 $53.85 S644500  $66.09 $70.56 $45.24 Gum Remover ~ $28.25 4107 $33.98 aMRA18312 $73.79 11950
Comet Cleaner w/ Bleach - P&G 8-320zbottles/cs [Comet 8/cs Comet  320z/8/cs Comet 8qts/cs 107917-/P&G 8 30314/84836923 P&G 320z/8/cs NO BID Comet 16/3/cs NO BID Comet 320z/8/ctn NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Amazon PG02287  $63.76  |PGC-30314 $6552  |PGCO2287CT $75.25  |CS  $60.59 $53.92 PGC02287CT  $56.00 LAGPGCOTO31  $99.04 901-607903  $70.99
Spartan  602-101 X . Phillips Supply 1qt/12/cs
Toilet Bowl Cleaner MISO  12qts/cs 320z btl/12/cs w/bowl  |Spartan  1qt/12/cs ProLink bright  12qts/cs VictoriaBay 12  L01254 [MSC  320z/12/cs NO BID Bright Solutions - 640z/4/cs NO BID NO BID BSL3600012 $32.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID
MP10506  $23.42 mop  $26.75 5710603  $27.50 150639 $48.60 $22.08 Non-Acid  $21.70 BSLE5160065  $80.20 #485-125-11856
Valley Janitor Supply ea MBJ
Cone Bowl Mop Better Brush ea Better Brush ea Supply Source (Impact) ProLink ea 107866 [Janico ea IMP3605 Better Brush  ea NO BID Impact Products  50/cs Tolco ea (100/cs only) 280105 NO BID Impact204 $0.82 NO BID NO BID NO BID
280712 $1.12 BBP.280712 $158 |ea SUP3600 $3.18  |$3.61 $1.60 Cone bowl mop $2.95 IMP3600 $203.26($4.07ea)  |¢) 450, #485-115.11950
Valley Janitor Supply 10/cs
WAVE urinal screen Fresh  10/bx Fresh  10/bx Fresh (apple spice) 12/bx [WizKid  6/bx,72 mastercs |Fresh  10/bx Wave  10/bx NO BID 2:2221 1?5/;3)(:5;5/(:5 Fresh 10/bx;6bx/cs WDS- NO BID ;r;;.r:)rgango :45835M;|<_3285X NO BID NO BID NO BID
FP3WDS $19.90 528405  $20.11 F3WDSP72M01 $30.35 |10640702 $148.32 ZWDS10MG  $18.60 WD S/O ACPHS  $17.95 Spiced Apple $20.22 12805
g:::v'::“ Gel Clog Drano 800z/ea; 6/cs  |Drano 2.5qt, 6/cs DVO 2?;:76 §2°;/9 122é ;5 NO BID Drano 12 DRAINO32 |SCJ Drano  800z/6/cs NO BID g;i’:)"o 5 122502/ 1@{;; o NO BID Drano  800z/6/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
694772 $62.12 CB401099 $71.38 . $68.76 694772 $64.00 : 901-CB401099 $66.24
Tide 950z/ea; 3/cs Tied 950z/3/cs P&G 2pks/1430z ea P&G  850z/bx/3bx/cs Tide 840z/4/cs Tide 950z/3/ctn
TIDE Laundry Detergent | g597 $69.60 pacsisor ;72.71 NOBID NO BID PGC16673  $57.24 PGC16668 $59.00 NOBID Sp00t1te 2109.14 NOBID 9012712358  $55.24 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID
Pyramid School Products
Claire  190z/12/cs 170z/12/cs $38.69
Fumniture Polish Chase 12cans/cs Spartan  200z/12/cs  |Spartan 200z/12/cs Chase  190z/cn,12cns/cs VictoriaBay 12  F00125 |[Chase 180z/14/cs NO BID CLACPsllBS(/)L / $68.07 Chase (spraypak) 120z/12/cs NO BID Cha5£41€)g.1; NOBID NOBID NOBID
CH4334109  $33.80 613203 $41.75 5611000 $52.68 106801 $47.25 $40.68 Furniture Polish ~ $30.75 433-4109 #37.98 #485-158-11930
Chase 180z/12/cs
) " . . " Bright Solutions  160z/6/cs
Stainless Steel Cleaner Chase  12cans/cs Spartan  1qt/12/cs Spartan 200z/12/cs Chase 180z/cn,12cns/cs Victoria Bay 12 K01020 Stainless Steel polish NO BID Chase (spraypak) 180z/12/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CH4334111  $31.82 SPT-326503 $35.76 SPA631000 $64.00 106779 $62.20 $40.08 $29.74 BSL95450006  $56.10 433-4111  $36.98
Pyramid School Products
Graffiti Remover . NO BID - NO BID Boardwalk 1602/12/cs NO BID 160z/12/0 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chase 160z/12/cs Spartan  1qt/12/cs PLZ/Claire 20gel/12/cs VictoriaBay 12  F00178 Chase 180z/12/cs SP*00011403 $87.30 Chase (spraypak) 160z/12/cs Chase4105-12
CH4334105  $52.98 601-150 $86.96 PCL880  $74.18 $50.16 Graffiti Remover $54.00 433-4105 $54.98 $59.75 #485-115-11940
Valley Janitor Supply
Floor Stripper . _ . . ' ' . ' i NO BID Diversey 5L pal NO BID . , Belco134B500 WXSTB2GS NO BID NO BID NO BID
FullPro  5G pails Diversey 5G baginbox |Spartan NAD-75 5G pail |Prolink Blaze 5G pail Victoria Bay 5G pail D00051 |5G Low HD stripper SCJ5547312 $154.80 Zep High traffic 1G/5/cs 5G pail $75.75 #485-154-
FULL STRIP GOLD  $39.95 [HP680-205 $50.72 S007505 $50.75 10555700  $61.66 $61.59 $39.90 901-ZPEZULFFS12 $54.85 |11305
Valley Janitor Supply
Floor Finish ) - : ) ) L ) : NO BID Diversey _ 5G bx NO BID Coastwide fsish & sealer | RetcoG59R500 WAXBSGS 56 NO BID NO BID NO BID
FullPro  5G pails Spartan  5G pail Spartan iShine 5G pail Prolink Spotlight 25% 5G [Victoria Bay 5G pail D00065 |MSC 5G pail SCJ4210179  $186.92 spray gloss 0.95L/6/cs pail  $85.00 #485-
3V6-9605  $73.25 682-229  $81.09 S545505  $99.98 pail 10555600 $86.78 $87.75 Hard as Daimond $68.00 901-24425445 $35.99 154-11080
Terrazzo Floor Finish FullPro  5G pails Spartan  5G pail Spartan Terra 5G pail Prolink Spotlight 25% 5G [Spartan 5G STER MSC  5G pail Zep zarathon 5G Diversey 5G bx NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
V69605  $73.25 SPT.545405 $65.00 |5581005 $93.99 pail 10555600 $86.78  |$82.79 IronMan  $64.00 #113735 $128.99 SCI04663  $150.62
Zep Burnish Boost .
Restorer FullPro  4G/cs Spartan  1G Spartan Bounce Back 5G VictoriaBay 4  D00081 |FlashBack 1qt/12/cs |(dilutes 1:32) 4/1G g'cvje;zys“ 16/5541/; 00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F191022 $44.36 684-103 $57.16 pail S433005 $81.78 |Prolink  12qts/cs 162791 |$56.52 Flash Back SB $54.00 #204824  $62.72 i
Valley Janitor Supply
Neutral Floor Cleaner . ' . ) Zep PH Perfect (dilutes 1;256) | Diversey 1G/4/cs NO BID . 1G/4/cs Waxie320024 NO BID NO BID NO BID
FullPro  4G/cs Diversey 5G baginbox |Spartan Damp 4G/cs Prolink Preference 1G,4G/cs |VictoriaBay 4 D0008O Sunshine  1G/4/cs 4/1G #72924 $46.10 SCJ03904 $41.77 Coastwide 1280z/4/ctn WAX320024 $35.10
9221 $27.98 P601-214  $33.99 S301604 $34.80 150695 $40.60 $26.92 4-1 $24.25 901-919529 $35.98 #485-154-11720
Baseboard Stripper Chase 12cans/cs 200z cn/12/cs |Spartan  200z/12/cs Prolink Baseboard 12cs/cs Betco 12 AXITAERO Chase 180z/12/cs iz;;gvovirhg;iea;z/lsm g&%ﬁz’;o 2302/1:;27/0751 Chase (spraypak) 190z/12/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CH4334112  $32.38 680-109  $40.83 S609700 $46.89 106780 $58.32 $47.04 4334112 $31.00 i : 433-4112 $37.78
. Valley Janitor Suppl 3M
Stripper Pads 20" BLACK |[ACS 5/cs 3M Niagara 5/cs 3M Niagara 5/cs Prolink 5/cs 108533 |VictoriaBay 5 VB20BSTP [3M 5/cs Zep Sct  #FSP0211 3M Niagra  5/cs ACS 5/cs 72-20 |Coastwide 5/ctn 5/csy szoBchF;};:L_se NO BID NO BID NO BID
TL10120 $17.55 MMM-35023 $13.67 3M7010341266 $15.74 [$26.30 $11.85 20-Blk $16.99 $42.86 MMMZ2ONHPS  $22.01 $13.86 901-655465 $18.99 #365-120-17470
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Zep 5ct  #FSP0221

3m

5/cs

Scrubbing Pads 20" green [ACS 5/cs 3M Niagara 5/cs 3M Niagara 5/cs Prolink  5/cs 231324 |VictoriaBay 5 VB20GSP 3M  5/cs ACS 5/cs 55-20 |Premier 5/ctn NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TL10320  $17.55 MMM-35023 $13.67 [3M7010384517 $15.48 [$26.30 $11.85 20-Green  $16.99 $55.95 MMM20CNS  $116.42 $13.86 901-PMP4020GREU $18.99
Valley Janitor Suppl 3M
Scrubbing Pads 20" blue  |ACS 5/cs 3M Niagara 5/cs 3M Niagara 5/cs Prolink  5/cs VictoriaBay 5 VB20BCP |3M 5/cs Zep Sct  #FSP0214 3M  5/cs MMM20NBL | 5¢q 5/cs 53-20 |Premier 5/ctn 5/csy FP20BSC ppsy;|_5_25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TL10420 $17.55 MMM-35043 $13.67 [3M7010384521 $15.48 (108532  $26.30 $11.85 20-Blue  $16.99 $40.58 $16.96 $13.86 901-4020BE  $13.67 #365-120-17450
Valley Janitor Suppl 3M
Polishing Pads 20" tan or  |5cq 5/ 3M Niagara  5/cs 3m 5/cs Prolink  5/cs 108530 |VicotriaBay 5 VB20WSPP [3M  5/cs Zep Sct #FSP0217 $36.00|0  5/cS ACS  5/cs 4120 |Coastwide 5/ctn 5/csy FP20WC plie.z5 NO BID NO BID NO BID
white TL10820 $17.55 MMM-35063 $13.67 [3M7100140864 $15.74 [$25.30 $11.85 20-White  $16.99 MMM20NW  $16.96 $13.86 901-663605 $15.77 #365-120-17485
. Valley Janitor Supply
Buffing Pads 20" red ACS  5/cs 3M Niagara 5/cs 3M Niagara  5/cs Prolink  5/cs 108524 |VictoriaBay 5 VB20RBFP |3m 5/cs Zep 5ot #FSP0219 $48.22 ?A'\:m\'/lmzaog;R 5&53 . ACS 5/cs 51-20 |Coastwide 5/ctn 3M 5/cs FP20RC $16.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TL10520 $17.55 MMM-35053 $13.67 [3M7010384525 $15.74 [$26.30 $11.85 20-Red $16.99 : $13.86 901-663603  $15.99 #365-120-17445
JobGuard/Med Pride
Ambitex  100/bx (4mil) Powder-free only UPC - Generic
Latex gloves - powdered |\, Gyard  100/bx Hospeco  100;/bx Ay NO BID Victoria Bay 1000 69600L |MSC  100/bx;10bx/cs NO BID TRALLG5101  $4.67 NOBID Ambitex L5101 100/bx NO BID NOBID 100/bx  $3.98 100/bx;10bx/cs LPF
VGA32A-size  $4.29/bx [280-314 $3.65 $36.00 Latex Gloves  $36.00 901-931421  $4.99 sm,med,Irg,xI-LPFG $35.50
Royalty 4mil black Ammex ACNPF Nitrile SriTrang/ShieldLine UPC - Generic
Nitrile - PF Exam grade VanGuard  100/bx Hospeco 100/bx Westcraft 100/bx 100/bx,10bx/cs Multiple |Victoria Bay 1000 MSC 100/bx;10bx/cs NO BID ProWorks  100/bx Hospeco  110/bx;1bx/cs 100/bx;10bx/ctn NO BID NO BID 1000/cs  $28.80 100/bx;10bx/cs NPF
gloves VGAllAsize  $3.98 280326 $3.65 WC106738 $4.88 sizes $37.80 FDGNPRLIM  $33.00 Nitrile  $29.95 IMP8644/S,MLXL $3.68 GLN106F-size $38.90 ACNPF44100XX  $47.99 sm,med, Irg X-NPFG-E |$35.50
. . Luxxeen  96rls/cs
Toilet Paper-  45"X || ;x45375  $46.52 NO BID Essity  96rls/cs Elite Premium  96rls/cs NO BID Tork 4x3.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3.75" Only (300 cs min., but they will store Westcraft WC3531 Royalty Virgin Premium - 4.4x4.4x3 8" (specsheet) 4.5x3.75 8600.5013
it)(only used 31 cases this year) width 4.10" (spec sheet) [4.33x3.5 TM1616S  $48.00 $49.98 Resolute 4.4"x3.5
I(‘)’I'Ift(::gf':’:;w'm large Novex NO BID NO BID NO BID Essity 36rs 61990 Baywest  36/cs NO BID Tork 9" rolls NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
$50.04 161990  $49.95
Royalty Natural Stigler Supply 6rls/cs  CT
Roll Towels - natural Novex  6rls/cs Tork  6rls/cs Westcraft  6rls/cs 800'/rl,6rls/cs 10638903 (VictoriaBay 6 VBRT800K [MSC  6/800'/cs NO BID KC  12rs/cs 5C04142 NO BID NO BID paper PP-770011-CS $26.24 |Marcal 6rls/cs  P728N NO BID NO BID
NXJ5600 $22.05 SCA-RK8002 $28.02 |WC2100N  $31.62 $26.25 $24.78 RESOOE  $22.95 $07.52 #640-175-14060 $39.00
Roll Towels - BAYWEST : Baywest Ecosoft 6/800'/cs
Only (Essity/Tork) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID EZTZO 6 8031300 NO BID NO BID BAY31300  $65.06 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
;.sr::: Dispenser - Baywest NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ::gz e 265828 NO BID NO BID Ef;'gosgg s851 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GOJO 2/cs GOJO 2/cs GOJO  2/cs GOJO  2/200ml/cs GOJO  2000ml/2/cs GOJO 2/cs
GOJO luxury hand wash 526202 $50.85 IE / o 6526202 $66.50 NO BID NO BID 526202 $52.00 NO BID 6115526202 ;62_67 NO BID 901-806434  $62.41 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
) GOJO  6/cs GOJO FMX.20 GOJOFMX  ea GOJO  ea
GOJO dispenser 888806 $132.00 N ETRER 6527106 $10.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5934 NO GHARGE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Westcraft Zep White Von Drehle Green )
Multi-fold towels Novex  4000/cs NPS  4000/cs 872/250/pk/16pks/cs Royalty ~ 250/pk,16pks/cs |Victorial Bay 4000 MSC  4000/cs seal Cert 16/250 Tork/Essity - 250/pk;16pks/cs NO BID Coastwide 250/pk;16/ctn NO BID CentralPoly 16/250/cs NO BID NO BID
NX56200 $21.45 904  $22.60 WC4A100N  $24.32 (4000) 10638906 $22.96 [VBMF91K  $20.00 4000MFN  $23.00 #FSP0228  $44.50 BAY48000  $34.36 901-373470  $27.99 200N $38.00
Heavenly Soft Zep 2ply Von Drehle Green )
Kitchen roll towels Novex 30rls/cs Tork  30rls/cs Westcraft ~ 30rls/cs 88sht/rl,30rls/cs T7100 |Victorial Bay 30  VBKT385|CF 85/rs/30rls/cs Seal Cert  30/85ct Tork/Essity - 84/r1;30rls/cs NO BID Quill 2ply 85/rl;30rls/ct NO BID Marcal  30/85/cs 06350- NO BID NO BID
NXT7100  $24.70 SCA-HB1990A  $30.65 |WC5501  $36.36 $27.95 $25.20 HH Roll Towel $23.95  [#FSP0232 $53.93 BAY41859  $36.68 901-7HH290CT  $38.27 12 $39.00
Scotch-Brite pad ACS  60/cs Scotch Brite  60/cs 3M Power Pad  20/cs NO BID 3M 80 9650 NO BID NO BID ;“&Mff,\/fs $15.35 ACS  60/cs 96-  |Scotch-Brite 80/pk NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5096  $26.40 MMM-08293  $31.13  [3M7000029659 $19.69 $25.60 - 050  $12.98 901-MC059166  $39.99
MSC 500/cs 5303713K Valley Janitor Supply 500/cs
Garbage Can Liners 30x36 - $22.00 or Pit PHD20HHC
Black NORAMCO  200/cs Heritage Bag ~ 250/cs |Westcraft  250/cs Prolink .70mil  250/cs Victoria Bay 150 UC 200/cs 202RL NO BID NO BID NO BID Coastwide 0.45mil 250/bx |LNIP303716N500 $34.00 |CentralPoly 500/cs Interplast  500/cs  |UPC 500
NORT3036-XH $19.97 |961-405  $15.55 WCL30363135K  $40.97 (224004 $19.95 VBLH303615B $19.50 $17.90 901-814875  $24.99 #640-126-13915 CP3036KXH $21.99 INT-3037-XH $23.72 [303716K $25.80
MSC 150/cs 5386022K _
Garbage Can Liners 38x58 $20.00 or Pitt Plastics ~ 100/cs Central PolyBag 16microns Interplast  150/cs
Black NORAMCO  100/CS Heritage Bag  100/cs  |Westcraft  100/cs Prolink 1.7mil 100/cs Victoria Bay 100 UC 100/cs 201TXHRL NO BID PITEC385815K $31.31 NOBID Coastwide 1.3mil 100/bx [CP3860K16 200/cs $18.73 CentralPoly 100/cs INT-3860-SuperEX-Hvy [UPC 150
NOR T3858-XXH 967-440  $26.39 WCL385818K $45.95 10305000 $30.95 VBLH385815B $27.00 $18.00 901-420456  $31.99 #640-127-13945 CP3858KXXH $20.99 $24.74 386022K  $20.50
Garbage Can Liners 38x60 Pitt Plastics  50/cs Central PolyBag 16microns
CLEAR NORAMCO  150/CS Pitt Plastics ~ 150/cs Westcraft  100/cs Prolink  22mil  150/cs Victoria Bay 100 MSC  150/cs NO BID SP00012974  $20.82 NO BID Coastwide 1mil 100/bx CP386ON16 200/cs $18.63 CentralPoly  100/cs Interplast  150/cs UPC 150
NOR R386022N $28.40 [920.050  $29.65 WCL385820C $52.50  |108414  $31.95 VBLH385815C  $30.00 SN386022N  $20.00 901814860 $30.99  |1040:127-13947 CP385BNXXH $21.66 SN386022N $24.74 |386022N  $20.50
] KC  200/cs KC  200/cs KC 50shts/pk/4pks/cs KC 200 41029CS [KCC  4bx/cs WypAll Red 200/pk  901]
Red Wipers (41029) 41029  $66.50 KCC-41029  $44.21  |KIMA1029CA  $40.74 NO BID $34.00 41029 $39.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID 24441465 $29.23 NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID
Blue Wipers - (41041) KC  160/bx KC  160/cs KC  160/cs NO BID KC 160 P041041 |KCC41041 160/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID WypAll 160/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
X80 41041  $39.20 874206  $36.10 K41041 $35.59 $27.20 41041  $36.00 901-848717  $31.58
Better Brush ea ODell ea RM ea Janico ea O'Dell ea O'Cedar ea Abco  12/cs (4.69ea) Coastwide 36" ea
Lobby Broom 431106 $4.18 501402 $4.00 NFG637400BLA  $7.54 NOBID BLKLOBBYBRM $4.53 Lobby broom  $3.25 NOBID SP*00011696  $5.41 0032INB $56.28 901-24420005  $3.99 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID
. ACA Enterprises ea LDP
Lobby Dustpan Better Brush  ea ODell  ea Abxo  ea NO BID Janico  ea B452 |impact ea NO BID OCedar  ea Abco  12ea/cs NO BID $5.77 #485-  [NOBID NO BID NO BID
410112 $8.98 518404  $1170  |ADPOO204EH  $9.65 $9.97 Lobby Dust Pan $8.99 SP00013288  $13.29 DPO0204EH  $7.59a 19411450
Valley Janitor Supply
Warehouse Broom (Com) g otyer prush ea ODell ea Carlisle ea NO BID Janico ea 6122 MSC ea NO BID 3?[‘103232103“ $:;.63 Abco  12ea/bundle BR28SE NO BID g;ﬁg;z?r B:;'59858 “ NO BID NO BID NO BID
432033 $11.15 501-303  $11.42 C4135067  $12/35 $8.14 Warhouse Broom $6.98 $8.29ea #485-110-10250
Mop Bucket - RCP7680 only Better Brush Carlisle RM  ea NO BID Newell Brands ~ ea 7580RM NO BID NO BID NO BID RM ea 7580YEL  [RM  ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NFG758088YEL  $105.89 $80.57 $87.98 901-24366885  $109.79
Wet Mop Head - Web Foot RM ea (min.order 6)
(white) RM only not RM RCPV118 NFGA21306WH00 Newel Brands  ea RCP ea NO BID NO BID RM 6ea/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FGA21306WHOO $15.36 NO BID FGA21306WH $12.91 FGA21306  $11.99 FGA21306WHO00 $10.99ea
Pyramid School Products ea
Folding Wet Floor Sign Better Brush  ea Impact  ea RM ea WFC25 24" ea 123443 [Newell Brands ea 0OC6112 |Impact ea NO BID 2?861:523-77 $20.07 Abco  10ea/cs WS0001 Coastwide  ea $45.25 RM 3633922 #801- NO BID NO BID NO BID
150325 $8.42 IMP-9152W  $9.98  [NFG611277YEL  $11.97 [$9.55 $9.76 Wet Floor sign  $6.99 ’ $7.39 901-364979 $6.99 17812110




FORT THOMAS INDEPENDENT SCHOOLS - BID RESULTS FOR 07/01/23 - 06/30/24

Invader  ea

Pyramid School Products RM

Side gate mop handle Better Brush  ea Boardwalk  ea NFGH14600GY00 NO BID Janico ea  608handle  |Impact ea NO BID M ea RCPH146 | Abco  Gealcs 01206NB NO BID H126 ea $17.99 #485- |NO BID NO BID NO BID
151360 $8.63 BWK-620 $9.18 $17.64 $8.82 Side gate $9.50 $26.87 $9.89%ea 172-14410
Floor finish mop head - RM ea
(white) RM only Better Brush Better Brush NFGA41306WHO00 Prolink Newell Brands  ea NO BID NO BID NO BID RM 6ea/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FGA41306WHOO $16.87 FGA41306WH00 $14.68 FGA41306 WHOO $11.99ea
Phillips Supply ea
SS squeegees Better Brush  ea Better Brush ea Unger ea NO BID Unger ea PR350 NO BID NO BID Unger ea Haviland 12ea/cs H14 Unger ea UngerGS300 STE1025 NO BID NO BID NO BID
260414  $3.36 BBP-260414  $7.44 |UPR350  $24.17 $20.35 STE1017  $12.57 $9.98 901-848795  $17.00 $12/60 #485-188-18100
Feminine Napkin Container [Impact  ea Hospeco  ea Hospeco ea RM6140 Recepticle ea Hospeco ea 6140RM |Impact ea NO BID Impact Products  ea Hospeco  4ea/cs 1102 Hospeco 250-201W ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1100 $21.50 HOS-250201W  $26.63 |[HHS6140WP  $30.59 182129  $59.95 $28.75 ABS $22.00 SP*00012161 $26.40 $19.98ea 901-HOS25201W $20.25
Pyramid School Products
Feminine Napkin Liner bags |Impact 500/cs Hospeco  500/cs Hospeco 250/cs RCP6141  250/cs 168459 |Hospeco 250 HS6141 |Hopseco  250/cs NO BID Impact Products  250/cs Hospeco  250/cs HS6141 |[Health Gards 250/pk Hospeco KL260 500/cs RM  250/cs 6141 NO BID NO BID
KL260  $28.95 HOS 260  $30.22 HHS5141  $21.43 $23.95 $20.00 HS6141  $16.99 IMP1101  $34.31 $17.98 901-2864194 $20.99  |$19.98 #485-148-14000  |$110.00
. . HOSPECO  250/cs Hospeco  250/cs Hopseco  250/cs Hospeco  200/cs Hospeco 250 Hospeco  250/cs Rochester Midland ~ 250/cs Hospeco  250/cs MT4 Maxithins 250/ctn Gards  250/cx #4
Mexithins napkins MT-4 $56.15 HOSMT4  $77.38  |HMT4  $61.40 109441  $52.95 147GUARDS $47.50 HosMT-4  $45.00 NOBID ROCA  $56.54 $48.95 MT-4  $41.99 NO BID $98.00 NOBID NOBID
Hospeco Tampax ]
Tampax tampons P&G  500/cs Tampax 500/cs 500/cs HT500 Tampons  200/cs Hospeco 500 VU5 Hospeco  500/cs NO BID Rochester Midland 500/¢cs Hospeco  500/cs  T500 Tampax 500/ctn NO BID Tampax 500/cs  T-500 NO BID NO BID
T500Tampax ~ $67.65 864206 $68.32 $105.14 10610200 $50.95 $70.00 HosT-500  $79.00 ROCPT  $145.59 $80.99 901-PT  $72.00 $99.00
Westcraft  250/cs
Health care bags NO BID Heritage Bag ~ 500/cs  [WCL242412RBIO NO BID XL Plastics 500 1W2424 NO BID NO BID g:;msnggéc:m $35.38 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Interplast  500/cs NO BID
861-140  $49.90 $27.87 $45.00 : INT-2433-XXH $33.32
. Swiffer
i‘i't"ffe' 860 Duster Starter |pg  per kit Thandle w/12 refills ea NO BID P&G 360 starter 3/bx,dbx/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
swiffer 11804  $5.89 PGC-77300 $27.36 199047-CS $44.50
i:"sftf:rr/iftindable Handle ) Swiffer . NO BID Swiffer  ea . ) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
e P&G per kit 1handle w/3dusters/6/cs |PGC Swiffer  6/cs P&G Extend. 6/cs P&G 6 82074PG |P&G  box SP*001889  $16.36 Swiffer  6kts/cs Swiffer 12/pk
W/ refill kit swiffer 82074 $12.32 960-956 $64.28 PGC82074ct $71.16 129011 $64.95 $52.50 PGC82074 $14.00 PGC82074  $10.89kts 901-24429163 $22.71
Swiffer Heavy Duty refills
3 y X . Swiffer 6/bx;4bx/cs
Swiffer 360 Duster Refills |P&G  40/cs Swiffer  40/cs PGC Swiffer  6/bx, 4bx/cs |P&G 360 ref 6/bx,4bx/cs NO BID NO BID LAGPG21620  $54.70 NO BID 6/pk  901-16944Q NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
swiffer 21459 $41.50 |PGC-21459CT $40.85 |PGC21620CT $48.91 199048-CS  $25.50 NO BID : $10.99
Swiffer Wet Jet Mop Starter |pe 5 5/cs Swiffer  2/cs PGC Swiffer  2kts/cs NO BID P&G ea  PGC92811KT [P&G  2/cs NO BID NO BID Swiffer  2/cs Swiffer ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Kit swiffer 92811 $57.90 [PGC-92811CT $63.52 [PGC92811CT  $65.28 $28.15 PGC92811CT  $54.00 PGC92811CT $56.98 901-32694Q $28.49
2:"':1?;’:”:;;:" Cleaning  lpeG  4/cs Swiffer  4btis/cs PGC Swiffer  4/cs NO BID P&G 4  PGC77133 P&G  1.25L/4/cs NO BID NO BID Swiffer  4/cs  PGC77133 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
swiffer 77133 $28.90 PGC-77809 $28.57 PGC77810 $28.93 $25.72 PGC77133  $27.00 $29.98
PGC Swiffer 24/pk,
Swiffer YVet Jet Mopping P&G  24/bx Swiffer  24/bx 4pks/cs PGCO8442CT NO BID P&G 24 PGC08443|P&G  24/bx;4bx/cs NO BID NO BID Swiffer 24/bx Swiffer pad refill 24/bx NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pad Refill swiffer 08443 $17.65 PAC-08443  $16.82 $76.40 $21.36 PGC08443CT $60.00 PGC08443 $14.99 #901-08443  $14.44
] Amrep Misty Crystal
Dust Mop Treatment Chase  12cans/cs Spartan  1G/4/cs Spartan  1G/4/cs Prolink Chase 12cns/cs Spartan 4 301304 MSC  1G/4/cs NO BID ((i:_ﬁzspgéios,zéiz/czgz 79 NO BID 1G/4/ctn  901-801509 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CH5152 $34.36 635-203 $32.82 SPA301304  $37.51 109546 $53.50 $32.80 4/1G $89.00 : $90.99
Microfiber Cleaning Cloth . N REAIEIRIEED el
16716 (red) Better Brush  12/pk ODell  12/pkg RM ea Hospeco Red 180/cs Victoria Bay 24 NO BID NO BID NO BID Monarch 12/pk RM 12/pk 901- |MFMP16 (RD) $5.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3801161R  $10.46 535-433 $8.58 NFGQ62000RDO0  $2.74 |100107000? $110.95 VBWPM16R $16.80 M915107RED  $5.76 887265CBR  $75.99 #850-192-14550
ACA Enterprises 12/pk
Microfiber cloths - (blue) Better Brush  12/pk ODell  12/pkg RM ea Hospeco Blue 180/cs Victoria Bay 24 NO BID NO BID RM 12/cs Monarch 12/pk RM  12/pk MFMP16 (pBL) $5.2§3p NO BID NO BID NO BID
16%16" 380216B $11.38 535-431 $9.02 NFGQ63000BL00 $3.26 (10010800 $125.90 VBWPM16L $16.80 RUBQG20BLUE  $60.72 M915107Blue  $5.76 901-659363CBR  $31.40 |#850-192-14550
RM ea
r;f:::i;fg;;%&%g’e" Better Brush RCRP'\_AQ 40965LU NFGA85306GR00 Prolink Newell Brands  ea RM  6/cs NO BID NO BID RM  6ea/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
$19.90 FGA85306GR0O0 $17.19 RCP A 85206 GRE $79.98 FGA85306GR0O0 $14.29ea
Batteries Plus 24/pk
Procell AAA Batteries ProCell  24/pk Duracell 24/bx Duracell  24/pk NO BID Duracell  24/pk NO BID NO BID NO BID Duracell  24/bx Procell PC2400 24/pk RAYALAAA-CP24 $6.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
PC2400BKD  $9.95 967-613 $9.84 DPC2400 $10.09 AAABATTERY $10.32 PC2400BKD $14.16 901-PC2400  $8.09 #450-006-19050
Procell PCI500BKDO01 Batteries Plus 24/pk
Procell AA Batteries ProCell  24/pk Duracell ~ 24/bx Duracell  24/pk NO BID Duracell  24/pk NO BID NO BID NO BID Duracell ~ 24/bx 24/pk  901-PC1500 RAYALAA-CP24 $6.00 #450- NO BID NO BID NO BID
PC1500BKD  $9.90 967-612 $9.84 DPC1500 $10.97 AABATTERY  $9.60 PC1500BKD $13.92 $7.80 006-19055
Batteries Plus 12/pk
Procell C Batteries ProCell  12/pk Duracell  12/bx Duracell  12/pk NO BID Duracell  12/pk NO BID NO BID NO BID Duracell  12/bx PC1400 |Procell PC1400 12/pk RAYALC-CP $7.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID
PC1400 $11.45 966-501 $11.89 DPC1400 $11.49 CBATTERY $13.80 $14.52 901-PC1400 $7.16 #450-006-19060
Batteries Plus 12/pk
Procell D Batteries ProCell  12/pk Duracell  12/bx Duracell  12/pk NO BID Duracell  12/pk NO BID NO BID NO BID Duracell  12/bx PC1300 (Procell PC1300 12/pk RAYALD-CP  $9.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID
PC1300 $14.48 968-458 $16.29 DPC1300 $11.88 DBATTERY  $16.92 $18.24 901-PC1300 $9.83 #450-006-19065
Batteries Plus  12/pk
Procell 9V batteries ProCell  12/pk Duracell ~ 12/bx Duracell  12/pk NO BID Duracell  12/pk NO BID NO BID NO BID Duracell  12/bx Procell PC1604BK 12/pk |RAYALOVA $11.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID
PC1604BKD $20.24 966-145 $20.38 DPC1604  $21.87 9VBATTERY $20.88 PC1604BKD $23.76 901-PC1604 $14.99 #450-006-19070
Dart  1000/cs Dart 1000/cs Dart 1000/cs Dart 1000 1212 Dart 1000/cs Dart  1000/ct 9011
12 oz Foam Cup 12012 $49.35 107-404 g46.20 DCC1212  $61.48 NOBID $49.00 NOBID NOBID SAATH12C /$63.50 NO BID 12012 $64.44 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID
Vacuum Bags - Sebo 370 [SEBO  10/pk M&M Vac 10 SEBO5093 [SEBO 10/bx
comfort g WIR1405-10  $15.95 NO BID Windsor NO BID $19.30 5093AM  $22.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pyramid School Products
28 Quart Garbage Cans Better Brush  ea RM ea RM ea NO BID Newell Brands  ea RM ea NO BID 2?82922& s0.88 RM  12ea/cs 2956BLA |Coastwide (beige) ea RM2956 1095058 ea RM ea 2956 NO BID NO BID
211728BK  $8.04 RCP-295600BK $7.20 |NFG295600BLA $7.74 2956BLK $5.95 2956 $7.00 : $5.99ea 901-29560 $5.99 $6.65 #615-195-12970 $7.00
RM  ea
41 Quart Garbage Cans RM ea RM ea NFG295700BLA NO BID Newell Brands ea RM ea NO BID 2?823278& $18.60 RM  12ea/cs 2957BLA [Coastwide (beige) ea NO BID RM ea NO BID NO BID
2957 $11.48 970-535 $12.95 $14.58 2957BLK  $9.08 2957 $11.99 : $10.99ea 901-29570  $7.99 2957 $10.33
RM  ea Phillips Supply ea RM
Brute Garbage Cans 44G [Better Brush ea RM ea NFG264360GRAY NO BID Newell Brands ea RM ea NO BID 2?82646;6 $82.08 RM 4ea/cs 2643GRA RM ea RUB2643G $48.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID
210144GY  $51.75 982-295 $57.16 $48.40 4444GY $41.58 2643GRA  $39.00 : $49.98ea 901-705144  $94.99 #485-134-13620
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RM ea

Brute Garbage Cans 55G [Better Brush ea RM ea RM ea NO BID Newell Brands ea RM ea NO BID RUB2655G s125.01 RM  3ea/cs 2655GRA RM ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
210155GY $61.40 966-572 $91.50 NFG265500GRAY  $72.89 2655GRAY  $53.55 2655 GRA  $63.00 : $79.98ea 901-812585CBR  $132.29

Brute Container Lid 44G  |Better Brush  ea RM ea RM  ea NO BID Newell Brands ea 264560 (RM  ea NO BID 2?82645? $28.27 RM  4ea/cs 2645- NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
210244GY $8.90 RCP-264560GY  $26.75 [NFG264560BLA $17.90 $13.91 2645-60 BLA  $16.00 . 60BLA $17.98ea

Brute Container Lid 55G  [Better Brush  ea RM ea RM  ea NO BID Newell Brands  ea RM  ea NO BID 2?82654668 $42.05 RM  3ea/cs 2654GRA  [RM  ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
210255GY $13.34 968-982 $36.34 NFG265400GRAY  $26.10 2654GRAY  $17.25 2654-GRA $36.00 : $21.99ea 901-847810 $25.99

Focial i Boardwalk Westcraft Zep Boardwalk 30/100ct | Tork 100/bx;30bx/cs Quill 2ply ig’(‘)”;' _Z%Z’Bag 2030

acial Tissues GEN 30bx/cs 100/bx,30bx/cs 100/bx,30bx/cs WC6501  [Royalty  100/bx,30bx/cs Victoria Bay 30 Cascade  30bx/cs #C50101 $44.30 BAY13000  $29.69 Boardwalk 100/bx;30bx/cs 100/bx;30bx/ctn 22/03’ #62/00?.70 14800 Resolute 30/100/cs NO BID NO BID

GEN6501  $18.40 BWK-6500 $26.19 ($36.22 10638908 $19.95 VBFACIAL  $22.50 Facial Tissue $23.95 BWK6500B $25.99 901-7TF830CT  $37.15 $22. B 324330 $28.99

Stigler Supply - $100.00 minimum order for free shippin or 10% of order charged for shipping. Reference "Member of Unified Purchasing Cooperative - Cincinnati"

Valley Janitorial - $200.00 minimum order for free shipping or 10% of order charged for shipping. Reference "Member of Unified Purchasing Cooperative - Cincinnati"

Batteries Plus - Minimum $20.00 order for free shipping or 10% of order charged for shipping.

ACA Enterprises - $300.00 minimum order for free shipping or 10% of order charged for shipping. Reference "Member of Unified Purchasing Cool

perative - Cincinnati"

Central Poly Bag - $300.00 minimum order for free shipping or 10% of order charged for shipping. Reference "192858"

Pyramid School Products - $50 minimum order for free shipping or 10% of order charged for shipping. Reference "CU-2025(Unified Purchasing)
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