2024-2025 CUSTODIAL BID TABULATION

CUSTODIAL BID
2025-2026

Sam Tell &
Uni-Pac Pyramid Acorn HP Products Quill Phillips Supply All Pro Central Poly 3lobal Industria Sons, Inc
LINE USE |ITEM DESCRIPTION
1 5 Adult Personal Wipes, Rigid Lens, 8.7"x12.6", 48/pk/case No Bid 4719 26.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 14 |Air Freshener, Fresh Easy, Mango, each No Bid 3.73 3.75 53.58 No Bid No Bid 3.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Air Freshener Dispenser, HOSPECPO, each No Bid 19.63 30.76 24.20 No Bid No Bid 24.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 2 Air Freshener, HOSPECO, metered aerosol, Cinammon, 12/70z/case No Bid 42.69 47.68 4.48 No Bid 59.31 46.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 3 Air Freshener, HOSPECO, metered aerosol, Fresh Linen, 12/70z/case No Bid 42.69 47.68 4.48 No Bid 59.31 46.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 6 Air Freshener, HOSPECO, metered aerosol, Sunburst, 12/70z/case No Bid 42.69 47.68 4.53 No Bid 59.31 46.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 9 Air Freshener Dispenser, Kim Care, Continous Air Dispenser, white, each No Bid 19.63 6.18 1.47 No Bid 10.84 19.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 5 Air Freshener, Kim Care, Continous Air Refill, Summer Fresh, 6/case No Bid No Bid 67.13 83.81 No Bid 75.85 43.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 3 Air Freshener, Kim Care, Continous Air Refill, Citrus, 6/case No Bid No Bid 79.02 17.04 No Bid 75.85 43.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 Air Freshener, TC MicroBurst 3000, preference pack No Bid 50.28 78.81 5.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 20 Air Freshener & Deodorizer, aerosol, Frebreze or equal, can No Bid 3.89 20.53 26.57 No Bid 5.47 31.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 Auto Scrubber, Tennent, TEN1217820, backer pad, 20"x14"x1", each No Bid No Bid 69.25 No Bid No Bid 77.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 2 Auto Scrubber, Tennent, hose assembly, w/2 cuff, each No Bid No Bid 20.39 No Bid No Bid 22.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 2 Auto Scrubber, Tennent, squeegee blade, T300/T500, front, each No Bid No Bid 13.89 No Bid No Bid 15.31 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 4 Auto Scrubber, Tennent, squeegee blade, T300/T500, rear, each No Bid No Bid 15.72 No Bid No Bid 17.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 2 Auto Scrubber, Tennent, squeegee replacement head, 18" window, each No Bid No Bid 17.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
17 Auto Scrubber, Tennent, squeegee replacement head, 18" handle, each No Bid No Bid 5.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18 48 Batteries, AA alkaline, Energizer or Duracell, 24/box No Bid 9.60 9.96 19.74 7.80 No Bid 9.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid
19 61 Batteries, AAA alkaline, Energizer or Duracell, 24/box No Bid 9.60 9.96 16.22 8.09 No Bid 9.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 15 Batteries, D alkaline, Energizer or Duracell, 12/box No Bid 16.08 16.51 14.36 13.47 No Bid 16.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid
21 5 Batteries, C alkaline, Energizer or Duracell, 12/box No Bid 10.56 12.04 11.60 12.83 No Bid 12.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid
22 Batteries, 9-Volt alkaline, Energizer or Duracell, 12/box No Bid 19.80 20.64 21.85 24.28 No Bid 20.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
23 2 Bed Bug Spray, Steri-Fab, 1 gallon No Bid No Bid 118.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid 74.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 1 Bed Bug Spray, Steri-Fab, 4 gallon/case No Bid No Bid 118.02 380.88 No Bid No Bid 298.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 1 Bed Bug Sprayer, Steri-Fab, each No Bid No Bid 118.02 No Bid No Bid 8.35 32.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 7 Carpet Shampoo, BETCO, 4/1gallon/case No Bid No Bid 38.85 40.60 65.39 54.74 53.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 4 Carpet Spot Remover, BETCO, 12/1quart/case No Bid No Bid 42.68 64.64 51.38 42.59 35.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
28 2 Defoamer, BETCO, 4/1gallon/case No Bid No Bid 62.67 100.03 74.07 55.42 42.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
29 89 Bleach, Clorox, 3/1210z/case No Bid No Bid 22.33 34.68 26.48 25.09 24.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30 16  |Bleach, Purebight H6, 6/1gallon/case No Bid No Bid 22.36 21.06 38.45 27.88 22.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid
31 10  [Blue micro fiber cleaning cloth, 12"x12", each No Bid 0.50 6.35 13.90 No Bid 12.28 0.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid
32 Bowl, clr short, F1005302, filter caps, Tennent, each (for floor scrubber) No Bid No Bid 11.86 No Bid No Bid 13.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
33 Broom, large angle, wood handle 51", each No Bid 4.99 5.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid
34 121 Broom, nylon, indoor, angle, metal handle 51", each No Bid 4.89 6.45 7.53 No Bid 14.78 7.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid
35 2 Broom, soft bristle push broom, 24", each No Bid 9.89 11.38 29.55 24.38 28.58 9.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36 22  |Bucket, 10 quart, Rubbermaid or equivalent, each No Bid 6.94 13.03 16.54 15.53 6.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid
37 4 Deodorizer, water soluble, lemon scent, quart No Bid No Bid 64.84 29.22 No Bid 5.97 46.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid
38 32 |Dishwashing liquid, Dawn, 8/320z/case No Bid 54.45 52.31 77.36 50.83 68.35 56.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid
39 Disinfectant all purpose cleaner spray, Clorox, bleach free, lemon scent, 320z., 9/case No Bid 52.99 62.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid 34.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
40 Disinfectant bathroom cleaner w/bleach, Clorox Commercial Solutions, 300z., 9/case No Bid 51.99 49.87 No Bid 52.33 No Bid 55.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid
41 15 |Disinfectant deodorizer, wintergreen, 4/1gallon/case No Bid No Bid 43.71 No Bid No Bid 52.01 48.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid
42 7 Disinfectant spray, Clorox, fresh scent, 12/190z/case No Bid 80.98 72.72 129.24 77.61 87.37 29.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid
43 8 Disinfectant spray, Lysol, crisp linen scent, 12/190z/case No Bid 109.98 110.01 55.89 105.99 152.17 29.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid
44 7 Disinfectant wipes, Clorox, fresh scent, 12/35ct/case No Bid 46.98 37.84 47.07 No Bid 39.84 43.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid
45 7 Disinfectant wipes, Clorox, lemon scent, 12/35ct/case No Bid 47.03 37.84 47.65 No Bid 40.26 43.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid
46 2 Disinfectant wipes, Lysol, lemon scent, 6/80ct/case No Bid 34.96 37.84 36.84 31.99 40.26 33.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid
47 5 Distilled water, gallon, 4/1gallon/case No Bid No Bid 15.00 9.32 No Bid No Bid 14.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48 3 Doodlebug, pad holder, w/o handle, each No Bid 4.97 5.87 6.44 No Bid 6.31 4.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid
49 Doodlebug, scrubber pads, 20/case No Bid 15.98 20.05 10.14 No Bid No Bid 18.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
50 3 Drain opener, non-acid for drains/grease traps, 12/32oz/case No Bid No Bid 39.19 42.07 No Bid 44.63 43.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid
51 3 Dust cloth, treated, 17"x24", 4/50/case No Bid 42.98 74.55 86.32 No Bid 109.67 74.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid




52 Dust mop, Infinity Twist, white, 5"x60", each No Bid 17.98 17.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid
53 2 Dust mop frame, 24"x5", each No Bid 3.79 2.80 2.95 5.45 4.07 3.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid
54 Dust mop frame, 48"x5", each No Bid 5.75 4.95 el 9.86 No Bid 5.19 No Bid No Bid No Bid
55 2 Dust mop handle, yellow fiberglass, clip-on, 15/16"x60", each No Bid 14.79 13.42 22.69 12.74 10.51 15.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
56 46 Dust mop head, fits 24"x5" frame, each No Bid 4.59 4.47 8.23 3.97 8.13 4.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid
57 3 Dust mop head, fits 48"x5" frame, each No Bid 7.89 8.13 7.80 6.17 17.58 7.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid
58 3 Dust mop spray, 170z, 12 cans/case No Bid 40.98 53.24 55.84 No Bid 82.72 36.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid
59 55 |Dust pan, lobby, each No Bid 8.25 11.62 16.49 21.19 13.29 9.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid
60 Dust pan, hand held, each No Bid 3.29 6.60 4.10 5.46 No Bid 2.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid
61 4 Duster microfiber, telescoping, each No Bid 5.78 6.07 5.49 No Bid 8.21 6.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
62 2 Easy trap duster, 8"x6", 250 sheets/roll, 1 roll/case No Bid 59.59 103.07 50.82 No Bid 53.04 65.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid
63 Exhaust filter, vaccum, Karcher 2846, each No Bid No Bid 27.73 7.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
64 39 Facial tissue, 8"x8-3/10", 100/box, 30 boxes/case - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid 29.98 18.47 37.17 No Bid 60.92 17.93 33.00 No Bid No Bid
65 5 Floor buffing pad, 3M ONLY, 17", round, red, 5/case No Bid No Bid 27.08 12.61 No Bid 12.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66 Floor buffing pad, 3M ONLY, 20", round, red, 5/case No Bid No Bid 35.04 16.14 37.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
67 Floor buffing pad, 3M ONLY, 14"x20", rectangle, red, 5/case No Bid No Bid 66.96 83.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
68 Floor cleaning pad, 3M ONLY, 17", round, blue, 5/case No Bid No Bid 27.08 25.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
69 10 Floor cleaning pad, 3M ONLY, 20", round, blue, 5/case No Bid No Bid 35.04 33.12 33.82 16.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
70 Floor cleaning pad, 3M ONLY, 14"x20", rectangle, blue, 5/case No Bid No Bid No Bid 83.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 Floor polishing pad, 3M ONLY, 17", round, white, 5/case No Bid No Bid 27.08 12.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
72 Floor polishing pad, 3M ONLY, 20", round, white, 5/case No Bid No Bid 35.04 16.13 30.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
73 8 Floor polishing pad, 3M ONLY, 14"x20", rectangle, white, 5/case No Bid No Bid 24.42 42.87 No Bid 41.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
74 Floor stripping pad, 3M ONLY, 17", round, black, 5/case No Bid No Bid 27.83 12.46 35.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
75 29 Floor stripping pad, 3M ONLY, 20", round, black, 5/case No Bid No Bid 36.02 16.16 30.65 84.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
76 Floor stripping pad, 3M ONLY, 14"x20", rectangle, black, 5/case No Bid No Bid 26.11 4414 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
77 Floor surface prep pad, 3M ONLY, 17", round, maroon, 10/case No Bid No Bid 85.22 106.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
78 3 Floor surface prep pad, 3M ONLY, 20", round, maroon, 10/case No Bid No Bid 100.72 125.99 No Bid 59.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
79 6 Floor surface prep pad, 3M ONLY, 14"x20", rectangle, maroon, 10/case No Bid No Bid 142.31 179.24 No Bid 69.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
80 10 Garbage can, classroom size, small, 40-41 qt, each No Bid 10.89 8.22 14.44 11.13 18.60 9.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid
81 Garbage can, round, grey, 44-45 gallon, each No Bid 40.98 50.18 47.99 68.84 No Bid 53.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid
82 Garbage can dollie w/wheels, round, grey, fits 44-45 gallon can, each No Bid 28.99 49.38 40.55 No Bid No Bid 32.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
83 Gloves, latex, disposable, small, 100/box - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid 3.89 4.45 6.72 No Bid No Bid 3.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid
84 25 |Gloves, latex, disposable, medium, 100/box - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid 3.89 4.45 6.72 No Bid 4.24 3.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid
85 137 |Gloves, latex, disposable, large, 100/box - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid 3.89 4.45 6.72 No Bid 4.24 3.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid
86 112 |Gloves, latex, disposable, x-large, 100/box - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid 3.89 4.45 6.72 No Bid 4.24 3.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid
87 Gloves, vinyl, powder free, disposable, small, 100/box - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid 2.89 21.83 3.33 No Bid No Bid 2.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
88 Gloves, vinyl, powder free, disposable, medium, 100/box - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid 2.89 21.83 3.33 No Bid 2.22 2.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
89 40 Gloves, vinyl, powder free, disposable, large, 100/box - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid 2.89 21.83 3.33 No Bid 2.22 2.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
90 43 Gloves, vinyl, powder free, disposable, x-large, 100/box - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid 2.89 21.83 3.33 No Bid 2.22 2.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
91 Gloves, vinyl, disposable, small, 100/box - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid 2.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
92 35 |Gloves, vinyl, disposable, medium, 100/box - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid 2.89 21.83 No Bid No Bid 222 2.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
93 35 |Gloves, vinyl, disposable, large, 100/box - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid 2.89 21.83 No Bid No Bid 2.22 2.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
94 172 |Gloves, vinyl, disposable, x-large, 100/box - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid 2.89 21.83 No Bid No Bid 222 2.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
95 Gloves, vinyl, 5mil, disposable, small, 100/box - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid 2.89 39.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
96 10  |Gloves, vinyl, 5mil, disposable, medium, 100/box - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid 2.89 34.80 4.55 No Bid 3.68 2.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
97 10  |Gloves, vinyl, 5mil, disposable, large, 100/box - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid 2.89 34.80 4.55 No Bid 3.68 2.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
98 20 Gloves, vinyl, 5mil, disposable, x-large, 100/box - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid 2.89 34.80 4.55 No Bid 3.68 2.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
99 16  |Grip & grab reaching tool, 36", each No Bid 10.98 23.57 41.53 No Bid 15.67 10.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid
100 Handle, wood, threaded, 5/16"x60", each No Bid 3.13 3.20 3.67 No Bid No Bid 3.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid
101 10 Laundry detergent, 25 oz bottle, each No Bid No Bid 38.09 No Bid No Bid 109.14 10.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid
102 3 Liquid, Nilodor-deod, 4/1gal/case No Bid No Bid 64.85 29.22 No Bid 92.66 48.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid
103 14  [Magic eraser sponges, Mr. Clean, 6/6ct/case No Bid 36.59 35.74 47.43 42.99 53.47 33.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
104 Microfiber finish system, includes: bucket w/lid, sleeve, pads & frame, each No Bid 173.99 257.66 182.23 No Bid No Bid 79.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid
105 Microphygeine filter, 531ER, each No Bid No Bid 5.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
106 9 Mop, wet, fiberglass gripper clamp style, 60" handle, each No Bid 13.98 21.37 26.46 27.25 25.68 4.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid
107 19  [Mop, rayon 240z (used for wax application), each No Bid 7.69 8.73 9.97 No Bid 10.11 5.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid
108 5 Mop bucket w/ wringer & splash guard, each No Bid 58.99 90.83 107.83 79.70 103.79 66.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
109 22 Mop superstitch brand, blue, 6/case No Bid 47.94 8.57 10.58 No Bid 55.09 4.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid




110 13 Paper towel dispenser, fits 8"'x800' roll, each No Bid No Bid 61.78 71.51 44.99 No Bid 64.75 55.00 No Bid No Bid
111 300 |Paper towels, hard roll, 7-9/10"x800', 6 rolls/case - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid No Bid 21.32 32.04 No Bid 88.29 22.85 30.99 No Bid No Bid
112 61 Paper towels, multi-fold, 9-3/8"x250"' 16 packs/case - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid No Bid 18.61 25.46 No Bid 42.86 22.50 25.10 No Bid No Bid
113 107 |Plastic liners, coreless, 16 micron, fits 33 gal can, heavyweight, 33"x40", case - SAMPLE H No Bid No Bid 22.55 22.82 No Bid 27.12 20.98 21.99 No Bid No Bid
114 137 |Plastic liners, coreless, 1.5 mil, 38"x58", case - SAMPLE REQUIRED 27.50 No Bid 29.52 29.74 No Bid 31.31 20.96 28.00 No Bid No Bid
115 190 |Plastic liners, coreless, 22 micron, fits 33 gal can, 34"x40", case - SAMPLE REQUIRED 29.40 No Bid 34.15 35.62 No Bid 34.95 24.87 30.00 No Bid No Bid
116 64 Plastic liners, coreless, 22 micron, fits 40-45 gal can, heavyweight, 40"x48", case - SAMPL] No Bid No Bid 28.89 33.61 No Bid 30.54 23.70 20.00 No Bid No Bid
117 2 Plastic liners, coreless, 2 mil (heaviest mil), 33"x39", case - SAMPLE REQUIRED 23.75 No Bid 21.88 35.36 No Bid 21.52 17.18 28.66 No Bid No Bid
118 37  |Plastic liners, coreless, 2 mil (heaviest mil), 38"x58", case - SAMPLE REQUIRED 35.80 No Bid 40.95 48.43 No Bid 24.44 28.87 38.66 No Bid No Bid
119 19  |Plastic liners, heavy duty, 37"x30"x36", case - SAMPLE REQUIRED 18.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 23.68 44.93 No Bid No Bid
120 5 Plunger, toilet, each No Bid 5.39 5.37 719 4.99 6.26 4.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid
121 3 Plunger, water fountain, 6" red force cup, each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid
122 Shovel, poly snow pusher, 50" w/2" blade, each No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.60 No Bid No Bid 6.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid
123 4 Polywool duster, extendable 52"-84", each No Bid 7.59 8.53 10.22 No Bid 8.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
124 Pouch easy shine reusable, 3M, 5/case No Bid No Bid 69.87 11.87 No Bid No Bid 78.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid
125 2 Rags, terry cloth, 25#, new, 12"x12", 25Ib/case - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid No Bid 48.36 13.97 No Bid 22.09 75.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
126 2 Rags, terry cloth, 25#, new, 18"x18", 25lb/case - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid No Bid 48.80 No Bid No Bid 22.09 75.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
127 19 Rags, terry cloth, new, white, 22"x24", 25/pack - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 22.09 83.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
128 3 Sanitary napkin wax bags, Rubbermaid, 8.75"x8.5", 250/case No Bid 23.25 35.32 29.88 36.17 34.31 33.12 38.00 No Bid No Bid
129 2 Scouring pad, heavyduty, green, 4"x6", pack No Bid 3.29 6.19 25.45 No Bid No Bid 5.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid
130 7 Scraper, short handle, Unger, 12", each No Bid 22.98 3.73 24.34 No Bid No Bid 6.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
131 14 Scraper, floor & window, Unger, 48", each No Bid 27.19 20.41 29.47 No Bid 17.87 13.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid
132 2 Scraper, handle, Unger, 4", each No Bid 4.69 3.73 25.13 25.29 19.19 13.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid
133 1 Soap dispenser, Bobrick, contura liquid, pump style, each No Bid No Bid 84.00 89.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
134 35 Soap dispenser, Impact ClearVu Encore, clear, 300z tank, each No Bid 16.99 11.44 26.41 No Bid No Bid 20.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid
135 47 Soap, foam hand soap, Kutol, 4/1gal/case No Bid No Bid 4419 46.62 No Bid 76.26 29.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid
136 19 Soap, liquid hand soap, antibacterial, Kutol, 4/1gal/case No Bid No Bid 46.56 57.68 No Bid No Bid 23.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid
137 34 |Soap, liquid hand soap, antibacterial, GOJO, 4/1gal/case No Bid 82.98 62.49 76.56 No Bid No Bid 23.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid
138 10 [Spill absorber (vomit cleanup), Tolco Soakit, 25/1Ib/case No Bid 89.10 77.30 69.71 No Bid 61.72 56.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
139 4 Spill absorber (vomit cleanup), Nilodor Nilogel deodorizing, 6/120z/case No Bid 48.99 42.48 74.04 No Bid 61.72 4414 No Bid No Bid No Bid
140 Sponge mop handle, heavy duty, speedy steel handle w/12" head, each No Bid 21.99 38.06 25.66 No Bid No Bid 23.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid
141 Sponge mop refill head, each No Bid 11.89 16.97 11.81 No Bid No Bid 12.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid
142 50 [Spray bottle with trigger, plastic, heavy duty, 320z., each No Bid 1.79 0.78 3.56 3.89 1.28 1.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
143 2 Swiffer duster kits, 6/case No Bid 33.55 33.38 40.56 No Bid 16.36 36.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid
144 3 Swiffer duster refills, hand held, 4/10ct/case No Bid 38.99 40.39 49.57 No Bid 54.70 43.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
145 Squeegee blade, rear, 32.68L, Lin Qtez (500)M, Tennent, each No Bid No Bid 15.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
146 Tilt truck , standard duty, black, 3/4 CU YD, Rubbermaid, FG101300BLA, each No Bid 699.98 709.49 627.01 No Bid No Bid 736.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
147 Tilt truck , standard duty, black, 1 CU YD, Rubbermaid, FG101500BLA, each No Bid 849.95 869.33 734.43 No Bid No Bid 954.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
148 15 |Toilet bowl cleaner, acid, 12/1qt/case No Bid No Bid 27.33 26.62 27.06 64.68 28.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid
149 5 Toilet bow! cleaner, non acid, 12/1qt/case No Bid No Bid 32.51 29.30 26.40 30.95 23.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid
150 120 |Toilet bowl swab, synthetic fiber head, 12" plastic handle, each No Bid 0.87 0.85 1.09 1.72 1.00 0.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid
151 184 |Toilet paper, standard roll, white, 2ply, 4.06"x3.66", 500sheets/roll, 96 rolls/case - SAMPLE| No Bid No Bid 45.50 59.21 No Bid 68.52 39.50 46.99 No Bid No Bid
152 2 Toilet paper, jumbo roll, white, 2ply, 1000'x3-3/10", 12 rolls/case - SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid No Bid 27.67 36.59 No Bid 51.96 26.75 35.99 No Bid No Bid
153 50 |Toilet paper dispenser, mini-twin, standard roll, transclucent black, each No Bid 39.99 2416 20.74 No Bid 20.33 21.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid
154 10 Toilet paper dispenser, jumbo roll, double roll, smoke, each No Bid 49.99 32.50 20.74 16.76 38.20 28.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid
155 Trailblazer disp finish kit, Maniford, 2 hoses, 1 shower cap, 5 kits/case No Bid No Bid 89.45 121.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
156 Trailblazer finish pads, 3 pads/case No Bid No Bid 98.34 80.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
157 Urinal cakes, 3oz., cherry, 12/case No Bid 9.98 6.79 12.30 14.18 No Bid 10.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid
158 6 Urinal screen, anti-splash, 10/box No Bid 22.18 45.73 32.09 No Bid 23.48 21.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
159 15 Urinal screen, anti-splash, black cherry, 10/box No Bid 22.18 13.84 32.09 No Bid 23.48 21.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
160 16 Urinal screen, anti-splash, cotton blossom, 10/box No Bid 22.18 20.09 32.09 21.49 23.48 21.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
161 10 Urinal screen, anti-splash, cucumber melon, 10/box No Bid 22.18 20.09 32.09 21.65 23.48 21.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
162 13 Urinal screen, anti-splash, mango, 10/box No Bid 22.18 20.09 32.09 21.27 23.48 21.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
163 10  |Urinal screen, anti-splash, mint, 10/box No Bid 22.18 20.09 32.09 No Bid 23.48 21.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
164 8 Urinal screen, anti-splash, spiced apple, 10/box No Bid 22.18 20.09 32.09 21.10 23.48 21.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
165 18 Urine remover, Clorox ONLY, 320z., each No Bid 6.26 30.27 6.44 No Bid 54.14 5.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid
166 2 Vacuum cleaner, Versamatic Karcher, 14", HEPA dual motor, upright, each No Bid No Bid 458.12 790.43 No Bid 744.02 445.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
167 Vacuum cleaner, Pacer 12, upright, each No Bid No Bid 72.52 611.42 No Bid 504.73 249.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid




168 5 Vacuum bags, fits; Windsor Sensor S/S2/XP/Versamatic Plus, 10/pack No Bid No Bid 13.71 25.10 No Bid 11.66 11.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
169 11 |Vacuum bags, fits; Pacer 12/15 (NSS96-191-1), 10/pack No Bid No Bid 29.52 46.09 No Bid 7.85 13.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid
170 Vaccum belt, Versamatic Karcher, each No Bid No Bid 22.67 23.21 No Bid No Bid 27.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
171 Vaccum bristle strip, Versamatic Karcher, 14", red, each No Bid No Bid 6.45 21.10 No Bid No Bid 23.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid
172 Vacuum micro filter, Versamatic Karcher, for S12/S15/S18/XP12/XP18, each No Bid No Bid 1.12 21.80 No Bid No Bid 9.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid
173 1 Vacuum belt replacement kit, Pacer 12 (NSS96-717-9), 2/pack No Bid No Bid 72.52 69.01 No Bid 59.42 63.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
174 1 Vaccum filter, motor filter, Versamatic (WIN1044), each No Bid No Bid 13.38 9.95 No Bid 1.05 22.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid
175 1 Vaccum filter, exhaust filter, Versamatic (WIN86431030), each No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.68 No Bid 11.98 34.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
176 1 Vacuum filter, HEPA, Pacer 12 (NSS96-005-1), each No Bid No Bid 41.18 49.75 No Bid 40.60 19.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid
177 7 Vaccum filter, motor, Pacer 12 (NSS96-074-1), each No Bid No Bid 13.38 18.11 No Bid 14.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
178 8 Vacuum power cord, Pacer 12, 120V, 40', each No Bid No Bid 69.54 75.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
179 1 Vacuum filter kit, HEPA, Windsor Sensor S2, upright, each No Bid No Bid No Bid 28.26 No Bid No Bid 37.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
180 63 |Vinegar, all purpose cleaning, gallon No Bid No Bid 13.73 10.43 No Bid No Bid 3.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid
181 Wall wash kit; 1 handle, 1 head, 2 cotton pads, Rubbermaid, each No Bid 70.98 71.27 75.58 No Bid No Bid 74.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid
182 Wall wash replacement pads, launderable cotton, 9"x5", white, 12/pack No Bid 126.96 15.67 128.76 No Bid No Bid 39.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid
183 24 Window cleaner, aerosol, 200z., 12/case No Bid 33.98 39.05 54.60 40.26 50.87 29.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid
184 3 Window cleaner, liquid, 4/1gal/case No Bid No Bid 55.73 31.97 26.10 No Bid 24.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Items below will be awarded to a single vendor - Diversey products ONLY - NO SUBSTITUTES
185 22 Bathmate disinfectant cleaner, Diversey, fresh scent, 12/320z/case No Bid No Bid 27.05 DISC. 30.91 No Bid 30.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
186 Bowl & bathroom disinfectant cleaner, Diversey, J-Fill, Crew, non-acid, 2/2.5liters/case No Bid No Bid 94.82 104.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
187 Cleaner general purpose, Diversey, J-Fill, citrus scent, 2/2 5liters/case No Bid No Bid 182.74 115.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
188 53 Cleaner neutral disinfectant, Diversey, J-Fill, Morning Mist, 2/2.5liters/case No Bid No Bid 87.94 M.M.No J Fi 77.45 No Bid 68.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
189 59 Floor finish wax, Diversey, DIV95104811, High Mileage, 5 gal/case No Bid No Bid 125.08 190.72 No Bid 132.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
190 31 Floor finish wax, Diversey, DIV5104984, TimeSaver, 5 gal/case No Bid No Bid 125.08 T.S. Disc 190.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
191 60 Floor neutral cleaner, Diversey, J-Fill, Stride, citrus scent, 2-2.5liters/case No Bid No Bid 182.74 279.16 No Bid 205.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
192 7 Floor wax stripper, Diversey, DIV95032360, Pro 5, 5 gal/case No Bid No Bid 103.33 118.54 No Bid 113.07 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
193 4 Glass cleaner, Diversey, J-Fill, Glance, 2/2.5 liters/case No Bid No Bid 66.47 95.76 No Bid 76.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
194 Snapback floor shine, Diversey, 4/1gal/case No Bid No Bid 97.34 133.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
195 17 Speedball, heavy duty power cleaner/degreaser, Diversey, J-Fill, citrus scent, 2/2.5liters/ca| No Bid No Bid 97.30 113.64 No Bid 108.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
196 16 Spitfire, power cleaner, Diversey, J-Fill, 2/2.5liters/case No Bid No Bid 101.01 115.11 No Bid 109.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
197 7 Stripper (aerosol), Bravo Power Foam, Diversey, 12/320z/case No Bid No Bid 91.84 108.24 No Bid 103.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




