Jefferson County Public Schools

Bid Tabulation

Event Name: Controls for Heating & A/C

Event ID: JCPS-8399

Approval Date: December 17, 2024

Date Bids Received: October 22, 2024

Contract Period: December 18, 2024 through December 17, 2025
Renewals: No renewal option

Comments: Award Status indicates an award

Item 1 Part
Number Item/Service Commodity Code || Vendor Name No Bid uom Quantity Provider Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes || Award Status Award Notes
001 Actuator. Barber Colman #MP-471-600. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1725674 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 2 BARBER MP-471-600 $1,193.3100 $2,386.6200
Engineering COLEMAN/SCHNEIDER
Awarded
001 Actuator. Barber Colman #MP-471-600. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1725674 CAPP INC 1-Each 2 Barber Colman MP-471-600 $1,234.1000 $2,468.2000
001 Actuator. Barber Colman #MP-471-600. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1725674 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 2 SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC MP-471-600 $1,331.0000 $2,662.0000
002 Actuator. Barber Colman #MP-5413. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1718198 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 2 BARBER COLEMAN/ MP-5413 $464.5600 $929.1200
Engineering SCHNEIDER
Awarded
002 Actuator. Barber Colman #MP-5413. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1718198 CAPP INC 1-Each 2 Barber Colman MP-5413 $480.4500 $960.9000
002 Actuator. Barber Colman #MP-5413. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1718198 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 2 SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC MP-5413 $558.0000 $1,116.0000
003 Actuator. Barber Colman #MP-5410. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1720827 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 3 BARBER MP-5410 $464.5600 $1,393.6800
Engineering COLEMAN/SCHNEIDER
Awarded
003 Actuator. Barber Colman #MP-5410. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1720827 CAPP INC 1-Each 3 Barber Colman MP-5410 $480.4500 $1,441.3500
003 Actuator. Barber Colman #MP-5410. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1720827 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 3 SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC MP-5410 $558.0000 $1,674.0000
004 Actuator. Barber Colman #MP-5430. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1714965 | Cochrane Supply & 1- Each 20 Barber MP-5430 $542.4200 $10,848.4000
Engineering Coleman/Schneider
Awarded
004 Actuator. Barber Colman #MP-5430. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1714965 CAPP INC 1-Each 20 Barber Colman MP-5430 $560.9500 $11,219.0000
004 Actuator. Barber Colman #MP-5430. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1714965 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 20 SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC MP-5430 $624.0000 $12,480.0000
005 Actuator. Barber Colman #MP-5433. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1718554 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 1 BARBER MP-5433 $542.4200 $542.4200
Engineering COLEMAN/SCHNEIDER
Awarded
005 Actuator. Barber Colman #MP-5433. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1718554 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Barber Colman MP-5433 $560.9500 $560.9500
005 Actuator. Barber Colman #MP-5433. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1718554 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC MP-5433 $624.0000 $624.0000
006 Actuator. Barber Colman #MPR5633. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1728018 CAPP INC 1-Each 5 Barber Colman MPR-5613 $492.3000 $2,461.5000 updates to MPR-5613, must buy AM- Reject - alternate product bid, not
601 as well acceptable.
006 Actuator. Barber Colman #MPR5633. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1728018 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 5 BARBER MPR-5633 $559.4000 $2,797.0000
Engineering COOLEMAN/SCHNEIDER
Awarded
006 Actuator. Barber Colman #MPR5633. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1728018 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 5 SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC MPR-5633 $644.0000 $3,220.0000
007 Actuator. Barber Colman #M573-5108. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1657876 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 1 BARBER M573-5108 $193.9000 $193.9000
Engineering COLEMAN/SCHNEIDER
Awarded




007 Actuator. Barber Colman #M573-5108. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1657876 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC M573-5108 $213.0000 $213.0000
007 Actuator. Barber Colman #M573-5108. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1657876 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 KMcC MCP-1030-5111 $229.0000 $229.0000 updates to KMC MCP-1030-5111
008 Actuator. Barber Colman #MK2690. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1008680 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 1 BARBER MK-2690 $64.6000 $64.6000
Engineering COLEMAN/SCHNEIDER
Awarded
008 Actuator. Barber Colman #MK2690. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1008680 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Barber Colman MK2690 $66.8000 $66.8000
008 Actuator. Barber Colman #MK2690. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1008680 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC MK-2690 $80.0000 $80.0000
009 Actuator. Barber Colman #MK-4601. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1283267 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 1 BARBER COLEMAN MK-4601 $142.1000 $142.1000
Engineering /SCHNEIDER
Awarded
009 Actuator. Barber Colman #MK-4601. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1283267 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Barber Colman MK-4601 $146.9500 $146.9500
009 Actuator. Barber Colman #MK-4601. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1283267 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC MK-4601 $171.0000 $171.0000
010 Actuator. Belimo #AFB-24-MFT-US. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2002634 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 1 BELIMO AFB-24-MFT US $355.5600 $355.5600
Engineering
Awarded
010 Actuator. Belimo #AFB-24-MFT-US. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2002634 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Belimo AFB-24-MFT-US $378.7500 $378.7500
010 Actuator. Belimo #AFB-24-MFT-US. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2002634 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 BELIMO AFB-24-MFT $434.0000 $434.0000
011 Actuator. Belimo #AFB-24-SR-US. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1719538 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 10 BELIMO AFB-24-SR US $300.1300 $3,001.3000
Engineering
Awarded
011 Actuator. Belimo #AFB-24-SR-US. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1719538 CAPP INC 1-Each 10 Belimo AFB-24-SR-US $343.8000 $3,438.0000
011 Actuator. Belimo #AFB-24-SR-US. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1719538 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 10 BELIMO AFB-24-SR $394.0000 $3,940.0000
012 Actuator. Belimo #AMB-24-SR-US. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1720045 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 1 BELIMO AMB-24-SR-US $257.5400 $257.5400
Engineering
Awarded
012 Actuator. Belimo #AMB-24-SR-US. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1720045 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Belimo AMB-24-SR-US $274.3500 $274.3500
012 Actuator. Belimo #AMB-24-SR-US. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1720045 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 BELIMO AMB-24-SR $329.0000 $329.0000
013 Actuator. Belimo 24 Volt Zone24NO. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2009182 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 5 BELIMO ZONE24NO $72.3300 $361.6500
Engineering
Awarded
013 Actuator. Belimo 24 Volt Zone24NO. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2009182 CAPP INC 1-Each 5 Belimo Zone24NO $77.0500 $385.2500
013 Actuator. Belimo 24 Volt Zone24NO. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2009182 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 5 BELIMO ZONE24NO $93.0000 $465.0000
014 Actuator. Belimo #GMB24-SR. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1720044 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 5 BELIMO GMB24-SR $332.2300 $1,661.1500
Engineering
Awarded
014 Actuator. Belimo #GMB24-SR. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1720044 CAPP INC 1-Each 5 Belimo GMB24-SR $353.9000 $1,769.5000




014 Actuator. Belimo #GMB24-SR. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1720044 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 5 BELIMO GMB24-SR $405.0000 $2,025.0000
015 Actuator. Belimo #LF24-SR. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1726087 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 10 BELIMO LF24-SR $230.1700 $2,301.7000
Engineering
Awarded
015 Actuator. Belimo #LF24-SR. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1726087 CAPP INC 1-Each 10 Belimo LF24-SR $245.2000 $2,452.0000
015 Actuator. Belimo #LF24-SR. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1726087 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 10 BELIMO LF24-SR $293.0000 $2,930.0000
016 Actuator. Belimo #LF24-3-US. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2009613 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 10 BELIMO LF24-3-Us $204.8200 $2,048.2000
Engineering
Awarded
016 Actuator. Belimo #LF24-3-US. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2009613 CAPP INC 1-Each 10 Belimo LF24-3-Us $218.2000 $2,182.0000
016 Actuator. Belimo #LF24-3-US. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2009613 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 10 BELIMO LF24-3 $262.0000 $2,620.0000
017 Actuator. Belimo #LMB24-SR-T. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1726088 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 20 BELIMO LMB24-SR-T $124.0500 $2,481.0000
Engineering
Awarded
017 Actuator. Belimo #LMB24-SR-T. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1726088 CAPP INC 1-Each 20 Belimo LMB24-SR-T $132.1500 $2,643.0000
017 Actuator. Belimo #LMB24-SR-T. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1726088 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 20 BELIMO LMB24-SR-T $158.0000 $3,160.0000
018 Actuator. Belimo #LMB24-3-T. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2008886 | Cochrane Supply & 1- Each 20 BELIMO $74.3600 $1,487.2000
Engineering
Awarded
018 Actuator. Belimo #LMB24-3-T. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2008886 CAPP INC 1-Each 20 Belimo LMB24-3-T $79.2000 $1,584.0000
018 Actuator. Belimo #LMB24-3-T. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2008886 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 20 BELIMO LMB24-3-T $96.0000 $1,920.0000
019 Actuator. Belimo #LMB24-SR. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2012439 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 15 BELIMO LMB24-SR $128.7800 $1,931.7000
Engineering
Awarded
019 Actuator. Belimo #LMB24-SR. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2012439 CAPP INC 1-Each 15 Belimo LMB24-SR $147.6000 $2,214.0000
019 Actuator. Belimo #LMB24-SR. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2012439 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 15 BELIMO LMB24-SR $177.0000 $2,655.0000
020 Actuator. Belimo #NFBUP. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1734704 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 6 BELIMO NFB-UP $235.2300 $1,411.3800
Engineering
Awarded
020 Actuator. Belimo #NFBUP. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1734704 CAPP INC 1-Each 6 Belimo NFBUP $250.6000 $1,503.6000
020 Actuator. Belimo #NFBUP. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1734704 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 6 BELIMO NFBUP $300.0000 $1,800.0000
021 Actuator. Belimo #NMB24-3. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1719535 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 2 BELIMO NMB24-3 $125.0600 $250.1200
Engineering
Awarded
021 Actuator. Belimo #NMB24-3. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1719535 CAPP INC 1-Each 2 Belimo NMB24-3 $133.2000 $266.4000
021 Actuator. Belimo #NMB24-3. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1719535 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 2 BELIMO NMB24-3 $160.0000 $320.0000




022 Actuator. Belimo #NMB-24SR. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2012036 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 10 BELIMO NMB24-SR $176.4300 $1,764.3000
Engineering
Awarded
022 Actuator. Belimo #NMB-24SR. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2012036 CAPP INC 1-Each 10 Belimo NMB-24SR $187.9500 $1,879.5000
022 Actuator. Belimo #NMB-24SR. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2012036 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 10 BELIMO NMB-24SR $225.0000 $2,250.0000
023 Actuator. Belimo #TFX24-3/A3 10’ cable. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2011545 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 10 BELIMO TFX24 $176.0000 $1,760.0000
Awarded
023 Actuator. Belimo #TFX24-3/A3 10’ cable. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2011545 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 10 BELIMO TFX24-A /A3 $179.1300 $1,791.3000
Engineering
023 Actuator. Belimo #TFX24-3/A3 10’ cable. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2011545 CAPP INC 1-Each 10 Belimo TFX24-3/A3 $190.8000 $1,908.0000
024 Actuator, Belimo TR24-3. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2010894 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 20 BELIMO TR24-3 $74.3600 $1,487.2000
Engineering
Awarded
024 Actuator, Belimo TR24-3. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2010894 CAPP INC 1-Each 20 Belimo TR24-3 $79.2000 $1,584.0000
024 Actuator, Belimo TR24-3. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2010894 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 20 BELIMO TR24-3 $95.0000 $1,900.0000
025 Amplifier, ultraviolet. Fireye #EUV1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700620-1707505 CAPP INC 1-Each 4 Fireye EUV1 $671.5000 $2,686.0000
Awarded
025 Amplifier, ultraviolet. Fireye #EUV1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700620-1707505 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 4 FIREYE EUV1 $685.4400 $2,741.7600
Engineering
025 Amplifier, ultraviolet. Fireye #EUV1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700620-1707505 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 4 FIREYE EUV1 $727.0000 $2,908.0000
026 Bracket, adapter. Honeywell #220738A. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2012449 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 HONEYWELL 220738A $135.0000 $135.0000
Awarded
026 Bracket, adapter. Honeywell #220738A. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2012449 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Honeywell 220738A $145.1500 $145.1500
026 Bracket, adapter. Honeywell #220738A. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2012449 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 1 HONEYWELL 220738A $148.5000 $148.5000
Engineering
027 Control, commercial defrosting timer. NO SUBSTITUTE. 2700825-1405787 | Cochrane Supply & No Bid 1-Each 1 $0.0000 $0.0000
Paragon #8145-00. Engineering
027 Control, commercial defrosting timer. NO SUBSTITUTE. 2700825-1405787 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 PARAGON 8145-00 $99.0000 $99.0000
Paragon #8145-00.
Awarded
027 Control, commercial defrosting timer. NO SUBSTITUTE. 2700825-1405787 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Paragon 8145-00 $123.7500 $123.7500
Paragon #8145-00.
028 Control, head pressure output 120 - 240. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850530-2008802 | Cochrane Supply & No Bid 1-Each 1 $0.0000 $0.0000
ICM #326H. Engineering
028 Control, head pressure output 120 - 240. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850530-2008802 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 Ic™m ICM379, (326H IS $37.0000 $37.0000 Reject - product does not meet
ICM #326H. DISCONTINUED) specifications, does not include
controller.
028 Control, head pressure output 120 - 240. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850530-2008802 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Ic™m ICM325A $175.2500 $175.2500
ICM #326H.
Awarded
029 Control, high pressure. Ranco #016-108. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700270-1652655 | Cochrane Supply & No Bid 1-Each 1 $0.0000 $0.0000

Engineering




029 Control, high pressure. Ranco #016-108. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700270-1652655 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 RANCO 016-108 $96.0000 $96.0000
Awarded
029 Control, high pressure. Ranco #016-108. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700270-1652655 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Ranco 016-108 $116.7000 $116.7000
030 Control, limit. Honeywell #L4008A1015. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700260-1132036 CAPP INC 1-Each 2 Honeywell L4008A1015 $158.5000 $317.0000
Awarded
030 Control, limit. Honeywell #.4008A1015. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700260-1132036 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 2 HONEYWELL L4008A1015 $178.3500 $356.7000
Engineering
030 Control, limit. Honeywell #L4008A1015. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700260-1132036 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 2 HONEYWELL L4008A1015 $182.0000 $364.0000
031 Control, low pressure, 1/4" flare, CO 15, CI NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700270-1612124 | Cochrane Supply & No Bid 1-Each 1 $0.0000 $0.0000
35. SUPCO #SLP1535. Engineering
031 Control, low pressure, 1/4" flare, CO 15, CI NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700270-1612124 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 SUPCO SLP1535 $11.0000 $11.0000
35. SUPCO #SLP1535.
Awarded
031 Control, low pressure, 1/4" flare, CO 15, CI NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700270-1612124 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Supco SLP1535 $14.1000 $14.1000
35. SUPCO #SLP1535.
032 Control, low pressure, CO 5, Cl 20. SUPCO NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700270-2011443 | Cochrane Supply & No Bid 1-Each 1 $0.0000 $0.0000
#SLP0520. Engineering
032 Control, low pressure, CO 5, Cl 20. SUPCO NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700270-2011443 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 SUPCO SLP0520 $11.0000 $11.0000
#SLP0520.
Awarded
032 Control, low pressure, CO 5, Cl 20. SUPCO NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700270-2011443 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Supco SLP0520 $14.1000 $14.1000
#SLP0520.
033 Control, low water cut off (hot water). NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120780-2002418 | Cochrane Supply & No Bid 1-Each 1 $0.0000 $0.0000
McDonnell Miller #751-P-MT-120. Engineering
033 Control, low water cut off (hot water). NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120780-2002418 | Progress Supply Inc. No Bid 1-Each 1 $0.0000 $0.0000
McDonnell Miller #751-P-MT-120.
033 Control, low water cut off (hot water). NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120780-2002418 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Mcdonnell Miller 751-P-MT-120 $282.9000 $282.9000
McDonnell Miller #751-P-MT-120.
Awarded
034 Control, pressure, manual reset. Johnson NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700270-1680988 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Johnson Controls P70DA-1 $114.7500 $114.7500
Controls #P70DA-1.
Awarded
034 Control, pressure, manual reset. Johnson NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700270-1680988 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 1 JOHNSON CONTROLS P70DA-1 $121.0200 $121.0200
Controls #P70DA-1. Engineering
034 Control, pressure, manual reset. Johnson NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700270-1680988 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 JOHNSON CONTROLS P70DA-1C $132.0000 $132.0000
Controls #P70DA-1.
035 Control, pressure, dual switch. Johnson NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700270-1495814 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 6 JOHNSON CONTROLS P70MA-1 $205.0300 $1,230.1800
Controls #P70MA-1. Engineering
Awarded
035 Control, pressure, dual switch. Johnson NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700270-1495814 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 6 JOHNSON CONTROLS P70MA-1C $223.0000 $1,338.0000
Controls #P70MA-1.
035 Control, pressure, dual switch. Johnson NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700270-1495814 CAPP INC 1-Each 6 Johnson Controls P70MA-1 $247.9500 $1,487.7000
Controls #P70MA-1.
036 Control, pressure. Johnson Controls NO SUBSTITUTE. 1300690-1665179 CAPP INC 1-Each 10 Johnson Controls A19ABC-24 $81.7500 $817.5000
#A19ABC-24.
Awarded
036 Control, pressure. Johnson Controls NO SUBSTITUTE. 1300690-1665179 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 10 JOHNSON CONTROLS A19ABC-24 $86.2200 $862.2000

#A19ABC-24.

Engineering




036 Control, pressure. Johnson Controls NO SUBSTITUTE. 1300690-1665179 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 10 JOHNSON CONTROLS A19ABC-24C $94.0000 $940.0000
#A19ABC-24.
037 Control, temperature. Honeywell NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700260-1726095 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Honeywell L4006E1125 $249.6500 $249.6500
#L4006E1125.
Awarded
037 Control, temperature. Honeywell NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700260-1726095 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 1 HONEYWELL L4006E1125 $280.8900 $280.8900
#L4006E1125. Engineering
037 Control, temperature. Honeywell NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700260-1726095 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 HONEYWELL L4006E1125 $285.0000 $285.0000
#L4006E1125.
038 Control, temperature. Johnson Controls. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700260-1339644 CAPP INC 1-Each 5 Johnson Controls A19ABC-36 $50.4500 $252.2500
#A19ABC-36.
Awarded
038 Control, temperature. Johnson Controls. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700260-1339644 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 5 JOHNSON CONTROLS A19ABC-36 $132.5600 $662.8000
#A19ABC-36. Engineering
038 Control, temperature. Johnson Controls. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700260-1339644 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 5 HONEYWELL A19ABC-36C $144.0000 $720.0000
#A19ABC-36.
039 Control, temperature, single stage, with NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700180-2010059 CAPP INC 1-Each 10 Johnson Controls A421ABC-02 $80.2000 $802.0000
display, -30° F to 212° F. Johnson Controls
#AG21ABC-02. Awanded
039 Control, temperature, single stage, with NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700180-2010059 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 10 JOHNSON CONTROLS A421ABC-02 $84.5900 $845.9000
display, -30° F to 212° F. Johnson Controls Engineering
#A421ABC-02.
039 Control, temperature, single stage, with NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700180-2010059 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 10 HONEYWELL A421ABC-02C $92.0000 $920.0000
display, -30° F to 212° F. Johnson Controls
#A421ABC-02.
040 Control, temperature, -30° F to 90° F, 5" NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120660-1402940 | Cochrane Supply & No Bid 1-Each 10 $0.0000 $0.0000
capillary. White Rodgers #1609-101. Engineering
040 Control, temperature, -30° F to 90° F, 5 NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120660-1402940 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 10 WHITE RODGERS 1609-101 $62.0000 $620.0000
capillary. White Rodgers #1609-101.
Awarded
040 Control, temperature, -30° F to 90° F, 5" NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120660-1402940 CAPP INC 1-Each 10 White Rodgers 1609-101 $70.2500 $702.5000
capillary. White Rodgers #1609-101.
041 Control, 35° F to 45° F, low limit NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120240-1548089 CAPP INC 1-Each 4 Johnson Controls Al1A-1 $223.7500 $895.0000
temperature cut out. Johnson Controls
BALIAL Awarded
041 Control, 35° F to 45° F, low limit NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120240-1548089 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 4 JOHNSON CONTROLS Al1A-1 $236.0200 $944.0800
temperature cut out. Johnson Controls Engineering
#A11A-1.
041 Control, 35° F to 45° F, low limit NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120240-1548089 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 4 JOHNSON CONTROLS Al1A-1C $257.0000 $1,028.0000
temperature cut out. Johnson Controls
#A11A-1.
042 Controller, aquastat. Honeywell #L6006A- NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700020-1011256 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Honeywell L6006A-1145 $155.7000 $155.7000
1145.
Awarded
042 Controller, aquastat. Honeywell #L6006A- NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700020-1011256 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 HONEYWELL L6006AA1145 $163.0000 $163.0000
1145.
042 Controller, aquastat. Honeywell #L6006A- NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700020-1011256 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 1 HONEYWELL L6006A1145 $175.2000 $175.2000
1145. Engineering
043 Controller, low pressure. Johnson Controls NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700170-1651757 CAPP INC 1-Each 5 Johnson Controls P70AB-2C $103.2000 $516.0000
#P70AB-2C.
Awarded
043 Controller, low pressure. Johnson Controls NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700170-1651757 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 5 JOHNSON CONTROLS P70AB-2C $108.8700 $544.3500
#P70AB-2C. Engineering
043 Controller, low pressure. Johnson Controls NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700170-1651757 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 5 JOHNSON CONTROLS P70AB-2C $119.0000 $595.0000

#P70AB-2C.




044 Controller, temperature, range 55° F to 175° NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700180-2010702 CAPP INC 1-Each Honeywell T991A1186 $556.9500 $2,784.7500
F. Honeywell #T991A1186.
Awarded
044 Controller, temperature, range 55° F to 175° NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700180-2010702 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each HONEYWELL T991A1186 $569.8700 $2,849.3500
F. Honeywell #T991A1186. Engineering
044 Controller, temperature, range 55° F to 175° NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700180-2010702 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each HONEYWELL T991A1186 $675.0000 $3,375.0000
F. Honeywell #T991A1186.
045 Diaphragm. Barber Colman #N800-9423. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120320-1731261 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC N800-8423 $30.0000 $30.0000
Awarded
045 Diaphragm. Barber Colman #N800-9423. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120320-1731261 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each BARBER COLEMAN/ N800-9423 $33.2200 $33.2200
Engineering SCHNEIDER
045 Diaphragm. Barber Colman #N800-9423. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120320-1731261 CAPP INC 1-Each Barber Colman N800-9423 $34.3500 $34.3500
046 Diffuser, high volume HVS 24 x 24 Hart and NO SUBSTITUTE. 1160655-1722825 | Cochrane Supply & No Bid 1-Each $0.0000 $0.0000
Cooley #050350. Engineering
046 Diffuser, high volume HVS 24 x 24 Hart and NO SUBSTITUTE. 1160655-1722825 | Progress Supply Inc. No Bid 1- Each $0.0000 $0.0000
Cooley #050350.
046 Diffuser, high volume HVS 24 x 24 Hart and NO SUBSTITUTE. 1160655-1722825 CAPP INC 1-Each Hart&Cooley 050350 $88.1500 $440.7500
Cooley #050350.
Awarded
047 Display, module. Fireye #ED510. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700620-1683679 CAPP INC 1-Each Fireye ED510 $884.1500 $4,420.7500
Awarded
047 Display, module. Fireye #ED510. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700620-1683679 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each FIREYE ED510 $902.5400 $4,512.7000
Engineering
047 Display, module. Fireye #ED510. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700620-1683679 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each FIREYE ED510 $957.0000 $4,785.0000
048 Kit, crankarm adapter. Belimo #ZG-AFB-US. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1719540 | Progress Supply Inc. No Bid 1-Each $0.0000 $0.0000
048 Kit, crankarm adapter. Belimo #ZG-AFB-US. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1719540 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each BELIMO ZG-AFB-US $47.3200 $47.3200
Engineering
Awarded
048 Kit, crankarm adapter. Belimo #ZG-AFB-US. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1719540 CAPP INC 1-Each Belimo 2G-AFB-US $50.4000 $50.4000
049 Kit, crankarm adapter. Belimo #2G-AFB. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2012541 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each BELIMO ZG-AFB $47.3200 $236.6000
Engineering
Awarded
049 Kit, crankarm adapter. Belimo #ZG-AFB. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2012541 CAPP INC 1-Each Belimo ZG-AFB $50.4000 $252.0000
049 Kit, crankarm adapter. Belimo #2G-AFB. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2012541 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each BELIMO ZG-AFB $52.0000 $260.0000
050 Kit, linkage. Barber Colman #AV-392. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1725675 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each BARBER AV-392 $243.1700 $1,215.8500
Engineering COLEMAN/SCHNEIDER
Awarded
050 Kit, linkage. Barber Colman #AV-392. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1725675 CAPP INC 1-Each Barber Colman AV-392 $251.5000 $1,257.5000
050 Kit, linkage. Barber Colman #AV-392. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1725675 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC AV-392 $292.0000 $1,460.0000
051 Kit, linkage. Barber Colman #AV-395. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1725676 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each BARBER COLEMAN AV-395 $243.1700 $243.1700
Engineering /SCHNEIDER

Awarded




051 Kit, linkage. Barber Colman #AV-395. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1725676 CAPP INC 1-Each Barber Colman AV-395 $251.5000 $251.5000
051 Kit, linkage. Barber Colman #AV-395. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1725676 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC AV-395 $292.0000 $292.0000
052 Kit, linkage. Barber Colman #AV-400. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1681769 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each BARBER COLEMAN/ AV-400 $19.2000 $19.2000
Engineering SCHNEIDER
Awarded
052 Kit, linkage. Barber Colman #AV-400. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1681769 CAPP INC 1-Each Barber Colman AV-400 $19.8500 $19.8500
052 Kit, linkage. Barber Colman #AV-400. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1681769 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC AV-400 $26.0000 $26.0000
053 Kit, linkage. Barber Colman #AV-600. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1406197 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each BARBER COLEMAN AV-600 $18.8300 $112.9800
Engineering
Awarded
053 Kit, linkage. Barber Colman #AV-600. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1406197 CAPP INC 1-Each Barber Colman AV-600 $19.5000 $117.0000
053 Kit, linkage. Barber Colman #AV-600. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1406197 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC AV-600 $26.0000 $156.0000
054 Kit, Pilot restriction. Barber Colman #AT- NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850470-1721285 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each BARBER COLEMAN AT-528 $26.8200 $134.1000
528. Engineering
Awarded
054 Kit, Pilot restriction. Barber Colman #AT- NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850470-1721285 CAPP INC 1-Each Barber Colman AT-528 $27.7500 $138.7500
528.
054 Kit, Pilot restriction. Barber Colman #AT- NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850470-1721285 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC AT-528 $37.0000 $185.0000
528.
055 Kit, switch. Honeywell #2207368B. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1718623 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each HONEYWELL 2207368 $216.0000 $216.0000
Awarded
055 Kit, switch. Honeywell #220736B. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1718623 CAPP INC 1-Each Honeywell 2207368 $218.3500 $218.3500
055 Kit, switch. Honeywell #2207368B. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1718623 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each HONEYWELL 2207368 $223.4200 $223.4200
Engineering
056 Motor, modutrol. Honeywell #M9184D- NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1718622 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each HONEYWELL M9184D1021 $1,071.2000 $1,071.2000
1021. Engineering
Awarded
056 Motor, modutrol. Honeywell #M9184D- NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1718622 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each HONEYWELL M9184D-1021 $1,180.0000 $1,180.0000
1021.
056 Motor, modutrol. Honeywell #M9184D- NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-1718622 CAPP INC 1-Each Honeywell M9184D-1021 $1,308.6500 $1,308.6500
1021.
057 Packing, valve. Barber Colman #YBA-622-2. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510630-1282071 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each BARBER COLEMAN YBA-622-2 $46.5000 $418.5000
Engineering
Awarded
057 Packing, valve. Barber Colman #YBA-622-2. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510630-1282071 CAPP INC 1-Each Barber Colman YBA-622-2 $48.1000 $432.9000
057 Packing, valve. Barber Colman #YBA-622-2. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510630-1282071 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC YBA-622-2 $56.0000 $504.0000
058 Packing, valve. Barber Colman #YBA-635. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510630-1664832 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each BARBER COLEMAN/ YBA-635 $58.3100 $466.4800
Engineering SCHNEIDER
Awarded
058 Packing, valve. Barber Colman #YBA-635. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510630-1664832 CAPP INC 1-Each Barber Colman YBA-635 $60.3000 $482.4000




058 Packing, valve. Barber Colman #YBA-635. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510630-1664832 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 8 SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC YBA-635 $73.0000 $584.0000
059 Packing, valve. Barber Colman #YBA-652-2. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510630-1727775 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 10 BARBER COLEMAN / YBA-652-2 $314.7500 $3,147.5000
Engineering SCHNEIDER
Awarded
059 Packing, valve. Barber Colman #YBA-652-2. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510630-1727775 CAPP INC 1-Each 10 Barber Colman YBA-652-2 $325.5000 $3,255.0000
059 Packing, valve. Barber Colman #YBA-652-2. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510630-1727775 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 10 SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC YBA-652-2 $378.0000 $3,780.0000
060 Packing. Belimo #2G-GV04. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2008837 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 8 BELIMO 2G-Gvoa $81.4600 $651.6800
Engineering
Awarded
060 Packing. Belimo #ZG-GV04. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2008837 CAPP INC 1-Each 8 Belimo ZG-GVo4 $86.8000 $694.4000
060 Packing. Belimo #2G-GV04. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1105150-2008837 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 8 BELIMO 2G-Gvoa $105.0000 $840.0000
061 Programmer. Fireye #EP160. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700620-1682817 CAPP INC 1-Each 8 Fireye EP160 $1,737.2500 $13,898.0000
Awarded
061 Programmer. Fireye #EP160. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700620-1682817 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 8 FIREYE EP160 $1,773.4200 $14,187.3600
Engineering
061 Programmer. Fireye #EP160. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700620-1682817 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 8 FIREYE EP160 $1,880.0000 $15,040.0000
062 Regulator, pressure. Johnson Controls #R- NO SUBSTITUTE. 1600440-1007154 CAPP INC 1-Each 8 Johnson Controls R-130-15 $176.4500 $1,411.6000
130-15.
Awarded
062 Regulator, pressure. Johnson Controls #R- NO SUBSTITUTE. 1600440-1007154 | Cochrane Supply & 1- Each 8 JOHNSON CONTROLS R-130-15 $186.1100 $1,488.8800
130-15. Engineering
062 Regulator, pressure. Johnson Controls #R- NO SUBSTITUTE. 1600440-1007154 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 8 JOHNSON CONTROLS R-130-15 $203.0000 $1,624.0000
130-15.
063 Relay. Honeywell #R8239A1052. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120680-1192347 CAPP INC 1-Each 6 Honeywell R8239A1052 $60.3500 $362.1000
Awarded
063 Relay. Honeywell #R8239A1052. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120680-1192347 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 6 HONEYWELL R8239A1052 $67.9200 $407.5200
Engineering
063 Relay. Honeywell #R8239A1052. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120680-1192347 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 6 HONEYWELL R8239A1052 $74.0000 $444.0000
064 Relay, Multi Voltage DPDT 20 AMP #RIB24P. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120720-1720038 CAPP INC 1-Each 8 Functional Devices RIB24P $48.3500 $386.8000
Awarded
064 Relay, Multi Voltage DPDT 20 AMP #RIB24P. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120720-1720038 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 8 FUNCTIONAL DEVICES RIB24P $48.8300 $390.6400
Engineering
064 Relay, Multi Voltage DPDT 20 AMP #RIB24P. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120720-1720038 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 8 FUNCTIONAL DEVICES RIB24P $60.0000 $480.0000
065 Relay, Multivoltage SPDT 10 AMP. #RIBU1C. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120720-2013930 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 15 FUNCTIONAL DEVICES RIBU1C $13.0800 $196.2000
Engineering
Awarded
065 Relay, Multivoltage SPDT 10 AMP. #RIBU1C. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120720-2013930 CAPP INC 1-Each 15 Functional Devices RIBU1C $14.7500 $221.2500
065 Relay, Multivoltage SPDT 10 AMP. #RIBU1C. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120720-2013930 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 15 FUNCTIONAL DEVICES RIBU1C $21.0000 $315.0000




066 Relay, 120 volt. Honeywell #R4222D1013. NO SUBSTITUTE. 2700680-1062942 CAPP INC 1-Each Honeywell R4222D1013 $24.4500 $24.4500
Awarded
066 Relay, 120 volt. Honeywell #R4222D1013. NO SUBSTITUTE. 2700680-1062942 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each HONEYWELL R4222D1013 $27.5400 $27.5400
Engineering
066 Relay, 120 volt. Honeywell #R4222D1013. NO SUBSTITUTE. 2700680-1062942 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each HONEYWELL R4222D1013 $30.0000 $30.0000
067 Relay, booster. Johnson Controls #R-2080-1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120720-1308061 CAPP INC 1-Each Johnson Controls R-2080-1 $259.8000 $259.8000
Awarded
067 Relay, booster. Johnson Controls #R-2080-1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120720-1308061 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each JOHNSON CONTROLS R-2080-1 $274.0000 $274.0000
Engineering
067 Relay, booster. Johnson Controls #R-2080-1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120720-1308061 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each JOHNSON CONTROLS R-2080-1 $291.0000 $291.0000
068 Scanner, ultraviolet, 36" long. Fireye NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700620-1718128 CAPP INC 1-Each Fireye UV1A3 $167.4000 $837.0000
#UV1A3.
Awarded
068 Scanner, ultraviolet, 36" long. Fireye NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700620-1718128 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each FIREYE UV1A3 $170.9000 $854.5000
#UV1A3. Engineering
068 Scanner, ultraviolet, 36" long. Fireye NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700620-1718128 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each FIREYE UV1A3 $182.0000 $910.0000
H#UV1A3.
069 Scanner, ultraviolet, 12" long. Fireye NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700620-1718129 CAPP INC 1-Each Fireye UV1A6 $199.6500 $1,597.2000
#UV1A6.
Awarded
069 Scanner, ultraviolet, 12" long. Fireye NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700620-1718129 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each FIREYE UV1A6 $203.8000 $1,630.4000
#UV1A6. Engineering
069 Scanner, ultraviolet, 12" long. Fireye NO SUBSTITUTE. 4700620-1718129 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each FIREYE UV1A6 $217.0000 $1,736.0000
#UV1A6.
070 Sensor. 6" pipe/immersion 1K Balco Temp NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120820-1733938 | Cochrane Supply & No Bid 1-Each $0.0000 $0.0000
Veries #TIWCOIO. Engineering
070 Sensor. 6" pipe/immersion 1K Balco Temp NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120820-1733938 | Progress Supply Inc. No Bid 1- Each $0.0000 $0.0000
Veries #TIWCOIO.
070 Sensor. 6" pipe/immersion 1K Balco Temp NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120820-1733938 CAPP INC 1-Each Veris Tiwcoio $46.4000 $46.4000
Veries #TIWCOIO.
Awarded
071 Sensor. Mamac #TE-205-F-5. Outside air NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120820-1283749 | Cochrane Supply & No Bid 1-Each $0.0000 $0.0000
temperature 1,000 ohm Balco. Engineering
071 Sensor. Mamac #TE-205-F-5. Outside air NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120820-1283749 CAPP INC 1-Each Mamac TE-205-F-5 $19.0000 $19.0000
temperature 1,000 ohm Balco.
Awarded
071 Sensor. Mamac #TE-205-F-5. Outside air NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120820-1283749 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each MAMAC SYSTEMS TE-205-F-5 $24.0000 $24.0000
temperature 1,000 ohm Balco.
072 Sensor, temperature. Veris Industries NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120820-1283730 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each VERI TFDIROO $20.1300 $20.1300
#TFDIR0O. Duct 8" 1,000 ohm Balco. Engineering
Awarded
072 Sensor, temperature. Veris Industries NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120820-1283730 CAPP INC 1-Each Veris TFDIROO $49.1000 $49.1000
#TFDIR0O. Duct 8" 1,000 ohm Balco.
072 Sensor, temperature. Veris Industries NO SUBSTITUTE. 1120820-1283730 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each VERIS INDUSTRIES TFDIROO $60.0000 $60.0000
#TFDIR0O. Duct 8" 1,000 ohm Balco.
073 Switch, pressure, air. Honeywell NO SUBSTITUTE. 7500350-1130716 CAPP INC 1-Each Honeywell C6097A3053 $60.1500 $60.1500

#C6097A3053.

Awarded




073 Switch, pressure, air. Honeywell NO SUBSTITUTE. 7500350-1130716 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 1 HONEYWELL C6097A3053 $120.8000 $120.8000
#C6097A3053. Engineering
073 Switch, pressure, air. Honeywell NO SUBSTITUTE. 7500350-1130716 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 HONEYWELL C6097A3053 $132.0000 $132.0000
#C6097A3053.
074 Switch, pressure flow. McDonnell Miller NO SUBSTITUTE. 7500350-1005405 | Cochrane Supply & No Bid 1-Each 6 $0.0000 $0.0000
#FS2-51. Engineering
074 Switch, pressure flow. McDonnell Miller NO SUBSTITUTE. 7500350-1005405 CAPP INC 1-Each 6 Mcdonnell Miller FS2-51 $165.6000 $993.6000
#FS2-51.
Awarded
074 Switch, pressure flow. McDonnell Miller NO SUBSTITUTE. 7500350-1005405 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 6 MCDONNELL MILLER FS2-51 $176.0000 $1,056.0000
#FS2-51.
075 Switch, pressure flow. McDonnell Miller #FS- NO SUBSTITUTE. 7500350-2013162 | Cochrane Supply & No Bid 1-Each 15 $0.0000 $0.0000
8W. Engineering
075 Switch, pressure flow. McDonnell Miller #FS- NO SUBSTITUTE. 7500350-2013162 CAPP INC 1-Each 15 Mcdonnell Miller FS-8W $227.7000 $3,415.5000
8W.
Awarded
075 Switch, pressure flow. McDonnell Miller #FS- NO SUBSTITUTE. 7500350-2013162 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 15 MCDONNELL MILLER FS-8W $244.0000 $3,660.0000
8W.
076 Switch, pressure 1" to 20" W.C., with manual NO SUBSTITUTE. 7500350-1005432 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Honeywell C6097A3012 $74.9000 $74.9000
reset. Honeywell #C6097A3012.
Awarded
076 Switch, pressure 1" to 20" W.C., with manual NO SUBSTITUTE. 7500350-1005432 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 1 HONEYWELL C6097A3012 $151.9000 $151.9000
reset. Honeywell #C6097A3012. Engineering
076 Switch, pressure 1" to 20" W.C., with manual NO SUBSTITUTE. 7500350-1005432 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 HONEYWELL C6097A3012 $165.0000 $165.0000
reset. Honeywell #C6097A3012.
077 Switch, pressure, 3" to 21" W.C., with NO SUBSTITUTE. 7500350-1693463 CAPP INC 1-Each 5 Honeywell €6097B3028 $86.4000 $432.0000
manual reset. Honeywell #C609783028.
Awarded
077 Switch, pressure, 3" to 21" W.C., with NO SUBSTITUTE. 7500350-1693463 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 5 HONEYWELL €6097B3028 $149.2500 $746.2500
manual reset. Honeywell #C6097B83028. Engineering
077 Switch, pressure, 3" to 21" W.C., with NO SUBSTITUTE. 7500350-1693463 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 5 HONEYWELL €6097B3028 $163.0000 $815.0000
manual reset. Honeywell #C609783028.
078 Thermostat. Barber Colman #2218-132. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1713274 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 1 BARBER COLEMAN/ 2218-132 $257.3500 $257.3500
Engineering SCHNEIDER
Awarded
078 Thermostat. Barber Colman #2218-132. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1713274 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Barber Colman 2218-132 $266.1500 $266.1500
078 Thermostat. Barber Colman #2218-132. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1713274 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC 2218-132 $310.0000 $310.0000
079 Thermostat. Barber Colman #2218-134. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1651033 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 5 BARBER COLEMAN/ 2218-134 $257.3100 $1,286.5500
Engineering SCHNEIDER
Awarded
079 Thermostat. Barber Colman #2218-134. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1651033 CAPP INC 1-Each 5 Barber Colman 2218-134 $266.1500 $1,330.7500
079 Thermostat. Barber Colman #2218-134. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1651033 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 5 SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC 2218-134 $310.0000 $1,550.0000
080 Thermostat. Barber Colman #TA1101. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1405303 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 1 BARBER COLEMAN / TA-1101 $245.8500 $245.8500
Engineering SCHNEIDER
Awarded
080 Thermostat. Barber Colman #TA1101. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1405303 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Barber Colman TA1101 $254.2500 $254.2500




080 Thermostat. Barber Colman #TA1101. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1405303 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC TA-1101 $296.0000 $296.0000
081 Thermostat. Barber Colman #TK-1001. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1010748 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 10 BARBER COLEMAN TK-1001 $191.8400 $1,918.4000
Engineering
Awarded
081 Thermostat. Barber Colman #TK-1001. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1010748 CAPP INC 1-Each 10 Barber Colman TK-1001 $198.4000 $1,984.0000
081 Thermostat. Barber Colman #TK-1001. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1010748 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 10 SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC TK-1001 $231.0000 $2,310.0000
082 Thermostat. Barber Colman #TK1201. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1282375 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 15 BARBER COLEMAN TK-1201 $336.9600 $5,054.4000
Engineering /SCHNEIDER
Awarded
082 Thermostat. Barber Colman #TK1201. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1282375 CAPP INC 1-Each 15 Barber Colman TK1201 $348.5000 $5,227.5000
082 Thermostat. Barber Colman #TK1201. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1282375 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 15 SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC TK-1201 $404.0000 $6,060.0000
083 Thermostat. Barber Colman #TK1281. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1708336 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 1 BARBER COLEMAN TK-1281 $358.0200 $358.0200
Engineering /SCHNEIDER
Awarded
083 Thermostat. Barber Colman #TK1281. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1708336 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Barber Colman TK1281 $370.3000 $370.3000
083 Thermostat. Barber Colman #TK1281. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1708336 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC TK-1281 $431.0000 $431.0000
084 Thermostat. Honeywell #T834N1002. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675480-1015538 CAPP INC 1-Each 5 Honeywell T834N1002 $38.9000 $194.5000
Awarded
084 Thermostat. Honeywell #T834N1002. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675480-1015538 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 5 HONEYWELL T834N1002 $41.0000 $205.0000
084 Thermostat. Honeywell #T834N1002. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675480-1015538 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 5 HONEYWELL T835N1002 $46.3300 $231.6500
Engineering
085 Thermostat. Honeywell #TH5110D01022. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675480-1667576 CAPP INC 1-Each 15 Honeywell TH5110D1022 $78.0500 $1,170.7500
Awarded
085 Thermostat. Honeywell #TH5110D01022. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675480-1667576 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 15 HONEYWELL TH5110D1022 $82.0000 $1,230.0000
085 Thermostat. Honeywell #TH5110D01022. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675480-1667576 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 15 HONEYWELL TH5110D1022 $87.8500 $1,317.7500
Engineering
086 tat. ywell NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675480-1675487 CAPP INC 1-Each 5 Honeywell TH5220D1029 $108.2500 $541.2500
2H/2C #TH5220D1029.
Awarded
086 Thermostat. Honeywell non-programable NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675480-1675487 | Progress Supply Inc. 1- Each 5 HONEYWELL TH5220D1029 $113.0000 $565.0000
2H/2C #TH5220D1029.
086 Thermostat. ywell NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675480-1675487 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 5 HONEYWELL TH5220D1029 $121.8000 $609.0000
2H/2C #TH5220D1029. Engineering
087 Thermostat. Honeywell #TP970A2004. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1015529 CAPP INC 1-Each 1 Honeywell TP970A2004 $152.3500 $152.3500
Awarded
087 Thermostat. Honeywell #TP970A2004. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1015529 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each 1 HONEYWELL TP970A2004 $155.9000 $155.9000
Engineering
087 Thermostat. Honeywell #TP970A2004. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1015529 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each 1 HONEYWELL TP970A2004 $174.0000 $174.0000




088 Thermostat. Johnson Controls #A19BBC-2. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4450280-1718126 CAPP INC 1-Each Johnson Controls A19BBC-2 $111.4000 $111.4000
Awarded
088 Thermostat. Johnson Controls #A198BC-2. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4450280-1718126 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each JOHNSON CONTROLS A19BBC-2 $117.5000 $117.5000
Engineering
088 Thermostat. Johnson Controls #A19BBC-2. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4450280-1718126 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each JOHNSON CONTROLS A19BBC-2 $142.0000 $142.0000
089 Thermostat. Johnson Controls #T-4002-201. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675600-1154076 CAPP INC 1-Each Johnson Controls T-4002-201 $139.8000 $139.8000
Awarded
089 Thermostat. Johnson Controls #T-4002-201. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675600-1154076 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each JOHNSON CONTROLS T-4002-201 $147.5000 $147.5000
Engineering
089 Thermostat. Johnson Controls #T-4002-201. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675600-1154076 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each JOHNSON CONTROLS T-4002-201 $178.0000 $178.0000
090 Thermostat. Johnson Controls #T4756-201. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1129693 CAPP INC 1-Each Johnson Controls T4756-201 $286.6500 $286.6500
Awarded
090 Thermostat. Johnson Controls #T4756-201. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1129693 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each JOHNSON CONTROLS T-4756-201 $302.3500 $302.3500
Engineering
090 Thermostat. Johnson Controls #T4756-201. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675680-1129693 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each JOHNSON CONTROLS T4756-201 $358.0000 $358.0000
091 Thermostat. Johnson Controls #T4756-205. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675480-1015412 CAPP INC 1-Each Johnson Controls T4756-205 $286.6500 $2,006.5500
Awarded
091 Thermostat. Johnson Controls #T4756-205. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675480-1015412 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each JOHNSON CONTROLS T-4756-205 $302.3500 $2,116.4500
Engineering
091 Thermostat. Johnson Controls #T4756-205. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675480-1015412 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each JOHNSON CONTROLS T4756-205 $358.0000 $2,506.0000
092 Thermostat. White Rodgers, heavy duty line NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675480-1732776 CAPP INC No Bid 1-Each $0.0000 $0.0000
voltage 120-277V #1A16-51.
092 Thermostat. White Rodgers, heavy duty line NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675480-1732776 | Cochrane Supply & No Bid 1- Each $0.0000 $0.0000
voltage 120-277V #1A16-51. Engineering
092 Thermostat. White Rodgers, heavy duty line NO SUBSTITUTE. 7675480-1732776 | Progress Supply Inc. No Bid 1-Each $0.0000 $0.0000
voltage 120-277V #1A16-51.
093 Timer, adjustable, solid state. Approved Products: Artisan #438UP, ABB #TMV-8000, or equal. 2700825-1667759 | Cochrane Supply & No Bid 1-Each $0.0000 $0.0000
Engineering
093 Timer, adjustable, solid state. Approved Products: Artisan #438UP, ABB #TMV-8000, or equal. 2700825-1667759 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each LITTELFUSE TMV8000 $42.0000 $42.0000
Awarded
093 Timer, adjustable, solid state. Approved Products: Artisan #438UP, ABB #TMV-8000, or equal. 2700825-1667759 CAPP INC 1-Each Littelfuse TMV-8000 $49.1500 $49.1500
094 Timer. Paragon #8145-20. NO SUBSTITUTE. 2700825-1344030 | Cochrane Supply & No Bid 1-Each $0.0000 $0.0000
Engineering
094 Timer. Paragon #8145-20. NO SUBSTITUTE. 2700825-1344030 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each PARAGON 8145-20 $99.0000 $396.0000
Awarded
094 Timer. Paragon #8145-20. NO SUBSTITUTE. 2700825-1344030 CAPP INC 1-Each Paragon 8145-20 $123.7500 $495.0000
095 Transformer. 175VA 120V to 24VAC thermal #TR175VA003 or equal. 2700830-1404573 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each FUNCTIONAL DEVICES TR175VA003 $55.9000 $55.9000
fuse on primary foot and single threaded Engineering
Awarded

hub mount functional devices.




095 Transformer. 175VA 120V to 24VAC thermal #TR175VA003 or equal. 2700830-1404573 CAPP INC 1-Each Functional Devices TR175VA003 $63.1000 $63.1000
fuse on primary foot and single threaded
hub mount functional devices.
095 Transformer. 175VA 120V to 24VAC thermal #TR175VA003 or equal. 2700830-1404573 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each FUNCTIONAL DEVICES TR175VA003 $73.0000 $73.0000
fuse on primary foot and single threaded
hub mount functional devices.
096 Transformer. Honeywell #50017460-001. NO SUBSTITUTE. 2700830-1718624 | Cochrane Supply & No Bid 1-Each $0.0000 $0.0000
Engineering
096 Transformer. Honeywell #50017460-001. NO SUBSTITUTE. 2700830-1718624 CAPP INC 1-Each Honeywell 50017460-001 $105.8000 $105.8000
Awarded
096 Transformer. Honeywell #50017460-001. NO SUBSTITUTE. 2700830-1718624 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each HONEYWELL 50017460-001 $122.0000 $122.0000
097 Transformer. Honeywell #AT72D1683. NO SUBSTITUTE. 2700830-1065225 | Cochrane Supply & No Bid 1-Each $0.0000 $0.0000
Engineering
097 Transformer. Honeywell #AT72D1683. NO SUBSTITUTE. 2700830-1065225 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each HONEYWELL AT72D1683 $27.0000 $54.0000
Awarded
097 Transformer. Honeywell #AT72D1683. NO SUBSTITUTE. 2700830-1065225 CAPP INC 1-Each Honeywell AT72D1683 $34.3000 $68.6000
098 Transformer. Honeywell #AT87A1106. NO SUBSTITUTE. 2700830-1065056 | Cochrane Supply & No Bid 1-Each $0.0000 $0.0000
Engineering
098 Transformer. Honeywell #AT87A1106. NO SUBSTITUTE. 2700830-1065056 CAPP INC 1-Each Honeywell AT87A1106 $45.5500 $45.5500
Awarded
098 Transformer. Honeywell #AT87A1106. NO SUBSTITUTE. 2700830-1065056 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each HONEYWELL AT87A1106 $48.0000 $48.0000
099 Valve. Barber Colman #AL-171. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850600-1718337 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each BARBAR COLEMAN AL-171 $68.3000 $341.5000
Engineering
Awarded
099 Valve. Barber Colman #AL-171. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850600-1718337 CAPP INC 1-Each Barber Colman AL-171 $70.6000 $353.0000
099 Valve. Barber Colman #AL-171. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850600-1718337 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC AL-171 $90.0000 $450.0000
100 Valve. Barber Colman #AL-181. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850600-1718338 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each BARBER COLEMAN AL-181 $73.4500 $146.9000
Engineering
Awarded
100 Valve. Barber Colman #AL-181. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850600-1718338 CAPP INC 1-Each Barber Colman AL-181 $75.9500 $151.9000
100 Valve. Barber Colman #AL-181. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850600-1718338 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC AL-181 $96.0000 $192.0000
101 Valve. Johnson Controls #V11HAA-100. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850600-1401512 CAPP INC 1-Each Johnson Controls V11HAA-100 $260.6000 $260.6000
Awarded
101 Valve. Johnson Controls #V11HAA-100. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850600-1401512 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each JOHNSON CONTROLS V11HAA-100 $274.9000 $274.9000
Engineering
101 Valve. Johnson Controls #V11HAA-100. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850600-1401512 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each JOHNSON CONTROLS V11HAA-100 $281.0000 $281.0000
102 Valve. Penn/Johnson #VA6AA-1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850530-1340589 CAPP INC 1-Each Johnson Controls VA46AA-1 $148.1000 $148.1000
Awarded
102 Valve. Penn/Johnson #V46AA-1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850530-1340589 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each JOHNSON CONTROLS V46AA-1 $156.3000 $156.3000

Engineering




102 Valve. Penn/Johnson #V46AA-1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850530-1340589 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each JOHNSON CONTROLS VA6AA-1 $160.0000 $160.0000
103 Valve. Penn/Johnson #V46AB-1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850530-1662894 CAPP INC 1-Each Johnson Controls VA46AB-1 $160.9500 $643.8000
Awarded
103 Valve. Penn/Johnson #V46AB-1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850530-1662894 | Cochrane Supply & 1-Each JOHNSON CONTROLS VA46AB-1 $169.8000 $679.2000
Engineering
103 Valve. Penn/Johnson #V46AB-1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7850530-1662894 | Progress Supply Inc. 1-Each JOHNSON CONTROLS VA46AB-1 $174.0000 $696.0000




Jefferson County Public Schools
Award Summary
Event Name: 8399 Controls for Heating & A/C

Event ID: JCPS-8399
Approval Date: December 17, 2024

CAPP INC $110,553.9500 $48,009.2000
Cochrane Supply & Engineering $102,455.4800 $58,973.8000
$124,434.0000 $3,470.0000

Progress Supply Inc.
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