
Jefferson County Public Schools
Bid Tabulation 
Event Name: PUMP PARTS (VARIOUS TYPES)
Event ID: JCPS-8400
Approval Date: December 3, 2024
Date Bids Received: October 16, 2024
Contract Period: January 18, 2025 through January 17, 2026
Renewals: No renewal option 
Comments: Award Status indicates an award

Item 
Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer 
Part Number

Unit Bid 
Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

001 Bearing assembly.  Armstrong 
#810119MF-001 or Bell & Gossett 

#189034LF.

Must be bronze fitted.  NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200050-1661925 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

1 0 0

001 Bearing assembly.  Armstrong 
#810119MF-001 or Bell & Gossett 

#189034LF.

Must be bronze fitted.  NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200050-1661925 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 810119MF-001 171.6 171.6

Awarded

001 Bearing assembly.  Armstrong 
#810119MF-001 or Bell & Gossett 

#189034LF.

Must be bronze fitted.  NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200050-1661925 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 818254-003K 251.88 251.88

002 Bearing assembly.  Armstrong #818404K-
000K or Bell & Gossett #189105LF.

Must be bronze fitted.  NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200050-1661927 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

1 0 0

002 Bearing assembly.  Armstrong #818404K-
000K or Bell & Gossett #189105LF.

Must be bronze fitted.  NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200050-1661927 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 818404-000K 287.22 287.22

Awarded

002 Bearing assembly.  Armstrong #818404K-
000K or Bell & Gossett #189105LF.

Must be bronze fitted.  NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200050-1661927 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

1 BELL & GOSSETT 189105LF 395 395

003 Bearing assembly.  Armstrong #818504-
000K or Bell & Gossett #186863LF.

Must be bronze fitted.  NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200050-1665742 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

1 0 0

003 Bearing assembly.  Armstrong #818504-
000K or Bell & Gossett #186863LF.

Must be bronze fitted.  NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200050-1665742 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 818504-000K 384.27 384.27

Awarded

003 Bearing assembly.  Armstrong #818504-
000K or Bell & Gossett #186863LF.

Must be bronze fitted.  NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200050-1665742 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 818504-000K 410.4 410.4

004 Bearing assembly.  Armstrong 
#816549MF-091 or Bell & Gossett 

#189163LF.

Must be bronze fitted.  NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200050-1661926 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

1 0 0

004 Bearing assembly.  Armstrong 
#816549MF-091 or Bell & Gossett 

#189163LF.

Must be bronze fitted.  NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200050-1661926 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 816549-091 227.76 227.76

Awarded

004 Bearing assembly.  Armstrong 
#816549MF-091 or Bell & Gossett 

#189163LF.

Must be bronze fitted.  NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200050-1661926 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 816549MF-091 243.4 243.4

005 Coupler assembly, 1/2" x 1/2" spring 
type.  Armstrong #810120-003 or Bell & 

Gossett #118473.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200300-1404797 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

2 0 0



005 Coupler assembly, 1/2" x 1/2" spring 
type.  Armstrong #810120-003 or Bell & 

Gossett #118473.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200300-1404797 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

1 Each 
Purchase

2 ARMSTRONG 810120-003 88.51 177.02

Awarded

005 Coupler assembly, 1/2" x 1/2" spring 
type.  Armstrong #810120-003 or Bell & 

Gossett #118473.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200300-1404797 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

2 ARMSTRONG 810120-003 91.2 182.4

006 Coupler assembly, 1/2" x 1/2".  
Armstrong #806026-001 or Bell & 

Gossett #118723.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200300-1407169 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

3 0 0

006 Coupler assembly, 1/2" x 1/2".  
Armstrong #806026-001 or Bell & 

Gossett #118723.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200300-1407169 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

1 Each 
Purchase

3 ARMSTRONG 806026-001K 29.7 89.1

Awarded

006 Coupler assembly, 1/2" x 1/2".  
Armstrong #806026-001 or Bell & 

Gossett #118723.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200300-1407169 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

3 ARMSTRONG 806026-001K 30.8 92.4

007 Coupler assembly, 5/8" x 1/2".  
Armstrong #810120-006 or Bell & 

Gossett #118709.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200300-1495798 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

1 0 0

007 Coupler assembly, 5/8" x 1/2".  
Armstrong #810120-006 or Bell & 

Gossett #118709.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200300-1495798 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 810120-006 122.67 122.67

Awarded

007 Coupler assembly, 5/8" x 1/2".  
Armstrong #810120-006 or Bell & 

Gossett #118709.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200300-1495798 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 810120-006 129.4 129.4

008 Gasket, for Bearing Assembly #818504-
000K.  Armstrong #106158-000 or Bell & 

Gossett #P57410.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510400-2010898 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

1 0 0

008 Gasket, for Bearing Assembly #818504-
000K.  Armstrong #106158-000 or Bell & 

Gossett #P57410.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510400-2010898 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 106158-000 6.85 6.85

Awarded

008 Gasket, for Bearing Assembly #818504-
000K.  Armstrong #106158-000 or Bell & 

Gossett #P57410.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510400-2010898 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 818504-000K 394.29 394.29

009 Gasket Kit, Flange.  Armstrong #804034-
000 or Bell & Gossett #118373.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510380-1726156 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

1 0 0

009 Gasket Kit, Flange.  Armstrong #804034-
000 or Bell & Gossett #118373.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510380-1726156 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 804034-000 8.85 8.85

Awarded

009 Gasket Kit, Flange.  Armstrong #804034-
000 or Bell & Gossett #118373.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510380-1726156 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 804034-000 9.15 9.15

010 Gasket, Pump.  Armstrong #106592-000. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510400-1716748 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

1 0 0

010 Gasket, Pump.  Armstrong #106592-000. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510400-1716748 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 106592-000 5.59 5.59

Awarded



010 Gasket, Pump.  Armstrong #106592-000. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510400-1716748 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 106592-000 5.7 5.7

011 Impeller.  Armstrong #812961-041 or Bell 
& Gossett #118431LF.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200500-1020184 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

1 0 0

011 Impeller.  Armstrong #812961-041 or Bell 
& Gossett #118431LF.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200500-1020184 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 812961-041 85.27 85.27

Awarded

011 Impeller.  Armstrong #812961-041 or Bell 
& Gossett #118431LF.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200500-1020184 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 812961-041 86.65 86.65

012 Impeller.  Armstrong #816556-041 or Bell 
& Gossett #118436LF.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200500-1020077 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

1 0 0

012 Impeller.  Armstrong #816556-041 or Bell 
& Gossett #118436LF.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200500-1020077 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 816556-041 161 161

Awarded

012 Impeller.  Armstrong #816556-041 or Bell 
& Gossett #118436LF.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200500-1020077 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 816556-041 167.6 167.6

013 Impeller.  Armstrong #816301-055 or Bell 
& Gossett #118612LF.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200500-1020040 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

1 0 0

013 Impeller.  Armstrong #816301-055 or Bell 
& Gossett #118612LF.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200500-1020040 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 816301-055 818.14 818.14

Awarded

013 Impeller.  Armstrong #816301-055 or Bell 
& Gossett #118612LF.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200500-1020040 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 816301-055 851.6 851.6

014 Impeller.  Armstrong #816302-047 or Bell 
& Gossett #186359LF.

 NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200500-1662597 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

1 0 0

014 Impeller.  Armstrong #816302-047 or Bell 
& Gossett #186359LF.

 NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200500-1662597 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 816302-047K 377.86 377.86

Awarded

014 Impeller.  Armstrong #816302-047 or Bell 
& Gossett #186359LF.

 NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200500-1662597 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 816302-047K 393.3 393.3

015 Seal kit.  Armstrong #825458-001 or Bell 
& Gossett #186862LF.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510880-1311799 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

2 0 0

015 Seal kit.  Armstrong #825458-001 or Bell 
& Gossett #186862LF.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510880-1311799 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

1 Each 
Purchase

2 ARMSTRONG 825458-001 155.52 311.04

Awarded

015 Seal kit.  Armstrong #825458-001 or Bell 
& Gossett #186862LF.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510880-1311799 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

2 ARMSTRONG 825458-001 161.9 323.8



016 Sleeve, shaft.  Armstrong #810150-251. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200300-2000708 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

1 0 0

016 Sleeve, shaft.  Armstrong #810150-251. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200300-2000708 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 810150-251 273.2 273.2

Awarded

016 Sleeve, shaft.  Armstrong #810150-251. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200300-2000708 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

1 ARMSTRONG 810150-251 291.85 291.85

017 Cartridge, Bearing.  Taco #1600-160RP-2. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200650-1612544 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

2 0 0

017 Cartridge, Bearing.  Taco #1600-160RP-2. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200650-1612544 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

1 Each 
Purchase

2 TACO 1600-160RP-2 473 946

Awarded

017 Cartridge, Bearing.  Taco #1600-160RP-2. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200650-1612544 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

2 TACO 1600-160RP-2 715.1 1430.2

018 Cartridge, Bearing.  Taco #0011-010RP.  NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200650-2012215 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

2 0 0

018 Cartridge, Bearing.  Taco #0011-010RP.  NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200650-2012215 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

1 Each 
Purchase

2 TACO 0011-010RP 254 508

Awarded

018 Cartridge, Bearing.  Taco #0011-010RP.  NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200650-2012215 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

2 TACO 0011-010RP 339 678

019 Flange Kit, 3/4".  Taco #110-251SF. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200650-2011632 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

1 0 0

019 Flange Kit, 3/4".  Taco #110-251SF. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200650-2011632 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

1 Each 
Purchase

1 TACO 110-251SF 43 43

Awarded

019 Flange Kit, 3/4".  Taco #110-251SF. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200650-2011632 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

1 TACO 110-251SF 52 52

020 Flange Kit, 1".  Taco #110-252SF. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200650-2011631 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

3 0 0

020 Flange Kit, 1".  Taco #110-252SF. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200650-2011631 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

1 Each 
Purchase

3 TACO 110-252SF 43 129

Awarded

020 Flange Kit, 1".  Taco #110-252SF. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6200650-2011631 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

3 TACO 110-252SF 52 156

021 Motor, 1/2 HP, 1725 RPM, 115/230 volt, 
48 Frame.  Taco #132-096RP.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6100002-1728641 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

1 0 0



021 Motor, 1/2 HP, 1725 RPM, 115/230 volt, 
48 Frame.  Taco #132-096RP.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6100002-1728641 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

1 Each 
Purchase

1 TACO 132-096RP 569 569

Awarded

021 Motor, 1/2 HP, 1725 RPM, 115/230 volt, 
48 Frame.  Taco #132-096RP.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6100002-1728641 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

1 TACO 132-096RP 861.4 861.4

022 Pump, Lead Free Stainless Steel.  Taco 
#007-SF5.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6225550-1721801 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

2 0 0

022 Pump, Lead Free Stainless Steel.  Taco 
#007-SF5.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6225550-1721801 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

1 Each 
Purchase

2 TACO 007-SF5 388 776

Awarded

022 Pump, Lead Free Stainless Steel.  Taco 
#007-SF5.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6225550-1721801 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

2 TACO 007-SF5 479 958

023 Pump, Circulating Lead Free Stainless 
Steel.  Taco #0011-SF4.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6225550-2011629 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

6 0 0

023 Pump, Circulating Lead Free Stainless 
Steel.  Taco #0011-SF4.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6225550-2011629 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

1 Each 
Purchase

6 TACO 0011-SF4 541 3246

Awarded

023 Pump, Circulating Lead Free Stainless 
Steel.  Taco #0011-SF4.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6225550-2011629 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

6 TACO 0011-SF4 669 4014

024 Pump, Circulating Lead Free Stainless 
Steel.  Taco #0013-SF3.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6225550-2012810 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

6 0 0

024 Pump, Circulating Lead Free Stainless 
Steel.  Taco #0013-SF3.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6225550-2012810 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

1 Each 
Purchase

6 TACO 0013-SF3 602 3612

Awarded

024 Pump, Circulating Lead Free Stainless 
Steel.  Taco #0013-SF3.

NO SUBSTITUTE. 6225550-2012810 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

6 TACO 0013-SF3 733 4398

025 Water seal kit.  Taco #862-172BRP. 4510880-1133562 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

1 0 0

025 Water seal kit.  Taco #862-172BRP. 4510880-1133562 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

1 Each 
Purchase

1 TACO 862-172BRP 373 373

Awarded

025 Water seal kit.  Taco #862-172BRP. 4510880-1133562 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

1 TACO 862-172BRP 572 572

026 Water seal kit.  Taco #1600-868CRP. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510880-1020522 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

1 0 0

026 Water seal kit.  Taco #1600-868CRP. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510880-1020522 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

1 Each 
Purchase

1 TACO 1600-868CRP 85 85

Awarded



026 Water seal kit.  Taco #1600-868CRP. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510880-1020522 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

1 TACO 1600-868CRP 159 159

027 Water seal kit. Taco VR #950-665BRP. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510880-1716225 Plumbers Supply 
Co. Inc.

No Bid 1 Each 
Purchase

2 0 0

027 Water seal kit. Taco VR #950-665BRP. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510880-1716225 Bluegrass Hydronics 
& Pump

1 Each 
Purchase

2 TACO 950-665BRP 404 808

Awarded

027 Water seal kit. Taco VR #950-665BRP. NO SUBSTITUTE. 4510880-1716225 CAPP INC 1 Each 
Purchase

2 TACO 950-665BRP 619 1238



Jefferson County Public Schools
Award Summary
Event Name: PUMP PARTS (VARIOUS TYPES)
Event ID: JCPS-8400
Approval Date: December 3, 2024

Vendor Name Bid Amount Awarded Amount
Bluegrass Hydronics & Pump $11,095.0000 $11,095.0000

CAPP INC $18,277.7000 $178.4500

Plumbers Supply Co. Inc. $3,975.1600 $3,328.9900
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