Jefferson County Public Schools

Bid Tabulation

Event Name: Gases, Industrial/Welding & Supplies

Event ID: JCPS-8396

Approval Date: November 12, 2024

Date Bids Received: September 30, 2024

Contract Period: December 9, 2024 through December 8, 2025

Renewals: No renewal option

Comments: Award Status indicates an award

Item Number	Item/Service	Description	Commodity Code	Vendor Name	No Bid	иом	Quantity	Manufacturer / Provider	Manufacturer Part Number	Unit Bid Price	Total Price	Vendor Response Item Notes	Award Status	Award Notes
001	Electrode, 1/8" E7018, 50 lbs.	Lincoln #ED028281 or equal.	9100090-2013113	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	1	Lincoln	ED028281	\$3.2500	\$3.2500	This is pricing without educational discount; will need to get you registered with Lincoln for better price.	Yes	
001	Electrode, 1/8" E7018, 50 lbs.	Lincoln #ED028281 or equal.	9100090-2013113	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	1	Lincoln	ED028281	\$4.4200	\$4.4200	sold in 50# cans		
001	Electrode, 1/8" E7018, 50 lbs.	Lincoln #ED028281 or equal.	9100090-2013113	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Each	1							
002	Flux, soldering. 4 oz. paste.	Harris #SCPF4 or equal.	9100210-1165742	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	25	Harris	SCPF4	\$3.9700	\$99.2500		Yes	
002	Flux, soldering. 4 oz. paste.	Harris #SCPF4 or equal.	9100210-1165742	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	25	Harris	40027	\$8.9100	\$222.7500	4 oz. jars		
002	Flux, soldering. 4 oz. paste.	Harris #SCPF4 or equal.	9100210-1165742	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Each	25							
003	Gas, Mapp 14.1 oz. throw-a-way (Thin type cylinder only).	Bernzomatic #MG9 or equal.	4500450-2002610	Southern Tool Supply	No	1 - Each	99	BERNZOMATIC 332477	8069049	\$9.6400	\$954.3600	2% 30 DAYS	Yes	
003	Gas, Mapp 14.1 oz. throw-a-way (Thin type cylinder only).	Bernzomatic #MG9 or equal.	4500450-2002610	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	99	Bernzomatic	NAS QLM-PRO	\$12.0500	\$1,192.9500	14.1 oz throw-a-away		
003	Gas, Mapp 14.1 oz. throw-a-way (Thin type cylinder only).	Bernzomatic #MG9 or equal.	4500450-2002610	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	99	Bernzomatic	MG9	\$14.9700	\$1,482.0300			
004	Propane, 14 oz. throw-a-way (Thin type cylinder only).	Bernzomatic #TX9 or equal.	4500450-1247583	Southern Tool Supply	No	1 - Each	20	BERNZOMATIC 304182	9696238	\$5.6200	\$112.4000	2% 30 DAYS	Yes	
004	Propane, 14 oz. throw-a-way (Thin type cylinder only).	Bernzomatic #TX9 or equal.	4500450-1247583	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	20	Bernzomatic	TX9	\$10.0000	\$200.0000			
004	Propane, 14 oz. throw-a-way (Thin type cylinder only).	Bernzomatic #TX9 or equal.	4500450-1247583	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	20	Bernzomatic	WTC LP1759	\$10.9000	\$218.0000	14.1 oz throw-a-away		
005	Solder, 100% lead free 1/8", 1-lb. roll.	Harris #BRGT61 or equal.	9100360-1690682	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Each	40							
	1		1	I	I	1	I		l .	l	l	I .		

005	Solder, 100% lead free 1/8", 1-lb.	Harris #BRGT61 or equal.	9100360-1690682	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	40	Harris	BRGT61	\$30.3000	\$1,212.0000			
	roll.													
													Yes	
005	Solder, 100% lead free 1/8", 1-lb.	Harris #BRGT61 or equal.	9100360-1690682	Welders Supply	No	1 - Each	40	Harris	BRGT61	\$70.1250	\$2,805.0000	1 # roll		
	roll.			Company of Louisville,							, ,			
				Inc.										
006	Solder, silver cadmium free, 5 Troy oz., plastic container. 45%	Harris #4535 or equal.	9100360-1690549	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Each	1							
	silver 1/16".													
	5													
006	Solder, silver cadmium free, 5	Harris #4535 or equal.	9100360-1690549	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	1	Harris	4535	\$132.9000	\$132.9000			
	Troy oz., plastic container. 45%													
	silver 1/16".												Yes	
006	Solder, silver cadmium free, 5	Harris #4535 or equal.	9100360-1690549	Welders Supply	No	1 - Each	1	Harris	AG45CF1165	\$150.0000	\$150.0000	5 tr oz		
	Troy oz., plastic container. 45%			Company of Louisville,			_			7-00.000	,			
	silver 1/16".			Inc.										
	5 H . 500//	11 1 150555	0400055 :-:		.,,									
007	Solder, wire, 50% tin, 50% lead, 1- lb roll, 1/8".	Harris #505061 or equal.	9100360-1313948	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Each	10							
	10 1011, 1/0 .													
007	Solder, wire, 50% tin, 50% lead, 1-	Harris #505061 or equal.	9100360-1313948	Welders Supply	No	1 - Each	10	Harris	505061	\$40.2000	\$402.0000	1 # roll		
	lb roll, 1/8".			Company of Louisville,										
				Inc.									Yes	
007	Solder, wire, 50% tin, 50% lead, 1-	Harris #505061 or equal.	9100360-1313948	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	10	Harris	505061	\$198.5000	\$1,985.0000			
007	lb roll, 1/8".	nams assessed on equal.	3100300 13133 10	Tiolstoil dases		2 20011	10	1101115	303001	\$150.5000	\$1,505.0000			
008	Torch, high intensity, trigger start,	Bernzomatic #TS8000 or equal.	9100570-1654079	Southern Tool Supply	No	1 - Each	30	BERNZOMATIC	5199476	\$51.5400	\$1,546.2000	2% 30 DAYS		
	adjustable flame control.							TS8000T					V	
													Yes	
800	Torch, high intensity, trigger start,	Bernzomatic #TS8000 or equal.	9100570-1654079	Welders Supply	No	1 - Each	30	Bernzomatic	NAs 361524	\$51.5600	\$1,546.8000	Torch		
	adjustable flame control.						30		10.0000001					
				Company of Louisville,			30		10.5501321					
							30		100 301321					
				Company of Louisville,			30		10.0301321					
008	Torch high intensity trigger start	Remonatic #TS8000 or equal	9100570-1654079	Company of Louisville, Inc.	No					\$70,0000	\$2 100 0000			
008	Torch, high intensity, trigger start, adjustable flame control.	Bernzomatic #TS8000 or equal.	9100570-1654079	Company of Louisville,	No	1 - Each	30	Bernzomatic	TS8000	\$70.0000	\$2,100.0000			
008	Torch, high intensity, trigger start, adjustable flame control.	Bernzomatic #TS8000 or equal.	9100570-1654079	Company of Louisville, Inc.	No					\$70.0000	\$2,100.0000			
008		Bernzomatic #TS8000 or equal.	9100570-1654079	Company of Louisville, Inc.	No					\$70.0000	\$2,100.0000			
008		Bernzomatic #TS8000 or equal.	9100570-1654079	Company of Louisville, Inc.	No					\$70.0000	\$2,100.0000			
008		Bernzomatic #TS8000 or equal.	9100570-1654079	Company of Louisville, Inc.	No					\$70.0000	\$2,100.0000			
008		Bernzomatic #TS8000 or equal.	9100570-1654079	Company of Louisville, Inc.	No					\$70.0000	\$2,100.0000			
Lot Item	adjustable flame control.	_		Company of Louisville, Inc. Holston Gases		1 - Each	30	Bernzomatic Manufacturer /	TS8000					
Lot Item Nos. 9-26	adjustable flame control. Item/Service	Bernzomatic #TS8000 or equal. Description	Commodity Code	Company of Louisville, Inc. Hoiston Gases Vendor Name	No Bid	1 - Each	30 Quantity	Bernzomatic	TS8000			Vendor Response Item Notes	Award Status	Award Notes
Lot Item	adjustable flame control.	_		Company of Louisville, Inc. Holston Gases		1 - Each	30	Bernzomatic Manufacturer /	TS8000				Award Status	Award Notes
Lot Item Nos. 9-26	adjustable flame control. Item/Service	_	Commodity Code	Company of Louisville, Inc. Hoiston Gases Vendor Name	No Bid	1 - Each	30 Quantity	Bernzomatic Manufacturer /	TS8000				Award Status	Award Notes
Lot Item Nos. 9-26	adjustable flame control. Item/Service	_	Commodity Code	Company of Louisville, Inc. Hoiston Gases Vendor Name	No Bid	1 - Each	30 Quantity	Bernzomatic Manufacturer /	TS8000				Award Status	Award Notes
Lot Item Nos. 9-26	adjustable flame control. Item/Service	_	Commodity Code	Company of Louisville, Inc. Hoiston Gases Vendor Name	No Bid	1 - Each	30 Quantity	Bernzomatic Manufacturer /	TS8000				Award Status	Award Notes
Lot Item Nos. 9-26	adjustable flame control. Item/Service	_	Commodity Code	Company of Louisville, Inc. Hoiston Gases Vendor Name	No Bid	1 - Each	30 Quantity	Bernzomatic Manufacturer /	TS8000				Award Status	Award Notes
Lot Item Nos. 9-26	adjustable flame control. Item/Service Acetylene. (Price per cu. ft.)	Description	Commodity Code 4600075-1723103	Company of Louisville, Inc. Hoiston Gases Vendor Name Southern Tool Supply	No Bid Yes	UOM 1 - Each	Quantity 830	Bernzomatic Manufacturer /	TS8000				Award Status	Award Notes
Lot Item Nos. 9-26	adjustable flame control. Item/Service Acetylene. (Price per cu. ft.) Acetylene, B-40 cu. ft./cylinder.	Description Please respond to the following in the	Commodity Code	Company of Louisville, Inc. Hoiston Gases Vendor Name	No Bid	1 - Each	30 Quantity	Bernzomatic Manufacturer /	TS8000				Award Status	Award Notes
Lot Item Nos. 9-26	adjustable flame control. Item/Service Acetylene. (Price per cu. ft.)	Description Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field:	Commodity Code 4600075-1723103	Company of Louisville, Inc. Hoiston Gases Vendor Name Southern Tool Supply	No Bid Yes	UOM 1 - Each	Quantity 830	Bernzomatic Manufacturer /	TS8000				Award Status	Award Notes
Lot Item Nos. 9-26	adjustable flame control. Item/Service Acetylene. (Price per cu. ft.) Acetylene, B-40 cu. ft./cylinder.	Description Please respond to the following in the	Commodity Code 4600075-1723103	Company of Louisville, Inc. Hoiston Gases Vendor Name Southern Tool Supply	No Bid Yes	UOM 1 - Each	Quantity 830	Bernzomatic Manufacturer /	TS8000				Award Status	Award Notes
Lot Item Nos. 9-26	adjustable flame control. Item/Service Acetylene. (Price per cu. ft.) Acetylene, B-40 cu. ft./cylinder.	Description Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field:	Commodity Code 4600075-1723103	Company of Louisville, Inc. Hoiston Gases Vendor Name Southern Tool Supply	No Bid Yes	UOM 1 - Each	Quantity 830	Bernzomatic Manufacturer /	TS8000				Award Status	Award Notes
Lot Item Nos. 9-26 009	adjustable flame control. Item/Service Acetylene. (Price per cu. ft.) Acetylene, B-40 cu. ft./cylinder.	Description Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field:	Commodity Code 4600075-1723103	Company of Louisville, Inc. Hoiston Gases Vendor Name Southern Tool Supply	No Bid Yes	UOM 1 - Each	Quantity 830	Bernzomatic Manufacturer /	TS8000				Award Status	Award Notes
Lot Item Nos. 9-26 009	adjustable flame control. Item/Service Acetylene. (Price per cu. ft.) Acetylene, B-40 cu. ft./cylinder. (Price per cylinder.)	Description Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	Commodity Code 4600075-1723103 4500050-1006422	Company of Louisville, Inc. Holston Gases Vendor Name Southern Tool Supply Southern Tool Supply	No Bid Yes	1 - Each UOM 1 - Each	Quantity 830	Bernzomatic Manufacturer /	TS8000				Award Status	Award Notes
Lot Item Nos. 9-26 009	adjustable flame control. Item/Service Acetylene. (Price per cu. ft.) Acetylene, B-40 cu. ft./cylinder. (Price per cylinder.) Acetylene, MC-10 cu. ft./cylinder.	Description Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge. Please respond to the following in the	Commodity Code 4600075-1723103	Company of Louisville, Inc. Hoiston Gases Vendor Name Southern Tool Supply	No Bid Yes	UOM 1 - Each	Quantity 830	Bernzomatic Manufacturer /	TS8000				Award Status	Award Notes
Lot Item Nos. 9-26 009	adjustable flame control. Item/Service Acetylene. (Price per cu. ft.) Acetylene, B-40 cu. ft./cylinder. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS	Commodity Code 4600075-1723103 4500050-1006422	Company of Louisville, Inc. Holston Gases Vendor Name Southern Tool Supply Southern Tool Supply	No Bid Yes	1 - Each UOM 1 - Each	Quantity 830	Bernzomatic Manufacturer /	TS8000				Award Status	Award Notes
Lot Item Nos. 9-26 009	adjustable flame control. Item/Service Acetylene. (Price per cu. ft.) Acetylene, B-40 cu. ft./cylinder. (Price per cylinder.) Acetylene, MC-10 cu. ft./cylinder.	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and	Commodity Code 4600075-1723103 4500050-1006422	Company of Louisville, Inc. Holston Gases Vendor Name Southern Tool Supply Southern Tool Supply	No Bid Yes	1 - Each UOM 1 - Each	Quantity 830	Bernzomatic Manufacturer /	TS8000				Award Status	Award Notes
Lot Item Nos. 9-26 009	adjustable flame control. Item/Service Acetylene. (Price per cu. ft.) Acetylene, B-40 cu. ft./cylinder. (Price per cylinder.) Acetylene, MC-10 cu. ft./cylinder.	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS	Commodity Code 4600075-1723103 4500050-1006422	Company of Louisville, Inc. Holston Gases Vendor Name Southern Tool Supply Southern Tool Supply	No Bid Yes	1 - Each UOM 1 - Each	Quantity 830	Bernzomatic Manufacturer /	TS8000				Award Status	Award Notes
Lot Item Nos. 9-26 009	adjustable flame control. Item/Service Acetylene. (Price per cu. ft.) Acetylene, B-40 cu. ft./cylinder. (Price per cylinder.) Acetylene, MC-10 cu. ft./cylinder.	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and	Commodity Code 4600075-1723103 4500050-1006422	Company of Louisville, Inc. Holston Gases Vendor Name Southern Tool Supply Southern Tool Supply	No Bid Yes	1 - Each UOM 1 - Each	Quantity 830	Bernzomatic Manufacturer /	TS8000				Award Status	Award Notes

_										
012	Argon. (Price per cu. ft.)		4600075-1723104	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Each	2000			
013	Argon and Carbon Dioxide Mix, 75% Argon - 25% Carbon Dioxide. (Price per cu. ft.)		4600075-1723105	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Each	7000			
014	Argon and Carbon Dioxide Mix, 75% Argon - 25% Carbon Dioxide. 96 cu. ft. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500125-1717308	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Each	1			
015	Carbon Dioxide (CO2). (Price per pound.)		4600075-1723106	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Pound	1			
016	Carbon Dioxide (CO2). 20 lb. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500150-1538992	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Each	1			
017	Carbon Dioxide (CO2). 10 lb. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500150-1110872	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Each	1			
018	Carbon Dioxide (CO2). 5 lb. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500150-1110881	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Each	55			
019	Nitrogen. With oil pump or water pump. (Price per cu. ft.)		4600075-1723107	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Each	1600			
020	Oxygen. (Price per cu. ft.)		4600075-1723108	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Each	9000			
021	Oxygen. 40 cu. ft. or comparable. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500400-1133919	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Each	5			
022	Oxygen. 20 cu. ft. or comparable. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500400-1187148	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Each	10			

	D (D: 1)		4500075 4574040	la =	.,	4 5 1						1		
023	Propane. (Price per pound.)		4600075-1574210	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Pound	1							
024	Propane, 34 lb. cylinder for forklift. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500450-1247574	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Each	20							
025	Propane, 100 lb. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500450-1079676	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Each	4							
026	Propane, 20 lb. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500450-1146736	Southern Tool Supply	Yes	1 - Each	10							
009	Acetylene. (Price per cu. ft.)		4600075-1723103	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	830	Welders Supply & Gases	GAS AC4	0.506	419.98	130 average cf per cylinder.	Yes	Awarded - as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 9 thru 26.
010	Acetylene, B-40 cu. ft./cylinder. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500050-1006422	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	20	Welders Supply & Gases	GAS ACB	20	400	40 cf cylinder. These tanks (small) would be exchanged as this gas is ordered and there is no demurrage. If additional tanks are needed beyond even exchanges the tanks could be purchased.	Yes	Awarded - as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 9 thru 26.
011	Acetylene, MC-10 cu. ft./cylinder. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500050-1006413	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	15	Welders Supply & Gases	GAS ACMC	14	210	10 of cylinder. these tanks (small) would be exchanged as this gas is ordered and there is no demurrage. If additional tanks are needed beyond even exchanges the tanks could be purchased.	Yes	Awarded - as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 9 thru 26.
012	Argon. (Price per cu. ft.)		4600075-1723104	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	2000	Welders Supply & Gases	GAS AR300	0.052	104	336 cf cylinder.	Yes	Awarded - as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 9 thru 26.
013	Argon and Carbon Dioxide Mix, 75% Argon - 25% Carbon Dioxide. (Price per cu. ft.)		4600075-1723105	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	7000	Welders Supply & Gases	GAS AG25300	0.052	364	380 cf cylinder.	Yes	Awarded - as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 9 thru 26.
014	Argon and Carbon Dioxide Mix, 75% Argon - 25% Carbon Dioxide. 96 cu. ft. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500125-1717308	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	1	Welders Supply & gases	GAS AG25100	9.6	9.6	136 cf cylinder.	Yes	Awarded - as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 9 thru 26.
015	Carbon Dioxide (CO2). (Price per pound.)		4600075-1723106	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Pound	1	Welders Supply & gases	GAS CO250	0.23	0.23	50 lb cylinder, syphon. Price per poind.	Yes	Awarded - as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 9 thru 26.

016	Carbon Dioxide (CO2). 20 lb. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500150-1538992	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	1	Welders Supply & gases	GAS CO220	7.6	7.6	20 lb cylinder. These tanks (small) would be exchanged as this gas is ordered and there is no demurrge. If additioanl tanks are needed beyond even exchange the tanks could be purchased.	Yes	Awarded - as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 9 thru 26.
017	Carbon Dioxide (CO2). 10 lb. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500150-1110872	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	1	Welders Supply & gases	GAS CO210	7.6	7.6	10 lb cylinder. these tanks (small) would be exchanged as this gas is ordered and there is no demurrage. If additional tanks are needed beyond even exchange the tanks could be purchased.	Yes	Awarded - as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 9 thru 26.
018	Carbon Dioxide (CO2). 5 lb. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500150-1110881	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	55	Welders Supply & gases	GAS CO25	6.6	363	5 lb cylinder. These tanks (small) would be exchanged as this gas is ordered and there is no demurrage. If additional tanks are needed beyond even exchange the tanks could be purchased.	Yes	Awarded - as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 9 thru 26.
019	Nitrogen. With oil pump or water pump. (Price per cu. ft.)		4600075-1723107	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	1600	Welders Supply & gases	GAS WPN100	0.028	44.8	115 cf cylinder	Yes	Awarded - as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 9 thru 26.
020	Oxygen. (Price per cu. ft.)		4600075-1723108	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	9000	Welders Supply & gases	GAS OX200	0.0265	238.5	251 cf cylinder	Yes	Awarded - as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 9 thru 26.
021	Oxygen. 40 cu. ft. or comparable. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500400-1133919	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	5	Welders Supply & gases	GAS OX40	4.9	24.5	40 cf cylinder. These tanks (small) would be exchanged as this gas is ordered and there is no demurrage. If additional tanks are needed beyond even exchange the tanks could be purchased.	Yes	Awarded - as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 9 thru 26.
022	Oxygen. 20 cu. ft. or comparable. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500400-1187148	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	10	Welders Supply & gases	GAS OXR	4.9	49	20 cf cylinder. These tanks (small) would be exchanged as this gas is ordered and there is no demurrage. If additional tanks are needed beyond even exchange the tanks could be purchased.	Yes	Awarded - as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 9 thru 26.
023	Propane. (Price per pound.)		4600075-1574210	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Pound	1	Welders Supply & gases	GAS PR40RED	0.55	0.55	40 lb cylinder	Yes	Awarded - as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 9 thru 26.
024	Propane, 34 lb. cylinder for forklift. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500450-1247574	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	20	Welders Supply & gases	GAS PR34RED	18.7	374	34 lb cylinder	Yes	Awarded - as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 9 thru 26.
025	Propane, 100 lb. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500450-1079676	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	4	Welders Supply & gases	GAS PR 100RED	59	236	100 lb cylinder	Yes	Awarded - as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 9 thru 26.
026	Propane, 20 lb. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500450-1146736	Welders Supply Company of Louisville, Inc.	No	1 - Each	10	Welders Supply & gases	GAS PR20CO	11	110	20 lb cylinder. These tanks (small) would be exchanged as this gas is ordered and there is no demurrage. If additional tanks are needed beyond even exchange the tanks could be purchased.	Yes	Awarded - as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 9 thru 26.

009	Acetylene. (Price per cu. ft.)		4600075-1723103	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	830	Holston Gases	SA	\$0.5000	\$415.0000	125CF Cylinder; \$4.00/month rental charge	
010	Acetylene, B-40 cu. ft./cylinder. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500050-1006422	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	20	Holston Gases	B-POL	\$20.7600	\$415.2000	40CF Cylinder; \$2.00/month rental charge	
011	Acetylene, MC-10 cu. ft./cylinder. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500050-1006413	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	15	Holston Gases	MC	\$14.5900	\$218.8500	10CF Cylinder; \$2.00/month rental charge	
012	Argon. (Price per cu. ft.)		4600075-1723104	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	2000	Holston Gases	LAR	\$0.0795	\$159.0000	336CF Cylinder; \$4.00/month rental charge	
013	Argon and Carbon Dioxide Mix, 75% Argon - 25% Carbon Dioxide. (Price per cu. ft.)		4600075-1723105	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	7000	Holston Gases	AG-25	\$0.0795	\$556.5000	375CF Cylinder; \$4.00/month rental charge	
014	Argon and Carbon Dioxide Mix, 75% Argon - 25% Carbon Dioxide. 96 cu. ft. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500125-1717308	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	1	Holston Gases	AG-25S	\$7.6320	\$7.6300	96CF Cylinder; \$2.00/month rental charge	
015	Carbon Dioxide (CO2). (Price per pound.)		4600075-1723106	Holston Gases	No	1 - Pound	1	Holston Gases	50CD	\$0.2500	\$0.2500	50lb Cylinder; \$4.00/month rental charge	
016	Carbon Dioxide (CO2). 20 lb. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500150-1538992	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	1	Holston Gases	20CD	\$5.0000	\$5.0000	20lb cylinder; \$2.00/month rental charge	
017	Carbon Dioxide (CO2). 10 lb. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500150-1110872	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	1	Holston Gases	10CD	\$2.5000	\$2.5000	10lb cylinder; \$2.00/month rental charge	
018	Carbon Dioxide (CO2). 5 lb. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500150-1110881	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	55	Holston Gases	5CD	\$1.2500	\$68.7500	5lb cylinder; \$2.00/month rental charge	
019	Nitrogen. With oil pump or water pump. (Price per cu. ft.)		4600075-1723107	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	1600	Holston Gases	LN	\$0.0619	\$99.0400	304CF Cylinder; \$4.00/month rental charge	

020	Oxygen. (Price per cu. ft.)		4600075-1723108	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	9000	Holston Gases	LO	\$0.0335	\$301.5000	337CF Cylinder; \$4.00/month rental charge	
021	Oxygen. 40 cu. ft. or comparable. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500400-1133919	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	5	Holston Gases	400	\$8.0000	\$40.0000	40CF Cylinder; \$2.00/month rental charge	
022	Oxygen. 20 cu. ft. or comparable. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500400-1187148	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	10	Holston Gases	RO	\$6.0000	\$60.0000	20CF Cylinder; \$2.00/month rental charge	
023	Propane. (Price per pound.)		4600075-1574210	Holston Gases	No	1 - Pound	1	Holston Gases	PRBULK	\$0.5800	\$0.5800	Various tank sizes	
024	Propane, 34 lb. cylinder for forklift. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500450-1247574	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	20	Holston Gases	33P	\$19.7200	\$394.4000	34lb propane tank for forklift; \$2.00/month rental charge	
025	Propane, 100 lb. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500450-1079676	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	4	Holston Gases	100P	\$58.0000	\$232.0000	100lb propane tank; \$4.00/month rental charge	
026	Propane, 20 lb. (Price per cylinder.)	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: State cylinder size and demurrage charge.	4500450-1146736	Holston Gases	No	1 - Each	10	Holston Gases	20P	\$11.6000	\$116.0000	20lb propane tank; \$2.00/month rental charge	

Jefferson County Public Schools

Award Summary

Event Name: Gases, Industrial/Welding & Supplies

Event ID: JCPS-8396

Approval Date: November 12, 2024

Vendor	Bid Amount	Award Total
Holston Gases	\$10,306.6300	\$1,447.4000
Southern Tool	\$2,612.9600	\$2,612.9600
Welders Supply	\$9,505.2800	\$3,365.3600