Jefferson County Public Schools
Bid Tabulation
Event Name: Water Coolers, Fountains & Parts
Event ID: JCPS-8389

Approval Date: October 15, 2024
Date Bids Received: September 16, 2024

Contract Period: December 1, 2024 through November 30, 2025
Renewals: No renewal options
Comments: Award Status indicates an award

Vendor
Item Commodity Manuf: ! Manuf: Response Item
Numb vice Description Code Vendor Name | No Bid UOM | Quantity Provider Part Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Notes Award Status Award Notes
001 Assembly, diaphragm for |Halsey Taylor #60-14757-550, Sexauer #055665 or Trayco| 6150200-1022628 Best Plumbing No Bid 1-Each 1 $0.0000 $0.0000
Halsey Taylor. #131797. NO SUBSTITUTE. Specialties, Inc.
001 Assembly, diaphragm for |Halsey Taylor #60-14757-550, Sexauer #055665 or Trayco| 6150200-1022628 | Plumbers Supply 1-Each 1 HALSEY TAYLOR / 6014757550 $23.3800 $23.3800
Halsey Taylor. #131797. NO SUBSTITUTE. Co. Inc. ELKAY
Awarded
002 Bubbler, for PBAM. Oasis #032799-005. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150260-2012074 Best Plumbing No Bid 1-Each 13 $0.0000 $0.0000
Specialties, Inc.
002 Bubbler, for PBAM. Oasis #032799-005. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150260-2012074 | Plumbers Supply 1-Each 13 OASIS 032799-005 $89.1200 $1,158.5600
Co. Inc.
Awarded
002 Bubbler, for PBAM. Oasis #032799-005. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150260-2012074 | Plumbmaster, Inc. 1-Each 13 OASIS 032799-005 $98.5000 $1,280.5000 PM# 33916
003 Cartridge, bubbler, fits all Tomlinson Ind. #1017157/7701PFLF Pro-Flo. NO 6150165-1183473 Best Plumbing No Bid 1-Each 10 $0.0000 $0.0000
brands of coolers, stainless SUBSTITUTE. Specialties, Inc.
steel housing with plastic
cover and rubber gasket,
120 PSI/8 bar.
003 Cartridge, bubbler, fits all Tomlinson Ind. #1017157/7701PFLF Pro-Flo. NO 6150165-1183473 | Plumbers Supply No Bid 1-Each 10 $0.0000 $0.0000
brands of coolers, stainless SUBSTITUTE. Co. Inc.
steel housing with plastic
cover and rubber gasket,
120 PSI/8 bar.
004 Cooler, water. Halsey Taylor #WC8AFS. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-1722143 Best Plumbing No Bid 1-Each 8 $0.0000 $0.0000
Specialties, Inc.
004 Cooler, water. Halsey Taylor #WC8AFS. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-1722143 | Plumbmaster, Inc. 1-Each 8 HALSEY TAYLOR HAC8PV-NF $637.5000 $5,100.0000 Reject - item is discontinued.
(replaces the
WCBAFS)
004 Cooler, water. Halsey Taylor #WC8AFS. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-1722143 | Plumbers Supply 1- Each 8 OASIS PLF8SKTP $1,397.6200 $11,180.9600 Reject - item is discontinued.
Co. Inc. WCBAFS
DISCONTINUED
005 Cooler, water. Oasis #PLF13P. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-1662738 Best Plumbing No Bid 1-Each 2 $0.0000 $0.0000

Specialties, Inc.




005 Cooler, water. Oasis #PLF13P. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-1662738 | Plumbers Supply 1-Each 2 OASIS PLF13P $1,098.9500 $2,197.9000
Co. Inc.
Awarded
005 Cooler, water. Oasis #PLF13P. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-1662738 | Plumbmaster, Inc. 1-Each 2 OASIS PLF13P $1,171.2500 $2,342.5000
006 Cooler, water. Oasis #PG8AC. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-1672181 Best Plumbing No Bid 1-Each 35 $0.0000 $0.0000
Specialties, Inc.
006 Cooler, water. Oasis #PG8AC. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-1672181 | Plumbers Supply 1-Each 35 OASIS PG8AC $493.1300 $17,259.5500
Co. Inc.
Awarded
006 Cooler, water. Oasis #PG8AC. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-1672181 | Plumbmaster, Inc. 1-Each 35 OASIS PG8AC $739.5000 $25,882.5000
007 Cooler, water. Oasis #P8M. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-1134329 Best Plumbing No Bid 1-Each 10 $0.0000 $0.0000
Specialties, Inc.
007 Cooler, water. Oasis #P8M. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-1134329 | Plumbers Supply 1-Each 10 OASIS P8M $915.5100 $9,155.1000
Co. Inc.
Awarded
007 Cooler, water. Oasis #P8M. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-1134329 | Plumbmaster, Inc. 1-Each 10 OASIS P8M $1,011.9000 $10,119.0000
008 Cooler, water, with bottle Oasis #PWEBF. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-2014915 Best Plumbing No Bid 1-Each 20 $0.0000 $0.0000
filler, retro fit kit. Specialties, Inc.
008 Cooler, water, with bottle Oasis #PWEBF. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-2014915 | Plumbers Supply 1-Each 20 OASIS PWEBF $578.3900 $11,567.8000
filler, retro fit kit. Co. Inc.
Awarded
008 Cooler, water, with bottle Oasis #PWEBF. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-2014915 | Plumbmaster, Inc. 1-Each 20 OASIS 507000 (replaces $646.9000 $12,938.0000
filler, retro fit kit. the PWEBF)
009 Cooler, water, with bottle Oasis #PGV8EBF. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-2014050 Best Plumbing No Bid 1-Each 1 $0.0000 $0.0000
filler, stainless steel. Specialties, Inc.
009 Cooler, water, with bottle Oasis #PGV8EBF. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-2014050 | Plumbers Supply 1-Each 1 OASIS PGV8EBF $1,471.9400 $1,471.9400

filler, stainless steel.

Co. Inc.

Awarded




009 Cooler, water, with bottle Oasis #PGVSEBF. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-2014050 | Plumbmaster, Inc. 1-Each 1 OASIS 507063 (replaces $1,646.2500 $1,646.2500
filler, stainless steel. the PGVSEBF)
010 Fountain, water. Oasis #PCM. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150260-1718388 Best Plumbing No Bid 1-Each 10 $0.0000 $0.0000
Specialties, Inc.
010 Fountain, water. Oasis #PCM. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150260-1718888 | Plumbers Supply 1-Each 10 OASIS PCM $364.1700 $3,641.7000
Co. Inc.
Awarded
010 Fountain, water. Oasis #PCM. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150260-1718888 | Plumbmaster, Inc. 1-Each 10 OASIS PCM $402.5000 $4,025.0000
011 Nozzle, bubbler. Oasis #030029-005. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150260-1729396 Best Plumbing No Bid 1-Each 10 $0.0000 $0.0000
Specialties, Inc.
011 Nozzle, bubbler. Oasis #030029-005. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150260-1729396 | Plumbers Supply 1-Each 10 OASIS 030029-005 $47.5000 $475.0000
Co. Inc.
Awarded
011 Nozzle, bubbler. Oasis #030029-005. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150260-1729396 | Plumbmaster, Inc. 1-Each 10 OASIS 030029-005 $53.9000 $539.0000 PM# 33923
012 Regulator. Elkay #61314C. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-2011918 | Plumbers Supply No Bid 1-Each 20 $0.0000 $0.0000
Co. Inc.
012 Regulator. Elkay #61314C. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-2011918 Best Plumbing 1-Each 20 Elkay 61314C $32.5900 $651.8000 Best Part # 77853
Specialties, Inc.
Awarded
012 Regulator. Elkay #61314C. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-2011918 | Plumbmaster, Inc. 1-Each 20 ELKAY 61314C $33.1500 $663.0000 PM# 37248
013 Valve, bubbler. Oasis #12000A or #030774-006. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-1233212 Best Plumbing No Bid 1-Each 50 $0.0000 $0.0000
Specialties, Inc.
013 Valve, bubbler. Oasis #12000A or #030774-006. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-1233212 | Plumbers Supply 1-Each 50 OASIS 030774-006 $126.3100 $6,315.5000
Co. Inc.
Awarded
013 Valve, bubbler. Oasis #12000A or #030774-006. NO SUBSTITUTE. 6150165-1233212 | Plumbmaster, Inc. 1-Each 50 OASIS 030774-006 $132.7000 $6,635.0000




Jefferson County Public Schools
Award Summary
Event Name: Water Coolers, Fountains & Parts

Event ID: JCPS-8389
Approval Date: October 15, 2024

Plumbmaster, Inc. $71,170.7500

Best Plumbing Specialties, Inc. $651.8000 $651.8000
Plumbers Supply Co. Inc. $64,447.3900 $53,266.4300
$0.0000
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