
Jefferson County Public Schools
Bid Tabulation 
Event Name: Tile & Related Items (Including Installation & Removal)
Event ID: JCPS-8374
Approval Date: September 3, 2024 
Date Bids Received: July 24, 2025
Contract Period: October 27, 2024 through October 26, 2025
Renewals: No renewal option
Comments: Award Status indicates an award

Item 
Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer 
Part Number Unit Bid Price Total Price

Vendor 
Response Item 

Notes Award Status Award Notes
001 Base, cove 1/8" x 4" black rubber (120 linear 

ft./ctn.). Must conform to ASTMF-1861, Type 
TP.

Approved Products: Johnsonite #DC40, Roppe or equal. PRICE PER 
LINEAR FOOT. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: No. of linear ft. per carton.

1515600-1127604 Parker Acoustical 1-Each 40 Roppe Roppe 128 5120

Awarded

002 Base, cove 1/8" x 4" brown rubber (120 
linear fr./ctn). 4' section. Must conform to 

ASTMF-1861 Type Tp.

Approved Products: Johnsonite #DC47, Roppe or equal. PRICE PER 
LINEAR FOOT. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: No. of linear ft. per carton.

1515600-1160096 Parker Acoustical 1-Each 10 Roppe Roppe 128 1280

Awarded

003 Base, cove 1/8" x 6" black rubber (120 linear 
ft./ctn.). Must conform to ASTMF-1861, Type 

TP.

Approved Products: Johnsonite #DC40, Roppe or equal. PRICE PER 
LINEAR FOOT. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: No. of linear ft. per carton.

1515600-1690870 Parker Acoustical 1-Each 1 Roppe Roppe 172 172

Awarded

004 Base, cove 1/8" x 6" brown rubber (120 
linear ft./ctn.), 4' section. Must conform to 

ASTMF-1861, Type TP.

Approved Products: Johnsonite #DC47, Roppe or equal. PRICE PER 
LINEAR FOOT. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: No. of linear ft. per carton.

1515600-1726155 Parker Acoustical 1-Each 1 Roppe Roppe 172 172

Awarded

005 Base, cove 1/8" x 4" black rubber, outside 
comer, 25/ct.

Must conform to ASTMF-1861, Type TP. Approved Product: Johnsonite 
or equal.

1515600-1127613 Parker Acoustical 1-25 Count 
Carton

1 Roppe Roppe 110 110

Awarded

006 Natural fissureed tile, 5/8" x 12" x 12", (48 sq. 
ft./ctn.)

Approved Product: USG #2990 or equal. Please respond to the 
following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: No. of sq. ft. 

per carton and size of tile.

1515580-1182545 Parker Acoustical No Bid 1-48 Sq. Ft.
Carton

10 0 0

006 Natural fissureed tile, 5/8" x 12" x 12", (48 sq. 
ft./ctn.)

Approved Product: USG #2990 or equal. Please respond to the 
following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: No. of sq. ft. 

per carton and size of tile.

1515580-1182545 Acoustical & Drywall 
Supply

1-48 Sq. Ft.
Carton

10 USG USG #2990 94.37 943.7

Awarded

007 Fissured ceiling tile, 5/8" x 2' x 2' (64 sq. 
ft./ctn.)

Approved Product: USG-2210 or equal. Please respond to the following 
in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES FIELD: No. of sq. ft. per carton 

and size of tile.

1515580-2013074 Parker Acoustical No Bid 1-64 Sq. Ft.
Carton

200 0 0

007 Fissured ceiling tile, 5/8" x 2' x 2' (64 sq. 
ft./ctn.)

Approved Product: USG-2210 or equal. Please respond to the following 
in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES FIELD: No. of sq. ft. per carton 

and size of tile.

1515580-2013074 Acoustical & Drywall 
Supply

1-64 Sq. Ft.
Carton

200 USG USG #2210 43.6 8720

Awarded

008 Fissured ceiling tile, 5/8" x 2' x 4' (64 sq. 
ft./ctn.)

Approved Product: USG-2410 or equal. Please respond to the following 
in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES FIELD: No. of sq. ft. per carton 

and size of tile.

1515580-1184105 Parker Acoustical No Bid 1-64 Sq. Ft.
Carton

500 0 0

008 Fissured ceiling tile, 5/8" x 2' x 4' (64 sq. 
ft./ctn.)

Approved Product: USG-2410 or equal. Please respond to the following 
in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES FIELD: No. of sq. ft. per carton 

and size of tile.

1515580-1184105 Acoustical & Drywall 
Supply

1-64 Sq. Ft.
Carton

500 USG USG #2410 43.29 21645

Awarded

009 Rock face ceiling tile, lay in panels, 5/8" x 2' x 
4' (48 sq. ft./ctn.)

Approved Product: USG-5894or equal. Please respond to the following 
in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES FIELD: No. of sq. ft. per carton 

and size of tile.

1515580-1415454 Parker Acoustical No Bid 1-48 Sq. Ft.
Carton

1 0 0

009 Rock face ceiling tile, lay in panels, 5/8" x 2' x 
4' (48 sq. ft./ctn.)

Approved Product: USG-5894or equal. Please respond to the following 
in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES FIELD: No. of sq. ft. per carton 

and size of tile.

1515580-1415454 Acoustical & Drywall 
Supply

1-48 Sq. Ft.
Carton

1 USG USG #5894 115.68 115.68

Awarded

010 Ceiling panel, Glasbord FRP, 2' x 4' x .10', 
white, pebble finish.

Approved Product: Crane CGI #6906 or equal. 1515580-1731816 Parker Acoustical No Bid 1-Each 1 0 0

010 Ceiling panel, Glasbord FRP, 2' x 4' x .10', 
white, pebble finish.

Approved Product: Crane CGI #6906 or equal. 1515580-1731816 Acoustical & Drywall 
Supply

1-Each 1 CRANE CRANE CGPF 
CLASS C

19.2 19.2

Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 11-15 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer 
Part Number Unit Bid Price Total Price

Vendor 
Response Item 

Notes Award Status Award Notes



011 Vinyl floor tile, 12" x 12" x 1/8". Cottage Tan. Approved Product: Standard Armstrong #51830. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1515600-1697395 Parker Acoustical No Bid 1-45 Sq. Foot 
Box

1200 0 0

012 Vinyl floor tile, 12" x 12" x 1/8". Polar White. Approved Product: Standard Armstrong #51941. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1515600-1722661 Parker Acoustical No Bid 1-45 Sq. Foot 
Box

48 0 0

013 Vinyl floor tile, 12" x 12" x 1/8". Sterling. Approved Product: Standard Armstrong #51904. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1515600-1733443 Parker Acoustical No Bid 1-45 Sq. Foot 
Box

600 0 0

014 Vinyl floor tile, 12" x 12" x 1/8". Gentian 
Blue.

Approved Product: Standard Armstrong #51946. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1515600-1733444 Parker Acoustical No Bid 1-45 Sq. Foot 
Box

1 0 0

015 Vinyl floor tile, 12" x 12" x 1/8". Color to be 
selected at time of order.

Approved Product: Standard Armstrong. NO SUBSTITUTE. Please 
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES FIELD: 

List available colors.

4600075-1733493 Parker Acoustical No Bid 1-45 Sq. Foot 
Box

1 0 0

011 Vinyl floor tile, 12" x 12" x 1/8". Cottage Tan. Approved Product: Standard Armstrong #51830. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1515600-1697395 Sherwin Williams #1245 1-45 Sq. Foot 
Box

1200 Armstrong/JJ 
Haines

101245371 56.95 68340

Awarded

012 Vinyl floor tile, 12" x 12" x 1/8". Polar White. Approved Product: Standard Armstrong #51941. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1515600-1722661 Sherwin Williams #1245 1-45 Sq. Foot 
Box

48 Armstrong/JJ 
Haines

101244036 56.95 2733.6

Awarded

013 Vinyl floor tile, 12" x 12" x 1/8". Sterling. Approved Product: Standard Armstrong #51904. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1515600-1733443 Sherwin Williams #1245 1-45 Sq. Foot 
Box

600 Armstrong/JJ 
Haines

101244192 56.95 34170

Awarded

014 Vinyl floor tile, 12" x 12" x 1/8". Gentian 
Blue.

Approved Product: Standard Armstrong #51946. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1515600-1733444 Sherwin Williams #1245 1-45 Sq. Foot 
Box

1 Armstrong/JJ 
Haines

101245595 56.95 56.95

Awarded

015 Vinyl floor tile, 12" x 12" x 1/8". Color to be 
selected at time of order.

Approved Product: Standard Armstrong. NO SUBSTITUTE. Please 
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES FIELD: 

List available colors.

4600075-1733493 Sherwin Williams #1245 1-45 Sq. Foot 
Box

1 Armstrong/JJ 
Haines

VCT 56.95 56.95

Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 16-19 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer 
Part Number Unit Bid Price Total Price

Vendor 
Response Item 

Notes Award Status Award Notes
016 Removal of non-asbestos floor tile. Please state price per sq. ft. 4600649-2010797 Sherwin Williams #1245 No Bid 1-Sq. Ft. 1 0 0

017 Removal of non-asbestos floor tile including 
slab preparation.

Please state price per sq. ft. 4600649-2010798 Sherwin Williams #1245 No Bid 1-Sq. Ft. 1 0 0

018 Installation, for vinyl floor tile, including 
adhesive.

Price per sq. ft. shall also include "floor preparation". 4600649-2010253 Sherwin Williams #1245 No Bid 1-Sq. Ft. 1 0 0

019 Installation, for cove base (4" or 6") Price per linear foot, including adhesive. 4600649-2013444 Sherwin Williams #1245 No Bid 1-Ft. 1 0 0

016 Removal of non-asbestos floor tile. Please state price per sq. ft. 4600649-2010797 Parker Acoustical 1-Sq. Ft. 1 Parker Labor 0.9 0.9

Awarded

017 Removal of non-asbestos floor tile including 
slab preparation.

Please state price per sq. ft. 4600649-2010798 Parker Acoustical 1-Sq. Ft. 1 Parker Labor 1.56 1.56

Awarded

018 Installation, for vinyl floor tile, including 
adhesive.

Price per sq. ft. shall also include "floor preparation". 4600649-2010253 Parker Acoustical 1-Sq. Ft. 1 Parker Labor 1.74 1.74

Awarded

019 Installation, for cove base (4" or 6") Price per linear foot, including adhesive. 4600649-2013444 Parker Acoustical 1-Ft. 1 Parker Labor 1.63 1.63

Awarded



Jefferson County Public Schools
Award Summary
Event Name: Tile & Related Items (Including Installation & Removal)
Event ID: JCPS-8374
Approval Date: September 3, 2024 

Vendor Bid Section Bid Amount Award Amount

Acoustical & Drywall Supply Bid Items: 1-10 $31,443.58 $31,443.58

Parker Acoustical Bid Items: 1-10 $6,854.00 $6,854.00

Parker Acoustical Lot Items: 16-19 $5.83 $5.83

Sherwin Williams #1245 Lot Items: 11-15 $105,357.50 $105,357.50
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