Jefferson County Public Schools

Bid Tabulation

Event Name: First Aid

Event ID: JCPS-8372

Approval Date: August 20, 2024

Date Bids Received: July 23, 2024

Contract Period: November 10, 2024 through November 9, 2025

No renewal option

C Award Status indi an award
Item ! Vendor Response
Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid uom Quantity Provider Part Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Item Notes Award Status Award Notes
001 Ball, absorbent, pure natural cotton, Kendal #2600 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800100-1073494 Elemental No Bid 500 Count 200
500/bag. approved product. Enterprises, LLC Bag
001 Ball, absorbent, pure natural cotton, Kendal #2600 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800100-1073494 Lite Source Inc No Bid 500 Count 200
500/bag. approved product. Bag
001 Ball, absorbent, pure natural cotton, Kendal #2600 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800100-1073494 | PYRAMID SCHOOL No Bid 500 Count 200
500/bag. approved product. PRODUCTS Bag
001 Ball, absorbent, pure natural cotton, Kendal #2600 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800100-1073494 School Health No Bid 500 Count 200
500/bag. approved product. Corporation Bag
001 Ball, absorbent, pure natural cotton, Kendal #2600 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800100-1073494 SCHOOL NURSE No Bid 500 Count 200
500/bag. approved product. SUPPLY INC Bag
001 Ball, absorbent, pure natural cotton, Kendal #2600 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800100-1073494 Henry Schein 500 Count 200 Richmond 183110 1004852 $8.1600 $1,632.0000 stock Reject - did not submit
500/bag. approved product. Bag sample for evaluation.
001 Ball, absorbent, pure natural cotton, Kendal #2600 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800100-1073494 | Bound Tree Medical, 500 Count 200 DYNAREX 3170 $8.3900 $1,678.0000 8.39/2000/BG
500/bag. approved product. Bag CORPORATION
002 Bandage, adhesive, 2" x 4 1/2", sterile, Dynarex #3634 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-1672762 | PYRAMID SCHOOL No Bid 50 Count 300
LATEX-FREE, 50/box. approved product. PRODUCTS Box
002 Bandage, adhesive, 2" x 4 1/2", sterile, Dynarex #3634 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-1672762 | Bound Tree Medical, 50 Count 300 DYNAREX 3634 $2.8200 $846.0000 2.82|50/BX
LATEX-FREE, 50/box. approved product. Box CORPORATION
002 Bandage, adhesive, 2" x 4 1/2", sterile, Dynarex #3634 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-1672762 Lite Source Inc 50 Count 300 Dynarex 3634 $2.9800 $894.0000 order in case qty (24/cs)
LATEX-FREE, 50/box. approved product. Box
002 Bandage, adhesive, 2" x 4 1/2", sterile, Dynarex #3634 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-1672762 Henry Schein 50 Count 300 Dynarex 3634 2674121 $3.3600 $1,008.0000 stock
LATEX-FREE, 50/box. approved product. Box
002 Bandage, adhesive, 2" x 4 1/2", sterile, Dynarex #3634 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-1672762 SCHOOL NURSE 50 Count 300 Dynarex (private 3634/50280 $3.8800 $1,164.0000 This item is bid out as
LATEX-FREE, 50/box. approved product. SUPPLY INC Box labeled with our exact to Dynarex #3634,
company name) but with our company
name and logo on the
box)
002 Bandage, adhesive, 2" x 4 1/2", sterile, Dynarex #3634 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-1672762 School Health 50 Count 300 School Health School $3.9000 $1,170.0000
LATEX-FREE, 50/box. approved product. Corporation Box Health/32120
002 Bandage, adhesive, 2" x 4 1/2", sterile, Dynarex #3634 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-1672762 Elemental 50 Count 300 DYN3634 3634 $6.9900 $2,097.0000
LATEX-FREE, 50/box. approved product. Enterprises, LLC Box
003 Bandage, adhesive, 1" x 3", flexible fabric, Macgill #9100 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-2011508 | PYRAMID SCHOOL No Bid 100 Count 2000
LATEX-FREE, 100/box. approved product. PRODUCTS Box
003 Bandage, adhesive, 1" x 3", flexible fabric, Macgill #9100 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-2011508 Henry Schein 100 Count 2000 H.S.I. 1126133 $1.6000 $3,200.0000 stock Reject - did not submit
LATEX-FREE, 100/box. approved product. Box sample for evaluation.
003 Bandage, adhesive, 1" x 3", flexible fabric, Macgill #9100 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-2011508 Lite Source Inc 100 Count 2000 Dynarex 3612 $2.0000 $4,000.0000 order in case qty (24/cs) Reject - did not submit
LATEX-FREE, 100/box. approved product. Box sample for evaluation.




003 Bandage, adhesive, 1" x 3", flexible fabric, Macgill #9100 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-2011508 SCHOOL NURSE 100 Count 2000 Dynarex (private 3612/50270 $2.4900 $4,980.0000 This item is bid out as Reject - did not submit
LATEX-FREE, 100/box. approved product. SUPPLY INC Box labeled with our exact to Dynarex #3612, sample for evaluation.
company name) but with our company
name and logo on the
box)
003 Bandage, adhesive, 1" x 3", flexible fabric, Macgill #9100 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-2011508 School Health 100 Count 2000 School Health School Health/ $2.8100 $5,620.0000 Reject - did not submit
LATEX-FREE, 100/box. approved product. Corporation Box 32006 sample for evaluation.
003 Bandage, adhesive, 1" x 3", flexible fabric, Macgill #9100 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-2011508 Elemental 100 Count 2000 McKesson 16-4811 $2.9900 $5,980.0000 Reject - did not submit
LATEX-FREE, 100/box. approved product. Enterprises, LLC Box sample for evaluation.
003 Bandage, adhesive, 1" x 3", flexible fabric, Macgill #9100 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-2011508 | Bound Tree Medical, 100 Count 2000 MED PLUS JJC 004444 $9.2900 $18,580.0000 9.29|100/BX
LATEX-FREE, 100/box. approved product. Box SERVICES USA
004 Bandage, adhesive, 1" x 3", sheer, LATEX- Macgill #9500 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-2011507 | PYRAMID SCHOOL No Bid 100 Count 2000
FREE, 100/box. approved product. PRODUCTS Box
004 Bandage, adhesive, 1" x 3", sheer, LATEX- Macgill #9500 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-2011507 | Bound Tree Medical, 100 Count 2000 TEMPO MEDICAL- CBAP013 $1.1100 $2,220.0000 1.11]100/BX
FREE, 100/box. approved product. Box CURAPLEX
004 Bandage, adhesive, 1" x 3", sheer, LATEX- Macgill #9500 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-2011507 Henry Schein 100 Count 2000 H.S.I. 1126162 $1.3700 $2,740.0000 stock
FREE, 100/box. approved product. Box
004 Bandage, adhesive, 1" x 3", sheer, LATEX- Macgill #9500 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-2011507 Lite Source Inc 100 Count 2000 Dynarex 3602 $1.5400 $3,080.0000 order in case gty (24/cs)
FREE, 100/box. approved product. Box
004 Bandage, adhesive, 1" x 3", sheer, LATEX- Macgill #9500 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-2011507 School Health 100 Count 2000 School Health School Health/ $1.8000 $3,600.0000
FREE, 100/box. approved product. Corporation Box 32028
004 Bandage, adhesive, 1" x 3", sheer, LATEX- Macgill #9500 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-2011507 SCHOOL NURSE 100 Count 2000 Dynarex (private 3602/50250 $1.9900 $3,980.0000 This item is bid out as
FREE, 100/box. approved product. SUPPLY INC Box labeled with our exact to Dynarex #3602,
company name) but with our company
name and logo on the
box)
004 Bandage, adhesive, 1" x 3", sheer, LATEX- Macgill #9500 or equal. Sample required if not bidding 3800140-2011507 Elemental 100 Count 2000 McKesson 1125511 $2.9900 $5,980.0000
FREE, 100/box. approved product. Enterprises, LLC Box
005 Pack, instant cold, large, approx. 5" x 8". For application where instant cold is needed. Becomes a 3800460-1073690 | PYRAMID SCHOOL No Bid 1 Each 30000
cold pack in seconds by squeezing the bag. PRODUCTS Purchase
005 Pack, instant cold, large, approx. 5" x 8". For application where instant cold is needed. Becomes a 3800460-1073690 SCHOOL NURSE No Bid 1 Each 30000
cold pack in seconds by squeezing the bag. SUPPLY INC Purchase
005 Pack, instant cold, large, approx. 5" x 8". For application where instant cold is needed. Becomes a 3800460-1073690 | Bound Tree Medical, 1 Each 30000 INTCO MEDICAL 1431-77000 $0.3400 $10,200.0000 0.34|1/EA
cold pack in seconds by squeezing the bag. Purchase
005 Pack, instant cold, large, approx. 5" x 8". For application where instant cold is needed. Becomes a 3800460-1073690 Elemental 1 Each 30000 McKesson 476731 $0.4000 $12,000.0000
cold pack in seconds by squeezing the bag. Enterprises, LLC Purchase
005 Pack, instant cold, large, approx. 5" x 8". For application where instant cold is needed. Becomes a 3800460-1073690 Lite Source Inc 1 Each 30000 Dynarex 4511 $0.4000 $12,000.0000 4" x 5" order in case qty
cold pack in seconds by squeezing the bag. Purchase (24/cs)
005 Pack, instant cold, large, approx. 5" x 8". For application where instant cold is needed. Becomes a 3800460-1073690 School Health 1 Each 30000 School Health School Health/ $0.4100 $12,300.0000 SOLD AS 16.CASE
cold pack in seconds by squeezing the bag. Corporation Purchase 37270 ONLY- $6.56, 5X7" SIZE
005 Pack, instant cold, large, approx. 5" x 8". For application where instant cold is needed. Becomes a 3800460-1073690 Henry Schein 1 Each 30000 Dynarex 4512 2670027 $1.0800 $32,400.0000 stock
cold pack in seconds by squeezing the bag. Purchase
006 Pad, sanitary, #4, maxi-pad. With adhesive strip, individually wrapped to fit machines, 3800500-1073949 Lite Source Inc No Bid 250 Count 100
50/case. Case
006 Pad, sanitary, #4, maxi-pad. With adhesive strip, individually wrapped to fit machines, 3800500-1073949 | Bound Tree Medical, 250 Count 100 MED PLUS KIM 49061 $3.4600 $346.0000 3.46[24/PK
50/case. Case SERVICES USA




006 Pad, sanitary, #4, maxi-pad. With adhesive strip, individually wrapped to fit machines, 3800500-1073949 Elemental 250 Count 100 Bodyform BPS288 $26.9900 $2,699.0000
50/case. Enterprises, LLC Case
006 Pad, sanitary, #4, maxi-pad. With adhesive strip, individually wrapped to fit machines, 3800500-1073949 Henry Schein 250 Count 100 Maxi-Thin 958544 1455858 $48.3900 $4,839.0000 non-stock
50/case. Case
006 Pad, sanitary, #4, maxi-pad. With adhesive strip, individually wrapped to fit machines, 3800500-1073949 | PYRAMID SCHOOL 250 Count 100 HOSPECO MT4 $48.9900 $4,899.0000
50/case. PRODUCTS Case
006 Pad, sanitary, #4, maxi-pad. With adhesive strip, individually wrapped to fit machines, 3800500-1073949 SCHOOL NURSE 250 Count 100 Impact Products 25130973/24006 $58.0000 $5,800.0000
50/case. SUPPLY INC Case
006 Pad, sanitary, #4, maxi-pad. With adhesive strip, individually wrapped to fit machines, 3800500-1073949 School Health 250 Count 100 Impact Products | Naturelle Modess/ $71.8800 $7,188.0000
50/case. Corporation Case 22003
007 Thermometer, single use, sterile, easy to Fahrenheit scale 96.0 degrees to 104.8 degrees, 100/box. 3800610-1720158 Lite Source Inc No Bid 100 Count 50
read. Expiration date should be 2 years beyond date of receipt. Box
Tempa Dot #5122 or equal. Sample required if not bidding
approved product.
007 Thermometer, single use, sterile, easy to Fahrenheit scale 96.0 degrees to 104.8 degrees, 100/box. 3800610-1720158 | PYRAMID SCHOOL No Bid 100 Count 50
read. Expiration date should be 2 years beyond date of receipt. PRODUCTS Box
Tempa Dot #5122 or equal. Sample required if not bidding
approved product.
007 Thermometer, single use, sterile, easy to Fahrenheit scale 96.0 degrees to 104.8 degrees, 100/box. 3800610-1720158 SCHOOL NURSE 100 Count 50 Tempa Dot 5122/9041 $30.0000 $1,500.0000
read. Expiration date should be 2 years beyond date of receipt. SUPPLY INC Box
Tempa Dot #5122 or equal. Sample required if not bidding
approved product.
007 Thermometer, single use, sterile, easy to Fahrenheit scale 96.0 degrees to 104.8 degrees, 100/box. 3800610-1720158 | Bound Tree Medical, 100 Count 50 MEDLINE MLI111220Z $31.9900 $1,599.5000 31.99|100/BX
read. Expiration date should be 2 years beyond date of receipt. Box INDUSTRIES, INC.
Tempa Dot #5122 or equal. Sample required if not bidding
approved product.
007 Thermometer, single use, sterile, easy to Fahrenheit scale 96.0 degrees to 104.8 degrees, 100/box. 3800610-1720158 School Health 100 Count 50 Medical Indicators | Medical Indicatore- $35.1100 $1,755.5000
read. Expiration date should be 2 years beyond date of receipt. Corporation Box Nextemp/ 13052
Tempa Dot #5122 or equal. Sample required if not bidding
approved product.
007 Thermometer, single use, sterile, easy to Fahrenheit scale 96.0 degrees to 104.8 degrees, 100/box. 3800610-1720158 Elemental 100 Count 50 TempaDot 5122 $35.9900 $1,799.5000
read. Expiration date should be 2 years beyond date of receipt. Enterprises, LLC Box
Tempa Dot #5122 or equal. Sample required if not bidding
approved product.
007 Thermometer, single use, sterile, easy to Fahrenheit scale 96.0 degrees to 104.8 degrees, 100/box. 3800610-1720158 Henry Schein 100 Count 50 Tempa-Dot 2208345 $44.8600 $2,243.0000 stock
read. Expiration date should be 2 years beyond date of receipt. Box

Tempa Dot #5122 or equal. Sample required if not bidding
approved product.




Jefferson County Public Schools

Bid Tabulation

Event Name: First Aid Supplies

Event ID: JCPS-8372

Approval Date: August 20, 2024

Bound Tree Medical, LLC $35,469.5000 $33,870.0000
Elemental Enterprises, LLC $30,555.5000 $0.0000
Henry Schein $48,062.0000 $0.0000
Lite Source Inc $19,974.0000 $0.0000
PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS $4,899.0000 $0.0000
School Health Corporation $31,633.5000 $0.0000
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY INC $17,424.0000 $1,500.0000
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