Jefferson County Public Schools

Bid Tabulation

Event Name: SCNS LUNCHROOM PRODUCTS (WAREHOUSE DELIVERY) SUPPLEMENT

Event ID: JCPS-8370
Approval Date: August 20, 2024
Date Bids Received: July 18, 2024

Contract Period: August 20, 2024 through June 30, 2025

Renewals: No renewal options

Comments: Award Status indicates an award

Item Number	Item/Service	Description	Commodity Code	Vendor Name	No Bid	иом	Quantity	Manufacturer / Provider	Manufacturer Part Number	Unit Bid Price	Total Price	Vendor Response Item Notes	Award Status	Award Notes
001	Dressing mix, Ranch flavor.	Dry mix packed in approx. 20-lb. bulk bag in box. Mixing ingredients to include mayonnaise and milk. Approved Product: Hidden Valley Ranch Dressing Mix #711005200. NO SUBSTITUTE. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of case and type of packaging.		Dole Packaged Foods	Yes	1 - 20 Pound Box	165							
001	Dressing mix, Ranch flavor.	Dry mix packed in approx. 20-lb. bulk bag in box. Mixing ingredients to include mayonnaise and milk. Approved Product: Hidden Valley Ranch Dressing Mix #711005200. NO SUBSTITUTE. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of case and type of packaging.	4445250-1728908	Sysco Louisville	No	1 - 20 Pound Box	165	Hidden Valley	711005200	\$43.2500	\$7,136.2500		Awarded	
002	Flour, stone-ground, white whole wheat, 50-lb. bag. Must be a fine ground whole wheat flour milled from 100% hard white wheat.	Wide variations of wheat utilized for this flour are not permitted. Moisture 14% maximum. Protein 12% minimum. The product shall be free of rancid, bitter, musty or other undesirable flavors or odors. Should be produced in accordance with good manufacturing practices and all applicable FDA regulations. Approved Product: General Mills S8034000 and General Mills/Gold Medal #16000-58034. NO SUBSTITUTE. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify number of lbs. per bag.	4445050-2002824	Dole Packaged Foods	Yes	1 - 50 Pound Bag	375							
002	Flour, stone-ground, white whole wheat, 50-lb. bag. Must be a fine ground whole wheat flour milled from 100% hard white wheat.	Wide variations of wheat utilized for this flour are not permitted. Moisture 14% maximum. Protein 12% minimum. The product shall be free of rancid, bitter, musty or other undesirable flavors or odors. Should be produced in accordance with good manufacturing practices and all applicable FDA regulations. Approved Product: General Mills 58034000 and General Mills/Gold Medal #16000-58034. NO SUBSTITUTE. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify number of lbs. per bag.	4445050-2002824	Sysco Louisville	No	1 - 50 Pound Bag	375	General Mills	58034000	\$22.7500	\$8,531.2500		Awarded	
003	Guacamole, Frozen. Bulk.	Serving to provide less than 250 mg per serving. Serving to provide ¼ cup Other/Additional vegetable equivalent according to the Child Nutrition Program. Packed approx. (6) 31b. bags per case. Approved Product: Simplot #10071179029380. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of serving, size of case and no. of servings per case.	4445915-2015113	Dole Packaged Foods	Yes	1 - 18 Pound Case	750							
003	Guacamole, Frozen. Bulk.	Serving to provide less than 250 mg per serving. Serving to provide % cup Other/Additional vegetable equivalent according to the Child Nutrition Program. Packed approx. (6) 31b. bags per case. Approved Product: Simplot #100717/9029830. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of serving, size of case and no. of servings per case.	4445915-2015113	Sysco Louisville	No	1 - 18 Pound Case	750	Simplot	10071179029830	\$78.3000	\$58,725.0000		Awarded	
004	Sugar, granulated. Extra fine, white. 50-lb. bag.	Approved Product: Domino #120580. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of lbs. per bag.	4445050-1728885	Dole Packaged Foods	Yes	1 - 50 Pound Bag	775							
004	Sugar, granulated. Extra fine, white. 50-lb. bag.	Approved Product: Domino #120580. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of lbs. per bag.	4445050-1728885	Sysco Louisville	No	1 - 50 Pound Bag	775	Domino	120580	\$47.1500	\$36,541.2500		Awarded	
005	Beverage, almond milk, unsweetened.	Original flavor. 640z carton. Shelf stable or refrigerated product acceptable. Packed approx. 6 (6402) cartons per case. Approved Product: Ardmore Farms #41980. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field. Specify no. of cartons per case and ounces per carton.	4445300-2015146	Dole Packaged Foods	Yes	1 - 64oz Carton	25							
005	Beverage, almond milk, unsweetened.	Original flavor. 640z carton. Shelf stable or refrigerated product acceptable. Packed approx. 6 (6402) cartons per case. Approved Product: Ardmore Farms #41980. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of cartons per case and ounces per carton.	4445300-2015146	Sysco Louisville	No	1 - 64oz Carton	25	Ardmore Farms	41980	\$16.1500	\$403.7500		Awarded	

								1				1		
006	Puree Foods. Shaped Dessert Variety Pack. Frozen.	Assorted variety can have: Apple, Banana, Vanilla and Peach Cobbler options. Packed approx. (24) 3oz molds. Approved Product: Hormel Thick & Easy #130609. Please respond to the	4445450-2015356	Dole Packaged	Yes	1 - Case	100							
		following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify the size of the package and no		Foods										
		of packages per case.		roous										
		or puringes per case.												
006	Puree Foods. Shaped Dessert Variety Pack. Frozen.	Assorted variety can have: Apple, Banana, Vanilla and Peach Cobbler options. Packed approx.	4445450-2015356	Sysco	No	1 - Case	100	Hormel Thick& Easy	130609	\$25.4500	\$2,545.0000			
000	Turee roods. Shaped Dessert Vallety Fack. Prozen.	(24) 3oz molds. Approved Product: Hormel Thick & Easy #130609. Please respond to the	4445450-2015550	Louisville	140	1 - Case	100	Hormer Hillicka Easy	130003	\$25.4500	\$2,545.0000			
		following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify the size of the package and no												
		of packages per case.											Awarded	
													/ munucu	
007	Puree Foods. Shaped Fruit Variety Pack. Frozen.	Assorted variety can have: Peach, Pear, Mixed Berry and Pineapple options. Packed approx.	4445450-2015357	Dole	Yes	1 - Case	100							
		(24) 2.5oz molds. Approved Product: Hormel Thick & Easy #17422. Please respond to the		Packaged										
		following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify the size of the package and no		Foods										
		of packages per case.												
				_						****	4			
007	Puree Foods. Shaped Fruit Variety Pack. Frozen.	Assorted variety can have: Peach, Pear, Mixed Berry and Pineapple options. Packed approx. (24) 2.5oz molds. Approved Product: Hormel Thick & Easy #17422. Please respond to the	4445450-2015357	Sysco Louisville	No	1 - Case	100	Hormel Thick&Easy	17422	\$26.1500	\$2,615.0000			
		following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify the size of the package and no		Louisville										
		of packages per case.											Awarded	
													Awarueu	
											1			
008	Turkey Nugget, Dill Flavored. WG Breading. Frozen.	Serving to provide 2 M/MA and 1 Grain equivalence according to the USDA Child Nutrition	4445600-2015363	Dole	Yes	1 - Case	400							
	Fully Cooked.	Program. No MSG. No artificial colors or flavors. No Trans Fat. Approved Product:		Packaged										
		Hormel/Jennie-O #134658. Note: This item will be purchased for a Limited Time Offer. Exact		Foods										
		quantities will be purchased for this special. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR												
		RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size and no. of servings per case.												
008	Turkey Nugget, Dill Flavored. WG Breading. Frozen.	Serving to provide 2 M/MA and 1 Grain equivalence according to the USDA Child Nutrition	4445600-2015363	Sysco	No	1 - Case	400	Hormel/Jenni-O	134658	\$24.7500	\$9,900.0000			
	Fully Cooked.	Program. No MSG. No artificial colors or flavors. No Trans Fat. Approved Product: Hormel/Jennie-O #134658. Note: This item will be purchased for a Limited Time Offer. Exact		Louisville										
		quantities will be purchased for this special. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR												
		RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size and no. of servings per case.											Awarded	
		0 . p												
Lot Item				Vendor				Manufacturer /	Manufacturer Part			Vendor Response		
Lot Item Nos. 9-11	Item/Service	Description	Commodity Code	Vendor Name	No Bid	UOM	Quantity	Manufacturer / Provider	Manufacturer Part Number	Unit Bid Price	Total Price	Vendor Response Item Notes	Award Status	Award Notes
		Description Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following			No Bid	UOM 1 - Count	Quantity 60			Unit Bid Price 47.3000	Total Price 2838.00		Award Status	Award Notes
Nos. 9-11		Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per		Name	No Bid	-		Provider	Number				Award Status	Award Notes
Nos. 9-11		Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following		Name Sysco	No Bid	1 - Count		Provider	Number					Award Notes
Nos. 9-11		Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per		Name Sysco	No Bid	1 - Count		Provider	Number				Award Status Awarded	Award Notes
Nos. 9-11		Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per		Name Sysco	No Bid	1 - Count		Provider	Number					Award Notes
Nos. 9-11		Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per		Name Sysco	No Bid	1 - Count		Provider	Number					Award Notes
Nos. 9-11 009	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case.	4445040-2014977	Sysco Louisville	No Bid	1 - Count Case	60	Provider Ener-G	Number 4015A	47.3000	2838.00			Award Notes
Nos. 9-11		Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven		Sysco Louisville	No Bid	1 - Count Case		Provider	Number					Award Notes
Nos. 9-11 009	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify	4445040-2014977	Sysco Louisville	No Bid	1 - Count Case	60	Provider Ener-G	Number 4015A	47.3000	2838.00			Award Notes
Nos. 9-11 009	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven	4445040-2014977	Sysco Louisville	No Bid	1 - Count Case	60	Provider Ener-G	Number 4015A	47.3000	2838.00		Awarded	Award Notes
Nos. 9-11 009	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify	4445040-2014977	Sysco Louisville	No Bid	1 - Count Case	60	Provider Ener-G	Number 4015A	47.3000	2838.00			Award Notes
Nos. 9-11 009	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify	4445040-2014977	Sysco Louisville	No Bid	1 - Count Case	60	Provider Ener-G	Number 4015A	47.3000	2838.00		Awarded	Award Notes
Nos. 9-11 009	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify	4445040-2014977	Sysco Louisville	No Bid	1 - Count Case	60	Provider Ener-G	Number 4015A	47.3000	2838.00		Awarded	Award Notes
Nos. 9-11 009	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify	4445040-2014977	Sysco Louisville	No Bid	1 - Count Case	60	Provider Ener-G	Number 4015A	47.3000	2838.00		Awarded	Award Notes
Nos. 9-11 009	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages. Gluten Free Hamburger Buns. Casein/Lactose Free.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4135 and Local Oven #20002. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify RE	4445040-2014977 4445040-2014978	Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville	No Bid	1 - Count Case	60	Provider Ener-G Ener-G	Number 4015A	47.3000 47.0500	2838.00		Awarded	Award Notes
Nos. 9-11 009	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages. Gluten Free Hamburger Buns. Casein/Lactose Free.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4135 and Local Oven	4445040-2014977 4445040-2014978	Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville	No Bid	1 - Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case	60	Provider Ener-G Ener-G	Number 4015A	47.3000 47.0500	2838.00		Awarded	Award Notes
Nos. 9-11 009	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages. Gluten Free Hamburger Buns. Casein/Lactose Free.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4135 and Local Oven #20002. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify RE	4445040-2014977 4445040-2014978	Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville	No Bid	1 - Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case	60	Provider Ener-G Ener-G	Number 4015A	47.3000 47.0500	2838.00		Awarded	Award Notes
Nos. 9-11 009	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages. Gluten Free Hamburger Buns. Casein/Lactose Free.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4135 and Local Oven #20002. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify RE	4445040-2014977 4445040-2014978	Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville	No Bid	1 - Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case	60	Provider Ener-G Ener-G	Number 4015A	47.3000 47.0500	2838.00		Awarded	Award Notes
Nos. 9-11 009	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages. Gluten Free Hamburger Buns. Casein/Lactose Free.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4135 and Local Oven #20002. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify RE	4445040-2014977 4445040-2014978	Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville	No Bid	1 - Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case	60	Provider Ener-G Ener-G	Number 4015A	47.3000 47.0500	2838.00		Awarded	Award Notes
Nos. 9-11 009	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages. Gluten Free Hamburger Buns. Casein/Lactose Free.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4135 and Local Oven #20002. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify RE	4445040-2014977 4445040-2014978	Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville	No Bid	1 - Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case	60	Provider Ener-G Ener-G	Number 4015A	47.3000 47.0500	2838.00		Awarded	Award Notes
Nos. 9-11 009	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages. Gluten Free Hamburger Buns. Casein/Lactose Free.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4135 and Local Oven #20002. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify RE	4445040-2014977 4445040-2014978	Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville	No Bid	1 - Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case	60	Provider Ener-G Ener-G	Number 4015A	47.3000 47.0500	2838.00		Awarded	Award Notes
Nos. 9-11 009	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages. Gluten Free Hamburger Buns. Casein/Lactose Free.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4135 and Local Oven #20002. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify RE	4445040-2014977 4445040-2014978	Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville	No Bid	1 - Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case	60	Provider Ener-G Ener-G	Number 4015A	47.3000 47.0500	2838.00		Awarded	Award Notes
010 011	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages. Gluten Free Hamburger Buns. Casein/Lactose Free.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4135 and Local Oven #20002. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify RE	4445040-2014977 4445040-2014978	Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville	No Bid	1 - Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case	60	Provider Ener-G Ener-G Ener-G	Number 4015A	47.3000 47.0500	2838.00	Item Notes	Awarded	Award Notes
010 011 Lot item	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages. Gluten Free Hamburger Buns. Casein/Lactose Free. Gluten Free Hot Dog Buns. Casein/Lactose Free.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4135 and Local Oven #20002. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case.	4445040-2014977 4445040-2014978 4445040-2014979	Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville Vendor		1 - 24 Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case	60	Provider Ener-G Ener-G Manufacturer /	Number 4015A EF4115 EF4135 Manufacturer Part	47.0500 47.0500	2838.00 2823.00 2352.50	Item Notes	Awarded Awarded	
Nos. 9-11 009 010 011 Lot item Nos. 12-13	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages. Gluten Free Hamburger Buns. Casein/Lactose Free. Gluten Free Hot Dog Buns. Casein/Lactose Free.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4135 and Local Oven #20002. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case.	4445040-2014977 4445040-2014978 4445040-2014979 Commodity Code	Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville Vendor Name	No Bid	1 - Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case	60 60 50 Quantity	Ener-G Ener-G Ener-G Manufacturer / Provider	Number 4015A EF4115 EF4135 Manufacturer Part Number	47.0500 47.0500 Unit Bid Price	2838.00 2823.00 2352.50 Total Price	Item Notes	Awarded	
Nos. 9-11 009 010 011	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages. Gluten Free Hamburger Buns. Casein/Lactose Free. Gluten Free Hot Dog Buns. Casein/Lactose Free.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4135 and Local Oven #20002. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Description Must be appropriate for preventing foods from sticking to grills, pots, sheet pans, etc. Must	4445040-2014977 4445040-2014978 4445040-2014979 Commodity Code	Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville Vendor Name Sysco		1 - 24 Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case	60	Provider Ener-G Ener-G Manufacturer /	Number 4015A EF4115 EF4135 Manufacturer Part	47.0500 47.0500	2838.00 2823.00 2352.50	Item Notes	Awarded Awarded	
Nos. 9-11 009 010 011 Lot item Nos. 12-13	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages. Gluten Free Hamburger Buns. Casein/Lactose Free. Gluten Free Hot Dog Buns. Casein/Lactose Free.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4135 and Local Oven #20002. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Description Must be appropriate for preventing foods from sticking to grills, pots, sheet pans, etc. Must also be appropriate for spraying on top of rolls, muffins, bread and pastries. Aerosol spray.	4445040-2014977 4445040-2014978 4445040-2014979 Commodity Code	Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville Vendor Name	No Bid	1 - Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case	60 60 50 Quantity	Ener-G Ener-G Ener-G Manufacturer / Provider	Number 4015A EF4115 EF4135 Manufacturer Part Number	47.0500 47.0500 Unit Bid Price	2838.00 2823.00 2352.50 Total Price	Item Notes	Awarded Awarded	
010 O11 Lot Item Nos. 12-13	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages. Gluten Free Hamburger Buns. Casein/Lactose Free. Gluten Free Hot Dog Buns. Casein/Lactose Free.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4135 and Local Oven #20002. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Description Must be appropriate for preventing foods from sticking to grills, pots, sheet pans, etc. Must	4445040-2014977 4445040-2014978 4445040-2014979 Commodity Code	Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville Vendor Name Sysco	No Bid	1 - 24 Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case	60 60 50 Quantity	Ener-G Ener-G Ener-G Manufacturer / Provider	Number 4015A EF4115 EF4135 Manufacturer Part Number	47.0500 47.0500 Unit Bid Price	2838.00 2823.00 2352.50 Total Price	Item Notes	Awarded Awarded Award Status	
010 O11 Lot Item Nos. 12-13	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages. Gluten Free Hamburger Buns. Casein/Lactose Free. Gluten Free Hot Dog Buns. Casein/Lactose Free.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4135 and Local Oven #20002. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Description Must be appropriate for preventing foods from sticking to grills, pots, sheet pans, etc. Must also be appropriate for spraying on top of rolls, muffins, bread and pastries. Aerosol spray. Packed approx. 6 (72 cz.) cans per case. Approved Products: PLZ Corp #1000004050. NO.	4445040-2014977 4445040-2014978 4445040-2014979 Commodity Code	Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville Vendor Name Sysco	No Bid	1 - 24 Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case	60 60 50 Quantity	Ener-G Ener-G Ener-G Manufacturer / Provider	Number 4015A EF4115 EF4135 Manufacturer Part Number	47.0500 47.0500 Unit Bid Price	2838.00 2823.00 2352.50 Total Price	Item Notes	Awarded Awarded	
Nos. 9-11 009 010 011 Lot item Nos. 12-13	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages. Gluten Free Hamburger Buns. Casein/Lactose Free. Gluten Free Hot Dog Buns. Casein/Lactose Free.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4135 and Local Oven #20002. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Description Must be appropriate for preventing foods from sticking to grills, pots, sheet pans, etc. Must also be appropriate for spraying on top of rolls, muffins, bread and pastries. Aerosol spray. Packed approx. 6 (72 oz.) cans per case. Approved Products: PLZ Corp #1000004050. NO SUBSTITUE: Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. RESPONSE ITEM NOT	4445040-2014977 4445040-2014978 4445040-2014979 Commodity Code	Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville Vendor Name Sysco	No Bid	1 - 24 Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case	60 60 50 Quantity	Ener-G Ener-G Ener-G Manufacturer / Provider	Number 4015A EF4115 EF4135 Manufacturer Part Number	47.0500 47.0500 Unit Bid Price	2838.00 2823.00 2352.50 Total Price	Item Notes	Awarded Awarded Award Status	
010 011 Lot item Nos. 12-13	Gluten Free Bread. Approx. (6) 1602. loaf/packages. Gluten Free Hamburger Buns. Casein/Lactose Free. Gluten Free Hot Dog Buns. Casein/Lactose Free.	Approved Product: LoPro #2241611001 and Ener-G #4015A. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of package and no. of servings per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4115 and Local Oven #20000. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Packed approx. 24 buns per case. Approved Products: Ener-g #EF4135 and Local Oven #20002. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of buns per pack and no. of packs per case. Description Must be appropriate for preventing foods from sticking to grills, pots, sheet pans, etc. Must also be appropriate for spraying on top of rolls, muffins, bread and pastries. Aerosol spray. Packed approx. 6 (72 oz.) cans per case. Approved Products: PLZ Corp #1000004050. NO SUBSTITUE: Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. RESPONSE ITEM NOT	4445040-2014977 4445040-2014978 4445040-2014979 Commodity Code	Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville Sysco Louisville Vendor Name Sysco	No Bid	1 - 24 Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case 1 - 24 Count Case	60 60 50 Quantity	Ener-G Ener-G Ener-G Manufacturer / Provider	Number 4015A EF4115 EF4135 Manufacturer Part Number	47.0500 47.0500 Unit Bid Price	2838.00 2823.00 2352.50 Total Price	Item Notes	Awarded Awarded Award Status	

013	Spray, pan food release.	Must be appropriate for preventing foods from sticking to grills, pots, sheet pans, etc. Must	4445050-2013364	Sysco	No	1 - 6 Count	1050	PLZ Corp	1000004034	25.1500	26407.50		
		also be appropriate for spraying on top of rolls, muffins, bread and pastries. Aerosol spray.		Louisville		Case							
		Packed approx. 6 cans per case. Can to be approx. 14 oz. Trigger adaptors to be included at											
		no charge if applicable. Approved Product: Gluten Free Bak-Klene #10000046169 and PLZ										Awarded	
		Corp #1000004034 or equal. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM										Awaraca	
		NOTES field: Specify size of container and no. of containers per case.											

Jefferson County Public Schools

Award Summary

Event Name: SCNS LUNCHROOM PRODUCTS (WAREHOUSE DELIVERY) SUPPLEMENT

Event ID: JCPS-8370

Approval Date: August 20, 2024

Vendor	Bid Amount	Awarded Amount