
Jefferson County Public Schools
Bid Tabulation 
Event Name: SCNS LUNCHROOM SUPPLIES (SCHOOL DELIVERY)
Event ID: JCPS-8360
Approval Date: July 23, 2024
Date Bids Received: June 21, 2024
Contract Period: August 3, 2024 through August 2, 2025
Renewals: One (1) year renewal option
Comments: Award Status indicates an award

Item 
Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

001 Bag, food grade, plastic, clear, closable zipper type.  
Gallon size.  FDA approved.

Thickness to be approx. 1.75 mil.  Approx. 250 per case.  Approved Products:  Handgards 
#304985463 and Foodhandler #20-FH60.    Please respond to the following in the VENDOR 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  Specify no. of bags per case.

4800850-2013371 Sysco Louisville No 1 - 250 Count Case 400 Foodhandler 20-FH60 $12.0500 $4,820.0000

Awarded

002 Bag, food grade, plastic, clear. FDA approved.  Non-vented.  Approx. 33" x 44" bun pan size.  Thickness to be approx. 0.90 mil.  
Approx. 250 bags per case.  Approved Products: Calico #9933X44 and Fortune #CA334408N.    

Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  Specify no. bags 
per roll and no. of rolls per case.

4800850-1723988 Calico Packaging, LLC No 1 - 250 Count Case 150 calico 9933x44 $23.7400 $3,561.0000 bidding as specfied

Awarded

002 Bag, food grade, plastic, clear. FDA approved.  Non-vented.  Approx. 33" x 44" bun pan size.  Thickness to be approx. 0.90 mil.  
Approx. 250 bags per case.  Approved Products: Calico #9933X44 and Fortune #CA334408N.    

Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  Specify no. bags 
per roll and no. of rolls per case.

4800850-1723988 Sysco Louisville Yes 1 - 250 Count Case 150

003 Bag, food grade, plastic clear, sandwich with flip lock 
top. Approx. 8.5"x10" saddlebag.

Thickness to be  approx. 0.60 mil. Approx. 2,000 units per case. Approved Product: Handgards 
#303679606. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPOSE ITEM NOTES field: 

Specify size of sandwich bag and no. units per case.

4800850-2014833 Sysco Louisville No 1 - 250 Count Case 550 Hangards 303679606 $19.2000 $10,560.0000

Awarded

004 Cup, translucent plastic. 5 oz. Approx. 2,500 cups per case. Approved Products: Dart #Y5, Empress #ESTRANS, Pactiv  #YE5SYS, 
and Solo #Y5JJR. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: 

Specify size of cup and no. of cups per case.

4800180-2011803 Sysco Louisville No 1 - 2500 Count Case 1000 Empress E5TRANS $46.2500 $46,250.0000

Awarded

005 Film wrap, plastic, .005 gauge, 18" wide.  Approx. 3,000 
ft. per roll.

Approved Products:  Anchor/Network #NSC183 and Sysco Classic/Pactiv #9063.   Please respond 
to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  Specify no. of ft. per roll and no. 

of rolls per case.

4800850-1706287 Sysco Louisville No 1 - 3000 Foot Roll 500 Sysco Classic 9063 $21.6500 $10,825.0000

Awarded

006 Foil wrap, heavy duty, 18" wide.  Approx. 1,000 ft. per 
roll.

Approved Products: Pactiv #W69323, and Western #282.   Please respond to the following in the 
VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  Specify no. of feet per roll.

4800850-2011434 Sysco Louisville No 1 - 1000 Foot Roll 125 Pactiv W69323 $85.1500 $10,643.7500

Awarded

007 Tray, food, paper, 3 lb., 500 per case. Approved Products:  Empress EFT300, Huhtamaki #35122045, SCT #0566, SCT #425, SQP #300, 
and Vintage #EFT300.  Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES 

field:  Specify no. per case.

4800450-2002166 Sysco Louisville No 1 - 500 Count Case 6400 Empress EFT300 $30.2500 $193,600.0000

Awarded

008 Tray, food, paper, 5 lb., 500 per case. Approved Products:  Huhtamaki #35122048, SCT #429, SCT #0567, SQP #500, and Vintage 
#EFT500.    Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  Specify 

no. per case.

4800450-1722452 Sysco Louisville No 1 - 500 Count Case 4000 Vintage EFT500 $38.2500 $153,000.0000

Awarded

009 Wipes, for hands and surfaces.  Antibacterial, sanitizing, 
alcohol-free.

Approx. (6) 270 count canisters per case.  In dispensing canisters, not individually wrapped.  
Approved Product:  Purell #9113-06.   Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE 

ITEM NOTES field:  Specify no. of wipes per canister and no. of canisters per case.

2000135-2012067 Sysco Louisville No 6 - 270 Count 
Containers

100 Purell 9113-06 $83.4500 $8,345.0000

Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 10-11 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

010 Bowl, disposable, black plastic, 12 oz., recyclable Appropriate for hot and cold foods.  20 mil. Minimum temperature for hot holding 180°.  
Approx. 500 per case.  Approved Product:  ParPak/WNA  #24013 or equal.   Please respond to 

the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  Specify no. of bowls per case.

4800070-2013383 Sysco Louisville No 1 - 500 Count Case 1700 ParPak/WNA 24013 $42.6500 $72,505.0000

Awarded

011 Bowl lid, dome to fit 12 oz., recyclable plastic bowl Item 
#13, clear, 15 mil.

Approx. 500 domes per case. Must be compatible with 12 oz. black plastic bowl.  Approved 
Product:  ParPak/WNA #24400.   Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE 

ITEM NOTES field:  Specify no. of lids per case.

4800225-2013377 Sysco Louisville No 1 - 500 Count Case 200 ParPak/WNA 24400 $38.0500 $7,610.0000

Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 12-13 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

012 Bowl, disposable, black plastic, 24 oz., 22.5 mil. Appropriate for cold foods. Packed approx. 250 bowls per case. Approved Product: 
ParPak/WNA #82638. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES 

field: Specify no. of bowls per case.

4800225-2013379 Sysco Louisville No 1 - 250 Count Case 450 ParPak/WNA 82638 $43.1500 $19,417.5000

Awarded



013 Bowl Lid, dome to fit 24 oz. black bowl. Clear. 15.5 mil. Packed approx. 250 lids per case. Approved Product: ParPak/WNA #82639. Please respond to 
the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of bowls per case.

4800225-2013380 Sysco Louisville No 1 - 250 Count Case 250 ParPak/WNA 82639 $49.9500 $12,487.5000

Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 14-15 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

014 Container, food, 6-oz., recyclable black plastic deep 
tray, 14 mil.

Must perform for hot and cold applications. Minimum temperature for hot holding 180°.  
Approx. 2,000 per case. Must be compatible with ParPak Plastic lid.  Approved Product:  

ParPak/WNA #21860.    Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES 
field:  Specify no. per case.

4800135-2013075 Sysco Louisville No 1 - 2000 Count Case 5500 ParPak/WNA 21860 $57.4500 $315,975.0000

Awarded

015 Container lid, plastic, to fit 6-oz., recyclable food 
container Item #17.  Approx. 2,500 per case.

Must perform for hot and cold applications.  Must be compatible with 6-oz. black plastic deep 
tray container.  Approved Product: ParPak/WNA #29332 or equal.    Please respond to the 

following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  Specify no. per case.

4800273-2013076 Sysco Louisville No 1 - 2500 Count Case 150 ParPak/WNA 29332 $57.1500 $8,572.5000

Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 16-17 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

016 Container, 8-oz. capacity, black plastic, 12.5 mil.  
Approx. 1,000 dishes per case.

Approved Product: ParPak/WNA #21980.   Please respond to the following in the VENDOR 
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  Specify no. per case.

4800225-2011970 Sysco Louisville No 1 - 1000 Count Case 2400 ParPak/WNA 21980 $31.8500 $76,440.0000

Awarded

017 Container lid, to fit 8-oz. food container Item #19, 9 
mil.  Approx. 1,000 lids per case.

Must be compatible with 8-oz. black plastic container.  Approved Product: ParPak/WNA #21879.   
Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  Specify no. per 

case.

4800225-2013376 Sysco Louisville No 1 - 1000 Count Case 100 ParPak/WNA 21879 $29.4500 $2,945.0000

Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 18-19 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

018 Container, food, Styrofoam, 8-oz. disposable.  Approx. 
500 per case.

Must be compatible with 8-oz. lid.    Approved Products:  WinCup #F-8 and Dart #8SJ20.   Please 
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. per case.

4800135-1734705 Sysco Louisville No 1 - 500 Count Case 1 Dart 8SJ20 $54.2500 $54.2500

Awarded

019 Container lid, to fit 8-oz. food container Item #21.  
Approx. 1,000 per case.

Must be compatible with 8-oz. disposable container.    Approved Products:  WinCup #FL-8 and 
Dart #20JL.   Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  

Specify no. per case.

4800273-1734706 Sysco Louisville No 1 - 1000 Count Case 1 Dart 20JL $33.5000 $33.5000

Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 20-21 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

020 Cup, soufflé, translucent plastic, 2oz. Approx. 2400 cups per case. Must be compatible with 2 oz. lid.  Approved Products: Dart 
#200PC, Pactiv #YL52FR, YS200, or Solo #8200. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of cup and no. of cups per case.

4800170-2015006 Sysco Louisville No 1 - 2400 Count Case 1300 Pactiv YL52FR $92.0500 $119,665.0000

Awarded

021 Cup, lid, to fit 2 oz. soufflé cup. Approx. 2400 lids per case. Must be compatible with 2 oz plastic soufflé cup.  Approved 
Products: Dart #200PCL, Pactiv #YLS2FR, or Solo #PL2. Please respond to the following in the 

VENDOR  RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of lids per case.

4800273-2015007 Sysco Louisville No 1 - 2400 Count Case 500 Pactiv YLS2FR $80.2500 $40,125.0000

Awarded



Jefferson County Public Schools
Award Summary 
Event Name: SCNS LUNCHROOM SUPPLIES (SCHOOL DELIVERY)
Event ID: JCPS-8360
Approval Date: July 23, 2024

Vendor Bid Section Bid Total Award Total
Calico Packaging, LLC Line Items 1-9 $3,561.0000 $3,561.0000

Sysco Louisville Line Items 1-9 $438,043.7500 $438,043.7500

Sysco Louisville Lot Item Nos. 10-11 $80,115.0000 $80,115.0000

Sysco Louisville Lot Item Nos. 12-13 $31,905.0000 $31,905.0000

Sysco Louisville Lot Item Nos. 14-15 $324,547.5000 $324,547.5000

Sysco Louisville Lot Item Nos. 16-17 $79,385.0000 $79,385.0000

Sysco Louisville Lot Item Nos. 18-19 $87.7500 $87.7500

Sysco Louisville Lot Item Nos. 20-21 $159,790.0000 $159,790.0000
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