HENDERSON COUNTY SCHOOLS

1805 Second Street, Henderson, Kentucky 42420 (270) 831-5000 | Fax: (270) 831-5009 www.henderson.kyschools.us Dr. Bob Lawson, Superintendent



To:

Bob Lawson, Superintendent

And School Board Members

From:

Director of Finance

Date:

June 17, 2024

Re:

Bid Recommendations

Bid Recommendations:

Courier Service Bid #8-24-5-5

Invitations were sent to Silver Creek Transportation. An invitation was also posted on our district webpage and an ad was placed in The Gleaner. We received a bid from Silver Creek Transportation. We recommend the contract be awarded to Silver Creek Transportation as highlighted on the tabulation sheet.

New or Retread Tires & Tubes Bid # 9-24-5-6

Invitations were sent to three vendors. Bids were received from Best One Fleet Service. Goodyear, & Purcell Tire Service. Best One had the lowest bid. We are recommending the bid be awarded Best One Fleet Service as highlighted on the tabulation sheet.

HENDERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION 1805 Second Street Henderson, KY 42420

Courier Service Bid # 8-24-5-5 TABULATION OF BIDS

Company	Silver Creek Transportation, LLC		
Daily costs for Courier Service for all	Silver creek Transportation, 220		
schools, offices, and other buildings	\$270.00		
Daily rate x 209 days per year	\$56,430.00		
Fuel Surcharge Rate	0		
How many vehicles are available in your			
company fleet?	35		
How many people do you have			
employed?	40		
Are your vehicles properly insured?	Yes		
Are your employees properly insured?	Yes		
Insurance Company	National Interstate		
Number of years experienced handling			
cash over \$5,000	30		
Additional Services (charge per hour)	\$0.00		
Commodity Runs (average 8-10 per year)	\$0.00		
Contact	Jason Cowan		
Address	2055 S. Green Street		
	Henderson, KY 42420		
Phone	270-826-0777		
Fax			
E-mail	jason@silvercreektrans.com		

HENDERSON COUNTY SCHOOLS 1805 SECOND STREET HENDERSON, KY 42420

New and Retread Tires Bid # 9-24-5-6

				Raben Tire & Auto
	Best One Fleet Service	Goodyear	Purcell Tire Service	Service
Highway Type Tread		3:		
Michelin XZE				
Load Range H				
275/80 R22.5	No Bid	No Bid	\$512.46	
Goodyear	No Bid	\$400.00	\$484.59	
Firestone FS591				
Load Range H	ELYGEN A			
295/75 R22.5	\$375.00	No Bid	No Bid	
Banding Retread				
BDV	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
HanKook				
Load Range AH 37	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Retreads				
Retreads Goodyear				
Unicircle	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Retreads: DWT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Retreads: G66	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Retreads: RDA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
If headed wheel				No Bid
refurbish consists of:				
sandblast, primer and				
painted in color of				
choosing with new	1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1			
valve	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Any disposal of tires	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Credit for every tire	THO BIG	Grade A: \$40.00 Grade	110 210	
casing picked up that is	Bus garage retreads	B: \$30.00 Grade C:		
recappable	casings	\$25.00	50%	
Discount for tires for	Casings	\$20.00	0070	
other Henderson	100000000000000000000000000000000000000	Police Pursuit - 52.50%		
County Schools	TO A POSITION	Passenger - 48% Light		
Vehicles		truck - 48%		
Vernicies	AND ASSESSED OF	Commercial LT - 60%		
	The state of the state of	Medium truck - 60%		
	20 1/4 BY 1 N	OTR Bias - 30%		
	Company of the second second	OTR Blas - 30%		
	15%	Retread - 73.76%	State Net Pricing	
	1370	Nelleau = 73.7070	State Net Friding	Halev Hartsfield
Contact	Craig Morphett	Chris Campbell	Derrick Madewell	Aaron McFadden
Address	6640 Toney Lane	1108 North Fares Ave	1029 N Green Street	1029 N Green Street
Addiess	Evanville, IN	Evansville, IN	Henderson, KY	Henderons, KY
	47715	a construction of the cons	42420	42420
Dhono	812-471-8473	812-465-5555	270-826-3931	270-826-3931
Phone		012-400-0000		210-020-3931
F	812-305-6014 (Ryne) 812-471-8924		270-860-7904	270 927 2945
Fax	812-471-8924 c.morphett@best1tire.com or		270-827-8211	270-827-2815
E-Mail	r.murch@best1tire.com	ct location 313@goodyear.com	derrick.madewell@purcelltire.com	