Deviates from
50%
commission to

023-03 30%
Individual Pictures Bid Package Description Jostens Lifetouch Red Exposure Strawbridge, Inc|Studio Il Xposed Media
(1)8x10; (2) 5x 7; (8) jumbo See links to Digital
Package A wallets; (24) medium wallets $25.00 $35.00 $25.00 $28.00 $28.00 Proposal/pricing below;
(2)8x10; (2) 5 x 7; (24) medium
Package B wallets $25.00 $42.00 $35.00 $26.00 $28.00
(2) 5 x7; (8) jumbo wallets; (24)
Package C medium wallets $20.00 $26.00 $20.00 $23.00 $20.00
(1) 8 x 10; (2) 4 x 6, (24) medium
Package D wallets $17.00 $26.00 $23.00 $22.00 $20.00
(1) 8 x10; (2) 4 x 6; (16) medium
Package E wallets $10.00 $26.00 $23.00 $19.00 $20.00
Package F (2) 4 x 6; (16) medium wallets $9.50 $20.00 $18.00 $14.00 $14.00
Package G (1)8x10 $9.50 $20.00 $15.00 $10.00 $12.00
Package H (2)5x7 $20.00 $15.00 $10.00 $12.00
the following bonus packages
Bonus can be added to package A - H
1 (1)8x10 10.00 17.00 15.00 10.00 12.00
2 (16) jumbo wallets 14.00 17.00 16.00 15.00 15.00
3 (1)10x 13 17.00 17.00 20.00 15.00 22.00
Optional Group Pictures
(1) 8 x 10 class group (no
8x10 - no names names) $10.00 $17.00 $15.00 $10.00 $12.00
(1) 8 x 10 class group (student
8x10 - student names addednames added) $15.00 $17.00 $18.00 $12.00 $17.00
Memory Mate Pkg
(1)8x10; (2)4 %6, (2) 5x7;
Package A (16) jumbo wallets; no group $15.00 |na $28.00 $35.00
(2)8x10; (2) 5 x 7; (16) jumbo
Package B wallets; no group $16.00 |na $28.00 $35.00
(1) 8 x10; (2) 4 x 6: (16) jumbo
Package C wallets; no group $16.00 |na $23.00 $30.00
(2) 5 x 7 (8) jumbo wallets; no
Package D group $10.00 |na $18.00 25.00
Package E (1)10x 13 $10.00 |na $20.00 18.00 22.00
Package F (1)8x10 $8.00 [na $15.00 14.00 12.00
Package G (2)5x7 $8.00 [na $15.00 14.00 12.00
Package H (16) jumbo wallets $12.00 |na $18.00 20.00 15.00
(1) 8 x 10 group (no package
Package | purchase) $10.00 |na $15.00 $15.00 $12.00
(1) 8 x 10 group (added to any
Package J package) $10.00 |na $13.00 $12.00 $10.00
Memory Mate folder; (1) 5x 7
group; (2) 4 x 6; (8) jumbo
Package K wallets $12.00 |na $20.00 $24.00
Dances
(2) 8 x10: (2) 5x 7; (32) jumbo
Package A wallets nb na $40.00 |No Bid $42.00
(2)8x 10; (4) 4 x 6, (16) jumbo
Package B wallets nb na $35.00 |No Bid $40.00
Package C (2) 8 x 10; (16) jumbo wallets nb na $23.00 |No Bid $32.00
(2)5x7; (4) 4 x6; (8) jumbo
Package D wallets nb na $23.00 |No Bid $28.00
Package E (2) 5 x7; (8) jumbo wallets nb na $18.00 |No Bid $28.00
Package F (2) 4 x 6; (8) jumbo wallets nb na $16.00 |No Bid $18.00
Package G (16) jumbo wallets nb na $16.00 |No Bid $16.00
Package H (24) jumbo wallets nb na $18.00 |No Bid $22.00
Package | (32) jumbo wallets nb na $23.00 |No Bid $28.00
gital Offeringsl/| ng Click here for Digital Proposal _Click here for additional Information Link to samples of wo| Click here for Digital Proposal
Studio Il
Southern Strawbridge Photography and
Company Jostens Liferouch Red Elephant Studio Exposure Studios, Inc. Design Xposed Med
Representative Billy Hargis Lexi Wolfe James Boler Tony Kirves Cheryl Griffith | Michael Hoskins Darian Jackson
studio@southernex
Jamie.boler@theredelephantstudio. | posure.photography | cgriffith@strawbr,
Email Address billy. hargis@jostens.d| alexis.heeke@shutterfly.con| com idge.net studioiiphoto@bellsoutl| info@xposedmedia.org

Address

653 Bohon Road

City/State/Zip
Phone Number

6769 Farnsley Knob Rd

482 Veterans Memorial Hwy

Harrodsburg KY 4033

Elizabeth, IN 47117

900 South Main

Scottsville, KY 42164

Street PO Box 3005 201 N. Main St. 319 Coombs Dr.
Durham, NC
Hopkinsville, KY 27715 Beaver Dam, KY 4232(|Bowling Green, KY 42101

859.608.805:

812-972-9383

270-239-1120

(270) 886-2919

859-583-5328

270-274-3227

615-705-0675

Links to samples of work



