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BID TABULATION 
 
  
Craig Thomas, Architect 

 
HENDERSON COUNTY HIGH SCHOOL 

CTE RENOVATION 
HENDERSON, KY 

     
 

          

CONTRACTOR UNIT 
PRICES 

BID 
BOND 

ADD 
1, 2 

CLAIR 
1 

BASE BID 
ALT #1 
TRANE 

ROOFTOP 
UNITS 

ALT #2 
TRANE 

CONTROLS 
 

ALT #3 
MILLER WELDING 

BOOTH ARMS 

ALT #4 
LITHONIA 
LIGHTING 

 

ALT #5 
LITHONIA 

CONTROLS 
 

 
ALT #6 

SQUARE D 
ELECTRICL 

EQUIP 
 

ALT #7 
SWC FOR 
PAGING & 
SECURITY 

ALT #8 
HONEY
WELL 
FIRE 

ALARM 

TOTAL 

ARC Construction Co. 
Evansville, IN    $3,407,000.00 n/c n/c +$24,915.00 n/c n/c n/c +$22,650.00 n/c   $3,454,565.00 

C.H. Garmong Construction 
Evansville, IN    $3,567,000.00 n/c n/c +$29,900.00 n/c n/c n/c +$22,200.00 n/c $3,619,100.00 

CXB Construction 
Henderson, KY    No Bid         No Bid 

Danco Construction 
Evansville, IN    $3,818,000.00 n/c n/c +$30,000.00 n/c n/c n/c +$23,000.00 n/c  $3,871,000.00 

Empire Contractors 
Evansville, IN 

   $3,393,460.00 n/c n/c +$65,000.00 n/c n/c n/c +$23,000.00 n/c  $3,481,460.00 

LEE Company 
Bowling Green. KY    No Bid         No Bid 
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