
Jefferson County Public Schools
Bid Tabulation 
Event Name: GRAPHICS SHOP SUPPLIES (MATERIALS PRODUCTION)
Event ID: JCPS-8334
Approval Date: May 28, 2024
Date Bids Received: May 25, 2024
Contract Period: June 2, 2024 through June 1, 2025
Renewals: No renewal option
Comments: Award Status indicates an award

Item 
Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

001 Satin, 8 mil., curl-resistant polyester film grey back for 
roll-up display stands. 36" x 98', 3" core.

Compatible with HP FB 550 Sitex and HP 560 printers. Approved Product: 
Brightline or equal.

4600548-2011933 ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 98 Foot 
Roll

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

001 Satin, 8 mil., curl-resistant polyester film grey back for 
roll-up display stands. 36" x 98', 3" core.

Compatible with HP FB 550 Sitex and HP 560 printers. Approved Product: 
Brightline or equal.

4600548-2011933 Athens Paper Company 1 - 98 Foot 
Roll

1 Sihl Inc. 3396-36 $182.7000 $182.7000 100' roll - 100% polyester     
Athens# 126306

Awarded

002 Wall graphics wrap. Removable vinyl adhesive. 6 mil., 
54" x 150', 3" core.

For HP 560 latex and HP FB 550 Sitex printers or comparable 54" width-
option. Approved Product: Magic Stick or equal.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 Nekoosa SPMWG65450N $295.0000 $295.0000 Athens# 108460

Awarded

002 Wall graphics wrap. Removable vinyl adhesive. 6 mil., 
54" x 150', 3" core.

For HP 560 latex and HP FB 550 Sitex printers or comparable 54" width-
option. Approved Product: Magic Stick or equal.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 DCM XL97VO551 $314.5000 $314.5000

003 Adhesive, vinyl (general purpose). 6 mil., matte white, 
54" x 50 yd. (150'), 3" core.

For HP 560 latex and HP FB 550 Sitex printers. Approved Product: Mojave 
Digital Media #SPM6005450N or equal.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

003 Adhesive, vinyl (general purpose). 6 mil., matte white, 
54" x 50 yd. (150'), 3" core.

For HP 560 latex and HP FB 550 Sitex printers. Approved Product: Mojave 
Digital Media #SPM6005450N or equal.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 Nekoosa SPM6005450N $187.8500 $187.8500 Athens# 106567

Awarded

004 Adhesive, vinyl, indoor, floor graphics. 6-10 mil., 54" x 
100', 3" core.

Anti-slip textured indoor floor graphics (removable). For HP 560 latex and HP 
FB 550 Sitex printers.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 100 Foot 
Roll

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

004 Adhesive, vinyl, indoor, floor graphics. 6-10 mil., 54" x 
100', 3" core.

Anti-slip textured indoor floor graphics (removable). For HP 560 latex and HP 
FB 550 Sitex printers.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - 100 Foot 
Roll

1 Que Media QM-TASQUE-5 $269.5000 $269.5000 8 mil, 150' roll,  no laminate 
needed - Athens# 119999

Awarded

005 Adhesive, vinyl, indoor/outdoor, floor and sidewalk 
graphics. 6-10 mil., 54" x 100', 3" core.

Anti-slip textured indoor-outdoor floor/sidewalk/carpet graphics 
(removeable). For HP 560 latex and HP FB 550 Sitex printers.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 100 Foot 
Roll

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

005 Adhesive, vinyl, indoor/outdoor, floor and sidewalk 
graphics. 6-10 mil., 54" x 100', 3" core.

Anti-slip textured indoor-outdoor floor/sidewalk/carpet graphics 
(removeable). For HP 560 latex and HP FB 550 Sitex printers.

N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - 100 Foot 
Roll

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

006 Board, corrugated plastic. 48" x 96", white, 3/16". Vendor will custom cut if needed. Approved Product: Corex or equal. Please 
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: 

indicate any minimum/maximum quantities for order as well as any 
additional cost for custom cutting.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

006 Board, corrugated plastic. 48" x 96", white, 3/16". Vendor will custom cut if needed. Approved Product: Corex or equal. Please 
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: 

indicate any minimum/maximum quantities for order as well as any 
additional cost for custom cutting.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 Matra Plast 53037 $9.7500 $9.7500 NO CUSTOM CUTTING available, 
25 sheets per carton, pallet pack 

of 275 available Awarded

007 Tape, 2-sided, adhesive banner hem, mounting and 
welding. Pressure sensitive 1" x 36 yard roll.

Approved Product: Orafel Ruban, or equal. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 36 Yard 
Roll

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

007 Tape, 2-sided, adhesive banner hem, mounting and 
welding. Pressure sensitive 1" x 36 yard roll.

Approved Product: Orafel Ruban, or equal. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - 36 Yard 
Roll

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

008 Tape, 1-sided, adhesive banner hem mounting and 
welding. 1.5" x 36 yard roll.

Approved Product: Banner Ups Power Tape,  or equal. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 36 Yard 
Roll

1 $0.0000 $0.0000



008 Tape, 1-sided, adhesive banner hem mounting and 
welding. 1.5" x 36 yard roll.

Approved Product: Banner Ups Power Tape,  or equal. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - 36 Yard 
Roll

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

009 Grommet set, size 0 nickel plated brass. Approved Product: Hiker,  or equal. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

009 Grommet set, size 0 nickel plated brass. Approved Product: Hiker,  or equal. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

010 Clear Choice Transfer Tape, medium-low tack, 30" x 
100 yds.

Approved Product: RTape AT60/AT60N,  or equal. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 100 Yard 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

010 Clear Choice Transfer Tape, medium-low tack, 30" x 
100 yds.

Approved Product: RTape AT60/AT60N,  or equal. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - 100 Yard 
Purchase

1 Nekoosa 12906 $161.5000 $161.5000

Awarded

011 Rollup 01 retractable banner stand and carrying bag, 
33.75"W x 86.5"H x 10"D.

Approved Product: Picasso or equal. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

011 Rollup 01 retractable banner stand and carrying bag, 
33.75"W x 86.5"H x 10"D.

Approved Product: Picasso or equal. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 Frontline INE816533 $94.7500 $94.7500 Athens# 120038

Awarded

012 Indoor/Outdoor A-Frame Easel Sign (White). Stand with slots to hold interchangeable preprinted signage. OUTSIDE 
DIMENSIONS: 46.125”H x 27”W x 3.125”. DIMENSIONS OF RECESSED SIGN 

AREA: 35.125”H x 24.375”W. WEIGHT: 20 lbs. Holds 2 signs per frame. 
Approved Product: Plasticade Signicade Deluxe A-Frame Sign, or equal.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

012 Indoor/Outdoor A-Frame Easel Sign (White). Stand with slots to hold interchangeable preprinted signage. OUTSIDE 
DIMENSIONS: 46.125”H x 27”W x 3.125”. DIMENSIONS OF RECESSED SIGN 

AREA: 35.125”H x 24.375”W. WEIGHT: 20 lbs. Holds 2 signs per frame. 
Approved Product: Plasticade Signicade Deluxe A-Frame Sign, or equal.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 Plasticade 140-w-1pkf $82.5000 $82.5000 Athens# 129504

Awarded

013 Indoor/Outdoor A-Frame Easel Sign (Black). Stand with slots to hold interchangeable preprinted signage. OUTSIDE 
DIMENSIONS: 46.125”H x 27”W x 3.125”. DIMENSIONS OF RECESSED SIGN 

AREA: 35.125”H x 24.375”W. WEIGHT: 20 lbs. Holds 2 signs per frame. 
Approved Product: Plasticade Signicade Deluxe A-Frame Sign, or equal.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

013 Indoor/Outdoor A-Frame Easel Sign (Black). Stand with slots to hold interchangeable preprinted signage. OUTSIDE 
DIMENSIONS: 46.125”H x 27”W x 3.125”. DIMENSIONS OF RECESSED SIGN 

AREA: 35.125”H x 24.375”W. WEIGHT: 20 lbs. Holds 2 signs per frame. 
Approved Product: Plasticade Signicade Deluxe A-Frame Sign, or equal.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 Plasticade 140-bk-1pkf $82.5000 $82.5000 Athens# 129505

Awarded

014 Adhesion Promoter, primer for hard to print 
substrates.

Approved Product: #AP3155 or equal. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

014 Adhesion Promoter, primer for hard to print 
substrates.

Approved Product: #AP3155 or equal. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

015 Standoffs, aluminum, diameter 1/2", 19/32", small, 4 
per package.

Approved Product: Pizazz Multimounts or equal. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 4 Count 
Pack

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

015 Standoffs, aluminum, diameter 1/2", 19/32", small, 4 
per package.

Approved Product: Pizazz Multimounts or equal. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - 4 Count 
Pack

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

016 Squeegee Bundle, white, 4" poly blend, 50-pack. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 50 Count 
Pack

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

016 Squeegee Bundle, white, 4" poly blend, 50-pack. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - 50 Count 
Pack

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

017 Hanger Clips - Foam Hanger Twist N Hook Foam Hanger for use with hanging foam core sheets. 100 count 
per package.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 100 Count 
Pack

1 $0.0000 $0.0000



017 Hanger Clips - Foam Hanger Twist N Hook Foam Hanger for use with hanging foam core sheets. 100 count 
per package.

N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - 100 Count 
Pack

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

018 Hanger Clips - Coro Hanger Pick N Hook Coro Hanger for use with hanging corrugated sheets. 100 count 
per package.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 100 Count 
Pack

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

018 Hanger Clips - Coro Hanger Pick N Hook Coro Hanger for use with hanging corrugated sheets. 100 count 
per package.

N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - 100 Count 
Pack

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

019 Paper, 55" x 450' roll, 30 lb. brown kraft paper, 3" 
core.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 450 Foot 
Roll

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

019 Paper, 55" x 450' roll, 30 lb. brown kraft paper, 3" 
core.

N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - 450 Foot 
Roll

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

020 Paper, 38" x 450' roll, 30lb. brown kraft paper, 3" 
core.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each Roll 1 $0.0000 $0.0000

020 Paper, 38" x 450' roll, 30lb. brown kraft paper, 3" 
core.

N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - Each Roll 1 $0.0000 $0.0000

021 Graphik Replacement Blade for Evolution E2. 100 per 
pack.

Approved Product: #CA05-032 or equal. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 100 Count 
Pack

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

021 Graphik Replacement Blade for Evolution E2. 100 per 
pack.

Approved Product: #CA05-032 or equal. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - 100 Count 
Pack

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

022 Magnum Magnetics, DigiMag, 48” x 50’, Matte .015, 3 
inch core.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each Roll 1 $0.0000 $0.0000

022 Magnum Magnetics, DigiMag, 48” x 50’, Matte .015, 3 
inch core.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each Roll 1 Newlife Magnetics NMMWC019X48 $142.8500 $142.8500 Athens# 101572

Awarded

023 Magnum Magnetics, MuscleMag, Inkjet, 24” x 50’, 
Matte, 3 inch core.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each Roll 1 $0.0000 $0.0000

023 Magnum Magnetics, MuscleMag, Inkjet, 24” x 50’, 
Matte, 3 inch core.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each Roll 1 Newlife Magnetics NMANMC024x2 $101.1000 $101.1000 Athens# 101565

Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 24-25 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

024 Banner, blockout, double-sided. Pole banner, 38" x 
164', 3" core.

For HP 560 latex and HP FB 550 Sitex printers. Approved Product: Ultraflex 
#TB180965 or equal.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 164 Foot 
Roll

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

025 Banner, blockout, double-sided. Pole banner, 54" x 
164', 3" core.

For HP 560 latex and HP FB 550 Sitex printers. Approved Product: Ultraflex 
#PBP18137050 or equal.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 164 Foot 
Roll

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

024 Banner, blockout, double-sided. Pole banner, 38" x 
164', 3" core.

For HP 560 latex and HP FB 550 Sitex printers. Approved Product: Ultraflex 
#TB180965 or equal.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - 164 Foot 
Roll

1 UltraFlex PBP18096550 $180.4000 $180.4000 Athens# 107511
Awarded

025 Banner, blockout, double-sided. Pole banner, 54" x 
164', 3" core.

For HP 560 latex and HP FB 550 Sitex printers. Approved Product: Ultraflex 
#PBP18137050 or equal.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - 164 Foot 
Roll

1 UltraFlex PBP18137050 $255.3000 $255.3000 Athens# 108270
Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 26-27 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

026 Banner, vinyl, 38" x 164', 13 oz., gloss white, roll, 3" 
core.

For HP 560 latex and HP FB 550 Sitex printers. Approved Product: Ultraflex Jet 
Flex outward print or equal.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 33 Yard 
Roll

20 $0.0000 $0.0000

027 Banner, vinyl, 63" x 164', 13 oz., gloss white, roll, 3" 
core.

For HP 560 latex and HP FB 550 Sitex printers. Approved Product: Ultraflex Jet 
Flex outward print or equal.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 33 Yard 
Roll

25 $0.0000 $0.0000

026 Banner, vinyl, 38" x 164', 13 oz., gloss white, roll, 3" 
core.

For HP 560 latex and HP FB 550 Sitex printers. Approved Product: Ultraflex Jet 
Flex outward print or equal.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - 33 Yard 
Roll

20 UltraFlex PPGFL096535 $69.3500 $1,387.0000 Athens# 129567
Awarded



027 Banner, vinyl, 63" x 164', 13 oz., gloss white, roll, 3" 
core.

For HP 560 latex and HP FB 550 Sitex printers. Approved Product: Ultraflex Jet 
Flex outward print or equal.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - 33 Yard 
Roll

25 UltraFlex PPGFL16035F $114.9500 $2,873.7500 Athens# 129568
Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 28-29 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

028 Window film, perforated, with adhesive backing and 
release liner. Perforated 80/20 54" x 164', 3" core.

Compatible with HP 560 latex and HP FB 550 Sitex printers. Approved 
Product: Ultraflex Ultravision Window Perf.  Or equal.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 164 Foot 
Roll

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

029 Window film, perforated, with adhesive backing and 
release liner. Perforated 80/20 39" x 164', 3" core.

Compatible with HP 560 latex and HP FB 550 Sitex printers. Approved 
Product: Ultraflex Ultravision Window Perf.  Or equal.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 164 Foot 
Roll

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

028 Window film, perforated, with adhesive backing and 
release liner. Perforated 80/20 54" x 164', 3" core.

Compatible with HP 560 latex and HP FB 550 Sitex printers. Approved 
Product: Ultraflex Ultravision Window Perf.  Or equal.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - 164 Foot 
Roll

1 UltraFlex OWV8020/137 $459.0000 $459.0000 Athens# 127938 Rejected - incomplete coverage for Lot 
Item Nos. 28 thru 29.

029 Window film, perforated, with adhesive backing and 
release liner. Perforated 80/20 39" x 164', 3" core.

Compatible with HP 560 latex and HP FB 550 Sitex printers. Approved 
Product: Ultraflex Ultravision Window Perf.  Or equal.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - 164 Foot 
Roll

1 UltraFlex 9999999 $0.0100 $0.0100 NOT available in 39" rolls Rejected - incomplete coverage for Lot 
Item Nos. 28 thru 29.

Lot Item 
Nos. 30-31 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

030 Board, PVC, white, 1/8" thick, 4' x 8' board. Vendor 
will cut sheets down, if required for project.

Approved Product: Sintra or equal. Please respond to the following in the 
VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: indicate any minimum/maximum 

quantities for order as well as any
additional cost for custom cutting.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 10 Sheet 
Bundle

2 $0.0000 $0.0000

031 Board, PVC, white, 1/8" thick, OVERSIZED 5' x 10' 
board. Vendor will cut sheets down, if required for 

project.

Approved Product: Sintra or equal. Please respond to the
following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: indicate any 

minimum/maximum quantities for order as well as any
additional cost for custom cutting.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

030 Board, PVC, white, 1/8" thick, 4' x 8' board. Vendor 
will cut sheets down, if required for project.

Approved Product: Sintra or equal. Please respond to the following in the 
VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: indicate any minimum/maximum 

quantities for order as well as any
additional cost for custom cutting.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - 10 Sheet 
Bundle

2 Palram 392196 $25.9000 $51.8000 Athens# 118872

Awarded

031 Board, PVC, white, 1/8" thick, OVERSIZED 5' x 10' 
board. Vendor will cut sheets down, if required for 

project.

Approved Product: Sintra or equal. Please respond to the
following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: indicate any 

minimum/maximum quantities for order as well as any
additional cost for custom cutting.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 Kommerling 392199 $37.0000 $37.0000 Athens# 118878

Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 32-33 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

032 Aluminum, white over black, 1/8" thick, OVERSIZED 5' 
x 10' board. Vendor will cut sheets down, if required 

for project.

Approved Product: MAX-Metal or equal. Please respond to the following in 
the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: indicate any minimum/maximum 

quantities for order as well as any
additional cost for custom cutting.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 -  Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

033 Aluminum, white over black (printable), 1/8" thick, 4' 
x 8' board. Vendor will cut sheets down, if required 

for project.

Approved Products: MAX-Metal or equal. Please respond to the following in 
the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: indicate any minimum/maximum 

quantities for order as well as
any additional cost for custom cutting.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 -  Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

032 Aluminum, white over black, 1/8" thick, OVERSIZED 5' 
x 10' board. Vendor will cut sheets down, if required 

for project.

Approved Product: MAX-Metal or equal. Please respond to the following in 
the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: indicate any minimum/maximum 

quantities for order as well as any
additional cost for custom cutting.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 -  Each 
Purchase

1 Alumanate wh360120008 $76.5000 $76.5000 Athens# 129614

Awarded

033 Aluminum, white over black (printable), 1/8" thick, 4' 
x 8' board. Vendor will cut sheets down, if required 

for project.

Approved Products: MAX-Metal or equal. Please respond to the following in 
the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: indicate any minimum/maximum 

quantities for order as well as
any additional cost for custom cutting.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 -  Each 
Purchase

1 Alumanate wh34896008w $53.0000 $53.0000 Athens# 129611

Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 34-35 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

034 Ultra board. 48" x 96", white, 3/16". Compatible with HP FB 550 Sitex printer. Approved Product: Ultra board or 
equal.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

035 Ultra board PLUS. 48" x 96", white, 1/4". Compatible with HP FB-550 Sitex UV flatbed printers. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

034 Ultra board. 48" x 96", white, 3/16". Compatible with HP FB 550 Sitex printer. Approved Product: Ultra board or 
equal.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 United Industries UB019WAX $44.3000 $44.3000 Athens# 119136
Awarded

035 Ultra board PLUS. 48" x 96", white, 1/4". Compatible with HP FB-550 Sitex UV flatbed printers. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 United Industries UP019wax $69.3000 $69.3000 Athens# 119164
Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 36-37 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

036 Laminating Film, 38" x 250', 1.7 mil., 3" core. Approved Product:  GBC Octiva, Write/Erase.   Or equal. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 250 Foot 
Roll

20 $0.0000 $0.0000 Rejected - incomplete coverage for Lot 
Item Nos. 36 thru 37.

037 Laminating Film, 51" x 250', 1.7 mil., 3" core. Approved Product:  GBC Octiva, Write/Erase.   Or equal. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - 250 Foot 
Roll

10 Graphic Finishing 
Partners (Gfp)

PDR-54150 2 Mil 
Clear Polypropylene 
Dry Erase Laminate 

54 x 150' (not 
available in 250')

$251.7500 $2,517.5000 GBC Octiva Dry Erase 
discontinued

Rejected - incomplete coverage for Lot 
Item Nos. 36 thru 37.



036 Laminating Film, 38" x 250', 1.7 mil., 3" core. Approved Product:  GBC Octiva, Write/Erase.   Or equal. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - 250 Foot 
Roll

20 $0.0000 $0.0000

037 Laminating Film, 51" x 250', 1.7 mil., 3" core. Approved Product:  GBC Octiva, Write/Erase.   Or equal. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - 250 Foot 
Roll

10 $0.0000 $0.0000

Lot Item 
Nos. 38-41 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

038 Laminating Film, gloss. 38" x 250', 3 mil., 3" core, lo-melt, roll. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 200 Foot 
Roll

20 $0.0000 $0.0000

039 Laminating Film, gloss. 61" x 250', 3 mil., 3" core, lo-melt, roll. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 200 Foot 
Roll

20 $0.0000 $0.0000

040 Laminating Film, satin. 38" x 250', 3 mil., 3" core, lo-melt, roll. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 200 Foot 
Roll

30 $0.0000 $0.0000

041 Laminating Film, satin. 61" x 250', 3 mil., 3" core, lo-melt, roll. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 200 Foot 
Roll

30 $0.0000 $0.0000

038 Laminating Film, gloss. 38" x 250', 3 mil., 3" core, lo-melt, roll. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - 200 Foot 
Roll

20 Transcendia 108741 $121.5000 $2,430.0000
Awarded

039 Laminating Film, gloss. 61" x 250', 3 mil., 3" core, lo-melt, roll. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - 200 Foot 
Roll

20 Transcedia 108745 $292.9500 $5,859.0000
Awarded

040 Laminating Film, satin. 38" x 250', 3 mil., 3" core, lo-melt, roll. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - 200 Foot 
Roll

30 Transcendia 108761 $124.5000 $3,735.0000
Awarded

041 Laminating Film, satin. 61" x 250', 3 mil., 3" core, lo-melt, roll. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - 200 Foot 
Roll

30 Transcendia 108765 $295.9500 $8,878.5000
Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 42-43 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

042 Paper, 36" x 300' roll, 35 lb.  Coated matte paper, 3" 
core.

Comparable length roll acceptable. Award will be subject to the best price per 
calculated square foot. Compatible with HP Z6100 Aqueous and HP 560 latex 

printers.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - 300 Foot 
Roll

100 HP L5C80A HP Universal 
Heavyweight Coated 
Paper 35 lb. 3" Core 

36 x 300'

$153.0500 $15,305.0000

043 Paper, 54" x 300' roll, 35 lb.  Coated matte paper, 3" 
core.

Comparable length roll acceptable. Award will be subject to the best price per 
calculated square foot. Compatible with HP Z6100 Aqueous and HP 560 latex 

printers.

N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - 300 Foot 
Roll

100 HP D9R46B HP 
Universal 

Heavyweight Coated 
Paper 35 lb. 3" core 

54 x 200' roll

$182.8900 $18,289.0000

042 Paper, 36" x 300' roll, 35 lb.  Coated matte paper, 3" 
core.

Comparable length roll acceptable. Award will be subject to the best price per 
calculated square foot. Compatible with HP Z6100 Aqueous and HP 560 latex 

printers.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - 300 Foot 
Roll

100 BMG 128483 $57.5000 $5,750.0000

Awarded

043 Paper, 54" x 300' roll, 35 lb.  Coated matte paper, 3" 
core.

Comparable length roll acceptable. Award will be subject to the best price per 
calculated square foot. Compatible with HP Z6100 Aqueous and HP 560 latex 

printers.

N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - 300 Foot 
Roll

100 BMG 105890 $84.5000 $8,450.0000

Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 44-45 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

044 Paper, HP Universal Heavyweight Coated, 3" core, 6.8 
mil., 125 gsm, 35 lb., 36" x 300'.

For HP PageWide 8000 XL printer.  Approved Product:  HP.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - 300 Foot 
Roll

50 BMG 128483 $107.8000 $5,390.0000 Rejected - substitute not acceptable. 

045 Paper, HP Universal Heavyweight Coated, 3" core, 6.8 
mil., 125 gsm, 35 lb., 40" x 300'.

For HP PageWide 8000 XL printer.  Approved Product:  HP.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - 300 Foot 
Roll

50 BMG 120874 $121.0000 $6,050.0000 Rejected - substitute not acceptable. 

044 Paper, HP Universal Heavyweight Coated, 3" core, 6.8 
mil., 125 gsm, 35 lb., 36" x 300'.

For HP PageWide 8000 XL printer.  Approved Product:  HP.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - 300 Foot 
Roll

50 HP L5C80A $153.0500 $7,652.5000
Awarded

045 Paper, HP Universal Heavyweight Coated, 3" core, 6.8 
mil., 125 gsm, 35 lb., 40" x 300'.

For HP PageWide 8000 XL printer.  Approved Product:  HP.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - 300 Foot 
Roll

50 HP L5C81A $168.3600 $8,418.0000
Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 46-60 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

046 HP Latex User Maintenance Kit.  For HP 560 Designjet 
printer.

Approved Product:  #HPF0M59A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP F0M59A $250.0000 $250.0000 104293

047 HP Latex 500 Series Wiper Roller.  For HP 560 
Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPT7U73A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP T7U73A $500.0000 $500.0000 119034



048 HP Latex 500 Series Ink Collector.  For HP 560 
Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPT7U74A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP T7174A $500.0000 $500.0000 119305

049 Latex printhead, HP 831, cyan/black.  For HP 560 
Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ677A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ677A $145.2100 $145.2100 104280

050 Latex printhead, HP 831, yellow/magenta.  For HP 560 
Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ678A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ678A $145.2100 $145.2100 104281

051 Latex printhead, HP 831, light magenta/light cyan.  For 
HP 560 Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ679A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ679A $145.2100 $145.2100 140282

052 Latex optimizer printhead, HP 831.  For HP 560 
Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ680A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ680A $145.2100 $145.2100 104283

053 Latex ink cartridge, HP 831A, 775 mil., black.  For HP 
560 Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ682A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ682A $163.0000 $163.0000 104262

054 Latex ink cartridge, HP 831A, 775 mil., cyan.  For HP 
560 Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ683A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ683 $163.0000 $163.0000 104263

055 Latex ink cartridge, HP 831A, 775 mil., magenta.  For 
HP 560 Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ684A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ684A $163.0000 $163.0000 104264

056 Latex ink cartridge, HP 831A, 775 mil., yellow.  For HP 
560 Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ685A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CX685A $163.0000 $163.0000 104265

057 Latex ink cartridge, HP 831A, 775 mil., light cyan.  For 
HP 560 Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ686A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ686A $163.0000 $163.0000 104266

058 Latex ink cartridge, HP 831A, 775 mil., light magenta.  
For HP 560 Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ687A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ687A $163.0000 $163.0000 104267

059 Latex optimizer ink cartridge, HP 831, 775 mil.  For HP 
560 Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ706A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ706A $163.0000 $163.0000 104269

060 Latex maintenance cartridge, HP 831.  For HP 560 
Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ681A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ681A $174.1400 $174.1400 104298

046 HP Latex User Maintenance Kit.  For HP 560 Designjet 
printer.

Approved Product:  #HPF0M59A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP F0M59A $221.0000 $221.0000
Awarded

047 HP Latex 500 Series Wiper Roller.  For HP 560 
Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPT7U73A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP T7U73A $421.0700 $421.0700
Awarded

048 HP Latex 500 Series Ink Collector.  For HP 560 
Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPT7U74A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP T7U74A $421.0700 $421.0700
Awarded

049 Latex printhead, HP 831, cyan/black.  For HP 560 
Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ677A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ677A $103.5000 $103.5000
Awarded

050 Latex printhead, HP 831, yellow/magenta.  For HP 560 
Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ678A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ678A $103.5000 $103.5000
Awarded

051 Latex printhead, HP 831, light magenta/light cyan.  For 
HP 560 Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ679A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ679A $103.5000 $103.5000
Awarded

052 Latex optimizer printhead, HP 831.  For HP 560 
Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ680A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ680A $103.5000 $103.5000
Awarded

053 Latex ink cartridge, HP 831A, 775 mil., black.  For HP 
560 Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ682A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ682A $163.0000 $163.0000
Awarded

054 Latex ink cartridge, HP 831A, 775 mil., cyan.  For HP 
560 Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ683A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ683A $163.0000 $163.0000
Awarded

055 Latex ink cartridge, HP 831A, 775 mil., magenta.  For 
HP 560 Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ684A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ684A $163.0000 $163.0000
Awarded

056 Latex ink cartridge, HP 831A, 775 mil., yellow.  For HP 
560 Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ685A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ685A $163.0000 $163.0000
Awarded

057 Latex ink cartridge, HP 831A, 775 mil., light cyan.  For 
HP 560 Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ686A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ686A $163.0000 $163.0000
Awarded

058 Latex ink cartridge, HP 831A, 775 mil., light magenta.  
For HP 560 Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ687A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ687A $163.0000 $163.0000
Awarded

059 Latex optimizer ink cartridge, HP 831, 775 mil.  For HP 
560 Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ706A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ706A $163.0000 $163.0000
Awarded

060 Latex maintenance cartridge, HP 831.  For HP 560 
Designjet printer.

Approved Product:  #HPCZ681A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CZ681A $122.5000 $122.5000
Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 61-70 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

061 Ink cartridge, HP FB794, 3 liter, cyan.  For HP FB 550 
Sitex printer.

Approved Product:  #G0Y93A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 hP g0y93a $462.0000 $462.0000

062 Ink cartridge, HP FB794, 3 liter, magenta.  For HP FB 
550 Sitex printer.

Approved Product:  #G0Y94A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP G0Y94A $462.0000 $462.0000



063 Ink cartridge, HP FB794, 3 liter, yellow.  For HP FB 550 
Sitex printer.

Approved Product:  #G0Y95A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP GOY95A $462.0000 $462.0000

064 Ink cartridge, HP FB794, 3 liter, black.  For HP FB 550 
Sitex printer.

Approved Product:  #G0Y96A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP goy96a $462.0000 $462.0000

065 Ink cartridge, HP FB794, 3 liter, light cyan.  For HP FB 
550 Sitex printer.

Approved Product:  #G0Y97A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP goy097a $462.0000 $462.0000

066 Ink cartridge, HP FB794, 3 liter, light magenta.  For HP 
FB 550 Sitex printer.

Approved Product:  #G0Y98A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP gyo98a $462.0000 $462.0000

067 Ink cartridge, HP FB251, 2 liter, white.  For HP FB 550 
Sitex printer.

Approved Product:  #CQ123A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP cq123a $415.0000 $415.0000

068 HP 1 liter UV Printhead Flush.  For HP FB 550 Sitex 
printer.

Approved Product:  #CH122A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP ch122a $45.0000 $45.0000

069 HP UV Replacement Bulb.  For HP FB 550 Sitex printer. Approved Product:  #CH231A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP ch231a $296.2500 $296.2500

070 HP Sitex FB5xx/7xx/950 Printer Cleaning Kit.  For HP 
FB 550 Sitex printer.

Approved Product:  #CQ121A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP cq121a $296.2500 $296.2500

061 Ink cartridge, HP FB794, 3 liter, cyan.  For HP FB 550 
Sitex printer.

Approved Product:  #G0Y93A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP G0Y93A $416.5000 $416.5000
Awarded

062 Ink cartridge, HP FB794, 3 liter, magenta.  For HP FB 
550 Sitex printer.

Approved Product:  #G0Y94A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP G0Y94A $416.5000 $416.5000
Awarded

063 Ink cartridge, HP FB794, 3 liter, yellow.  For HP FB 550 
Sitex printer.

Approved Product:  #G0Y95A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP G0Y95A $416.5000 $416.5000
Awarded

064 Ink cartridge, HP FB794, 3 liter, black.  For HP FB 550 
Sitex printer.

Approved Product:  #G0Y96A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP G0Y96A $416.5000 $416.5000
Awarded

065 Ink cartridge, HP FB794, 3 liter, light cyan.  For HP FB 
550 Sitex printer.

Approved Product:  #G0Y97A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP G0Y97A $416.5000 $416.5000
Awarded

066 Ink cartridge, HP FB794, 3 liter, light magenta.  For HP 
FB 550 Sitex printer.

Approved Product:  #G0Y98A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP G0Y98A $416.5000 $416.5000
Awarded

067 Ink cartridge, HP FB251, 2 liter, white.  For HP FB 550 
Sitex printer.

Approved Product:  #CQ123A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CQ123A $366.7800 $366.7800
Awarded

068 HP 1 liter UV Printhead Flush.  For HP FB 550 Sitex 
printer.

Approved Product:  #CH122A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CH122A $45.0000 $45.0000
Awarded

069 HP UV Replacement Bulb.  For HP FB 550 Sitex printer. Approved Product:  #CH231A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CH231A $270.8700 $270.8700
Awarded

070 HP Sitex FB5xx/7xx/950 Printer Cleaning Kit.  For HP 
FB 550 Sitex printer.

Approved Product:  #CQ121A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP CQ121A $117.6500 $117.6500
Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 71-76 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

071 Ink cartridge, HP 842A, 775 mil., black.  For HP 
PageWide 8000 XL printer.

Approved Product:  #C1Q45A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

072 Ink cartridge, HP 842A, 775 mil., cyan.  For HP 
PageWide 8000 XL printer.

Approved Product:  #C1Q46A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

073 Ink cartridge, HP 842A, 775 mil., magenta.  For HP 
PageWide 8000 XL printer.

Approved Product:  #C1Q47A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

074 Ink cartridge, HP 842A, 775 mil., yellow.  For HP 
PageWide 8000 XL printer.

Approved Product:  #C1Q48A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

075 Cleaning Container, HP 841.  For HP PageWide 8000 
XL printer.

Approved Product:  #F9J47A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

076 Maintenance Cartridge, HP 841.  For HP PageWide 
8000 XL printer.

Approved Product:  #F9J48A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

071 Ink cartridge, HP 842A, 775 mil., black.  For HP 
PageWide 8000 XL printer.

Approved Product:  #C1Q45A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP C1Q45A $124.5000 $124.5000
Awarded

072 Ink cartridge, HP 842A, 775 mil., cyan.  For HP 
PageWide 8000 XL printer.

Approved Product:  #C1Q46A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP C1Q46A $204.0000 $204.0000
Awarded

073 Ink cartridge, HP 842A, 775 mil., magenta.  For HP 
PageWide 8000 XL printer.

Approved Product:  #C1Q47A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP C1Q47A $204.0000 $204.0000
Awarded

074 Ink cartridge, HP 842A, 775 mil., yellow.  For HP 
PageWide 8000 XL printer.

Approved Product:  #C1Q48A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP C1Q48A $204.0000 $204.0000
Awarded

075 Cleaning Container, HP 841.  For HP PageWide 8000 
XL printer.

Approved Product:  #F9J47A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP F9J47A $39.0000 $39.0000
Awarded

076 Maintenance Cartridge, HP 841.  For HP PageWide 
8000 XL printer.

Approved Product:  #F9J48A.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

1 - Each 
Purchase

1 HP F9J48A $51.0000 $51.0000
Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 77-78 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

77 Tape, velcro hook side 1" roll with peel-off backing, white. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000



78 Tape, velcro loop side. 1" roll with peel-off backing, white. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

77 Tape, velcro hook side 1" roll with peel-off backing, white. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

78 Tape, velcro loop side. 1" roll with peel-off backing, white. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

Lot Item 
Nos. 79-81 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

079 Super-steel blade for Graphtec FC 8600-160, 64". Approved Product:  #PHP33-CB15N-HS (D0426).  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Pair 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

080 Super-steel blade for Graphtec FC 8600-160, 64". Approved Product:  #PHP33-CB09UB (D0923).  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Pair 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

081 Teflon cutting strip for Graphtec FC 8600-160, 64" 
cutter/plotter.

Approved Product:  Graphtec.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

079 Super-steel blade for Graphtec FC 8600-160, 64". Approved Product:  #PHP33-CB15N-HS (D0426).  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Pair 
Purchase

1 Graphtec 109998 $225.0000 $225.0000
Awarded

080 Super-steel blade for Graphtec FC 8600-160, 64". Approved Product:  #PHP33-CB09UB (D0923).  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Pair 
Purchase

1 Graphtec 999 $105.0000 $105.0000
Awarded

081 Teflon cutting strip for Graphtec FC 8600-160, 64" 
cutter/plotter.

Approved Product:  Graphtec.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 Graphtec 999 $55.0000 $55.0000
Awarded

Lot Item 
Nos. 82-88 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

082 Superior Quality Replacement Blade for Excalibur 
vertical cutter.  100 per pack.

Approved Product:  #CA50-010-080.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 100 Count 
Pack

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

083 Medium Duty Replacement Blade for Excalibur 
vertical cutter.  100 per pack.

Approved Product:  #CA50-019.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 100 Count 
Pack

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

084 Scoring Blade for Steeltrak. Approved Product:  #STSB.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

085 Aluminum Cutting Wheels for Steeltrak. Approved Product:  #STALW.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

086 V-Groove replacement blades for Steeltrak. Approved Product:  #STVGB.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

087 Sight-line replacement Strips for Steeltrak.  3 per 
pack.

Approved Product:  #SLS.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - 3 Count 
Pack

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

088 Yellow T-shaped silicon cord for Steeltrak.  Packed 
10m (32ft.).

Approved Product:  #SILYT.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

082 Superior Quality Replacement Blade for Excalibur 
vertical cutter.  100 per pack.

Approved Product:  #CA50-010-080.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - 100 Count 
Pack

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

083 Medium Duty Replacement Blade for Excalibur 
vertical cutter.  100 per pack.

Approved Product:  #CA50-019.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - 100 Count 
Pack

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

084 Scoring Blade for Steeltrak. Approved Product:  #STSB.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

085 Aluminum Cutting Wheels for Steeltrak. Approved Product:  #STALW.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

086 V-Groove replacement blades for Steeltrak. Approved Product:  #STVGB.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

087 Sight-line replacement Strips for Steeltrak.  3 per 
pack.

Approved Product:  #SLS.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - 3 Count 
Pack

1 $0.0000 $0.0000

088 Yellow T-shaped silicon cord for Steeltrak.  Packed 
10m (32ft.).

Approved Product:  #SILYT.  NO SUBSTITUTE. N/A Athens Paper Company No Bid 1 - Each 
Purchase

1 $0.0000 $0.0000



Jefferson County Public Schools
Award Summary
Event Name: GRAPHICS SHOP SUPPLIES (MATERIALS PRODUCTION)
Event ID: JCPS-8334
Approval Date: May 28, 2024

Vendor Name Bid Amount Awarded Amount

ARC Document 
Solutions LLC

$59,362.9400 $22,936.9400

Athens Paper Company $60,995.3400 $42,125.8500
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