HENDERSON COUNTY SCHOOLS
1805 Second Street, Henderson, Kentucky 42420
(270) 831-5000 | Fax: (270) 831-5009
www.henderson.kyschools.us

Dr. Bob Lawson, Superintendent

To: Bob Lawson, Superintendent
And School Board Members

From: Cindy Cloutier M
Director of Finance

Date: March 18, 2022
Re: Bid Recommendations

Bid Recommendations:

Child Nutrition Serving Lines RFP CN-1-24-3

Bid invitations were sent to seven vendors. We received bids from CRS One Source,
C&T Design and Equipment, and Manning Brothers. We recommend that you award the
bid to Manning Brothers as indicated on the attached tabulation sheet.

Lawn mowing and Landscaping Services 2-24-5-3

Bid invitations were sent to three vendors. We received bids from Brandon’s Lawn Care,
River City Service, and Unlimited Lawncare & Landscaping. We recommend that you
award the bid to all three companies as indicated on the attached tabulation sheet.

Bid Renewal Recommendations:

Fire Safety Equipment Inspection 5-23-5-4

The current contract is with Priority One Fire & Security. They have given satisfactory
service and Maintenance is agreeable to renew the contract for another year. We are
recommending you renew with Priority One Fire & Security.

The mission of Henderson County Schools is to provide extraordinary educational opportunities for every student.
Equal Educational and Employment Institution




Henderson County Schools
Child Nutrition Serving Lines

CN-1-24-3
R O D P 0 g Bro g Bro g Bro Pho o8
0 ompa -
School No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Equipment Purchase 4 Serving Lines Vollrath Duke Eagle/Randell
Removal of Equipment Yes v v v
Equipment Price $235,629.72 | $168,980.00 $110,420.00 $144,932.00 $220,796.00
Equipment Installation Price $1,120.00 included $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00
5yrcomp | 2yrparts & 1 yr. everything/5 yr
Equipment Warranty labor conpressor 2 yr parts & labor 5 yr compressor
See Attached Best
interpretation
Confirm demensions and Specs. of specs. See Attached See Attached See Attached
School
Equipment Purchase
Removal of Equipment v + v
Equipment Price $176,722.29 | $144,917.00 $103,494.00 $108,699.00 $165,597.00
Equipment Installation Price $840.00 included $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00
5yrcomp | 2yrparts & 1 yr. everything/5 yr
Equipment Warranty labor. conpressor 2 yr parts & labor 5 yr compressor
See Attached Best
interpretation
Confirm demensions and Specs. of specs. See Attached See Attached See Attached
School
Equipment Purchase Walk-in Freezer/Cooler
Removal of Equipment [Yes ¥ v v
$33,2432/ | $49,797.00
Equipment Price $30.825.84 $48,570.00 $48,750.00 $48,570.00
Equipment Installation Price $28,810.00 | $29,975.00 $21,200.00 $21,200.00 $21,200.00
See Attached| 2 yr parts &
Equipment Warranty labor 5 yr parts & labor 5 yr parts & labor 5 yr parts & labor
See Attached Cooler:
11'X7'x7'9"
Freezer11'7"x
Confirm demensions and Specs. 11'7" See Attached See Attached See Attached
School
Equipment Purchase Walk-in Freezer/Cooler
Removal of Equipment [Yes v v v
Included in | $24,123.00
quote by $29,500.00 includes | $29,500.00 includes | $29,500.00 includes
Equipment Price MelKay Installation Installation installation
Equipment Installation Price $8,930.00 $9,825.00
See Attached| 1 yr parts &
Equipment Warranty labor 5 yr Parts & Labor 5 yr parts & labor 5 yr parts & labor
See Attached| Confirmed
Confirm demensions and Specs. er site visit See Attached See Attached See Attached
School
Equipment Purchase Walk-in Freezer/Cooler
Removal of Equipment Yes v v v
$30,392.00/ | $53,449.00
Equipment Price $27.668.32 $42,865.00 $42,865.00 $42,865.00
Equipment Installation Price $29,300.00 | $29,975.00 $18,800.00 $18,000.00 $18,800.00
See Attached| 2 yrparts &
Equipment Warranty labor 5 yr Parts & Labor 5 yr parts & labor 6 yr parts & labor
See Attached| Cooler:
11'7"x8'-8.5"
Freezer:
Confirm demensions and Specs. 11'7"x11'7" See Attached See Attached See Attached
Contact Kim Clark Jon King _Nikol Newtor|John Hamel|  Stacey Landfield Milli Doty [Josh Melhing
Address —_j
]
800-543-
7374 ext.
Phone 270-684-1656 _ |812-421-0872 _|800-632-457|8902 859-396-4443 317-919-17|859-468-9268
kimclark@crson (Jking@c- nnewton@hp |jhamel@hub |stacey@manningbrothers
Email esource.com |tdesign.co spet.com ert.com l.com millie@phoen| jmehling@zinkfsg.com




Henderson County Schools
1805 Second Street
Henderson, KY 42420
Lawn Mowing and Landscaping Services Tabulation Sheet
Bid 2-24-5-3
Contract Dates: April 1, 2024 - November 1, 2024

Brandon's Lawn Care

River City Service

Unlimited Lawncare &
Landscaping

AB Chandler $425.00 $418.00 $395.00
Bend Gate $510.00 $549.00 $480.00
Board of Education $150.00 $163.50 $140.00
Cairo $375.00 $360.00 $330.00
Central Academy $229.25 $225.00 $210.00
East Heights $648.00 $630.00 $600.00
Hend. Co. High $1,500.00 $1,450.00 $1,380.00
Jefferson $490.00 $420.00 $510.00
Niagara $275.00 $245.00 $265.00
North Middle $725.00 $725.00 $670.00
South Heights $235.00 $225.00 $200.00
South Middle $550.00 $495.00 $545.00
Spottsville $430.00 $475.00 $490.00
Thelma B Johnson Early
Learning Center $325.00 $300.00 $270.00
Mowing Weekly Total $6,867.25 $6,680.50 $6,485.00
Board of Education $45.00 $40.00 $30.00
Professional Development $35.00 $25.00 $20.00
Thelma B Johnson Early
Learning Center $70.00 $75.00 $60.00
Landscaping Weekly Total $150.00 $140.00 $110.00
Equipment List Provided v v v
References v v 7
Number years in business 8 6 23
Personnel 5-8 5-8 10-12
Attended the Pre-Bid Conf.
3/1/24 v v v
Contact Brandon Spainhoward Jeff Cooomes Aaron & Wendy Daugherty
Address 1210 Atkinson School 8422 Tscharner Road 132 Carlisle Street
Henderson, KY 42420 Henderson, KY 42420 Henderson, Ky 42420

270-860-0539(Wendy)  270-
Phone 270-844-9008 270-860-5072 860-0536 (Aaron)
Fax

Unlimitedlawncare19@outlook.c
E-mail Address spainhoward99@icloud.com |Jeff.coomes@outlook.com om




