
Approved by the Oldham County Board of Education 
December 11, 2023 

ENCLOSURE B-1 
December 11, 2023 

OLDHAM COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION 

CONCERN 
Consider Approval of Project Initiation and Engineer selection for the Auditorium Light and Sound 
Improvements at NOHS and Auditorium Sound System Improvements at OCHS. 

DISCUSSION 
On August 28, 2023, the Board approved the auditorium lighting upgrades project at OCHS.  The school 
has requested that the sound system be upgraded due to it being pieced together over the years and all 
components no longer work together. North Oldham High School Auditorium Lights and Sound System 
are also in need of upgrades.  

The project requires the assignment of a design professional. Licensed architects and/or engineers are 
assigned to all projects that construct new buildings, modify, renovate, or construct additions to existing 
buildings. The architect/engineer is responsible for the proper preparation of all plans, specifications, 
estimates and periodic inspections during the execution of the construction contract. The consultant being 
recommended for the North Oldham High School portion of this project is Shrout Tate Wilson Consulting 
Engineers. 

RECOMMENDATION 
Award selection of Shrout Tate Wilson Consulting Engineers, 1330 Bardstown Road, Louisville, KY  
40204 for the Auditorium Lights and Sound System Upgrades at NOHS and OCHS to and hereby authorize 
the Director of Facilities Management to execute the necessary documentation.   
 
 
 
On a motion by _______________, seconded by _______________, the Board approved selection of 
Shrout Tate Wilson Consulting Engineers, 1330 Bardstown Road, Louisville, KY 40204 for the 
Auditorium Lights and Sound System Upgrades at NOHS and OCHS to and hereby authorize the Director 
of Facilities Management to execute the necessary documentation. ( - )  
 
 
 
              
Suzanne Hundley, Board Chair     Jason Radford, Superintendent/Secretary 
 
  



Approved by the Oldham County Board of Education 
December 11, 2023 

ENCLOSURE B-2 
December 11, 2023 

OLDHAM COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION 

CONCERN 
Consider Approval of Award of Contract for Topographic Surveys at Crestwood, Locust Grove, Goshen, 
and Harmony Elementary Schools. 

DISCUSSION 
On September 25, 2023, the Board of Education approved the selection of Architect/Civil Engineer to 
RossTarrant Architects (RTA) for the Site/Access Improvements at Various Elementary Schools PH 2 
Project. A topographic survey needs to be conducted at each site. Two firms submitted a proposal and were 
reviewed by RTA and Brent Bohannon, Director of Facilities Management. They recommended QK4 be 
awarded the contract for the proposal in the amount of $25,000.00 for the topographic surveys at Crestwood, 
Locust Grove, Goshen, and Harmony Elementary Schools. 

RECOMMENDATION 
Award of contract for the topographic survey at Crestwood, Locust Grove, Goshen, and Harmony 
Elementary Schools to QK4, 9920 Corporate Campus Drive, Suite 1200, Louisville, KY  40223, in the 
amount of 25,000.00 for the proposal amount and hereby authorize the Director of Facilities Management 
to execute the necessary documentation.   
 
 
 
On a motion by _______________, seconded by _______________, the Board approved the Award of 
Contract for the topographic survey at Crestwood, Locust Grove, Goshen, and Harmony Elementary 
Schools to QK4, 9920 Corporate Campus Drive, Suite 1200, Louisville, KY  40223, in the amount of 
25,000.00 for the proposal amount and hereby authorize the Director of Facilities Management to execute 
the necessary documentation. ( - ) 
 
 
 
              
Suzanne Hundley, Board Chair     Jason Radford, Superintendent/Secretary 
 
  





















Approved by the Oldham County Board of Education 
December 11, 2023 

ENCLOSURE B-3 
December 11, 2023 

OLDHAM COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION 

CONCERN 
Consider Approval of Award of Contract for Topographic Surveys at OCHS, NOHS and SOHS. 

DISCUSSION 
On September 25, 2023, the Board of Education approved the selection of Architect/Civil Engineer to 
RossTarrant Architects (RTA) for the Athletic Stadium and Field Improvements at Various Schools PH 2 
Project and the South Oldham High School Ph 3 Renovation & Addition Project. A topographic survey 
needs to be conducted at each site.  Three firms submitted a proposal and were reviewed by RTA and Brent 
Bohannon, Director of Facilities Management. They recommended Bowman Consulting Group, LTD be 
awarded the contract for the proposal in the amount of $79,032.50 for the topographic surveys at OCHS, 
NOHS, and SOHS.   

RECOMMENDATION 
Award of contract for the topographic survey at Surveys at OCHS, NOHS and SOHS to P Bowman 
Consulting Group, LTD, 3001 Taylor Springs Dr, Louisville, KY 40220, in the amount of $79,032.50 for 
the proposal amount and hereby authorize the Director of Facilities Management to execute the necessary 
documentation.   
 
 
 
On a motion by _______________, seconded by _______________, the Board approved of contract for 
the topographic survey at Surveys at OCHS, NOHS and SOHS to P Bowman Consulting Group, LTD, 
3001 Taylor Springs Dr, Louisville, KY 40220, in the amount of $79,032.50 for the proposal amount and 
hereby authorize the Director of Facilities Management to execute the necessary documentation. ( - )  
 
 
 
              
Suzanne Hundley, Board Chair     Jason Radford, Superintendent/Secretary 
  



Approved by the Oldham County Board of Education 
December 11, 2023 

ENCLOSURE B-4 
December 11, 2023 

OLDHAM COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION 

CONCERN 
Consider Approval of Change Order #4 for the Athletic Stadium and Field Improvements at Various 
Schools, Bid Package B – SOHS and OCHS Stadium Improvements Project. 

DISCUSSION 
Change Order #4 (attached) proposes additional cost to the Athletic Stadium and Field Improvements at 
Various Schools, Bid Package B – SOHS and OCHS Stadium Improvements Project for re-feeding power 
to the ticket booth, change in finish on the coiling grilles, modification of gates at OCHS, and the addition 
of backlighting on the SOHS scoreboard.   

RossTarrant Architects and Brent Bohannon, Director of Facilities Management, recommend approval of 
Change Order #4 in the amount of $22,509.20 to the Parco Constructors Group, LLC contract. 

RECOMMENDATION 
Approve Change Order #4 for the Athletic Stadium and Field Improvements at Various Schools, Bid 
Package B – SOHS and OCHS Stadium Improvements Project in the amounts of $22,509.20 for submission 
to the Kentucky Department of Education, District Facilities Branch, Division of District Support and 
hereby authorize the Director of Facilities Management to execute the necessary documentation. 
 
 
 
On a motion by _______________, seconded by _______________, the Board approved Change Order 
#4 for the Athletic Stadium and Field Improvements at Various Schools, Bid Package B – SOHS and 
OCHS Stadium Improvements Project in the amounts of $22,509.20 for submission to the Kentucky 
Department of Education, District Facilities Branch, Division of District Support and hereby authorize the 
Director of Facilities Management to execute the necessary documentation. ( - )  
 
 
 
              
Suzanne Hundley, Board Chair     Jason Radford, Superintendent/Secretary 
  

































Approved by the Oldham County Board of Education 
December 11, 2023 

ENCLOSURE B-5 
December 11, 2023 

OLDHAM COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION 

CONCERN 
Consider Approval of Revised BG-1 and Change Order #5 for the South Oldham High School Shop 
Renovation Project. 

DISCUSSION 
Change Order #5 (attached) proposes additional cost to the South Oldham High School Shop Renovation 
Project for ductwork controls and economizer, the addition of a teacher’s welding station, additional breaker 
panels needed for the distribution panel and welding hook-ups for $23,760.00. 

A revised BG-1 form is required when the total change order amount exceeds the construction 
contingency. 

RossTarrant Architects and Brent Bohannon, Director of Facilities Management, recommends approval of 
Change Order #5 in the amount of $23,760.00 to the Hayes Contracting, LLC contract. 

RECOMMENDATION 
Approve the Revised BG-1 Form and Change Order #5 for the South Oldham High School Shop 
Renovation Project in the amount of $23,760.00 for submission to the Kentucky Department of 
Education, District Facilities Branch, Division of District Support and hereby authorize the Director of 
Facilities Management to execute the necessary documentation. 
 
 
 
On a motion by _______________, seconded by _______________, the Board approved the Revised BG-
1 Form and Change Order #5 for the South Oldham High School Shop Renovation Project in the amount 
of $23,760.00 for submission to the Kentucky Department of Education, District Facilities Branch, 
Division of District Support and hereby authorize the Director of Facilities Management to execute the 
necessary documentation. ( - ). 
 
 
 
              
Suzanne Hundley, Board Chair     Jason Radford, Superintendent/Secretary 
  





































Approved by the Oldham County Board of Education 
December 11, 2023 

ENCLOSURE B-6 
December 11, 2023 

OLDHAM COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION 

CONCERN 
Consider Approval of BG-4 for the Site/Access Improvements at Various Elementary Schools Project. 

DISCUSSION 
On December 12, 2022, the Board of Education approved the contract to Parco Constructors Group, LLC 
for the Site/Access Improvements at Various Elementary Schools Project. OCS Facilities Management 
indicates that the project is now complete. The final contract amount is $949,046.63. 

KDE requires board approval of BG-4 form to close out each Owner-Contractor agreement.  Pending final 
approval of the BG-4 form a project reconciliation revision to the BG-1 will be presented to the board and 
the BG-5 form to reconcile the funding sources and close the project. 

RECOMMENDATION 
Approve the BG-4 form for the Site/Access Improvements at Various Elementary Schools Project for the 
Parco Constructors Group, LLC contract, subject to approval by the Kentucky Department of Education, 
District Facilities Branch, Division of District Support and hereby authorize the Director of Facilities 
Management to execute the necessary documentation. 
 
 
 
On a motion by _______________, seconded by _______________, the Board approved the BG-4 form 
for the Site/Access Improvements at Various Elementary Schools Project for the Parco Constructors 
Group, LLC contract, subject to approval by the Kentucky Department of Education, District Facilities 
Branch, Division of District Support and hereby authorize the Director of Facilities Management to 
execute the necessary documentation. ( - ). 
 
 
 
              
Suzanne Hundley, Board Chair     Jason Radford, Superintendent/Secretary 








