

Jefferson County Public Schools

Bid Tabulation

Event Name: Laboratory Testing (for Nutrition Service Center)

Event ID: 8288

Approval Date: November 14, 2023

Date Bids Received: October 17, 2023

Contract Period: November 22, 2023 through November 21, 2024

Renewals: Two (2) annual renewals at the option of both parties.

Comments: Awarded to Marsil Laboratories LLC

Item Number	Item/Service	Description	Commodity Code	UOM	Quantity	Sample Required	Vendor Name	Manufacturer		Unit Bid Price	Total Price	Supplier Notes	Vendor Response				
								Manufacturer / Provider	Provider Part Number				Item Notes	No Bid	Award Status	Award Notes	
001	Allergen Testing	Corn	4600649-2013917	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Romer Lab	MarLab 001	\$50.00	\$250.00					Awarded	
002	Allergen Testing	Egg	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Romer Lab	MarLab 002	\$50.00	\$250.00					Awarded	
003	Allergen Testing	Fish	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Romer Lab	MarLab 003	\$50.00	\$250.00					Awarded	
004	Allergen Testing	Milk	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Romer Lab	MarLab 004	\$50.00	\$250.00					Awarded	
005	Allergen Testing	Peanuts	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Romer Lab	MarLab 005	\$50.00	\$250.00					Awarded	
006	Allergen Testing	Sesame	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Romer Lab	MarLab 006	\$50.00	\$250.00					Awarded	
007	Allergen Testing	Shellfish	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Romer Lab	MarLab 007	\$50.00	\$250.00					Awarded	
008	Allergen Testing	Soy	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Romer Lab	MarLab 008	\$50.00	\$250.00					Awarded	
009	Allergen Testing	Sunflower	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Romer Lab	MarLab 009	\$50.00	\$250.00					Awarded	
010	Allergen Testing	Tree nuts	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Romer Lab	MarLab 010	\$50.00	\$250.00					Awarded	
011	Allergen Testing	Wheat	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Romer Lab	MarLab 011	\$50.00	\$250.00					Awarded	
012	Microbial testing of food and non food contact surfaces.	Pathogen Swabs: Bacillus Cereus	N/A	1 Each	125	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 012	\$35.00	\$4,375.00					Awarded	
013	Microbial testing of food and non food contact surfaces.	Pathogen Swabs: Clostridium Per fringes	N/A	1 Each	125	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 013	\$35.00	\$4,375.00					Awarded	
014	Microbial testing of food and non food contact surfaces.	Pathogen Swabs: Coliform. Total	N/A	1 Each	125	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 014	\$15.00	\$1,875.00					Awarded	
015	Microbial testing of food and non food contact surfaces.	Pathogen Swabs: E.coli	N/A	1 Each	125	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 015	\$15.00	\$1,875.00					Awarded	
016	Microbial testing of food and non food contact surfaces.	Pathogen Swabs: E.coli 0157:H7	N/A	1 Each	125	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 016	\$35.00	\$4,375.00					Awarded	
017	Microbial testing of food and non food contact surfaces.	Pathogen Swabs: Listeria spp.	N/A	1 Each	125	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	Marlab 017	\$35.00	\$4,375.00					Awarded	
018	Microbial Testing for food and non food contact surfaces.	Pathogen Swabs: Listeria Monocytogenes	N/A	1 Each	125	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	Marlab 018	\$35.00	\$4,375.00					Awarded	
019	Microbial testing of food and non food contact surfaces.	Pathogen Swabs: Salmonella	N/A	1 Each	125	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	Marlab 019	\$35.00	\$4,375.00					Awarded	

Item Number	Item/Service	Description	Commodity Code	UOM	Quantity	Sample Required	Vendor Name	Manufacturer		Unit Bid		Vendor Response			Award Status	Award Notes
								Manufacturer / Provider	Number	Price	Total Price	Supplier Notes	Item Notes	No Bid		
020	Microbial testing of food and non food contact surfaces.	Pathogen Swabs: Staphylococcus aureus	N/A	1 Each	125	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 020	\$15.00	\$1,875.00				Awarded	
021	Microbial testing of food and non food contact surfaces.	Pathogen Swabs: Aerobic Plate Count	N/A	1 Each	125	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 021	\$15.00	\$1,875.00				Awarded	
022	Microbial testing of raw food products and finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center: APC	4600649-1729323	1 Each	10	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 022	\$15.00	\$150.00				Awarded	
023	Microbial testing of raw food products and finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center: B. Cereus	N/A	1 Each	10	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 023	\$35.00	\$350.00				Awarded	
024	Microbial testing of raw food products and finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center: C. Perfringens	N/A	1 Each	10	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 024	\$35.00	\$350.00				Awarded	
025	Microbial testing of raw food products and finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center: Coliform, Total	N/A	1 Each	10	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 025	\$15.00	\$150.00				Awarded	
026	Microbial testing of raw food products and finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center: E.coli	N/A	1 Each	10	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 026	\$15.00	\$150.00				Awarded	
027	Microbial testing of raw food products and finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center: E.coli O157:H7	N/A	1 Each	10	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 027	\$35.00	\$350.00				Awarded	
028	Microbial testing of raw food products and finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center: Listeria	N/A	1 Each	10	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 028	\$35.00	\$350.00				Awarded	
029	Microbial testing of raw food products and finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center: pH	N/A	1 Each	10	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 029	\$15.00	\$150.00				Awarded	
030	Microbial testing of raw food products and finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center: Salmonella	N/A	1 Each	10	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 030	\$35.00	\$350.00				Awarded	
031	Microbial testing of raw food products and finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center: Staphylococcus aureus	N/A	1 Each	10	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 031	\$15.00	\$150.00				Awarded	
032	Microbial testing of raw food products and finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center: Water Activity	N/A	1 Each	10	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 032	\$20.00	\$200.00				Awarded	
033	Nutrition analysis of finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center. Estimated number of NSC finished products to be tested: 1 analysis for: Ash. Please list unit price.	4600649-1732281	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Subcontractor	MarLab 033	\$85.00	\$425.00				Awarded	
034	Nutrition analysis of finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center. Estimated number of NSC finished products to be tested: 1 analysis for: Calcium. Please list unit price.	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Subcontractor	MarLab 033	\$85.00	\$425.00				Awarded	
035	Nutrition analysis of finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center. Estimated number of NSC finished products to be tested: 1 analysis for: Calories. Please list unit price.	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Subcontractor	MarLab 033	\$5.00	\$25.00				Awarded	
036	Nutrition analysis of finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center. Estimated number of NSC finished products to be tested: 1 analysis for: Carbohydrates. Please list unit price.	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Subcontractor	MarLab 033	\$5.00	\$25.00				Awarded	
037	Nutrition analysis of finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center. Estimated number of NSC finished products to be tested: 1 analysis for: Dietary Fiber. Please list unit price.	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Subcontractor	MarLab 033	\$85.00	\$425.00				Awarded	

Item Number	Item/Service	Description	Commodity Code	UOM	Quantity	Sample Required	Vendor Name	Manufacturer		Unit Bid		Vendor Response			Award Status	Award Notes
								Manufacturer / Provider	Part Number	Price	Total Price	Supplier Notes	Item Notes	No Bid		
038	Nutrition analysis of finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center. Estimated number of NSC finished products to be tested: 1 analysis for: Dietary Sugars. Please list unit price.	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Subcontractor	MarLab 033	\$85.00	\$425.00				Awarded	
039	Nutrition analysis of finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center. Estimated number of NSC finished products to be tested: 1 analysis for: Fat. Please list unit price.	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Subcontractor	MarLab 033	\$85.00	\$425.00				Awarded	
040	Nutrition analysis of finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center. Estimated number of NSC finished products to be tested: 1 analysis for: Iron. Please list unit price.	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Subcontractor	MarLab 033	\$85.00	\$425.00				Awarded	
041	Nutrition analysis of finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center. Estimated number of NSC finished products to be tested: 1 analysis for: Moisture. Please list unit price.	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Subcontractor	MarLab 033	\$85.00	\$425.00				Awarded	
042	Nutrition analysis of finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center. Estimated number of NSC finished products to be tested: 1 analysis for: Protein. Please list unit price.	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Subcontractor	MarLab 033	\$85.00	\$425.00				Awarded	
043	Nutrition analysis of finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center. Estimated number of NSC finished products to be tested: 1 analysis for: Saturated Fat. Please list unit price.	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Subcontractor	MarLab 033	\$85.00	\$425.00				Awarded	
044	Nutrition analysis of finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center. Estimated number of NSC finished products to be tested: 1 analysis for: Sodium. Please list unit price.	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Subcontractor	MarLab 033	\$85.00	\$425.00				Awarded	
045	Nutrition analysis of finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center. Estimated number of NSC finished products to be tested: 1 analysis for: Vitamin A. Please list unit price.	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Subcontractor	MarLab 033	\$85.00	\$425.00				Awarded	
046	Nutrition analysis of finished products.	Manufactured at the Nutrition Service Center. Estimated number of NSC finished products to be tested: 1 analysis for: Vitamin C. Please list unit price.	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Subcontractor	MarLab 033	\$85.00	\$425.00				Awarded	
047	Courier Service (only include if samples will be picked up from the Nutrition Service Center by the company's courier).	If produce will be shipped via FedEx/UPS, shipping supplies that maintains temperature control, freight charge must be included in pricing for testing.	N/A	1 Each	15	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	UPS	MarLab 034	\$100.00	\$1,500.00				Awarded	

Item Number	Item/Service	Description	Commodity Code	UOM	Quantity	Sample Required	Vendor Name	Manufacturer / / Provider Part		Unit Bid		Vendor Response					
								Provider	Number	Price	Total Price	Supplier Notes	Item Notes	No Bid	Award Status	Award Notes	
048	Shelf life study of finished product up to 15 days. Please list unit price.	Shelf Life Study includes: Aerobic Plate Count, Bacillus Cereus, Clostridium Perfringens, E.Coli 0157:H7, Generic E. Coli, Lactic Acid, Listeria spp, pH, Salmonella, Staphylococcus Aureus, Total Coliform, Water activity, Yeast and Mold and others if needed.	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 035	\$500.00	\$2,500.00					Awarded	
049	Shelf life study of finished product up to 45 days. Please list unit price.	Shelf Life Study includes: Aerobic Plate Count, Bacillus Cereus, Clostridium Perfringens, E.Coli 0157:H7, Generic E. Coli, Lactic Acid, Listeria spp, pH, Salmonella, Staphylococcus Aureus, Total Coliform, Water activity, Yeast and Mold and others if needed.	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 036	\$500.00	\$2,500.00					Awarded	
050	Shelf life study of finished product up to 60 days. Please list unit price.	Shelf Life Study includes: Aerobic Plate Count, Bacillus Cereus, Clostridium Perfringens, E.Coli 0157:H7, Generic E. Coli, Lactic Acid, Listeria spp, pH, Salmonella, Staphylococcus Aureus, Total Coliform, Water activity, Yeast and Mold and others if needed.	N/A	1 Each	5	No	Marsil Laboratories LLC	Marsil Laboratories	MarLab 037	\$500.00	\$2,500.00					Awarded	