Jefferson County Public Schools

Bid Tabulation \

Event Name: HVAC/REFRIGERATION SERVICE

Event ID: JCPS-8254

Approval Date: July 25, 2023

Date Bids Received: July 5, 2023

Contract Period: August 2, 2023 through August 1, 2024

Renewals: Two (2) annual renewals at the option of both parties.

Comments: Award Status indicates an award.

Lot Item
Numbers Sample Mfg / Provider Part Extended Vendor Response Item
1-8 Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name  Mfg / Provider Number Bid Price Price Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
001 Cost per hour: Licensed HVAC | Please respond to the following in the 4600649-2013399 1-Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $88.00 $88.00 1.15% 2.15% 3.15% Awarded Awarded as low total
Technician for Nutrition VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Purchase Mechanical Service bidder for Lot Item Nos.
Service Center. Percentage over invoice price for the 1 through 8.
following: (1) Materials, (2) Parts and
(3) Equipment.
002 Cost per hour overtime: Licensed HVAC Technician after 5:00 NA 1- Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $121.00 $121.00 Awarded Awarded as low total
p.m. for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Mechanical Service bidder for Lot Item Nos.
1 through 8.
003 Cost per hour: Licensed HVAC Technician for Saturday NA 1-Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $121.00 $121.00 Awarded Awarded as low total
for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Mechanical Service bidder for Lot Item Nos.
1 through 8.
004 Cost per hour: Licensed HVAC Technician for Sunday NA 1- Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $155.00 $155.00 Awarded Awarded as low total
for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Mechanical Service bidder for Lot Item Nos.
1 through 8.
005 Cost per hour: HVAC helper, prior approval required NA 1-Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $46.00 $46.00 Awarded Awarded as low total
for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Mechanical Service bidder for Lot Item Nos.
1 through 8.
006 Cost per hour overtime: HVAC helper after 5:00 p.m., prior NA 1-Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $54.00 $54.00 Awarded Awarded as low total
approval required for Nutrition Service Purchase Mechanical Service bidder for Lot Item Nos.
Center. 1 through 8.
007 Cost per hour: HVAC helper for Saturday, prior NA 1-Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $66.00 $66.00 Awarded Awarded as low total
approval required for Nutrition Service Purchase Mechanical Service bidder for Lot Item Nos.

Center.

1 through 8.




Lot Item

Numbers Sample Mfg / Provider Part Extended Vendor Response Item
1-8 Item/Service Description Commodity Code uomMm Quantity Required Vendor Name  Mfg / Provider Number Bid Price Price Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
008 Cost per hour: HVAC helper for Sunday, prior NA 1- Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $87.00 $87.00 Awarded Awarded as low total
approval required for Nutrition Service Purchase Mechanical Service bidder for Lot Item Nos.
Center. 1 through 8.
001 Cost per hour: Licensed HVAC | Please respond to the following in the 4600649-2013399 1-Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Journeyman - $85.00 $85.00
Technician for Nutrition VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Purchase Service Straight Time
Service Center. Percentage over invoice price for the
following: (1) Materials, (2) Parts and
(3) Equipment.
002 Cost per hour overtime: Licensed HVAC Technician after 5:00 NA 1- Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Journeyman- $125.00 $125.00
p.m. for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Service Overtime
003 Cost per hour: Licensed HVAC Technician for Saturday NA 1-Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Journeyman- $125.00 $125.00
for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Service Overtime
004 Cost per hour: Licensed HVAC Technician for Sunday NA 1-Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Journeyman-Holiday ~ $150.00 $150.00
for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Service Pay
005 Cost per hour: HVAC helper, prior approval required NA 1-Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Apprentice - Straight|  $50.00 $50.00
for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Service Time
006 Cost per hour overtime: HVAC helper after 5:00 p.m., prior NA 1-Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Apprentice- $75.00 $75.00
approval required for Nutrition Service Purchase Service Overtime
Center.
007 Cost per hour: HVAC helper for Saturday, prior NA 1-Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Apprentice - Over $75.00 $75.00
approval required for Nutrition Service Purchase Service time
Center.
008 Cost per hour: HVAC helper for Sunday, prior NA 1- Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Apprentice - Holiday ~ $100.00 $100.00
approval required for Nutrition Service Purchase Service Pay
Center.
001 Cost per hour: Licensed HVAC | Please respond to the following in the 4600649-2013399 1-Each 1 No Walker Mechanical NA NA $89.00 $89.00 2% DISCOINT IF PAID IN 15
Technician for Nutrition VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Purchase DAYS. NET 30 DAYS.

Service Center.

Percentage over invoice price for the
following: (1) Materials, (2) Parts and
(3) Equipment.

$50.00 TRUCK CHARGE
PER CALL.




Lot Item

Numbers Sample Mfg / Provider Part Extended Vendor Response Item
1-8 Item/Service Description Commodity Code uomMm Quantity Required Vendor Name  Mfg / Provider Number Bid Price Price Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
002 Cost per hour overtime: Licensed HVAC Technician after 5:00 NA 1- Each 1 No Walker Mechanical NA NA $133.50 $133.50 2% DISCOUNT IF PAID IN
p.m. for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase 15 DAYS. NET 30 DAYS.
$50.00 TRUCK CHARGE
PER CALL.
003 Cost per hour: Licensed HVAC Technician for Saturday NA 1-Each 1 No Walker Mechanical NA NA $133.50 $133.50 2% DISCOUNT IF PAID IN
for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase 15 DAYS. 30 DAYS NET.
$50.00 TRUCK CHARGE
PER CALL.
004 Cost per hour: Licensed HVAC Technician for Sunday NA 1- Each 1 No Walker Mechanical NA NA $178.00 $178.00 2% DISCOUNT IF PAID IN
for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase 15 DAYS. NET 30 DAYS.
$50 TRUCK CHARGE PER
CALL.
005 Cost per hour: HVAC helper, prior approval required NA 1-Each 1 No Walker Mechanical NA NA $55.00 $55.00
for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase
006 Cost per hour overtime: HVAC helper after 5:00 p.m., prior NA 1-Each 1 No Walker Mechanical NA NA $82.50 $82.50
approval required for Nutrition Service Purchase
Center.
007 Cost per hour: HVAC helper for Saturday, prior NA 1-Each 1 No Walker Mechanical NA NA $82.50 $82.50
approval required for Nutrition Service Purchase
Center.
008 Cost per hour: HVAC helper for Sunday, prior NA 1-Each 1 No Walker Mechanical NA NA $110.00 $110.00
approval required for Nutrition Service Purchase
Center.
e S |
Lot Item
Numbers Sample Mfg / Provider Part Extended Vendor Response Item
9-16 Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name  Mfg / Provider Number Bid Price Price Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
009 Cost per hour: Refrigeration | Please respond to the following in the NA 1-Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $88.00 $88.00 1-15% 2-15% 3-15% Awarded Awarded as low total
Technician for Nutrition VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Purchase Mechanical Service bidder for Lot Item Nos.
Service Center. Percentage over invoice price for the 9 through 16.
following: (1) Materials, (2) Parts and
(3) Equipment.
010 Cost per hour overtime: Refrigeration Technician after 5:00 NA 1- Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $121.00 $121.00 Awarded Awarded as low total
p.m. for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Mechanical Service bidder for Lot Item Nos.
9 through 16.
&




Lot Item

Numbers Sample Mfg / Provider Part Extended Vendor Response Item
9-16 Item/Service Description Commodity Code uomMm Quantity Required Vendor Name  Mfg / Provider Number Bid Price Price Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
011 Cost per hour: Refrigeration Technician for Saturday NA 1-Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $121.00 $121.00 Awarded Awarded as low total
for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Mechanical Service bidder for Lot Item Nos.
9 through 16.
012 Cost per hour: Refrigeration Technician for Sunday for NA 1- Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $155.00 $155.00 Awarded Awarded as low total
Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Mechanical Service bidder for Lot Item Nos.
9 through 16.
013 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper, prior approval NA 1-Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $46.00 $46.00 Awarded Awarded as low total
required for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Mechanical Service bidder for Lot Item Nos.
9 through 16.
014 Cost per hour overtime: Refrigeration helper after 5:00 p.m., NA 1-Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $54.00 $54.00 Awarded Awarded as low total
prior approval required for Nutrition Purchase Mechanical Service bidder for Lot Item Nos.
Service Center. 9 through 16.
015 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper for Saturday, prior NA 1-Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $66.00 $66.00 Awarded Awarded as low total
approval required for Nutrition Service Purchase Mechanical Service bidder for Lot Item Nos.
Center. 9 through 16.
016 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper for Sunday, prior NA 1- Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $87.00 $87.00 Awarded Awarded as low total
approval required for Nutrition Service Purchase Mechanical Service bidder for Lot Item Nos.
Center. 9 through 16.
009 Cost per hour: Refrigeration | Please respond to the following in the NA 1-Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Refrigeration - $85.00 $85.00
Technician for Nutrition VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Purchase Service Journeyman
Service Center. Percentage over invoice price for the
following: (1) Materials, (2) Parts and
(3) Equipment.
010 Cost per hour overtime: Refrigeration Technician after 5:00 NA 1-Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Refrigeration - $130.00 $130.00
p.m. for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Service Journeyman OT
011 Cost per hour: Refrigeration Technician for Saturday NA 1-Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Refrigeration - $130.00 $130.00
for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Service Journeyman OT




Lot Item

Numbers Sample Mfg / Provider Part Extended Vendor Response Item
9-16 Item/Service Description Commodity Code uomMm Quantity Required Vendor Name  Mfg / Provider Number Bid Price Price Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
012 Cost per hour: Refrigeration Technician for Sunday for NA 1-Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Refrigeration - $150.00 $150.00

Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Service Journeyman Holiday
013 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper, prior approval NA 1-Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Refrigeration $53.00 $53.00
required for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Service Apprentice
014 Cost per hour overtime: Refrigeration helper after 5:00 p.m., NA 1- Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Refrigeration $87.00 $87.00
prior approval required for Nutrition Purchase Service Apprentice OT
Service Center.
015 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper for Saturday, prior NA 1-Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Refrigeration $87.00 $87.00
approval required for Nutrition Service Purchase Service Apprentice OT
Center.
016 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper for Sunday, prior NA 1- Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Refrigeration $106.00 $106.00
approval required for Nutrition Service Purchase Service Apprentice Holiday
Center.
009 Cost per hour: Refrigeration | Please respond to the following in the NA 1-Each 1 No Glenns Commercial Glenns Glenns Commercial $96.00 $96.00 Materials ,parts and
Technician for Nutrition VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Purchase Service equipment furnished at
Service Center. Percentage over invoice price for the cost plus 45% mark up
following: (1) Materials, (2) Parts and
(3) Equipment.
010 Cost per hour overtime: Refrigeration Technician after 5:00 NA 1- Each 1 No Glenns Commercial Glenns Glenns Commercial $144.00 $144.00
p.m. for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Service
011 Cost per hour: Refrigeration Technician for Saturday NA 1-Each 1 No Glenns Commercial Glenns Glenns Commercial $144.00 $144.00
for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Service
012 Cost per hour: Refrigeration Technician for Sunday for NA 1- Each 1 No Glenns Commercial Glenns Glenns commercial $144.00 $144.00
Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Service
013 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper, prior approval NA 1-Each 1 No Glenns Commercial Glenns Glenns Commercial $68.00 $68.00
required for Nutrition Service Center. Purchase Service




Lot Item

Numbers Sample Mfg / Provider Part Extended Vendor Response Item
9-16 Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name  Mfg / Provider Number Bid Price Price Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
014 Cost per hour overtime: Refrigeration helper after 5:00 p.m., NA 1- Each 1 No Glenns Commercial Glenns Glenns Commercial $102.00 $102.00
prior approval required for Nutrition Purchase Service
Service Center.
015 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper for Saturday, prior NA 1-Each 1 No Glenns Commercial Glenns Glenns Commercial | $102.00 $102.00
approval required for Nutrition Service Purchase Service
Center.
016 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper for Sunday, prior NA 1- Each 1 No Glenns Commercial Glenns Glenns Commercial $102.00 $102.00
approval required for Nutrition Service Purchase Service
Center.
Lot Item
Numbers Sample Mfg / Provider Part Extended Vendor Response Item
17-24 Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name  Mfg / Provider Number Bid Price Price Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
017 Cost per hour: Refrigeration | Please respond to the following in the NA 1-Each 1 No Schardein Schardein Material, Parts and $93.00 $93.00 Awarded Awarded as low total
Technician for JCPS school | VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Purchase Mechanical Mechanical Equipment 10% bidder for Lot Item Nos.
sites. Percentage over invoice price for the markup 17 through 24.
following: (1) Materials, (2) Parts and
(3) Equipment.
018 Cost per hour overtime: Refrigeration Technician after 5:00 NA 1- Each 1 No Schardein Schardein Material,, Partsand ~ $110.44 $110.44 Awarded Awarded as low total
p.m. for JCPS school sites. Purchase Mechanical Mechanical Equipment 10% bidder for Lot Item Nos.
markup 17 through 24.
019 Cost per hour: Refrigeration Technician for Saturday NA 1-Each 1 No Schardein Schardein Material, Partsand | $110.44 $110.44 Awarded Awarded as low total
for JCPS school sites. Purchase Mechanical Mechanical Equipment 10% bidder for Lot Item Nos.
markup 17 through 24.
020 Cost per hour: Refrigeration Technician for Sunday for NA 1-Each 1 No Schardein Schardein Material, Partsand ~ $110.44 $110.44 Awarded Awarded as low total
JCPS school sites. Purchase Mechanical Mechanical Equipment 10% bidder for Lot Item Nos.
markup 17 through 24.
021 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper, prior approval NA 1-Each 1 No Schardein Schardein Material, Parts and $30.00 $30.00 Awarded Awarded as low total
required, for JCPS school sites. Purchase Mechanical Mechanical Equipment 10% bidder for Lot Item Nos.

markup

17 through 24.




Lot Item

Numbers Sample Mfg / Provider Part Extended Vendor Response Item
17-24 Item/Service Description Commodity Code uomMm Quantity Required Vendor Name  Mfg / Provider Number Bid Price Price Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
022 Cost per hour overtime: Refrigeration helper after 5:00 p.m., NA 1-Each 1 No Schardein Schardein Material, Parts and $45.00 $45.00 Awarded Awarded as low total
prior approval required, for JCPS Purchase Mechanical Mechanical Equipment 10% bidder for Lot Item Nos.
school sites. markup 17 through 24.
023 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper for Saturday, prior NA 1-Each 1 No Schardein Schardein Material, Parts and $45.00 $45.00 Awarded Awarded as low total
approval required, for JCPS school Purchase Mechanical Mechanical Equipment 10% bidder for Lot Item Nos.
sites. markup 17 through 24.
024 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper for Sunday, prior NA 1-Each 1 No Schardein Schardein Material, Parts and $45.00 $45.00 Awarded Awarded as low total
approval required, for JCPS school Purchase Mechanical Mechanical Equipment 10% bidder for Lot Item Nos.
sites. markup 17 through 24.
017 Cost per hour: Refrigeration | Please respond to the following in the NA 1-Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $88.00 $88.00 1.15% 2.15% 3. 15%
Technician for JCPS school | VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Purchase Mechanical Service
sites. Percentage over invoice price for the
following: (1) Materials, (2) Parts and
(3) Equipment.
018 Cost per hour overtime: Refrigeration Technician after 5:00 NA 1-Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $121.00 $121.00
p.m. for JCPS school sites. Purchase Mechanical Service
019 Cost per hour: Refrigeration Technician for Saturday NA 1-Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $121.00 $121.00
for JCPS school sites. Purchase Mechanical Service
020 Cost per hour: Refrigeration Technician for Sunday for NA 1-Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $155.00 $155.00
JCPS school sites. Purchase Mechanical Service
021 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper, prior approval NA 1-Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $46.00 $46.00
required, for JCPS school sites. Purchase Mechanical Service




Lot Item

Numbers Sample Mfg / Provider Part Extended Vendor Response Item
17-24 Item/Service Description Commodity Code uomMm Quantity Required Vendor Name  Mfg / Provider Number Bid Price Price Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
022 Cost per hour overtime: Refrigeration helper after 5:00 p.m., NA 1-Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $54.00 $54.00

prior approval required, for JCPS Purchase Mechanical Service
school sites.
023 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper for Saturday, prior NA 1-Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $66.00 $66.00
approval required, for JCPS school Purchase Mechanical Service
sites.
024 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper for Sunday, prior NA 1-Each 1 No Intertech NA NA $87.00 $87.00
approval required, for JCPS school Purchase Mechanical Service
sites.
017 Cost per hour: Refrigeration | Please respond to the following in the NA 1-Each 1 No Thermal Service N/A N/A $0.20 $0.20
Technician for JCPS school | VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Purchase
sites. Percentage over invoice price for the
following: (1) Materials, (2) Parts and
(3) Equipment.
018 Cost per hour overtime: Refrigeration Technician after 5:00 NA 1- Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Refrigeration $130.00 $130.00
p.m. for JCPS school sites. Purchase Service Journeyman OT
019 Cost per hour: Refrigeration Technician for Saturday NA 1-Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Refrigeration $130.00 $130.00
for JCPS school sites. Purchase Service Journeyman OT
020 Cost per hour: Refrigeration Technician for Sunday for NA 1-Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Refrigeration $150.00 $150.00
JCPS school sites. Purchase Service Journeyman Holiday
021 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper, prior approval NA 1-Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Refrigeration $53.00 $53.00
required, for JCPS school sites. Purchase Service Apprentice




Lot Item

Numbers Sample Mfg / Provider Part Extended Vendor Response Item
17-24 Item/Service Description Commodity Code uomMm Quantity Required Vendor Name  Mfg / Provider Number Bid Price Price Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
022 Cost per hour overtime: Refrigeration helper after 5:00 p.m., NA 1-Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Refrigeration $87.00 $87.00

prior approval required, for JCPS Purchase Service Apprentice OT
school sites.
023 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper for Saturday, prior NA 1-Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Refrigeration $87.00 $87.00
approval required, for JCPS school Purchase Service Apprentice OT
sites.
024 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper for Sunday, prior NA 1-Each 1 No Thermal Service Thermal Refrigeration $106.00 $106.00
approval required, for JCPS school Purchase Service Apprentice Holiday
sites.
017 Cost per hour: Refrigeration | Please respond to the following in the NA 1-Each 1 No Walker Mechanical NA NA $89.00 $89.00 2% DISCOUNT IF PAID IN
Technician for JCPS school | VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Purchase 15 DAYS.NET 30 DAYS.
sites. Percentage over invoice price for the $50.00 TRUCK CHARGE
following: (1) Materials, (2) Parts and PER CALL
(3) Equipment.
018 Cost per hour overtime: Refrigeration Technician after 5:00 NA 1-Each 1 No Walker Mechanical NA NA $133.50 $133.50 2% DISCOUNT IF PAID IN
p.m. for JCPS school sites. Purchase 15 DAYS. NET 30
DAYS.$50.00 TRUCK
CHARGE PER CALL
019 Cost per hour: Refrigeration Technician for Saturday NA 1-Each 1 No Walker Mechanical NA NA $133.50 $133.50 2% DISCOUNT IF PAID IN
for JCPS school sites. Purchase 15 DAYS. 30 DAYS NET.
$50.00 TRUCK CHARGE
PER CALL.
020 Cost per hour: Refrigeration Technician for Sunday for NA 1-Each 1 No Walker Mechanical NA NA $178.00 $178.00 2% DISCOUNT IF PAID IN
JCPS school sites. Purchase 15 DAYS. 30 DAYS NET.
$50.00 TRUCK CHARGE
PER CALL.
021 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper, prior approval NA 1-Each 1 No Walker Mechanical NA NA $55.00 $55.00
required, for JCPS school sites. Purchase




Lot Item

Numbers Sample Mfg / Provider Part Extended Vendor Response Item
17-24 Item/Service Description Commodity Code uomMm Quantity Required Vendor Name  Mfg / Provider Number Bid Price Price Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
022 Cost per hour overtime: Refrigeration helper after 5:00 p.m., NA 1-Each 1 No Walker Mechanical NA NA $82.50 $82.50

prior approval required, for JCPS Purchase
school sites.
023 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper for Saturday, prior NA 1-Each 1 No Walker Mechanical NA NA $82.50 $82.50
approval required, for JCPS school Purchase
sites.
024 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper for Sunday, prior NA 1-Each 1 No Walker Mechanical NA NA $110.00 $110.00
approval required, for JCPS school Purchase
sites.
017 Cost per hour: Refrigeration | Please respond to the following in the NA 1-Each 1 No Glenns Commercial Glenns Glenns $110.00 $110.00 materials ,parts and
Technician for JCPS school | VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Purchase Service Commercial equipment furnished at
sites. Percentage over invoice price for the Service cost plus 45% mark up
following: (1) Materials, (2) Parts and
(3) Equipment.
018 Cost per hour overtime: Refrigeration Technician after 5:00 NA 1-Each 1 No Glenns Commercial Glenns Glenns $165.00 $165.00
p.m. for JCPS school sites. Purchase Service Commercial
Service
019 Cost per hour: Refrigeration Technician for Saturday NA 1-Each 1 No Glenns Commercial Glenns Glenns $165.00 $165.00
for JCPS school sites. Purchase Service Commercial
Service
020 Cost per hour: Refrigeration Technician for Sunday for NA 1-Each 1 No Glenns Commercial Glenns Glenns $165.00 $165.00
JCPS school sites. Purchase Service Commercial
Service
021 Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper, prior approval NA 1-Each 1 No Glenns Commercial Glenns Glenns $95.00 $95.00
required, for JCPS school sites. Purchase Service Commercial
Service

10




Cost per hour: Refrigeration helper for Saturday, prior 1- Each Glenns Commercial Glenns $142.50 $142.50
approval required, for JCPS school Purchase Service Commercial
sites. Service

1"



	Tabulation Report (by Lot)



