

Jefferson County Public Schools																																																																																																																																																			
Bid Tabulation																																																																																																																																																			
Event Name: WOOD FLOOR RESTORATION																																																																																																																																																			
Event ID: JCPS-8249																																																																																																																																																			
Approval Date: July 25, 2023																																																																																																																																																			
Date Bids Received: June 12, 2023																																																																																																																																																			
Contract Period: July 25, 2023 through May 24, 2024																																																																																																																																																			
Renewals: One (1) renewal at the option of both parties.																																																																																																																																																			
Comments: All bids rejected. May be rebid at a later date.																																																																																																																																																			
<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>Lot Item Numbers 1-11</th> <th>Item/Service</th> <th>Description</th> <th>Commodity Code</th> <th>UOM</th> <th>Quantity</th> <th>Sample Required</th> <th>Vendor Name</th> <th>Mfg / Provider</th> <th>Mfg/ Provider Part Number</th> <th>Unit Bid Price</th> <th>Total Price</th> <th>Vendor Response Item Notes</th> <th>Award Status</th> <th>Award Notes</th> <th>No Bid</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>001</td> <td>Selective refinishing of flat wood surfaces</td> <td>(classroom, hallway, stage or gym floors) including existing baseboards where applicable and minor repairs for holes, scratches and gaps. Price per square foot.</td> <td>4600649-2014817</td> <td>1 - 1 Sq. Foot Purchase</td> <td>1</td> <td>No</td> <td>AZTEC FLOORING INC</td> <td>Bona Kemi Oil Modified products</td> <td>Sport Poly</td> <td>\$9.00</td> <td>\$9.00</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td>Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>002</td> <td>Complete refinishing of flat wood surfaces</td> <td>(classroom, hallway, stage or gym floors) including existing baseboards where applicable and minor repairs for holes, scratches and gaps. Price per square foot.</td> <td>NA</td> <td>1 - 1 Sq. Foot Purchase</td> <td>1</td> <td>No</td> <td>AZTEC FLOORING INC</td> <td>Bona Kemi Oil Modified products</td> <td>Sport Poly</td> <td>\$5.50</td> <td>\$5.50</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td>Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>003</td> <td>Staining of flat wood surfaces</td> <td>(classroom, hallway, stage or gym floors). Price per square foot.</td> <td>NA</td> <td>1 - 1 Sq. Foot Purchase</td> <td>1</td> <td>No</td> <td>AZTEC FLOORING INC</td> <td>Dura Seal</td> <td>Dura Seal</td> <td>\$0.75</td> <td>\$0.75</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td>Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>004</td> <td>Selective refinishing of steps</td> <td>(tread and riser). Price per linear foot.</td> <td>NA</td> <td>1 - Each Purchase</td> <td>1</td> <td>No</td> <td>AZTEC FLOORING INC</td> <td>Dura Seal</td> <td>Dura Seal</td> <td>\$15.00</td> <td>\$15.00</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td>Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>005</td> <td>Staining of steps</td> <td>(tread and riser). Price per linear foot.</td> <td>NA</td> <td>1 - Each Purchase</td> <td>1</td> <td>No</td> <td>AZTEC FLOORING INC</td> <td>Dura Seal</td> <td>Dura Seal</td> <td>\$1.50</td> <td>\$1.50</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td>Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>006</td> <td>Labor, hourly rate for Journeyman, after school hours, between 4 pm and 10:30 pm; misc. wood flooring, base, trim repair.</td> <td>Price per hour. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: State percentage of markup cost for miscellaneous materials.</td> <td>NA</td> <td>1 - Each Purchase</td> <td>1</td> <td>No</td> <td>AZTEC FLOORING INC</td> <td>Self Performed</td> <td>Self Performed</td> <td>\$73.50</td> <td>\$73.50</td> <td>markup per request 15%</td> <td></td> <td>Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>007</td> <td>Labor, hourly rate for Helper, after school hours, between 4 pm and 10:30 pm; misc. wood flooring, base, trim repair.</td> <td>Price per hour. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: State percentage of markup cost for miscellaneous materials.</td> <td>NA</td> <td>1 - Each Purchase</td> <td>1</td> <td>No</td> <td>AZTEC FLOORING INC</td> <td>Self Performed</td> <td>Self Performed</td> <td>\$66.50</td> <td>\$66.50</td> <td>markup per request 15%</td> <td></td> <td>Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.</td> <td></td> </tr> </tbody> </table>																				Lot Item Numbers 1-11	Item/Service	Description	Commodity Code	UOM	Quantity	Sample Required	Vendor Name	Mfg / Provider	Mfg/ Provider Part Number	Unit Bid Price	Total Price	Vendor Response Item Notes	Award Status	Award Notes	No Bid	001	Selective refinishing of flat wood surfaces	(classroom, hallway, stage or gym floors) including existing baseboards where applicable and minor repairs for holes, scratches and gaps. Price per square foot.	4600649-2014817	1 - 1 Sq. Foot Purchase	1	No	AZTEC FLOORING INC	Bona Kemi Oil Modified products	Sport Poly	\$9.00	\$9.00			Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.		002	Complete refinishing of flat wood surfaces	(classroom, hallway, stage or gym floors) including existing baseboards where applicable and minor repairs for holes, scratches and gaps. Price per square foot.	NA	1 - 1 Sq. Foot Purchase	1	No	AZTEC FLOORING INC	Bona Kemi Oil Modified products	Sport Poly	\$5.50	\$5.50			Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.		003	Staining of flat wood surfaces	(classroom, hallway, stage or gym floors). Price per square foot.	NA	1 - 1 Sq. Foot Purchase	1	No	AZTEC FLOORING INC	Dura Seal	Dura Seal	\$0.75	\$0.75			Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.		004	Selective refinishing of steps	(tread and riser). Price per linear foot.	NA	1 - Each Purchase	1	No	AZTEC FLOORING INC	Dura Seal	Dura Seal	\$15.00	\$15.00			Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.		005	Staining of steps	(tread and riser). Price per linear foot.	NA	1 - Each Purchase	1	No	AZTEC FLOORING INC	Dura Seal	Dura Seal	\$1.50	\$1.50			Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.		006	Labor, hourly rate for Journeyman, after school hours, between 4 pm and 10:30 pm; misc. wood flooring, base, trim repair.	Price per hour. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: State percentage of markup cost for miscellaneous materials.	NA	1 - Each Purchase	1	No	AZTEC FLOORING INC	Self Performed	Self Performed	\$73.50	\$73.50	markup per request 15%		Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.		007	Labor, hourly rate for Helper, after school hours, between 4 pm and 10:30 pm; misc. wood flooring, base, trim repair.	Price per hour. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: State percentage of markup cost for miscellaneous materials.	NA	1 - Each Purchase	1	No	AZTEC FLOORING INC	Self Performed	Self Performed	\$66.50	\$66.50	markup per request 15%		Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.	
Lot Item Numbers 1-11	Item/Service	Description	Commodity Code	UOM	Quantity	Sample Required	Vendor Name	Mfg / Provider	Mfg/ Provider Part Number	Unit Bid Price	Total Price	Vendor Response Item Notes	Award Status	Award Notes	No Bid																																																																																																																																				
001	Selective refinishing of flat wood surfaces	(classroom, hallway, stage or gym floors) including existing baseboards where applicable and minor repairs for holes, scratches and gaps. Price per square foot.	4600649-2014817	1 - 1 Sq. Foot Purchase	1	No	AZTEC FLOORING INC	Bona Kemi Oil Modified products	Sport Poly	\$9.00	\$9.00			Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.																																																																																																																																					
002	Complete refinishing of flat wood surfaces	(classroom, hallway, stage or gym floors) including existing baseboards where applicable and minor repairs for holes, scratches and gaps. Price per square foot.	NA	1 - 1 Sq. Foot Purchase	1	No	AZTEC FLOORING INC	Bona Kemi Oil Modified products	Sport Poly	\$5.50	\$5.50			Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.																																																																																																																																					
003	Staining of flat wood surfaces	(classroom, hallway, stage or gym floors). Price per square foot.	NA	1 - 1 Sq. Foot Purchase	1	No	AZTEC FLOORING INC	Dura Seal	Dura Seal	\$0.75	\$0.75			Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.																																																																																																																																					
004	Selective refinishing of steps	(tread and riser). Price per linear foot.	NA	1 - Each Purchase	1	No	AZTEC FLOORING INC	Dura Seal	Dura Seal	\$15.00	\$15.00			Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.																																																																																																																																					
005	Staining of steps	(tread and riser). Price per linear foot.	NA	1 - Each Purchase	1	No	AZTEC FLOORING INC	Dura Seal	Dura Seal	\$1.50	\$1.50			Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.																																																																																																																																					
006	Labor, hourly rate for Journeyman, after school hours, between 4 pm and 10:30 pm; misc. wood flooring, base, trim repair.	Price per hour. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: State percentage of markup cost for miscellaneous materials.	NA	1 - Each Purchase	1	No	AZTEC FLOORING INC	Self Performed	Self Performed	\$73.50	\$73.50	markup per request 15%		Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.																																																																																																																																					
007	Labor, hourly rate for Helper, after school hours, between 4 pm and 10:30 pm; misc. wood flooring, base, trim repair.	Price per hour. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: State percentage of markup cost for miscellaneous materials.	NA	1 - Each Purchase	1	No	AZTEC FLOORING INC	Self Performed	Self Performed	\$66.50	\$66.50	markup per request 15%		Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.																																																																																																																																					

Lot Item Numbers 1-11	Item/Service	Description	Commodity Code	UOM	Quantity	Sample Required	Vendor Name	Mfg / Provider	Mfg/ Provider Part Number	Unit Bid Price	Total Price	Vendor Response Item Notes	Award Status	Award Notes	No Bid
008	Labor, hourly rate for Journeyman, Monday - Friday, between 6 am and 4 pm; misc. wood flooring, base, trim repair.	Price per hour. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: State percentage of markup cost for miscellaneous materials.	NA	1 - Each Purchase	1	No	AZTEC FLOORING INC	Self Performed	Self Performed	\$65.00	\$65.00	markup per request 10%		Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.	
009	Labor, hourly rate for Helper, Monday - Friday, between 6 am and 4 pm; misc. wood flooring, base, trim repair. Price per hour.	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: State percentage of markup cost for miscellaneous materials.	NA	1 - Each Purchase	1	No	AZTEC FLOORING INC	Self Performed	Self Performed	\$58.00	\$58.00	markup per request 10%		Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.	
010	Labor, hourly rate for Journeyman, weekends; misc. wood flooring, base, trim repair.	Price per hour. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: State percentage of markup cost for miscellaneous materials.	NA	1 - Each Purchase	1	No	AZTEC FLOORING INC	Self Performed	Self Performed	\$73.50	\$73.50	markup per request 15%		Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.	
011	Labor, hourly rate for Helper, weekends; misc. wood flooring, base, trim repair. Price per hour.	Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: State percentage of markup cost for miscellaneous materials.	NA	1 - Each Purchase	1	No	AZTEC FLOORING INC	Self Performed	Self Performed	\$66.50	\$66.50	markup per request 15%		Reject-alternate bids not acceptable.	