Jefferson County Public Schools

Bid Tabulation \
Event Name: SPOKEN LANGUAGE INTERPRETING SERVICES & TRANSLATION OF DOCUMENTS
Event ID: JCPS-8245
Approval Date: July 25, 2023

Date Bids Received: June 22, 2023
Contract Period: July 25, 2023 through June 30, 2024
Renewals: Two (2) annual renewals at the option of both parties.
Comments: Award Status indicates an award.

Spoken Language Onsite, (per specifications). 4600649-2013779 1 Each 1 No Datagain Inc. $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service Price per hour. Purchase
001 Spoken Language Onsite, (per specifications). 4600649-2013779 1 Each 1 No EPIC Translations $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service Price per hour. Purchase
001 Spoken Language Onsite, (per specifications). 4600649-2013779 1 Each 1 No Idea Language Services, $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service Price per hour. Purchase Lcc
001 Spoken Language Onsite, (per specifications). 4600649-2013779 1 Each 1 No Language Line Services, $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service Price per hour. Purchase Inc.
001 Spoken Language Onsite, (per specifications). 4600649-2013779 1 Each 1 No Languages Translation $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service Price per hour. Purchase Services
001 Spoken Language Onsite, (per specifications). 4600649-2013779 1 Each 1 No Lionbridge Global $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service Price per hour. Purchase Solutions Il Inc.
001 Spoken Language Onsite, (per specifications). 4600649-2013779 1 Each 1 No Zab, LLC $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service Price per hour. Purchase
001 Spoken Language Onsite, (per specifications). 4600649-2013779 1 Each 1 No BELOZ LLC Beloz lic Onsite $45.00 $45.00 The rate for onsite Awarded
Interpreting Service Price per hour. Purchase interpreting services
will be $45.00/HR,
with a minimum of
two hours, and in 15
minutes increments
thereafter.




Sample Mfg / Provider Part Vendor Response
Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name Mfg / Provider Number Unit Bid Price  Total Price  Supplier Notes Item Notes Award Notes No Bid
001 Spoken Language Onsite, (per specifications). 4600649-2013779 1 Each 1 No Propio LS, LLC Propio N/A $45.00 $45.00
Interpreting Service Price per hour. Purchase
001 Spoken Language Onsite, (per specifications). 4600649-2013779 1 Each 1 No Catholic Charities, Catholic Charities N/A $48.00 $48.00 2-hour minimum
Interpreting Service Price per hour. Purchase Language Services of Louisville, Inc.
001 Spoken Language Onsite, (per specifications). 4600649-2013779 1 Each 1 No Ready Made Language Ready Made N/A $55.00 $55.00 2 hour minimum
Interpreting Service Price per hour. Purchase Resources Language
Resources
001 Spoken Language Onsite, (per specifications). 4600649-2013779 1 Each 1 No HOMELAND LANGUAGE HOMELAND HOUR $65.00 $65.00 cancelling 65
Interpreting Service Price per hour. Purchase SERVICES LANGUAGE charges apply
SERVICES
001 Spoken Language Onsite, (per specifications). 4600649-2013779 1 Each 1 No Interpreters Unlimited Interpreters Interpreters $65.00 $65.00 2%/NET20
Interpreting Service Price per hour. Purchase Unlimited, Inc. Unlimited, Inc.
002 Spoken Language Phone/conference call, (per NA 1 Each 1 No Datagain Inc. $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service specifications). Price per Purchase
minute.
002 Spoken Language Phone/conference call, (per NA 1 Each 1 No EPIC Translations $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service specifications). Price per Purchase
minute.
002 Spoken Language Phone/conference call, (per NA 1 Each 1 No Languages Translation $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service specifications). Price per Purchase Services
minute.
002 Spoken Language Phone/conference call, (per NA 1 Each 1 No Zab, LLC $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service specifications). Price per Purchase
minute.
002 Spoken Language Phone/conference call, (per NA 1Each 1 No Lionbridge Global Lionbridge Lionbridge $0.63 $0.63 Per minute rate for Reject - does not meet bid
Interpreting Service specifications). Price per Purchase Solutions 11, Inc. all 380 languages specifications.
minute.
002 Spoken Language Phone/conference call, (per NA 1 Each 1 No Propio LS, LLC Propio N/A $0.69 $0.69
Interpreting Service specifications). Price per Purchase
minute.
002 Spoken Language Phone/conference call, (per NA 1 Each 1 No HOMELAND LANGUAGE HOMELAND MINUTE $0.74 $0.74 0.74 Reject - does not meet bid
Interpreting Service specifications). Price per Purchase SERVICES LANGUAGE specifications.
minute. SERVICES




Sample Mfg / Provider Part Vendor Response
Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name Mfg / Provider Number Unit Bid Price  Total Price  Supplier Notes Item Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
002 Spoken Language Phone/conference call, (per NA 1Each 1 No Idea Language Services, Idea Language Interpreting $0.90 $0.90 Reject - does not meet bid
Interpreting Service specifications). Price per Purchase Lcc Services, LLC specifications.
minute.
002 Spoken Language Phone/conference call, (per NA 1 Each 1 No Interpreters Unlimited Interpreters Interpreters $0.95 $0.95 2%/NET20 Reject - does not meet bid
Interpreting Service specifications). Price per Purchase Unlimited, Inc. Unlimited, Inc. specifications.
minute.
002 Spoken Language Phone/conference call, (per NA 1Each 1 No Language Line Services,  Languageline N/A $0.99 $0.99 Awarded Awarded to Language Line
Interpreting Service specifications). Price per Purchase Inc. Solutions Services, Inc. based on the
minute. evaluation criteria set forth in
the Invitation to Bid.
002 Spoken Language Phone/conference call, (per NA 1 Each 1 No Ready Made Language Ready Made N/A $1.00 $1.00 30 minute minimum
Interpreting Service specifications). Price per Purchase Resources Language
minute. Resources
002 Spoken Language Phone/conference call, (per NA 1 Each 1 No Catholic Charities, Catholic Charities N/A $1.65 $1.65 15 minute minimum,
Interpreting Service specifications). Price per Purchase Language Services of Louisville, Inc. then per minute.
minute.
002 Spoken Language Phone/conference call, (per NA 1 Each 1 No BELOZ LLC Beloz lic (o] ] $1.75 $1.75 OnDemand service is
Interpreting Service specifications). Price per Purchase currently unavailable
minute.
003 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, NA 1 Each 1 No Datagain Inc. $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service Spanish only, (per Purchase
specifications). Price per
minute.
003 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, NA 1 Each 1 No EPIC Translations $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service Spanish only, (per Purchase
specifications). Price per
minute.
003 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, NA 1 Each 1 No Languages Translation $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service Spanish only, (per Purchase Services
specifications). Price per
minute.
003 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, NA 1 Each 1 No Lionbridge Global $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service Spanish only, (per Purchase Solutions 11, Inc.
specifications). Price per
minute.
003 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, NA 1 Each 1 No Zab, LLC $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service Spanish only, (per Purchase
specifications). Price per
minute.




Sample Mfg / Provider Part Vendor Response
Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name Mfg / Provider Number Unit Bid Price  Total Price  Supplier Notes Item Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
003 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, NA 1 Each 1 No HOMELAND LANGUAGE HOMELAND MINUTE $0.56 $0.56 0.56 Reject - does not meet bid
Interpreting Service Spanish only, (per Purchase SERVICES LANGUAGE specifications.
specifications). Price per SERVICES
minute.
003 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, NA 1 Each 1 No Propio LS, LLC Propio N/A $0.75 $0.75
Interpreting Service Spanish only, (per Purchase
specifications). Price per
minute.
003 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, NA 1 Each 1 No Interpreters Unlimited Interpreters Interpreters $0.95 $0.95 2%/NET20 Reject - does not meet bid
Interpreting Service Spanish only, (per Purchase Unlimited, Inc. Unlimited, Inc. specifications.
specifications). Price per
minute.
003 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, NA 1 Each 1 No Catholic Charities, Catholic Charities N/A $1.15 $1.15 15 minute minimum, Reject - does not meet bid
Interpreting Service Spanish only, (per Purchase Language Services of Louisville, Inc. then per minute. specifications.
specifications). Price per
minute.
003 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, NA 1 Each 1 No Idea Language Services, | Idea Language Interpreting $1.25 $1.25 Reject - does not meet bid
Interpreting Service Spanish only, (per Purchase Lcc Services, LLC specifications.
specifications). Price per
minute.
003 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, NA 1 Each 1 No Ready Made Language Ready Made N/A $1.50 $1.50 1 hour minimum Reject - does not meet bid
Interpreting Service Spanish only, (per Purchase Resources Language specifications.
specifications). Price per Resources
minute.
003 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, NA 1 Each 1 No Language Line Services, | Languageline N/A $1.65 $1.65 Awarded Awarded to Language Line
Interpreting Service Spanish only, (per Purchase Inc. Solutions Services, Inc. based on the
specifications). Price per evaluation criteria set forth in
minute. the Invitation to Bid.
003 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, NA 1 Each 1 No BELOZ LLC Beloz lic VRI - SPANISH Only $1.75 $1.75 OnDemand service is
Interpreting Service Spanish only, (per Purchase currently unavailable
specifications). Price per
minute.
004 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, all NA 1 Each 1 No Datagain Inc. $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service spoken languages other than Purchase
Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per
minute.
004 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, all NA 1 Each 1 No EPIC Translations $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service spoken languages other than Purchase

Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per
minute.




Sample Mfg / Provider Part Vendor Response

Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name Mfg / Provider Number Unit Bid Price  Total Price  Supplier Notes Item Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
004 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, all NA 1 Each 1 No Languages Translation $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service  spoken languages other than Purchase Services

Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per

minute.
004 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, all NA 1 Each 1 No Lionbridge Global $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service  spoken languages other than Purchase Solutions I, Inc.

Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per

minute.
004 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, all NA 1 Each 1 No Zab, LLC $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service spoken languages other than Purchase

Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per

minute.
004 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, all NA 1 Each 1 No HOMELAND LANGUAGE HOMELAND MINUTE $0.74 $0.74 0.74 Reject - does not meet bid
Interpreting Service spoken languages other than Purchase SERVICES LANGUAGE specifications.
Spanish, (no sign language), SERVICES
(per specifications). Price per
minute.
004 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, all NA 1 Each 1 No Propio LS, LLC Propio N/A $0.75 $0.75
Interpreting Service spoken languages other than Purchase

Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per

minute.
004 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, all NA 1 Each 1 No Interpreters Unlimited Interpreters Interpreters $1.25 $1.25 2%/NET20 Reject - does not meet bid
Interpreting Service spoken languages other than Purchase Unlimited, Inc. Unlimited, Inc. specifications.

Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per

minute.
004 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, all NA 1 Each 1 No Idea Language Services, Idea Language Interpreting $1.50 $1.50 Reject - does not meet bid
Interpreting Service  spoken languages other than Purchase Lcc Services, LLC specifications.

Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per

minute.
004 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, all NA 1 Each 1 No Ready Made Language Ready Made N/A $1.50 $1.50 1 hour minimum Reject - does not meet bid
Interpreting Service spoken languages other than Purchase Resources Language specifications.
Spanish, (no sign language), Resources
(per specifications). Price per
minute.




004 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, all NA 1 Each No Catholic Charities, Catholic Charities N/A $1.65 $1.65 15 minute minimum, Reject - does not meet bid
Interpreting Service spoken languages other than Purchase Language Services of Louisville, Inc. then per minute. specifications.
Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per
minute.
004 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, all NA 1 Each No BELOZ LLC Beloz lic VRI - Other than $1.75 $1.75 OnDemand service is Reject - does not have service
Interpreting Service  spoken languages other than Purchase SPANISH currently unavailable available.
Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per
minute.
004 Spoken Language Remote video interpreting, all NA 1Each No Language Line Services,  Languageline N/A $1.75 $1.75 Awarded Awarded to Language Line
Interpreting Service  spoken languages other than Purchase Inc. Solutions Services, Inc. based on the
Spanish, (no sign language), evaluation criteria set forth in
(per specifications). Price per the Invitation to Bid.
minute.
005 Spoken Language Scheduled video/virtual NA 1 Each No Datagain Inc. $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service | meeting interpreting. Spanish Purchase
only, (per specifications).
Price per minute.
005 Spoken Language Scheduled video/virtual NA 1 Each No EPIC Translations $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service | meeting interpreting. Spanish Purchase
only, (per specifications).
Price per minute.
005 Spoken Language Scheduled video/virtual NA 1 Each No Languages Translation $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service | meeting interpreting. Spanish Purchase Services
only, (per specifications).
Price per minute.
005 Spoken Language Scheduled video/virtual NA 1 Each No Lionbridge Global $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service | meeting interpreting. Spanish Purchase Solutions Il Inc.
only, (per specifications).
Price per minute.
005 Spoken Language Scheduled video/virtual NA 1Each No Propio LS, LLC Propio N/A $0.00 $0.00
Interpreting Service | meeting interpreting. Spanish Purchase
only, (per specifications).
Price per minute.




005 Spoken Language Scheduled video/virtual NA 1 Each No Zab, LLC $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Interpreting Service meeting interpreting. Spanish Purchase
only, (per specifications).
Price per minute.
005 Spoken Language Scheduled video/virtual NA 1 Each No HOMELAND LANGUAGE HOMELAND MINUTE $0.60 $0.60 0.6
Interpreting Service meeting interpreting. Spanish Purchase SERVICES LANGUAGE
only, (per specifications). SERVICES
Price per minute.
005 Spoken Language Scheduled video/virtual NA 1 Each No Interpreters Unlimited Interpreters Interpreters $0.95 $0.95 2%/NET20
Interpreting Service | meeting interpreting. Spanish Purchase Unlimited, Inc. Unlimited, Inc.
only, (per specifications).
Price per minute.
005 Spoken Language Scheduled video/virtual NA 1 Each No Catholic Charities, Catholic Charities N/A $1.15 $1.15 15 minute minimum, Reject - does not meet bid
Interpreting Service | meeting interpreting. Spanish Purchase Language Services of Louisville, Inc. then per minute. specifications.
only, (per specifications).
Price per minute.
005 Spoken Language Scheduled video/virtual NA 1 Each No Idea Language Services, | Idea Language Interpreting $1.50 $1.50 Reject - does not meet bid
Interpreting Service meeting interpreting. Spanish Purchase Lcc Services, LLC specifications.
only, (per specifications).
Price per minute.
005 Spoken Language Scheduled video/virtual NA 1 Each No Ready Made Language Ready Made N/A $1.50 $1.50 1 hour minimum
Interpreting Service meeting interpreting. Spanish Purchase Resources Language
only, (per specifications). Resources
Price per minute.
005 Spoken Language Scheduled video/virtual NA 1 Each No Language Line Services, Languageline N/A $1.65 $1.65 Rate per minute is Awarded Awarded to Language Line
Interpreting Service | meeting interpreting. Spanish Purchase Inc. Solutions for standard hours of Services, Inc. based on the

only, (per specifications).
Price per minute.

8am-5pm local time.
Rates will be charged
at 1.5 times the
standard rate
outside of standard
hours. Subjecttoa 1
hr minimum and 24
cancellation
requirement.

evaluation criteria set forth in
the Invitation to Bid.




Item Number

Item/Service

Description

Commodity Code

Uom

Quantity

Sample
Required

Vendor Name

Mfg / Provider

Mfg / Provider Part
Number

Unit Bid Price  Total Price

Vendor Response
Item Notes

Award Status Award Notes No Bid

005

Spoken Language
Interpreting Service

Scheduled video/virtual
meeting interpreting. Spanish
only, (per specifications).
Price per minute.

NA

1Each
Purchase

1

No

BELOZ LLC

Beloz lic

Scheduled VRI
Conference

$1.75

$1.75

OnDemand service is
currently unavailable

006

006

006

006

006

006

006

Spoken Language
Interpreting Service

Spoken Language
Interpreting Service

Spoken Language
Interpreting Service

Spoken Language
Interpreting Service

Spoken Language
Interpreting Service

Spoken Language
Interpreting Service

Spoken Language
Interpreting Service

Scheduled video/virtual
meeting interpreting, all
spoken languages other than
Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per
minute.

Scheduled video/virtual
meeting interpreting, all
spoken languages other than
Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per
minute.

Scheduled video/virtual
meeting interpreting, all
spoken languages other than
Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per
minute.

Scheduled video/virtual
meeting interpreting, all
spoken languages other than
Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per
minute.

Scheduled video/virtual
meeting interpreting, all
spoken languages other than
Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per
minute.

Scheduled video/virtual
meeting interpreting, all
spoken languages other than
Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per
minute.

Scheduled video/virtual
meeting interpreting, all
spoken languages other than
Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per
minute.

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

1Each
Purchase

1Each
Purchase

1Each
Purchase

1Each
Purchase

1Each
Purchase

1Each
Purchase

1Each

Purchase

No

No

No

Datagain Inc.

EPIC Translations

Languages Translation
Services

Lionbridge Global
Solutions |1, Inc.

Propio LS, LLC

Zab, LLC

HOMELAND LANGUAGE
SERVICES

Propio

HOMELAND
LANGUAGE
SERVICES

N/A

MINUTE

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.90

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.90

0.9

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




Item Number

Item/Service

Sample Mfg / Provider Part Vendor Response
Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name Mfg / Provider Number Unit Bid Price  Total Price  Supplier Notes Item Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
006 Spoken Language Scheduled video/virtual NA 1 Each 1 No Interpreters Unlimited Interpreters Interpreters $1.25 $1.25 2%/NET20
Interpreting Service meeting interpreting, all Purchase Unlimited, Inc. Unlimited, Inc.
spoken languages other than
Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per
minute.
006 Spoken Language Scheduled video/virtual NA 1 Each 1 No Ready Made Language Ready Made N/A $1.50 $1.50 1 hour minimum
Interpreting Service meeting interpreting, all Purchase Resources Language
spoken languages other than Resources
Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per
minute.
006 Spoken Language Scheduled video/virtual NA 1 Each 1 No Catholic Charities, Catholic Charities N/A $1.65 $1.65 15 minute minimum, Reject - does not meet bid
Interpreting Service meeting interpreting, all Purchase Language Services of Louisville, Inc. then per minute. specifications.
spoken languages other than
Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per
minute.
006 Spoken Language Scheduled video/virtual NA 1 Each No BELOZ LLC Beloz lic Scheduled VRI $1.75 $1.75 OnDemand service is Reject - does not have service
Interpreting Service meeting interpreting, all Purchase Conference currently unavailable available.
spoken languages other than
Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per
minute.
006 Spoken Language Scheduled video/virtual NA 1 Each No Language Line Services, Languageline N/A $1.75 $1.75 Rate per minute is Awarded Awarded to Language Line
Interpreting Service meeting interpreting, all Purchase Inc. Solutions for standard hours of Services, Inc. based on the
spoken languages other than 8am-5pm local time. evaluation criteria set forth in
Spanish, (no sign language), Rates will be charged the Invitation to Bid.
(per specifications). Price per at 1.5 times the
_— standard rate
outside of standard
hours. Subjecttoa 1
hr minimum and 24
cancellation
requirement.
006 Spoken Language Scheduled video/virtual NA 1 Each 1 No Idea Language Services, Idea Language Interpreting $2.00 $2.00
Interpreting Service meeting interpreting, all Purchase Lcc Services, LLC
spoken languages other than
Spanish, (no sign language),
(per specifications). Price per
minute.
007 Document Translation | Font 12, 1 inch margins. (per NA 1 Each 1 No Lionbridge Global $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
specifications). Price per Purchase Solutions Il Inc.
page.
007 Document Translation | Font 12, 1 inch margins. (per NA 1 Each 1 No HOMELAND LANGUAGE HOMELAND PAGE $35.00 $35.00 large documents; 35
specifications). Price per Purchase SERVICES LANGUAGE discounts apply
page. SERVICES
9




007 Document Translation | Font 12, 1 inch margins. (per NA 1 Each No EPIC Translations EPIC Translations N/A $39.50 $39.50 200 to 250 words per
specifications). Price per Purchase LLC page
page.
007 Document Translation | Font 12, 1 inch margins. (per NA 1Each No Idea Language Services, | Idea Language Translation $40.00 $40.00 Awarded Awarded to Idea Language
specifications). Price per Purchase LcC Services, LLC Services, LLC based on the
page. evaluation criteria set forth in
the Invitation to Bid.
007 Document Translation | Font 12, 1 inch margins. (per NA 1 Each No Datagain Inc. Datagain Inc. Item 7: Document $42.00 $42.00 $42 per page for the Reject - does not meet bid
specifications). Price per Purchase Translation following languages specifications.
page. Spanish
Somali
Swabhili
Arabic
Kinyarwanda
Nepali
French
Vietnamese
Burmese
Kirundi
007 Document Translation | Font 12, 1 inch margins. (per NA 1 Each No Zab, LLC Zab Translation N/A $43.00 $43.00 Typically priced Reject - alternate bids not
specifications). Price per Purchase Solutions depending on acceptable per bid terms and
page. language/formatting conditions.
complexity and on a
per-word basis. Non-
exhaustive sample
rate card to be
included with bid.
Cost will decrease
over time through
effective use of
translation memory
tools.
007 Document Translation | Font 12, 1 inch margins. (per NA 1 Each No Language Line Services, | Languageline N/A $45.00 $45.00 Rate provided is for Reject - does not meet bid
specifications). Price per Purchase Inc. Solutions Spanish Only. specifications.
page.
As a cost savings
measure and
opportunity,
additional pricing
and services are
listed in the Misc.
Attachment File"
007 Document Translation | Font 12, 1 inch margins. (per NA 1 Each No Catholic Charities, Catholic Charities N/A $48.00 $48.00 Word doc preferred
specifications). Price per Purchase Language Services of Louisville, Inc.
page.
007 Document Translation | Font 12, 1 inch margins. (per NA 1 Each No BELOZ LLC Beloz lic Translation $50.00 $50.00
specifications). Price per Purchase

page.

10




007 Document Translation | Font 12, 1 inch margins. (per NA 1 Each No Propio LS, LLC Propio N/A $50.00 $50.00 Price quoted is
specifications). Price per Purchase for approximatly
page. 250 words
(12inch font, 1
inch margins,
double spaced)
007 Document Translation | Font 12, 1 inch margins. (per NA 1 Each No Ready Made Language Ready Made N/A $50.00 $50.00 1 page minimum Awarded Awarded to Ready Made
specifications). Price per Purchase Resources Language Language Resources based on
page. Resources the evaluation criteria set
forth in the Invitation to Bid.
007 Document Translation | Font 12, 1 inch margins. (per NA 1Each No Interpreters Unlimited Interpreters Interpreters $65.00 $65.00 2%/NET20 Awarded Awarded to Interpreters
specifications). Price per Purchase Unlimited, Inc. Unlimited, Inc. Unlimited based on the
page. evaluation criteria set forth in
the Invitation to Bid.
007 Document Translation | Font 12, 1 inch margins. (per NA 1 Each No Languages Translation LTS LTS $96.00 $96.00
specifications). Price per Purchase Services

page.
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