Jefferson County Public Schools

Bid Tabulation \

Event Name: PUMPS (VARIOUS)

Event ID: JCPS-8236

Approval Date: June 6, 2023

Date Bids Received: May 15, 2023

Contract Period: June 6, 2023 through June 5, 2024

Renewals: No renewal option.

Comments: Award Status indicates an award.

Item Sample Vendor Response Item
Number Item Service Description Commodity Code uomMm quired pplier Name MFG Provider  MFG Provider Part Bid Price Bid Total Award Status Notes Award Notes  No Bid
1 Pump, condensate, 115 Little Giant ABS-3 #551320 or 6225600-1677700 1-Each No SHEARER $0.00 No Bid
volt. equal. Purchase COMPANY/THE
RANVIER GROUP
1 Pump, condensate, 115 Little Giant ABS-3 #551320 or 6225600-1677700 1-Each No CAPP INC LITTLE GIANT 551320 $558.00 $3,348.00 Awarded
volt. equal. Purchase
2 Pump, condensate, 115 Little Giant VCMA-15ULS #554405  6225600-2002420 1-Each No SHEARER $0.00 No Bid
volt, vertical, with safety or equal. Purchase COMPANY/THE
switch, 1/50 HP. RANVIER GROUP
2 Pump, condensate, 115 Little Giant VCMA-15ULS #554405  6225600-2002420 1-Each No CAPP INC LITTLE GIANT 554405 $70.00 $140.00 Awarded
volt, vertical, with safety or equal. Purchase
switch, 1/50 HP.
3 Pump, condensate, 115 Little Giant VCCA-20ULS 6225600-1345002 1-Each No SHEARER $0.00 No Bid
volt, low profile, 1/30 #554201101 or equal. Purchase COMPANY/THE
HP. RANVIER GROUP
3 Pump, condensate, 115 Little Giant VCCA-20ULS 6225600-1345002 1-Each No CAPP INC LITTLE GIANT 554201101 $132.00 $528.00 Awarded
volt, low profile, 1/30 #554201101 or equal. Purchase
HP.
4 Pump, submersible, GPM 79 at 10-ft. head, must have ~ 6225850-1685939 1-Each No SHEARER CHAMPION CPE55V-12 $417.00 $2,085.00 Awarded 1/2HP 115V 1P
automatic, 1/2 HP, 115 vertical ball float control Purchase COMPANY/THE 79GPM@10TDH

volt, single phase, permanently mounted to pump
body, cast iron body, non-
clogging vortex impeller, passes
5/8" spherical solids. Zoeller

M137 #137-0001 or equal.

RANVIER GROUP




Item Sample Vendor Response Item
Number Item Service Description Commodity Code uom quired lier Name MFG Provider  MFG Provider Part Bid Price Bid Total Award Status Notes Award Notes  No Bid
4 Pump, submersible,  GPM 79 at 10-ft. head, must have ~ 6225850-1685939 1-Each No CAPP INC ZOELLER 137-0001 $553.00 $2,765.00
automatic, 1/2 HP, 115 vertical ball float control Purchase
volt, single phase, permanently mounted to pump
body, cast iron body, non-
clogging vortex impeller, passes
5/8" spherical solids. Zoeller
M137 #137-0001 or equal.
5 Pump, submersible, non-  GPM 79 at 10-ft. head, 1 1/2" 6225850-1698218 1-Each No SHEARER CHAMPION CPE55V-12 $417.00 $417.00 Awarded 1/2HP 115V 1P
automatic, 1/2 HP, 115 NPT discharge, cast iron body, Purchase COMPANY/THE 79GPM@10TDH
volt, single phase, non-clogging vortex impeller, RANVIER GROUP
passes 5/8" spherical solids.
Zoeller N137 #137-0002 or equal.
5 Pump, submersible, non-  GPM 79 at 10-ft. head, 1 1/2" 6225850-1698218 1-Each No CAPP INC ZOELLER 137-0002 $509.00 $509.00
automatic, 1/2 HP, 115 NPT discharge, cast iron body, Purchase
volt, single phase, non-clogging vortex impeller,
passes 5/8" spherical solids.
Zoeller N137 #137-0002 or equal.
6 Pump, submersible, non- GPM 50 at 15-ft. head, 2" NPT 6225850-2010953 1-Each No SHEARER CHAMPION CPSE533 $844.00 $844.00 1/2HP 3 PH 208V
automatic, 1/2 HP, 200- discharge, cast iron construction, Purchase COMPANY/THE 50GPM@15TDH
208 volt, 3 phase, non-clogging vortex impeller, RANVIER GROUP
passes 2" spherical solids. Zoeller
J267 #267-0011 or equal.
6 Pump, submersible, non- GPM 50 at 15-ft. head, 2" NPT 6225850-2010953 1- Each No CAPP INC ZOELLER 267-0011 $850.00 $850.00 Awarded Awarded to
automatic, 1/2 HP, 200- discharge, cast iron construction, Purchase CAPP INC
208 volt, 3 phase, non-clogging vortex impeller, b?sed on
passes 2" spherical solids. Zoeller thelr_3% =4y
1267 #267-0011 or equal. ay Gl
7 Pump, submersible, non{ GPM 50 at 15-ft. head, 2" NPT 6225850-1722170 1-Each No CAPP INC ZOELLER 267-0004 $585.00 $585.00 Awarded
automatic, 1/2 HP, 230 | discharge, cast iron construction, Purchase
volt, single phase, non-clogging vortex impeller,
passes 2" spherical solids. Zoeller
E267 #267-0004 or equal.
7 Pump, submersible, non{ GPM 50 at 15-ft. head, 2" NPT 6225850-1722170 1-Each No SHEARER CHAMPION CPSE522 $762.00 $762.00 1/2 HP 230V 1P
automatic, 1/2 HP, 230 | discharge, cast iron construction, Purchase COMPANY/THE 50GPM@15TDH
volt, single phase, non-clogging vortex impeller, RANVIER GROUP
passes 2" spherical solids. Zoeller
E267 #267-0004 or equal.
8 Pump, submersible, non- GPM 50 at 15-ft. head, 2" NPT 6225850-1722171 1-Each No CAPP INC ZOELLER 267-0010 $745.00 $745.00 Awarded
automatic, 1/2 HP, 230 discharge, cast iron construction, Purchase
volt, 3 phase, non-clogging vortex impeller,

passes 2" spherical solids. Zoeller
F267 #267-0010 or equal.




Item Sample Vendor Response Item
Number Item Service Description Commodity Code uom quired lier Name MFG Provider  MFG Provider Part Bid Price Bid Total Award Status Notes Award Notes  No Bid
8 Pump, submersible, non- GPM 50 at 15-ft. head, 2" NPT 6225850-1722171 1-Each No SHEARER CHAMPION CPSE533 $882.00 $882.00 1/2HP 3 PH 230V
automatic, 1/2 HP, 230 discharge, cast iron construction, Purchase COMPANY/THE 50GPM@15TDH
volt, 3 phase, non-clogging vortex impeller, RANVIER GROUP
passes 2" spherical solids. Zoeller
F267 #267-0010 or equal.
9 Pump, submersible, non{ GPM 50 at 15-ft. head, 2" NPT 6225850-1722172 1-Each No CAPP INC ZOELLER 267-0041 $745.00 $745.00 Awarded
automatic, 1/2 HP, 460 | discharge, cast iron construction, Purchase
volt, 3 phase, non-clogging vortex impeller,
passes 2" spherical solids. Zoeller
G267 #267-0041 or equal.
9 Pump, submersible, non{ GPM 50 at 15-ft. head, 2" NPT 6225850-1722172 1-Each No SHEARER CHAMPION CPSE543 $882.00 $882.00 1/2HP 3 PH 460V
automatic, 1/2 HP, 460 | discharge, cast iron construction, Purchase COMPANY/THE 50GPM@15TDH
volt, 3 phase, non-clogging vortex impeller, RANVIER GROUP
passes 2" spherical solids. Zoeller
G267 #267-0041 or equal.
10 Pump, submersible, non- GPM 168 at 20-ft. head, 3" 6225850-1718481 1-Each No SHEARER CHAMPION CPSEV2033 $1,424.00 $1,424.00 Awarded 2HP 208V 3P
automatic, 2 HP, 200- flanged vertical discharge, cast Purchase COMPANY/THE 175PM@20TDH 3"
208 volt, 3 phase, iron body, non-clogging bronze RANVIER GROUP VERTOCAL FLANGE
vortex impeller, passes 2"
spherical solids. Zoeller J295
#395-0008 or equal.
10 Pump, submersible, non-  GPM 168 at 20-ft. head, 3" 6225850-1718481 1- Each No CAPP INC ZOELLER 395-0008 $1,887.00  $1,887.00
automatic, 2 HP, 200-  flanged vertical discharge, cast Purchase
208 volt, 3 phase, iron body, non-clogging bronze
vortex impeller, passes 2"
spherical solids. Zoeller J295
#395-0008 or equal.
11 Pump, submersible, non GPM 168 at 20-ft. head, 3" 6225850-2008834 1-Each No SHEARER CHAMPION CPSEV2033 $1,424.00 $1,424.00 Awarded 2HP 230V 3P
automatic, 2 HP, 230 flanged vertical discharge, cast Purchase COMPANY/THE 175GPM@20TDH 3"
volt, 3 phase, iron body, non-clogging bronze RANVIER GROUP VERTICAL FLANGE
vortex impeller, passes 2"
spherical solids. Zoeller F295
#395-0006 or equal.
11 Pump, submersible, non GPM 168 at 20-ft. head, 3" 6225850-2008834 1-Each No CAPP INC ZOELLER 395-0006 $1,976.00 $1,976.00
automatic, 2 HP, 230 flanged vertical discharge, cast Purchase

volt, 3 phase,

iron body, non-clogging bronze
vortex impeller, passes 2"
spherical solids. Zoeller F295
#395-0006 or equal.




Item
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Number Item Service Description Commodity Code uom quired pplier Name MFG Provider ~ MFG Provider Part  Bid Price Bid Total Award Status Notes Award Notes  No Bid
12 Pump, submersible, non- GPM 168 at 20-ft. head, 3" 6225850-2012195 1-Each No SHEARER CHAMPION CPSEV2022 $1,245.00 $1,245.00 Awarded 2HP 230V 1P
automatic, 2 HP, 230 flanged vertical discharge, cast Purchase COMPANY/THE 175GPM@20TDH 3"
volt, single phase, iron body, non-clogging bronze RANVIER GROUP VERTICAL FLANGE
vortex impeller, passes 2"
spherical solids. Zoeller E295
#395-0004 or equal.
12 Pump, submersible, non- GPM 168 at 20-ft. head, 3" 6225850-2012195 1-Each No CAPP INC ZOELLER 395-0004 $1,773.00 $1,773.00
automatic, 2 HP, 230 flanged vertical discharge, cast Purchase
volt, single phase, iron body, non-clogging bronze
vortex impeller, passes 2"
spherical solids. Zoeller E295
#395-0004 or equal.
13 Pump, submersible, non GPM 168 at 20-ft. head, 3" 6225850-1722174 1-Each No SHEARER CHAMPION CPSE2043 $1,410.00 $1,410.00 Awarded 2HP 460V 3P
automatic, 2 HP, 460 flanged vertical discharge, cast Purchase COMPANY/THE 175GPM@20TDH 3"
volt, 3 phase, iron body, non-clogging bronze RANVIER GROUP VERTICAL FLANGE
vortex impeller, passes 2"
spherical solids. Zoeller G295
#395-0007 or equal.
13 Pump, submersible, non GPM 168 at 20-ft. head, 3" 6225850-1722174 1-Each No CAPP INC ZOELLER 395-0007 $1,879.00 $1,879.00
automatic, 2 HP, 460 flanged vertical discharge, cast Purchase
volt, 3 phase, iron body, non-clogging bronze
vortex impeller, passes 2"
spherical solids. Zoeller G295
#395-0007 or equal.
14 Pump, submersible, non- GPM 250 at 20-ft. head, 4" 6225850-2013057 1-Each No CAPP INC ZOELLER 405-0009 $2,858.00 $2,858.00 Awarded
automatic, 3 HP, 460  flanged horizontal discharge, cast Purchase
volt, 3 phase, iron construction, non-clogging
vortex impeller, passes 3"
spherical solids. Zoeller G405
#405-0009 or equal.
14 Pump, submersible, non- GPM 250 at 20-ft. head, 4" 6225850-2013057 1-Each No SHEARER CHAMPION CP4SE204DS $4,724.00 $4,724.00 2HP 460V 3P
automatic, 3 HP, 460  flanged horizontal discharge, cast Purchase COMPANY/THE 250GPM@25TDH 4"
volt, 3 phase, iron construction, non-clogging

vortex impeller, passes 3"
spherical solids. Zoeller G405
#405-0009 or equal.

RANVIER GROUP

HORIZONTAL DSICHARGE
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