Jefferson County Public Schools
. .
Bid Tabulation
Event Name: PRINTING: 2023-2024 CODE OF ACCEPTABLE BEHAVIOR
Event ID: JCPS-8234
Approval Date: June 6, 2023
Date Bids Received: May 11, 2023
Contract Period: June 6, 2023 through May 31, 2024
Renewals: No renewal option. ‘ ‘
Comments: The Board has opted to award Item No. 4. Award Status indicates an award.
Item Sample Vendor Response Item
Number Item Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Supplier Name MFG Provider MFG Provider Part Bid Price Bid Total Award Status Notes No Bid Award Notes
1 Printing, 40 pages plus | As per specifications. Please respond to the | 4600548-1714169 1-Each 105000 No V.G. Reed & Sons, Inc | V.G. Reed NA $0.34 $35,332.50 $311.60 per additional
cover (10 sheets of text | following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 1,000 regardless of
paper plus 1 cover | NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies additional quantity
sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per ordered.
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
1 Printing, 40 pages plus | As per specifications. Please respond to the | 4600548-1714169 1-Each 105000 No K.K. Stevens Publishing KKSPC 40 plus Cover $0.35 $37,023.00 1,000=$2,379.92
cover (10 sheets of text | following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 2,500=52,975.26
paper plus 1 cover | NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies 5,000=$3,897.72
sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
1 Printing, 40 pages plus | As per specifications. Please respond to the | 4600548-1714169 1-Each 105000 No Vivid Impact Vivid Impact $266,620.00 $0.55 $57,718.50
cover (10 sheets of text | following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase Corporation
paper plus 1 cover | NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies
sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
2 Printing, 44 pages plus  As per specifications. Please respond to the 1- Each 105000 No K.K. Stevens Publishing KKSPC 44 plus Cover $0.37 $39,291.00 1,000=52,523.33
cover (11 sheets of text ~ following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 2,500=5$3,160.02

paper plus 1 cover
sheet).

NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies
if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.

5,000=54,143.86




Item Sample Vendor Response Item
Number Item Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Supplier Name MFG Provider MFG Provider Part Bid Price Bid Total Award Status Notes No Bid Award Notes
2 Printing, 44 pages plus  As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No V.G. Reed & Sons, Inc V.G. Reed NA $0.38 $39,595.50 $348.87 per additional
cover (11 sheets of text ~ following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 1,000 regardless of
paper plus 1 cover  NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies additional quantity
sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per ordered.
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
2 Printing, 44 pages plus  As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No Vivid Impact Vivid Impact $266,623.00 $0.62 $65,184.00
cover (11 sheets of text ~ following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase Corporation
paper plus 1 cover  NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies
sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
3 Printing, 48 pages plus | As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No V.G. Reed & Sons, Inc V.G. Reed NA $0.36 $37,800.00 $335.94 per additional
cover (12 sheets of text | following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 1,000 regardless of
paper plus 1 cover | NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies additional quantity
sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per ordered.
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
3 Printing, 48 pages plus | As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No K.K. Stevens Publishing KKSPC 48 plus Cover $0.38 $39,900.00 1,000=2,437.09
cover (12 sheets of text | following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 2,500=$3,073.73
paper plus 1 cover | NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies 5,000=54,064.73
sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
3 Printing, 48 pages plus | As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No Vivid Impact Vivid Impact $266,624.00 $0.64 $67,462.50
cover (12 sheets of text | following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase Corporation
paper plus 1 cover | NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies
sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
4 Printing, 52 pages plus  As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No K.K. Stevens Publishing KKSPC 52 plus Cover $0.41 $42,525.00 Awarded 1,000=$2,734.90 The Board has
cover (13 sheets of text ~ following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 2,500=$3,420.04 opted to award

paper plus 1 cover
sheet).

NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies
if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.

5,000=54,481.18

Item No. 4.




Item Sample Vendor Response Item
Number Item Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Supplier Name MFG Provider MFG Provider Part Bid Price Bid Total Award Status Notes No Bid Award Notes
4 Printing, 52 pages plus  As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No V.G. Reed & Sons, Inc V.G. Reed NA $0.42 $44,100.00 $389.41 per additional The Board has
cover (13 sheets of text  following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 1,000 regardless of opted to award
paper plus 1 cover  NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies additional quantity Item No. 4.
sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per ordered.
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
4 Printing, 52 pages plus  As per specifications. Please respond to the 1- Each 105000 No Vivid Impact Vivid Impact $266,626.00 $0.66 $69,373.50 The Board has
cover (13 sheets of text  following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase Corporation opted to award
paper plus 1 cover  NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies Item No. 4.
sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
5 Printing, 56 pages plus | As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No V.G. Reed & Sons, Inc V.G. Reed NA $0.39 $40,635.00 $358.83 per additional
cover (14 sheets of text | following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 1,000 regardless of
paper plus 1 cover | NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies additional quantity
sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per ordered.
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
5 Printing, 56 pages plus | As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No K.K. Stevens Publishing KKSPC 56 plus Cover $0.41 $43,081.50 1,000=52,633.08
cover (14 sheets of text | following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 2,500=$3,317.28
paper plus 1 cover | NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies 5,000=$4,384.49
sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
5 Printing, 56 pages plus | As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No Vivid Impact Vivid Impact $266,631.00 $0.70 $73,258.50
cover (14 sheets of text | following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase Corporation
paper plus 1 cover | NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies
sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
6 Printing, 40 pages plus  As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No V.G. Reed & Sons, Inc V.G. Reed NA $0.34 $35,700.00 $311.60 per additional
cover (10 sheets of text  following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 1,000 regardless of

paper plus 2 sided
cover sheet).

NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies
if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.

additional quantity
ordered.




Item Sample Vendor Response Item
Number Item Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Supplier Name MFG Provider MFG Provider Part Bid Price Bid Total Award Status Notes No Bid Award Notes
6 Printing, 40 pages plus  As per specifications. Please respond to the 1- Each 105000 No K.K. Stevens Publishing KKSPC 40 plus Cover $0.36 $38,020.50 1,000=52,491.47
cover (10 sheets of text ~ following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 2,500=53,098.31
paper plus 2 sided  NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies 5,000=54,047.22
cover sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
6 Printing, 40 pages plus  As per specifications. Please respond to the 1- Each 105000 No Vivid Impact Vivid Impact $266,621.00 $0.56 $58,800.00
cover (10 sheets of text  following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase Corporation
paper plus 2 sided  NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies
cover sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
7 Printing, 44 pages plus | As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No V.G. Reed & Sons, Inc | V.G. Reed NA $0.38 $39,900.00 $348.87 per additional
cover (11 sheets of text | following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 1,000 regardless of
paper plus 2 sided | NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies additional quantity
cover sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per ordered.
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
7 Printing, 44 pages plus | As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No K.K. Stevens Publishing KKSPC 44 plus Cover $0.38 $40,299.00 1,000=5$2,634.88
cover (11 sheets of text | following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 2,500=$3,283.07
paper plus 2 sided NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies 5,000=$4,293.36
cover sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
7 Printing, 44 pages plus | As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No Vivid Impact Vivid Impact $266,622.00 $0.63 $66,276.00
cover (11 sheets of text | following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase Corporation
paper plus 2 sided | NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies
cover sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
8 Printing, 48 pages plus  As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No V.G. Reed & Sons, Inc V.G. Reed NA $0.37 $38,850.00 $335.94 per additional
cover (12 sheets of text ~ following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 1,000 regardless of

paper plus 2 sided
cover sheet).

NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies
if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.

additional quantity
ordered.




Item Sample Vendor Response Item
Number Item Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Supplier Name MFG Provider MFG Provider Part Bid Price Bid Total Award Status Notes No Bid Award Notes
8 Printing, 48 pages plus  As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No K.K. Stevens Publishing KKSPC 48 plus Cover $0.39 $40,897.50 1,000=52,548.64
cover (12 sheets of text  following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 2,500=$3,196.78
paper plus 2 sided NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies 5,000=54,214.23
cover sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
8 Printing, 48 pages plus  As per specifications. Please respond to the 1- Each 105000 No Vivid Impact Vivid Impact $266,625.00 $0.66 $68,953.50
cover (12 sheets of text  following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase Corporation
paper plus 2 sided NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies
cover sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
9 Printing, 52 pages plus | As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No K.K. Stevens Publishing KKSPC 52 plus Cover $0.41 $43,512.00 1,000=5$2,846.45
cover (13 sheets of text | following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 2,500=5$3,543.09
paper plus 2 sided NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies 5,000=54,630.68
cover sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
9 Printing, 52 pages plus | As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No V.G. Reed & Sons, Inc V.G. Reed NA $0.43 $45,150.00 $389.41 per additional
cover (13 sheets of text | following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 1,000 regardless of
paper plus 2 sided NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies additional quantity
cover sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per ordered.
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
9 Printing, 52 pages plus | As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No Vivid Impact Vivid Impact $266,627.00 $0.67 $70,444.50
cover (13 sheets of text | following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase Corporation
paper plus 2 sided NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies
cover sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
10 Printing, 56 pages plus  As per specifications. Please respond to the 1- Each 105000 No V.G. Reed & Sons, Inc ~ V.G. Reed NA $0.39 $40,950.00 $358.83 per additional
cover (14 sheets of text  following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 1,000 regardless of

paper plus 2 sided
cover sheet).

NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies
if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.

additional quantity
ordered.




Item Sample Vendor Response Item
Number Item Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Supplier Name MFG Provider MFG Provider Part Bid Price Bid Total Award Status Notes No Bid Award Notes
10 Printing, 56 pages plus  As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No K.K. Stevens Publishing KKSPC 56 plus Cover $0.42 $44,079.00 1,000=52,744.63
cover (14 sheets of text  following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase 2,500=5$3,440.33
paper plus 2 sided NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies 5,000=54,533.99
cover sheet). if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
10 Printing, 56 pages plus  As per specifications. Please respond to the 1-Each 105000 No Vivid Impact Vivid Impact $266,632.00 $0.71 $74,350.50
cover (14 sheets of text  following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM Purchase Corporation

paper plus 2 sided
cover sheet).

NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies
if ordered after initial quantity. Price per
additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial
quantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if
ordered after initial quantity.
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