Jefferson County Public Schools

Bid Tabulation

Event Name: UNIFORM & FLOOR MAT RENTAL (SCNS)

Event ID: JCPS-8222

Approval Date: May 23, 2023

Date Bids Received: April 27, 2023

Contract Period: July 1, 2023 through June 30, 2024

Renewals: Two (2) annual renewals at the option of both parties.

Comments: Awarded to Cintas.

Lot Item MFG / Vendor
Number Sample Provider Part  Unit Bid Response Item
1-49 Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name  MFG / Provider Number Price Total Price Award Status Notes No Bid Award Notes
1 Shirt, navy, 65/35 poly/cotton with 262-day employee cost for "average sizes" including all charges. | 4600649-1729326 | 1 - Each 1 Yes Cintas Cintas 675 $0.17 $0.17 Awarded
gripper front closure, no buttons, extra |Bid price per week. APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #675 OR EQUAL. Purchase
long body, no pockets, collarless, SAMPLE REQUIRED.
hemmed short sleeve.
2 Shirt, navy, 65/35 poly/cotton with 262-day employee cost for "oversizes" including all charges. Bid 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 675 $0.17 $0.17 Awarded
gripper front closure, no buttons, extra price per week. APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #675 OR EQUAL. Purchase
long body, no pockets, collarless,
hemmed short sleeve.
3 Shirt, navy, 65/35 poly/cotton with 188-day employee cost for "average sizes" including all charges. 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 675 $0.17 $0.17 Awarded
gripper front closure, no buttons, extra |Bid price per week. APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #675 OR EQUAL. Purchase
long body, no pockets, collarless,
hemmed short sleeve.
4 Shirt, navy, 65/35 poly/cotton with 188-day employee cost for "oversizes" including all charges. Bid 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 675 $0.17 $0.17 Awarded
gripper front closure, no buttons, extra price per week. APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #675 OR EQUAL. Purchase
long body, no pockets, collarless,
hemmed short sleeve.
5 Shirt, navy, 65/35 poly/cotton with First year loss charge for Item Nos. 1 thru 4. APPROVED PRODUCT: 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 675 $22.40 $22.40 Awarded
gripper front closure, no buttons, extra CINTAS #675 OR EQUAL. Purchase
long body, no pockets, collarless,
hemmed short sleeve.
6 Trousers, specialized, men, white, 7 1/2  post cure durable press, heavy-duty brass ratcheting zipper, hook 1-Each 1 Yes Cintas Cintas 945 $0.22 $0.22 Awarded
oz. twill, 65% polyester, 35% combed and eye closure, two slack style front pockets, two set-in hip Purchase
cotton, pockets, darts over hip pockets for better fit, no button closure on
hip pockets, belt loops. 262-day employee cost for "average sizes"
including all charges. Bid price per week. APPROVED PRODUCT:
CINTAS #945 OR EQUAL. SAMPLE REQUIRED.
7 Trousers, specialized, men, white, 7 1/2 | post cure durable press, heavy-duty brass ratcheting zipper, hook 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 945 $0.22 $0.22 Awarded
oz. twill, 65% polyester, 35% combed and eye closure, two slack style front pockets, two set-in hip Purchase

cotton,

pockets, darts over hip pockets for better fit, no button closure on
hip pockets, belt loops. 262-day employee cost for "oversizes"
including all charges. Bid price per week. APPROVED PRODUCT:
CINTAS #945 OR EQUAL.




Lot Item MFG / Vendor
Number Sample Provider Part  Unit Bid Response Item
1-49 Item/Service Description Commodity Code UOM  Quantity Required Vendor Name  MFG / Provider Number Price Total Price Award Status Notes No Bid Award Notes
8 Trousers, specialized, men, white, 7 1/2  post cure durable press, heavy-duty brass ratcheting zipper, hook 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 945 $0.22 $0.22 Awarded
oz. twill, 65% polyester, 35% combed and eye closure, two slack style front pockets, two set-in hip Purchase
cotton, pockets, darts over hip pockets for better fit, no button closure on
hip pockets, belt loops. 188-day employee cost for "average sizes"
including all charges. Bid price per week. APPROVED PRODUCT:
CINTAS #945 OR EQUAL.
9 Trousers, specialized, men, white, 7 1/2 | post cure durable press, heavy-duty brass ratcheting zipper, hook 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 945 $0.22 $0.22 Awarded
oz. twill, 65% polyester, 35% combed and eye closure, two slack style front pockets, two set-in hip Purchase
cotton, pockets, darts over hip pockets for better fit, no button closure on
hip pockets, belt loops. 188-day employee cost for "oversizes"
including all charges. Bid price per week. APPROVED PRODUCT:
CINTAS #945 OR EQUAL.
10 Trousers, specialized, men, white, 7 1/2  post cure durable press, heavy-duty brass ratcheting zipper, hook 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 945 $27.49 $27.49 Awarded
oz. twill, 65% polyester, 35% combed and eye closure, two slack style front pockets, two set-in hip Purchase
cotton, pockets, darts over hip pockets for better fit, no button closure on
hip pockets, belt loops. First year loss charge for Item Nos. 6 thru
9. APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #945 OR EQUAL.
11 Trousers, specialized, women, white, 7 side elastic waist trousers, post cure durable press, heavy-duty 1-Each 1 Yes Cintas Cintas 390 $0.24 $0.24 Awarded
1/2 oz. twill, 65% polyester, 35% combed brass ratcheting zipper, hook and eye closure, self fabric Purchase
cotton, waistband, side elastic waist inserts, two slack style front pockets,
no button closure on hip pockets. 262-day employee cost for
"average sizes" including all charges. Bid price per week.
APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #390 OR EQUAL. SAMPLE
REQUIRED.
12 Trousers, specialized, women, white, 7 side elastic waist trousers, post cure durable press, heavy-duty 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 390 $0.24 $0.24 Awarded
1/2 oz. twill, 65% polyester, 35% combed brass ratcheting zipper, hook and eye closure, self fabric Purchase
cotton, waistband, side elastic waist inserts, two slack style front pockets,
no button closure on hip pockets. 262-day employee cost for
"oversizes" including all charges. Bid price per week. APPROVED
PRODUCT: CINTAS #390 OR EQUAL.
13 Trousers, specialized, women, white, 7 side elastic waist trousers, post cure durable press, heavy-duty 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 390 $0.24 $0.24 Awarded
1/2 oz. twill, 65% polyester, 35% combed brass ratcheting zipper, hook and eye closure, self fabric Purchase
cotton, waistband, side elastic waist inserts, two slack style front pockets,
no button closure on hip pockets. 188-day employee cost for
"average sizes" including all charges. Bid price per week.
APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #390 OR EQUAL.
14 Trousers, specialized, women, white, 7 side elastic waist trousers, post cure durable press, heavy-duty 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 390 $0.24 $0.24 Awarded
1/2 oz. twill, 65% polyester, 35% combed brass ratcheting zipper, hook and eye closure, self fabric Purchase
cotton, waistband, side elastic waist inserts, two slack style front pockets,
no button closure on hip pockets. 188-day employee cost for
"oversizes" including all charges. Bid price per week. APPROVED
PRODUCT: CINTAS #390 OR EQUAL.
15 Trousers, specialized, women, white, 7 side elastic waist trousers, post cure durable press, heavy-duty 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 390 $28.50 $28.50 Awarded
1/2 oz. twill, 65% polyester, 35% combed brass ratcheting zipper, hook and eye closure, self fabric Purchase

cotton, waistband, side elastic waist inserts, two slack style front pockets,
no button closure on hip pockets. First year loss charge for Item

Nos. 11 thru 14. APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #390 OR EQUAL.




Lot Item MFG / Vendor
Number Sample Provider Part  Unit Bid Response Item
1-49 Item/Service Description Commodity Code UOM  Quantity Required Vendor Name  MFG / Provider Number Price Total Price Award Status Notes No Bid Award Notes
16 Shirt, specialized, light blue, 4 1/2 0z.  pre-cure durable press finish with soil release. Seven gripper front 1-Each 1 Yes Cintas Cintas 65493 $0.17 $0.17 Awarded item code
TouchTex poplin, 65% polyester, 35% closures, two-piece, lined, sewn-in stays collar. One-piece, fully Purchase changed to 833
cotton, lined, gripper closure cuffs. Stitched down front facing, two-piece
yoke, no pockets, short sleeve. 262-day employee cost for
"average sizes" including all charges. Bid price per week.
APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #65493 OR EQUAL. SAMPLE
REQUIRED.
17 Shirt, specialized, light blue, 4 1/2 oz. | pre-cure durable press finish with soil release. Seven gripper front 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 65493 $0.17 $0.17 Awarded item code
TouchTex poplin, 65% polyester, 35% closures, two-piece, lined, sewn-in stays collar. One-piece, fully Purchase changed to 833
cotton, lined, gripper closure cuffs. Stitched down front facing, two-piece
yoke, no pockets, short sleeve. 262-day employee cost for
"oversizes" including all charges. Bid price per week. APPROVED
PRODUCT: CINTAS #65493 OR EQUAL.
18 Shirt, specialized, light blue, 4 1/2 0z.  pre-cure durable press finish with soil release. Seven gripper front 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 65493 $0.17 $0.17 Awarded item code
TouchTex poplin, 65% polyester, 35% closures, two-piece, lined, sewn-in stays collar. One-piece, fully Purchase changed to 833
cotton, lined, gripper closure cuffs. Stitched down front facing, two-piece
yoke, no pockets, short sleeve. 220-day employee cost for
"average sizes" including all charges. Bid price per week.
APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #65493 OR EQUAL.
19 Shirt, specialized, light blue, 4 1/2 oz. | pre-cure durable press finish with soil release. Seven gripper front 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 65493 $0.17 $0.17 Awarded item code
TouchTex poplin, 65% polyester, 35% closures, two-piece, lined, sewn-in stays collar. One-piece, fully Purchase changed to 833
cotton, lined, gripper closure cuffs. Stitched down front facing, two-piece
yoke, no pockets, short sleeve. 220-day employee cost for
"oversizes" including all charges. Bid price per week. APPROVED
PRODUCT: CINTAS #65493 OR EQUAL.
20 Shirt, specialized, light blue, 4 1/2 0oz.  pre-cure durable press finish with soil release. Seven gripper front 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 65493 $27.49 $27.49 Awarded item code
TouchTex poplin, 65% polyester, 35% closures, two-piece, lined, sewn-in stays collar. One-piece, fully Purchase changed to 833
cotton, lined, gripper closure cuffs. Stitched down front facing, two-piece
yoke, no pockets, short sleeve. First year loss charge for Item Nos.
16 thru 19. APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #65493 OR EQUAL.
21 Trousers, industrial, men, navy, 8 1/4 oz. | post-cure durable press finish. Heavy duty brass ratcheting zipper. 1-Each 1 Yes Cintas Cintas 945 $0.22 $0.22 Awarded
TouchTex twill, 65% polyester, 35% Innerlined waistband, synthetic blend trim. Two slack front style Purchase
cotton, pockets, darts over hip pockets for better fit. Slight taper. 262-day
employee cost for "average sizes" including all charges. Bid price
per week. APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #945 OR EQUAL. SAMPLE
REQUIRED.
22 Trousers, industrial, men, navy, 8 1/4 oz. post-cure durable press finish. Heavy duty brass ratcheting zipper. 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 945 $0.22 $0.22 Awarded
TouchTex twill, 65% polyester, 35% Innerlined waistband, synthetic blend trim. Two slack front style Purchase
cotton, pockets, darts over hip pockets for better fit. Slight taper. 262-day
employee cost for "oversizes" including all charges. Bid price per
week. APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #945 OR EQUAL.
23 Trousers, industrial, men, navy, 8 1/4 oz. | post-cure durable press finish. Heavy duty brass ratcheting zipper. 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 945 $0.22 $0.22 Awarded
TouchTex twill, 65% polyester, 35% Innerlined waistband, synthetic blend trim. Two slack front style Purchase

cotton,

pockets, darts over hip pockets for better fit. Slight taper. 220-day
employee cost for "average sizes" including all charges. Bid price
per week. APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #945 OR EQUAL.




Lot Item MFG / Vendor
Number Sample Provider Part  Unit Bid Response Item
1-49 Item/Service Description Commodity Code UOM  Quantity Required Vendor Name  MFG / Provider Number Price Total Price Award Status Notes No Bid Award Notes
24 Trousers, industrial, men, navy, 8 1/4 oz. post-cure durable press finish. Heavy duty brass ratcheting zipper. 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 945 $0.22 $0.22 Awarded
TouchTex twill, 65% polyester, 35% Innerlined waistband, synthetic blend trim. Two slack front style Purchase
cotton, pockets, darts over hip pockets for better fit. Slight taper. 220-day
employee cost for "oversizes" including all charges. Bid price per
week. APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #945 OR EQUAL.
25 Trousers, industrial, men, navy, 8 1/4 oz. | post-cure durable press finish. Heavy duty brass ratcheting zipper. 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 945 $27.49 $27.49 Awarded
TouchTex twill, 65% polyester, 35% Innerlined waistband, synthetic blend trim. Two slack front style Purchase
cotton, pockets, darts over hip pockets for better fit. Slight taper. First
year loss charge for Item Nos. 21 thru 24. APPROVED PRODUCT:
CINTAS #945 OR EQUAL.
26 Shirt, specialized performance knit, no  50% cotton with soil release. Gripper line placket closure. Ribbed 1-Each 1 Yes Cintas Cintas 65493 $0.22 $0.22 Awarded
pockets, white, 5 1/2 oz. jersey knit, 50%  knit collar, oversize fit, superior shrinkage control, short sleeve. Purchase
polyester, 262-day employee cost for "average sizes" including all charges.
Bid price per week. APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #65493 OR
EQUAL. SAMPLE REQUIRED.
27 Shirt, specialized performance knit, no | 50% cotton with soil release. Gripper line placket closure. Ribbed 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 65493 $0.22 $0.22 Awarded
pockets, white, 5 1/2 oz. jersey knit, 50% | knit collar, oversize fit, superior shrinkage control, short sleeve. Purchase
polyester, 262-day employee cost for "oversizes" including all charges. Bid
price per week. APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #65493 OR EQUAL.
28 Shirt, specialized performance knit, no  50% cotton with soil release. Gripper line placket closure. Ribbed 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 65493 $27.49 $27.49 Awarded
pockets, white, 5 1/2 oz. jersey knit, 50%  knit collar, oversize fit, superior shrinkage control, short sleeve. Purchase
polyester, First year loss charge for Item Nos. 26 thru 27. APPROVED
PRODUCT: CINTAS #65493 OR EQUAL.
29 Trousers, pleated, industrial, men and 35% cotton, post-cure durable press finish. Heavy duty brass 1-Each 1 Yes Cintas Cintas 865 $0.22 $0.22 Awarded
women, khaki, 7 1/2 oz. TouchTex twill, ratcheting zipper. Innerlined waistband, folder set band with Purchase
65% polyester, outlet. Two slack style front pockets, two set-in hip pockets, darts
over hip pockets for better fit. 262-day employee cost for "average
sizes" including all charges. Bid price per week. APPROVED
PRODUCT: CINTAS #865 OR EQUAL. SAMPLE REQUIRED.
30 Trousers, pleated, industrial, men and 35% cotton, post-cure durable press finish. Heavy duty brass 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 865 $0.22 $0.22 Awarded
women, khaki, 7 1/2 oz. TouchTex twill, ratcheting zipper. Innerlined waistband, folder set band with Purchase
65% polyester, outlet. Two slack style front pockets, two set-in hip pockets, darts
over hip pockets for better fit. 262-day employee cost for for
"oversizes" including all charges. Bid price per week. APPROVED
PRODUCT: CINTAS #865 OR EQUAL.
31 Trousers, pleated, industrial, men and 35% cotton, post-cure durable press finish. Heavy duty brass 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 865 $27.49 $27.49 Awarded
women, khaki, 7 1/2 oz. TouchTex twill, ratcheting zipper. Innerlined waistband, folder set band with Purchase
65% polyester, outlet. Two slack style front pockets, two set-in hip pockets, darts
over hip pockets for better fit. First year loss charge for Item Nos.
29 thru 30. APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #865 OR EQUAL.
32 Coat, butcher, white, 7 oz. spun One patch inside breast pocket, two lower patch pockets. Side 1-Each 1 Yes Cintas Cintas 82496 $0.32 $0.32 Awarded
polyester fabric, with Soil Release Finish. vent openings at waist. Six heavy duty snap closures. One piece Purchase

collar, cut on front facings to form lapel. One piece back. 262-day
employee cost for "average sizes" including all charges. Bid price
per week. APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #82496 OR EQUAL.
SAMPLE REQUIRED.




Lot Item MFG / Vendor
Number Sample Provider Part  Unit Bid Response Item
1-49 Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name  MFG / Provider Number Price Total Price Award Status Notes No Bid Award Notes
33 Coat, butcher, white, 7 oz. spun One patch inside breast pocket, two lower patch pockets. Side 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 82496 $0.32 $0.32 Awarded
polyester fabric, with Soil Release Finish. | vent openings at waist. Six heavy duty snap closures. One piece Purchase
collar, cut on front facings to form lapel. One piece back. 262-day
employee cost for "oversizes" including all charges. Bid price per
week. APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #82496 OR EQUAL.
34 Coat, butcher, white, 7 oz. spun One patch inside breast pocket, two lower patch pockets. Side 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 82496 $30.54 $30.54 Awarded
polyester fabric, with Soil Release Finish. vent openings at waist. Six heavy duty snap closures. One piece Purchase
collar, cut on front facings to form lapel. One piece back. First
year loss charge for Item Nos. 32 thru 33. APPROVED PRODUCT:
CINTAS #82496 OR EQUAL.
35 Jacket, navy, 7 1/2 oz. twill, 65% Solid brass zipper, collar, cuffs and waistband 100% polyester 1 x 1 1-Each 1 Yes Cintas Cintas 677 $0.44 $0.44 Awarded
polyester, 35% combed cotton, with pre-| rib knit. Welted slash pockets and utility pocket on left sleeve. Purchase
cure durable press finish. Permanently lined black 100% nylon taffeta quilted to a 3.3 ounce
1/8" polyester foam. 262-day employee cost for "average sizes"
including all charges. Bid price per week. APPROVED PRODUCT:
CINTAS #677 OR EQUAL. SAMPLE REQUIRED.
36 Jacket, navy, 7 1/2 oz. twill, 65% Solid brass zipper, collar, cuffs and waistband 100% polyester 1 x 1 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 677 $0.44 $0.44 Awarded
polyester, 35% combed cotton, with pre-  rib knit. Welted slash pockets and utility pocket on left sleeve. Purchase
cure durable press finish. Permanently lined black 100% nylon taffeta quilted to a 3.3 ounce
1/8" polyester foam. 262-day employee cost for "oversizes"
including all charges. Bid price per week. APPROVED PRODUCT:
CINTAS #677 OR EQUAL.
37 Jacket, navy, 7 1/2 oz. twill, 65% Solid brass zipper, collar, cuffs and waistband 100% polyester 1 x 1 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 677 $0.44 $0.44 Awarded
polyester, 35% combed cotton, with pre-| rib knit. Welted slash pockets and utility pocket on left sleeve. Purchase
cure durable press finish. Permanently lined black 100% nylon taffeta quilted to a 3.3 ounce
1/8" polyester foam. 220-day employee cost for "average sizes"
including all charges. Bid price per week. APPROVED PRODUCT:
CINTAS #677 OR EQUAL.
38 Jacket, navy, 7 1/2 oz. twill, 65% Solid brass zipper, collar, cuffs and waistband 100% polyester 1 x 1 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 677 $0.44 $0.44 Awarded
polyester, 35% combed cotton, with pre-  rib knit. Welted slash pockets and utility pocket on left sleeve. Purchase
cure durable press finish. Permanently lined black 100% nylon taffeta quilted to a 3.3 ounce
1/8" polyester foam. 220-day employee cost for "oversizes"
including all charges. Bid price per week. APPROVED PRODUCT:
CINTAS #677 OR EQUAL.
39 Jacket, navy, 7 1/2 oz. twill, 65% Solid brass zipper, collar, cuffs and waistband 100% polyester 1 x 1 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 677 $0.44 $0.44 Awarded
polyester, 35% combed cotton, with pre-| rib knit. Welted slash pockets and utility pocket on left sleeve. Purchase
cure durable press finish. Permanently lined black 100% nylon taffeta quilted to a 3.3 ounce
1/8" polyester foam. 188-day employee cost for "average sizes"
including all charges. Bid price per week. APPROVED PRODUCT:
CINTAS #677 OR EQUAL.
40 Jacket, navy, 7 1/2 oz. twill, 65% Solid brass zipper, collar, cuffs and waistband 100% polyester 1 x 1 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 677 $0.44 $0.44 Awarded
polyester, 35% combed cotton, with pre-  rib knit. Welted slash pockets and utility pocket on left sleeve. Purchase
cure durable press finish. Permanently lined black 100% nylon taffeta quilted to a 3.3 ounce
1/8" polyester foam. 188-day employee cost for "oversizes"
including all charges. Bid price per week. APPROVED PRODUCT:
CINTAS #677 OR EQUAL.
41 Jacket, navy, 7 1/2 oz. twill, 65% finish. Solid brass zipper, collar, cuffs and waistband 100% 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 677 $40.72 $40.72 Awarded
polyester, 35% combed cotton, with pre- | polyester 1 x 1 rib knit. Welted slash pockets and utility pocket on Purchase

cure durable press

left sleeve. Permanently lined black 100% nylon taffeta quilted to
a 3.3 ounce 1/8" polyester foam. First year loss charge for Item
Nos. 35 thru 40. APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #677 OR EQUAL.




Lot Item MFG / Vendor
Number Sample Provider Part  Unit Bid Response Item
1-49 Item/Service Description Commodity Code UOM  Quantity Required Vendor Name  MFG / Provider Number Price Total Price Award Status Notes No Bid Award Notes
42 Shorts, men's, dark blue, waist sizes 30" - Bid price per week. APPROVED PRODUCT: CINTAS #370 OR EQUAL. 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 370 $0.22 $0.22 Awarded
58", work trousers, permanent press, and Purchase
hemmed.
43 Shorts, men's, dark blue, waist sizes 30" - First year loss charge for Item No. 42. APPROVED PRODUCT: 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 370 $27.49 $27.49 Awarded
58", work trousers, permanent press, and CINTAS #370 OR EQUAL. Purchase
hemmed.
a4 Sizing Fee, per individual, to include 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 125 $2.50 $2.50 Awarded
sizing of all garments. Purchase
45 Mat, 3 x 5, washable mat with two kinds | Heatset fibers, color to be determined. Bid weekly rental charge. 1-Each 3 No Cintas Cintas 84335 $2.11 $6.33 Awarded
of scraping and wiping fibers, coarse and APPROVED PRODUCT: MILLENIAL MATS #84335 OR EQUAL. Purchase
fine nylon, on nitrile rubber backing. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: First year loss charge.
46 Mat, 4 x 6, washable mat with two kinds Heatset fibers, color to be determined. Bid weekly rental charge. 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 84435 $2.61 $2.61 Awarded
of scraping and wiping fibers, coarse and APPROVED PRODUCT: MILLENIAL MATS #84335 OR EQUAL. Purchase
fine nylon, on nitrile rubber backing. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: First year loss charge.
a7 Locker, garment, big 8-compartment Bid weekly rental charge. APPROVED PRODUCT: GEORGE O DAY 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 8000 $0.00 $0.00 Awarded 300
Change-O-Matic Lockable Lockers or | #8000. NOTE: Vendor is to provide literature to describe garment Purchase
equal. locker to be supplied. Please respond to the following in the
VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: First year loss charge.
48 Locker, soiled garment, standard laundry Bid weekly rental charge. NOTE: Vendor is to provide literature 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 8001 $0.00 $0.00 Awarded 250
lockup. to describe garment locker to be supplied. Please respond to the Purchase
following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: First year
loss charge.
49 Enviromental energy charge. Bid weekly rental charge. 1-Each 1 No Cintas Cintas 106 $0.00 $0.00 Awarded
Purchase
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