TO:

Members of the Hardin County Board of Education

FROM:

Nannette Johnston, Superintendent
SUBJECT:
FS-400 Milk Bid

DATE:

June 17, 2010

This is a decision paper
ISSUE:

We bid dairy products for school food service annually

FACTS:
We sent out bid requests to five different vendors.  We only received bids from four companies.

DISCUSSION:
Milk prices increased slightly compared to the 2009-10 school year as shown in the tabulation below. Our recommendation is shown by “***” beside recommended vendor. 

RECOMMENDED MOTION:










I move that we approve the Milk Bid as recommended. 



Goldenrod is the low bidder.




Effective July 1, 2010 through June 30, 2011

FS -400 Milk Bid

	FS-400 - 2010-2011 Milk Bid Tabulation - Part I
	

	ITEM
	 Southern Belle 
	 Haywood 
	 Goldenrod

*** 
	 Dean  
	 Prairie Farms 
	 Last year's prices 

	1/2 pt carton skim white milk
	 No Bid 
	      0.2600 
	            0.2010 
	      0.2100 
	            0.1950 
	        0.1925 

	1/2 pt carton 1% white milk
	 No Bid 
	      0.2715 
	            0.2040 
	      0.2150 
	            0.2050 
	        0.1975 

	1/2 pt carton 1% chocolate milk
	 No Bid 
	      0.2725 
	            0.2040 
	      0.2225 
	            0.2150 
	        0.2075 

	1/2 pt carton 1% strawberry milk
	 No Bid 
	      0.2750 
	 *FF .204 
	      0.2350 
	            0.2150 
	        0.2250 

	1/2 pt carton 1% vanilla milk
	 No Bid 
	 N/A 
	 *FF .204 
	      0.2350 
	            0.2150 
	        0.2250 

	1/2 pt carton 1% cookies 'n cream milk
	 No Bid 
	 N/A 
	 N/A 
	 N/A 
	 N/A 
	                -     

	1/2 pt carton lactose-free milk
	 No Bid 
	      0.6500 
	 N/A 
	      0.4800 
	            0.4100 
	        0.5500 

	1 gallon 2% LOW-FAT milk
	 No Bid 
	      3.5000 
	            3.1500 
	      3.2500 
	            3.0000 
	        3.2500 

	1 galllon WHOLE milk
	 No Bid 
	      3.7500 
	            3.3000 
	      3.3500 
	            3.1000 
	        3.4500 

	5# cottage cheese, Low-Fat
	 No Bid 
	      8.0000 
	            6.7500 
	      6.7500 
	            6.7500 
	        5.9000 

	Individual sour-cream, 200 ct
	 No Bid 
	N/A
	100 ct/10.45
	N/A
	100 ct/9.29
	0

	5# sour cream, low fat
	 No Bid 
	      8.0000 
	            6.3500 
	      6.2500 
	            5.7500 
	        4.6000 

	8 oz 100% orange juice
	 No Bid 
	 N/A 
	            0.2270 
	      0.2350 
	            0.1900 
	        0.1900 

	
	 No Bid 
	
	
	
	
	

	**Quart Dairy East Lactose Free
	
	
	            2.4500 
	
	
	

	**1/2 pt carton FF Skim Choc
	
	
	            0.2010 
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	


	FS400, 2010-2011 MILK BID TABULATION WORKSHEET
	
	

	
	per velocity 08/01/09 - 05/25/10
	Haywood Pricing
	Haywood - total amount of order
	Goldenrod Pricing

***
	Goldenrod - total amount of order
	Dean's Pricing
	Dean - total amount of order
	Prairie Farms Pricing
	Prairie Farms - total amount of order
	Current Bid Pricing - 2009-2010
	Total amount of order per current bid pricing

	1/2 pt carton skim white milk
	64735
	$0.2600 
	$16,831.10 
	$0.2010 
	$13,011.74 
	$0.2100 
	$13,594.35 
	$0.1950 
	$12,623.33 
	$0.1925 
	$12,461.49 

	1/2 pt carton 1% white milk
	476606
	$0.2715 
	$129,398.53 
	$0.2040 
	$97,227.62 
	$0.2150 
	$102,470.29 
	$0.2050 
	$97,704.23 
	$0.1975 
	$94,129.69 

	1/2 pt carton 1% chocolate milk
	1931362
	$0.2725 
	$526,296.15 
	$0.2040 
	$393,997.85 
	$0.2225 
	$429,728.05 
	$0.2150 
	$415,242.83 
	$0.2075 
	$400,757.62 

	1/2 pt carton 1% strawberry milk
	133527
	$0.2750 
	$36,719.93 
	$0.2040 
	$27,239.51 
	$0.2350 
	$31,378.85 
	$0.2150 
	$28,708.31 
	$0.2250 
	$30,043.58 

	1/2 pt carton 1% vanilla milk
	142953
	$0.2350 
	$33,593.96 
	$0.2040 
	$29,162.41 
	$0.2350 
	$33,593.96 
	$0.2150 
	$30,734.90 
	$0.2250 
	$32,164.43 

	1/2 pt carton 1% cookies 'n cream milk
	0
	$0.0000 
	$0.00 
	$0.0000 
	$0.00 
	$0.0000 
	$0.00 
	$0.0000 
	$0.00 
	$0.0000 
	$0.00 

	1/2 pt carton lactose-free milk
	60
	$0.6500 
	$39.00 
	$0.6500 
	$39.00 
	$0.4800 
	$28.80 
	$0.4100 
	$24.60 
	$0.5500 
	$33.00 

	1 gallon 2% LOW-FAT milk
	346
	$3.5000 
	$1,211.00 
	$3.1500 
	$1,089.90 
	$3.2500 
	$1,124.50 
	$3.0000 
	$1,038.00 
	$3.2500 
	$1,124.50 

	1 galllon WHOLE milk
	0
	$3.7500 
	$0.00 
	$3.3000 
	$0.00 
	$3.3500 
	$0.00 
	$3.1000 
	$0.00 
	$3.4500 
	$0.00 

	5# cottage cheese, Low-Fat
	489
	$8.0000 
	$3,912.00 
	$6.7500 
	$3,300.75 
	$6.7500 
	$3,300.75 
	$6.7500 
	$3,300.75 
	$5.9000 
	$2,885.10 

	Individual sour-cream, 200 ct
	0
	$0.0000 
	$0.00 
	$10.4500 
	$0.00 
	$0.0000 
	$0.00 
	$9.2900 
	$0.00 
	$0.0000 
	$0.00 

	5# sour cream, low fat
	3097
	$8.0000 
	$24,776.00 
	$6.3500 
	$19,665.95 
	$6.2500 
	$19,356.25 
	$5.7500 
	$17,807.75 
	$4.6000 
	$14,246.20 

	8 oz 100% orange juice
	285064
	$0.2350 
	$66,990.04 
	$0.2270 
	$64,709.53 
	$0.2350 
	$66,990.04 
	$0.1900 
	$54,162.16 
	$0.1900 
	$54,162.16 

	
	
	
	$839,767.69 
	
	$649,444.26 
	
	$701,565.83 
	
	$661,346.85 
	
	$642,007.75 


