June 17, 2010

THIS IS A DECISION PAPER

TO:

Members of Hardin County Board of Education

FROM:

Nannette Johnston, Superintendent

SUBJECT:
Oil/Lubricant & Antifreeze Bids

PROPOSAL:
Approve the lubricant & antifreeze bids as tabulated.

FACT A: 
Six oil companies bid on the annual lubricant & antifreeze contract for Hardin County Schools.

FACT B:
Apollo Oil, Key Oil, and A & M Oil have low bids as tabulated below.

RECOMMENDATION:   Approve the low bids as indicated on chart below.

RECOMMENDED MOTION:   I move that the Hardin County Board of Education approves the low bids from Apollo Oil, Key Oil, and A & M Oil as indicated on chart below for the duration of one year beginning July 1, 2010, and ending June 30, 2011.

	ITEM
	AMS

OIL
	APOLLO
	HYDROTEX
	KEY OIL

	NEWCOMB

OIL
	A & M

OIL

	15W40 Oil, per case of quarts

15W40 Oil, per case of gallons
	69.30

90.80
	33.73

31.93
	No Bid
	25.95
33.85
	34.50

34.50
	37.77

36.51

	15W40 Oil, bulk, per gallon
	No Bid
	6.40
	No Bid
	6.70
	No Bid
	9.62

	55-gal drum Dexacool

Red/Orange, per drum
	1273.00
	1193.18
	No Bid
	621.50
	No Bid
	1217.04

	55-gal drum antifreeze

Green, per drum
	No Bid
	343.74
	No Bid
	308.00
	522.50
	355.87

	55-gal drum Dextron III trans fluid, per drum
	No Bid
	318.00
	No Bid
	281.50
	336.05
	296.45

	Dextron III trans fluid, Per case of quarts
	No Bid
	17.99
	No Bid
	26.54
	28.05
	25.83

	Gear Oil, 55-gal drum 80-90, per rum
	No Bid
	409.44
	1673.58
	430.50
	610.00
	401.10

	Chassis grease 55-gal drum, EP NLGI2, per drum
	No Bid
	510.34
	1847.12
	640.00
	No Bid
	542.66

	Citgo Syndurance 5W40 oil, w/ sample, per gallon
	No Bid
	14.18
	No Bid
	13.44
	No Bid
	14.80

	Ext Life trans fluid, Allison TES-295 specs, 55-gallon drum
	1584.00
	1498.75
	No Bid
	649.00
	No Bid
	1489.62








