
Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name Discount % Supplier Notes
Vendor Response Item 

Notes No Bid Award Status Award Notes
001 ALEGACY FOOD SERVICE 

PRODUCTS
Misc items like dredges, scoops, cutting boards, 

etc...
4600245-2013732 C&T Design and 

Equipment Co. Inc.
55.00 Awarded

001 ALEGACY FOOD SERVICE 
PRODUCTS

Misc items like dredges, scoops, cutting boards, 
etc...

4600245-2013732 Dine Company No Bid

001 ALEGACY FOOD SERVICE 
PRODUCTS

Misc items like dredges, scoops, cutting boards, 
etc...

4600245-2013732 Pueblo Hotel Supply No Bid

002 AMAZON Misc items like pot holders, coolers, step stools, 
etc...

C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

No Bid

002 AMAZON Misc items like pot holders, coolers, step stools, 
etc...

Dine Company No Bid

002 AMAZON Misc items like pot holders, coolers, step stools, 
etc...

Pueblo Hotel Supply No Bid

002 AMAZON Misc items like pot holders, coolers, step stools, 
etc...

Pueblo Hotel Supply No Bid

003 AMERICAN METAL CRAFT Misc items like baskets, turners, brushes, etc... C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

30.00%

003 AMERICAN METAL CRAFT Misc items like baskets, turners, brushes, etc... Dine Company 45% Awarded

003 AMERICAN METAL CRAFT Misc items like baskets, turners, brushes, etc... Pueblo Hotel Supply 0% Total cost of American 
Metalcraft items: 

190.44

004 BROWNE FOOD SERVICE 
EQUIPMENT

Misc items like hot pads, sponges, scrapers, 
etc...

C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

40.00%

004 BROWNE FOOD SERVICE 
EQUIPMENT

Misc items like hot pads, sponges, scrapers, 
etc...

Dine Company 50% Awarded

004 BROWNE FOOD SERVICE 
EQUIPMENT

Misc items like hot pads, sponges, scrapers, 
etc...

Pueblo Hotel Supply 0% Total cost of Browne 
USA items: 39.89

005 CARLISLE Misc items like dispensers, brushes, cutting 
boards, etc...

C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

48.10% Awarded

005 CARLISLE Misc items like dispensers, brushes, cutting 
boards, etc...

Dine Company 47%

005 CARLISLE Misc items like dispensers, brushes, cutting 
boards, etc...

Pueblo Hotel Supply 0% Total cost of Carlisle 
items: 146.16

Contract Period: February 28, 2023 through February 27, 2024
Renewals: Two (2) annual renewals at the option of both parties.
Comments: Award Status indicates an award.

Event ID: JCPS-8198

Jefferson County Public Schools
Bid Tabulation 
Event Name: SMALL LUNCHROOM EQUIPMENT (PERCENTAGE)

Approval Date: February 28, 2023
Date Bids Received: February 6, 2023
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006 CAMBRO Misc items like racks, carts, labels, etc... C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

51.10%

006 CAMBRO Misc items like racks, carts, labels, etc... Dine Company 54% Awarded

006 CAMBRO Misc items like racks, carts, labels, etc... Pueblo Hotel Supply 0% Total cost of Cambro 
items: 1,178.40

007 COOPER ATKINS Misc items like thermometers, probe wipes, 
etc...

C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

34.00%

007 COOPER ATKINS Misc items like thermometers, probe wipes, 
etc...

Dine Company 35% Awarded

007 COOPER ATKINS Misc items like thermometers, probe wipes, 
etc...

Pueblo Hotel Supply 0% Total cost of Cooper-
Atkins items: 101.39

008 DAYMARK SAFETY SYSTEMS Misc items like labels, mats, nets, etc... C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

No Bid

008 DAYMARK SAFETY SYSTEMS Misc items like labels, mats, nets, etc... Dine Company No Bid

008 DAYMARK SAFETY SYSTEMS Misc items like labels, mats, nets, etc... Pueblo Hotel Supply No Bid

009  DEXTER Misc items like knives, turners, scrapers, etc... C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

45.00%

009  DEXTER Misc items like knives, turners, scrapers, etc... Dine Company 47% Awarded

009  DEXTER Misc items like knives, turners, scrapers, etc... Pueblo Hotel Supply 0% Total cost of Dexter 
items: 81.03

010 EDLUND Misc items like scales, can openers, etc... C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

39.00%

010 EDLUND Misc items like scales, can openers, etc... Dine Company 42% Awarded

010 EDLUND Misc items like scales, can openers, etc... Pueblo Hotel Supply 0% Total cost of Edlund 
items: 1,463.53

011 HAMILTON BEACH COMMERCIAL Misc items like blenders, dehydrators, etc... C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

10.00%

011 HAMILTON BEACH COMMERCIAL Misc items like blenders, dehydrators, etc... Dine Company No Bid

011 HAMILTON BEACH COMMERCIAL Misc items like blenders, dehydrators, etc... Pueblo Hotel Supply 0% Total cost of Hamilton 
Beach items: 1,686.00

Awarded Awarded based on total of discounted prices of 
evaluation items.

012 IRP Misc items like coolers, dividers, etc... C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

10.00% Awarded

012 IRP Misc items like coolers, dividers, etc... Dine Company No Bid
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012 IRP Misc items like coolers, dividers, etc... Pueblo Hotel Supply No Bid

013 MERCER CULINARY Misc items like knives, towels, turners, etc... C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

30.00%

013 MERCER CULINARY Misc items like knives, towels, turners, etc... Dine Company 50% Awarded

013 MERCER CULINARY Misc items like knives, towels, turners, etc... Pueblo Hotel Supply 0% Total cost of Mercer 
items: 81.03

014 NEMCO FOOD EQUIPMENT Misc items like condiment stations, warmers, 
cutters, etc...

C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

40.00%

014 NEMCO FOOD EQUIPMENT Misc items like condiment stations, warmers, 
cutters, etc...

Dine Company 45% Awarded

014 NEMCO FOOD EQUIPMENT Misc items like condiment stations, warmers, 
cutters, etc...

Pueblo Hotel Supply 0% Total cost of Nemco 
items: 4,433.32

015 REFRIGERATION SOLUTIONS Misc items like cooler filters. C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

20.00% Awarded

015 REFRIGERATION SOLUTIONS Misc items like cooler filters. Dine Company No Bid

015 REFRIGERATION SOLUTIONS Misc items like cooler filters. Pueblo Hotel Supply No Bid

016 RUBBERMAID Misc items like trash containers and dollies, 
etc...

C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

10.00% Awarded

016 RUBBERMAID Misc items like trash containers and dollies, 
etc...

Dine Company No Bid

016 RUBBERMAID Misc items like trash containers and dollies, 
etc...

Pueblo Hotel Supply No Bid

017 SAN JAMAR Misc items like mats, oven mitts, pan holders, 
etc...

C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

40.75% Awarded

017 SAN JAMAR Misc items like mats, oven mitts, pan holders, 
etc...

Dine Company 40.10%

017 SAN JAMAR Misc items like mats, oven mitts, pan holders, 
etc...

Pueblo Hotel Supply 0% Total cost of San Jamar 
items: 133.24

018 SERVER Misc items like dispensers, condiment pumps, 
etc...

C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

39.10%

018 SERVER Misc items like dispensers, condiment pumps, 
etc...

Dine Company 42% Awarded

018 SERVER Misc items like dispensers, condiment pumps, 
etc...

Pueblo Hotel Supply No Bid
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019 SUNKIST Misc items like sectionizers, corers, plungers, 
etc...

C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

10.10% Awarded

019 SUNKIST Misc items like sectionizers, corers, plungers, 
etc...

Dine Company No Bid

019 SUNKIST Misc items like sectionizers, corers, plungers, 
etc...

Pueblo Hotel Supply No Bid

020 TABLE CRAFT Misc items like squeeze bottles, shakers, 
dredges, etc...

C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

40.10% Awarded

020 TABLE CRAFT Misc items like squeeze bottles, shakers, 
dredges, etc...

Dine Company 40%

020 TABLE CRAFT Misc items like squeeze bottles, shakers, 
dredges, etc...

Pueblo Hotel Supply 0% Total cost of TableCraft 
items: 73.95

021 VICTORINOX Misc items like knives, turners, shears, etc... C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

20.00%

021 VICTORINOX Misc items like knives, turners, shears, etc... Dine Company 40% Awarded

021 VICTORINOX Misc items like knives, turners, shears, etc... Pueblo Hotel Supply 0% Total cost of Victorinox 
items: 58.23

022 VOLLRATH Misc items like colanders, pans, lids, etc... C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

46.75%

022 VOLLRATH Misc items like colanders, pans, lids, etc... Dine Company 47% Awarded

022 VOLLRATH Misc items like colanders, pans, lids, etc... Pueblo Hotel Supply 0% Total cost of Vollrath 
items: 208.00

023 WINCO Misc items like sponges, easels, floor mats, etc... C&T Design and 
Equipment Co. Inc.

50.00%

023 WINCO Misc items like sponges, easels, floor mats, etc... Dine Company 57% Awarded

023 WINCO Misc items like sponges, easels, floor mats, etc... Pueblo Hotel Supply 0% Total cost of Winco 
items: 117.15
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