Jefferson County Public Schools

Bid Tabulation \

Event Name: HVAC-R SUPPLIES & EQUIPMENT

Event ID: JCPS-8195 [

Approval Date: February 28, 2023

Date Bids Received: February 2, 2023

Contract Period: March 1, 2023 through February 28, 2024

R Is: No renewal option. ‘

C Award Status indicates an award.
001 Barrier, heat, absorbs heat from Virginia #TB11 or Nu-Calgon 9100360-1195746 1-1Each 5 No S.W.H. Supply NU-CALGON 4371-36 $13.03 $65.15
welding, brazing or soldering, 11 oz. #4371-36. NO SUBSTITUTE. Purchase Company, Inc.
001 Barrier, heat, absorbs heat from Virginia #TB11 or Nu-Calgon 9100360-1195746 1-1Each 5 No Progress Supply Inc. NU-CALGON CG-4371-36 $13.36 $66.80
welding, brazing or soldering, 11 oz. #4371-36. NO SUBSTITUTE. Purchase
001 Barrier, heat, absorbs heat from Virginia #TB11 or Nu-Calgon 9100360-1195746 1-1Each 5 No CAPP INC NU CALGON 4371-36 $16.75 $83.75
welding, brazing or soldering, 11 oz. #4371-36. NO SUBSTITUTE. Purchase

Cap, O-ring quick seal, 3/8" SAE. JB Industries #NFT5-6 or equal. 4420850-1448295 1-1Each CAPP INC JB INDUSTRIES $2.00 $20.00
Purchase
003 Cap, O-ring quick seal, 3/8" SAE. JB Industries #NFT5-6 or equal. 4420850-1448295 1-1Each 10 No S.W.H. Supply 1B NFT5-6 $4.48 $44.80
Purchase Company, Inc.
003 Cap, O-ring quick seal, 3/8" SAE. JB Industries #NFT5-6 or equal. 4420850-1448295 1-1Each 10 No Progress Supply Inc. B JB-NFT5-6 $6.08 $60.80
Purchase

Capacitor, 5 Mfd 370 Vac oval single | GE #305L, Mars #12005, #G35-
run. 936 or equal.

2760240-1196218

1-1Each
Purchase

Progress Supply Inc.

MA-12929




Sample MFG / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name MFG / Provider  Part Number Price Total Price Item Notes No Bid Award Status Award Notes
005 Capacitor, 5 Mfd 370 Vac oval single | GE #305L, Mars #12005, #G35- 2760240-1196218 1-1Each 10 No S.W.H. Supply MARS 12005 $2.91 $29.10
run. 936 or equal. Purchase Company, Inc.
005 Capacitor, 5 Mfd 370 Vac oval single | GE #305L, Mars #12005, #G35- 2760240-1196218 1-1Each 10 No CAPP INC MARS 12005 $4.00 $40.00
run. 936 or equal. Purchase

Capacitor, 12.5 Mfd 370 Vac oval run. | GE #C312L, Mars #12009, #G35- 2760280-2002786 1-1Each Progress Supply Inc. MA-12933 $2.50 $10.00
940 or equal. Purchase
007 Capacitor, 12.5 Mfd 370 Vac oval run. | GE #C312L, Mars #12009, #G35- 2760280-2002786 1-1Each 4 No S.W.H. Supply MARS 12009 $3.95 $15.80
940 or equal. Purchase Company, Inc.
007 Capacitor, 12.5 Mfd 370 Vac oval run. | GE #C312L, Mars #12009, #G35- 2760280-2002786 1-1Each 4 No CAPP INC MARS 12009 $7.75 $31.00
940 or equal. Purchase

Capacitor, 45 Mfd 440/370 Vac oval
single run, 2.75x 1.75 x 4.75.

GE #4450, #POCF45A or equal.

2760240-1689679

1-1Each
Purchase

CAPP INC

009 Capacitor, 45 Mfd 440/370 Vac oval | GE #4450, #POCF45A or equal. 2760240-1689679 1-1Each 5 No Progress Supply Inc. MARS MA-12948 $4.84 $24.20
single run, 2.75 x 1.75 x 4.75. Purchase

009 Capacitor, 45 Mfd 440/370 Vac oval | GE #4450, #POCF45A or equal. 2760240-1689679 1-1Each 5 No S.W.H. Supply PACKARD POCF45A $10.85 $54.25
single run, 2.75x 1.75 x 4.75. Purchase Company, Inc.




Sample MFG / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name MFG / Provider  Part Number Price Total Price Item Notes No Bid Award Status Award Notes
011 Cleaner, coil, acid base, gallon Diversitech Pro-Kleen, Nu- 5400140-1659440 1-1 Gallon 6 No CAPP INC $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
container. Calgon #4133-08, Virginia #AB-1 Container
or equal.
011 Cleaner, coil, acid base, gallon Diversitech Pro-Kleen, Nu- 5400140-1659440 1-1Gallon 6 No S.W.H. Supply VIRGINIA AB-1 $26.95 $161.70
container. Calgon #4133-08, Virginia #AB-1 Container Company, Inc.
or equal.
011 Cleaner, coil, acid base, gallon Diversitech Pro-Kleen, Nu- 5400140-1659440 1-1 Gallon 6 No FLORENCE NYCO #NL294-G4 $28.00 $168.00
container. Calgon #4133-08, Virginia #AB-1 Container HARDWARE
or equal.
011 Cleaner, coil, acid base, gallon Diversitech Pro-Kleen, Nu- 5400140-1659440 1-1Gallon 6 No Progress Supply Inc. NU-CALGON CG-4133-08 $29.08 $174.48
container. Calgon #4133-08, Virginia #AB-1 Container
or equal.

Cleaner, coil, non-acid base, gallon

Diversitech Pro-Green, Nu-

5400140-1733277

1-1Gallon

CAPP INC

container. Calgon #4168-08, Virginia #AK-1 Container
or equal.
013 Cleaner, coil, non-acid base, gallon Diversitech Pro-Green, Nu- 5400140-1733277 1-1Gallon 14 No Progress Supply Inc. NU-CALGON CG-4168-08 $20.41 $285.74
container. Calgon #4168-08, Virginia #AK-1 Container
or equal.
013 Cleaner, coil, non-acid base, gallon Diversitech Pro-Green, Nu- 5400140-1733277 1-1 Gallon 14 No S.W.H. Supply VIRGINIA AK-1 $23.26 $325.64
container. Calgon #4168-08, Virginia #AK-1 Container Company, Inc.

or equal.




Sample MFG / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name MFG / Provider  Part Number Price Total Price Item Notes NoBid Award Status Award Notes
015 Cleaner, ice machine, nickel safe, Nu-Calgon #4287-34 or equal. 1120118-1399713 1-1Pint 12 No CAPP INC $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
pint. Container
015 Cleaner, ice machine, nickel safe, Nu-Calgon #4287-34 or equal. 1120118-1399713 1-1Pint 12 No FLORENCE RECTORSEAL 88312 $8.49 $101.88
pint. Container HARDWARE
015 Cleaner, ice machine, nickel safe, Nu-Calgon #4287-34 or equal. 1120118-1399713 1-1Pint 12 No S.W.H. Supply NU-CALGON 4287-34 $12.28 $147.36
pint. Container Company, Inc.
015 Cleaner, ice machine, nickel safe, Nu-Calgon #4287-34 or equal. 1120118-1399713 1-1Pint 12 No Progress Supply Inc. NU-CALGON CG-4287-34 $12.59 $151.08
pint. Container

Cleat, S60".

Southwark #110460 SOU-6560
orequal.

1160655-1722838

1-1Each
Purchase

CAPP INC

Cleat, S60".

Southwark #110460 SOU-6560
orequal.

1160655-1722838

1-1Each
Purchase

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

SOUTHWARK

Coil, solenoid, 120 volt.

Alco #AMG-120 or #057331. NO

2700230-1339519

1-1Each

S.W.H. Supply

057331

$35.15

$35.15

Cock, Gas, 11/2". Brass #MC10710112. NO 6150160-1023485 1-1Each CAPPINC $0.00 $0.00
SUBSTITUTE. Purchase
019 Cock, Gas, 11/2". Brass #MC10710112. NO 6150160-1023485 1-1Each 6 No S.W.H. Supply $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
SUBSTITUTE. Purchase Company, Inc.

SUBSTITUTE. Purchase Company, Inc.
021 Coil, solenoid, 120 volt. Alco #AMG-120 or #057331. NO 2700230-1339519 1-1Each 1 No Progress Supply Inc. EMERSON AL-AMG120V $36.05 $36.05
SUBSTITUTE. Purchase




Sample MFG / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response

Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name MFG / Provider  Part Number Price Total Price Item Notes NoBid Award Status Award Notes
021 Coil, solenoid, 120 volt. Alco #AMG-120 or #057331. NO 2700230-1339519 1-1Each 1 No CAPPINC ALCO 057331 $41.00 $41.00
SUBSTITUTE. Purchase

Coil, solenoid, 24 volt. Alco #AMG-24 or #057341. NO 2700230-1699930 1-1Each S.W.H. Supply 057341 $35.15 $35.15
SUBSTITUTE. Purchase Company, Inc.
023 Coil, solenoid, 24 volt. Alco #AMG-24 or #057341. NO 2700230-1699930 1-1Each 1 No Progress Supply Inc. EMERSON AL-AMG24V $36.05 $36.05
SUBSTITUTE. Purchase
023 Coil, solenoid, 24 volt. Alco #AMG-24 or #057341. NO 2700230-1699930 1-1Each 1 No CAPPINC ALCO 057341 $40.00 $40.00
SUBSTITUTE. Purchase

Collar, snap-in. Surf Air 8" #5408 or HRT-50312 1160655-1722813 1-1Each CAPPINC
or equal. Purchase

Collar, snap-in. Surf Air 8" #5408 or HRT-50312 1160655-1722813 1-1Each S.W.H. Supply HART & COOLEY 050312 $86.32
or equal. Purchase Company, Inc.

Control, temperature, 20' capillary. JCI #A70HA-1C. 4700260-1724264 1-1Each CAPP INC A70HA-1C $215.00 $860.00
Purchase
027 Control, temperature, 20' capillary. JCI #A70HA-1C. 4700260-1724264 1-1Each 4 No Progress Supply Inc. JOHNSON JC-A70HA-1C $235.55 $942.20
Purchase CONTROLS
027 Control, temperature, 20' capillary. JCI #A70HA-1C. 4700260-1724264 1-1Each 4 No S.W.H. Supply PENN A70HA-1 $235.55 $942.20
Purchase Company, Inc.




Item Number

Item/Service

Controller, temperature adaptive 3

Description

Thermosolution KE2 temp part

Commodity Code

4700180-2013807

uom

1-1Each

Quantity

Sample
Required

Vendor Name

CAPP INC

MFG / Provider

MFG / Provider
Part Number

Unit Bid
Price

$0.00

Total Price

$0.00

Vendor Response
Item Notes

NoBid Award Status

Award Notes

temp sensor and terminal board. #21177 or equal. Purchase
029 Controller, temperature adaptive 3 | Thermosolution KE2 temp part 4700180-2013807 1-1Each 4 No Progress Supply Inc. | KE2 SOLUTIONS KE2-21177 $309.57 $1,238.28
temp sensor and terminal board. #21177 or equal. Purchase
029 Controller, temperature adaptive 3 | Thermosolution KE2 temp part 4700180-2013807 1-1Each 4 No S.W.H. Supply KE2 21177 $315.38 $1,261.52
temp sensor and terminal board. #21177 or equal. Purchase Company, Inc.
031 Core, drier, high capacity. Alco #H-48, Sporlan #RCW48 or 1120360-1110854 1-1Each 15 No CAPP INC ALCO 059542 $19.75 $296.25
equal. Purchase
031 Core, drier, high capacity. Alco #H-48, Sporlan #RCW48 or 1120360-1110854 1-1Each 15 No S.W.H. Supply SPORLAN RCW-48 $43.95 $659.28
equal. Purchase Company, Inc.
031 Core, drier, high capacity. Alco #H-48, Sporlan #RCW48 or 1120360-1110854 1-1Each 15 No Progress Supply Inc. SPORLAN SPO-RCW-48 $45.08 $676.20
equal. Purchase

Detector, leak, 1-gt. spray bottle. Big Blu #RT100S. NO 7650070-1732309 1-1Quart CAPP INC $0.00 $0.00
SUBSTITUTE. Bottle
033 Detector, leak, 1-gt. spray bottle. Big Blu #RT100S. NO 7650070-1732309 1-1Quart 70 No S.W.H. Supply REFRIGERATION RT100S $8.22 $575.40
SUBSTITUTE. Bottle Company, Inc. TECH
033 Detector, leak, 1-gt. spray bottle. Big Blu #RT100S. NO 7650070-1732309 1-1Quart 70 No Progress Supply Inc. | REFRIGERATION RT-RT100S $8.51 $595.70
SUBSTITUTE. Bottle TECHNOLOGIES




Sample MFG / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name MFG / Provider  Part Number Price Total Price Item Notes NoBid Award Status Award Notes

Drier, filter, 1/4", 3 cu. in., solder. Alco #EK-032S or #060012, 1120360-1009536 1-1Each CAPP INC
Sporlan #C-032-S or equal. Purchase

Drier, filter, 1/4", 3 cu. in., solder. Alco #EK-032S or #060012, 1120360-1009536 1-1Each S.W.H. Supply SPORLAN $11.66 $233.20
Sporlan #C-032-S or equal. Purchase Company, Inc.

Drier, filter, 1/4" ODF, solder. Alco #EK-082S or #047606, 1120360-1194854 1-1Each CAPPINC $0.00 $0.00
Sporlan #C-082S or equal. Purchase
037 Drier, filter, 1/4" ODF, solder. Alco #EK-082S or #047606, 1120360-1194854 1-1Each 9 No S.W.H. Supply SPORLAN C-082-S $17.71 $159.39
Sporlan #C-082S or equal. Purchase Company, Inc.
037 Drier, filter, 1/4" ODF, solder. Alco #EK-082S or #047606, 1120360-1194854 1-1Each 9 No Progress Supply Inc. SPORLAN SPO-C-082-S $18.17 $163.53
Sporlan #C-082S or equal. Purchase

Drier, filter, 3/8", 16 cu. in., flare, Alco #EK-163 or #047613, 1120360-1009634 1-1Each CAPP INC $0.00 $0.00
SAE, male. Sporlan #C-163 or equal. Purchase
039 Drier, filter, 3/8", 16 cu. in., flare, Alco #EK-163 or #047613, 1120360-1009634 1-1Each 15 No S.W.H. Supply SPORLAN C-163 $21.49 $322.35
SAE, male. Sporlan #C-163 or equal. Purchase Company, Inc.
039 Drier, filter, 3/8", 16 cu. in., flare, Alco #EK-163 or #047613, 1120360-1009634 1-1Each 15 No Progress Supply Inc. SPORLAN SPO-C-163 $22.04 $330.60
SAE, male. Sporlan #C-163 or equal. Purchase
7




Item Number

Item/Service

Drier, filter, 3/8", 16 cu. in., solder,

for Acid burnout.

Drier, filter, 3/8", 16 cu. in., solder,

for Acid burnout.

Drier, filter, 3/8", solder.

Drier, filter, 3/8", solder.

Drier, filter, 3/8", solder.

Drier, filter, 1/2", 30 cu. in., solder.

Drier, filter, 1/2", 30 cu. in., solder.

Description

Emerson #BOK163SHH or
#060242, Sporlan #C-163-S-HH
or equal.

Emerson #BOK163SHH or
#060242, Sporlan #C-163-S-HH
or equal.

Sporlan #C-083-S or #400503 or
equal.

Sporlan #C-083-S or #400503 or
equal.

Sporlan #C-083-S or #400503 or
equal.

Alco #EK-304S, Sporlan #C-304-S
orequal.

Alco #EK-304S, Sporlan #C-304-S
orequal.

Commodity Code

1120360-2010411

1120360-2010411

1120360-2012601

1120360-2012601

1120360-2012601

1120360-1193766

1120360-1193766

uom

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

Sample

Quantity Required

Vendor Name

MFG / Provider

Unit Bid
Price

MFG / Provider
Part Number

Vendor Response

Total Price Item Notes NoBid Award Status Award Notes

B - B -.

-

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

.- B -- ) .---

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

Progress Supply Inc.

SPORLAN

SPORLAN

B B B -.
B B B -.--

- B -- ) ---

-

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

SPORLAN

B B - -.




Sample MFG / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name MFG / Provider  Part Number Price Total Price Item Notes NoBid Award Status Award Notes
045 Drier, filter, 1/2", 30 cu. in., solder. |Alco #EK-304S, Sporlan #C-304-S 1120360-1193766 1-1Each 1 No Progress Supply Inc. SPORLAN SPO-C-304-S $39.36 $39.36
orequal. Purchase

Drier, filter, 3/4", 30 cu. in., solder.

Alco #AL306SV, Sporlan #306-S
or equal.

1120360-1009698

1-1Each
Purchase

CAPP INC

Drier, filter, 3/4", 30 cu. in., solder.

Drier, filter, 7/8", 45 cu. in., solder.

Alco #AL306SV, Sporlan #306-S
or equal.

Alco #ASD45S7-VV or #049173
or equal.

1120360-1009698

1120360-1009778

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

S.W.H. Supply

Company, Inc.

CAPP INC

SPORLAN

Drier, filter, 7/8", 45 cu. in., solder.

Duct, flex, 10", metalized polyester
outer, 25 ft. per box. R-6.0.

Alco #ASD45S7-VV or #049173
or equal.

ATCO 036 or equal.

1120360-1009778

1160655-1722836

1-1Each
Purchase

1-25 Foot
Box

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

CAPP INC

Duct, flex, 10", metalized polyester
outer, 25 ft. per box. R-6.0.

Ell, adjustable, 4", 90 degree, 30 ga.

ATCO 036 or equal.

1160655-1722836

1-25 Foot
Box

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

1362410 $300.16

#40404 or #ATC-70180600 or 1160655-1734339 1-1Each CAPPINC
equal. Purchase
053 Ell, adjustable, 4", 90 degree, 30 ga. | #40404 or #ATC-70180600 or 1160655-1734339 1-1Each 12 No S.W.H. Supply SOUTHWARK 90430 $2.54 $30.48
equal. Purchase Company, Inc.
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Item Number

Item/Service

Fan, bathroom exhaust, ceili

Description

FaBroan #A110 or equal.

Commodity Code

1120400-1727646

1-1Each

Sample

Quantity Required Vendor Name

CAPP INC

MFG / Provider
Part Number

Unit Bid
Price

Vendor Response

MFG / Provider Total Price Item Notes No Bid Award Status Award Notes

mount, 120V, 4" round duct, 110 Purchase

$0.00
Fan, bathroom exhaust, ceilil FaBroan #A110 or equal. 1120400-1727646 1-1Each S.W.H. Supply $87.71
mount, 120V, 4" round duct, 110 Purchase Company, Inc.
SFM.

$526.26

Fitting, access, 1/4" MFL solder union | J/B #A31002, Robinair #40416,
with 1/8" OD copper tube extension. Wagner #VAX-2 or equal.

7850010-1495118 1-1Each S.W.H. Supply

Purchase Company, Inc.

-

Fitting, access, 1/4" MFL solder union | J/B #A31002, Robinair #40416,
with 1/8" OD copper tube extension. Wagner #VAX-2 or equal.

7850010-1495118 1-1Each

Purchase

Progress Supply Inc. JB-A31002

Fitting, access, 1/4" MFL solder union | J/B #A31002, Robinair #40416,
with 1/8" OD copper tube extension. Wagner #VAX-2 or equal.

7850010-1495118 1-1Each

Purchase

CAPP INC

Fitting, access, 1/8" MPT x 1/4" flare, | JB Industries #A31482 or equal.
with schraeder and cap, brass.

7850010-2002279 1-1Each

Purchase

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

- b ) -
- B b
1-1Each 10 Progress Supply Inc. B JB-A31482 $9.50 $95.00
Purchase

Fitting, access, 1/8" MPT x 1/4" flare, | JB Industries #A31482 or equal.
with schraeder and cap, brass.

7850010-2002279 1-1Each

Purchase

Fitting, access, 1/8" MPT x 1/4" flare, | JB Industries #A31482 or equal.
with schraeder and cap, brass.

7850010-2002279




Sample MFG / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name MFG / Provider  Part Number Price Total Price Item Notes NoBid Award Status Award Notes

061 Fitting, access, 1/4" valve core. JB Industries #A31999 or equal. 7850010-2011395 1-1Each 35 No S.W.H. Supply J/B A31999 $3.36 $117.60

Purchase Company, Inc.
061 Fitting, access, 1/4" valve core. JB Industries #A31999 or equal. 7850010-2011395 1-1Each 35 No Progress Supply Inc. B JB-A31999 $3.59 $125.65

Purchase
061 Fitting, access, 1/4" valve core. JB Industries #A31999 or equal. 7850010-2011395 1-1Each 35 No CAPP INC B A31999 $5.00 $175.00

Purchase

Gauge, combination pressure and 1/2" bottom mount, 3 1/2" 4700400-1694042 1-1Each CAPP INC $0.00 $0.00
temperature, steel case and ring. polycarbonate lens, 0-200 PSI, Purchase
80-320 degrees F. Amtek
#PT1088, Dautheridge
#99001010 or equal.
063 Gauge, combination pressure and 1/2" bottom mount, 3 1/2" 4700400-1694042 1-1Each 5 No S.W.H. Supply DAUTHRIDGE 99001010 $30.60 $153.00
temperature, steel case and ring. polycarbonate lens, 0-200 PSI, Purchase Company, Inc.

Gauge, compound vacuum and

80-320 degrees F. Amtek
#PT1088, Dautheridge
#99001010 or equal.

1/8" MPT connection,

4700400-1011416

1-1Each

CAPP INC

$0.00 $0.00

pressure, low side 30" vacuum, to | temperature scale for R-12, R-22 Purchase
120 Ibs. pressure with retard to 250 | and R-502, 2 1/2" diameter dial.
Ibs. and restriction to avoid pulsation Robinair #11794, Weiss
and overload. #LMF502L or equal.
065 Gauge, compound vacuum and 1/8" MPT connection, 4700400-1011416 1-1Each 6 No S.W.H. Supply ROBINAIR 11794 $22.66 $135.96
pressure, low side 30" vacuum, to  |temperature scale for R-12, R-22 Purchase Company, Inc.

120 Ibs. pressure with retard to 250
Ibs. and restriction to avoid pulsation
and overload.

and R-502, 2 1/2" diameter dial.
Robinair #11794, Weiss
#LMF502L or equal.




Item Number

Item/Service

Gauge, pressure, steel case and ring,

Description

1/4", center back mount, for use

Commodity Code

4700400-1682601

uom

1-1Each

Quantity

Sample
Required

Vendor Name

CAPP INC

MFG / Provider

MFG / Provider

Part Number

Unit Bid

Price

$0.00

Vendor Response

Total Price Item Notes NoBid Award Status Award Notes

$0.00

polycarbonate lens. with air, water and oil, 2 1/2" Purchase
dial, 0-30 PSI. Winters
#PEM1437 or equal.
067 Gauge, pressure, steel case and ring, | 1/4", center back mount, for use 4700400-1682601 1-1Each 1 No S.W.H. Supply WINTERS PEM1437 $8.50 $8.50
polycarbonate lens. with air, water and oil, 2 1/2" Purchase Company, Inc.

Gauge, pressure, steel case and ring,

dial, 0-30 PSI. Winters
#PEM1437 or equal.

1/4" bottom mount, for use with

4700400-1682598

1-1Each

S.W.H. Supply

WINTERS

PEM212

$6.25

$50.00

polycarbonate lens. air, water and oil, 2 1/2" dial, 0- Purchase Company, Inc.
30 PSI. Trerice #800B, Winters
#PEM212 or equal.
069 Gauge, pressure, steel case and ring, |1/4" bottom mount, for use with 4700400-1682598 1-1Each 8 No CAPP INC TRERICE 800B2502LA30 $8.50 $68.00
polycarbonate lens. air, water and oil, 2 1/2" dial, 0- Purchase

Gauge, pressure, steel case and ring,

30 PSI. Trerice #800B, Winters
#PEM212 or equal.

1/4" bottom mount, for use with

4700400-1682603

1-1Each

S.W.H. Supply

WINTERS

PEM214

$6.25

$125.00

polycarbonate lens. air, water and oil, 2 1/2" dial, 0- Purchase Company, Inc.
100 PSI. Trerice #800B, Winters
#PEM214 or equal.
071 Gauge, pressure, steel case and ring, |1/4" bottom mount, for use with 4700400-1682603 1-1Each 20 No CAPP INC TRERICE 800B2502LA100 $8.50 $170.00
polycarbonate lens. air, water and oil, 2 1/2" dial, 0- Purchase

100 PSI. Trerice #800B, Winters
#PEM214 or equal.
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Item Number

Item/Service

Gauge, pressure, steel case and ring,
polycarbonate lens.

Gauge, pressure, steel case and ring,
polycarbonate lens.

Indicator, liquid moisture, 1/4" SAE
male x female flare 1/4".

Indicator, liquid moisture, 1/4" SAE
male x female flare 1/4".

Indicator, liquid moisture, 3/8" SAE
male x female.

Indicator, liquid moisture, 3/8" SAE
male x female.

Description

1/4" bottom mount, for use with
air, water and oil, 4" dial, 0-30
PSI. Trerice #800B, Winters
#PEM221 or equal.

1/4" bottom mount, for use wi
air, water and oil, 4" dial, 0-30
PSI. Trerice #800B, Winters
#PEM221 or equal.

Sporlan #SA12FM or #700026.
NO SUBSTITUTE.

Sporlan #SA12FM or #700026.
NO SUBSTITUTE.

porlan #SA13FM or #700091.
NO SUBSTITUTE.

porlan #SA13FM or #700091.
NO SUBSTITUTE.

Commodity Code

4700400-1664665

4700400-1664665

7650805-13996!

7650805-13996!

7650805-1399615

7650805-1399615

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

Quantity

Sample
Required Vendor Name

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

CAPP INC

CAPP INC

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

CAPP INC

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

MFG / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
MFG / Provider  Part Number Price Total Price Item Notes NoBid Award Status Award Notes

WINTERS PEM221 $11.25 $45.00
TRERICE 800B4002LA30

B -.

B B - -.




NoBid Award Status

Sample MFG / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name MFG / Provider ~ Part Number Price Total Price Item Notes
079 Insert, one piece EPDM sleeve Lovejoy #3JE or Dayton 6200300-1691301 1-1Each 5 No S.W.H. Supply LOVEJOY 3JE $4.63 $23.15
coupling. #32ZP54. Purchase Company, Inc.
079 Insert, one piece EPDM sleeve Lovejoy #3JE or Dayton 6200300-1691301 1-1Each 5 No CAPP INC LOVEJOY 3JE $6.25 $31.25
coupling. #32ZP54. Purchase

Insert, two piece w/ ring EPDM
sleeve.

Lovejoy #5E coupler or Dayton
#32ZP71.

6200300-1027392

1-1Each
Purchase

CAPP INC

Insert, two piece w/ ring EPDM
sleeve.

Insert, shaft coupler, two-piece w/
retainer, 585 in.-lb.

Lovejoy #5E coupler or Dayton
#32ZP71.

Lovejoy TB Woods #6E or
Dayton #32ZP72.

6200300-1027392

6200300-2014285

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

CAPP INC

LOVEJOY

$226.50

$216.00

Insert, shaft coupler, two-piece w/
retainer, 585 in.-lb.

Insert, two piece w/ ring EPDM
sleeve.

Lovejoy TB Woods #6E or
Dayton #32ZP72.

Lovejoy Woods #7E or Dayton
#32ZP73.

6200300-2014285

6200300-1247476

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

CAPP INC

LOVEJOY

TB WOODS

$453.00

$180.00

Insert, two piece w/ ring EPDM
sleeve.

Insert, shaft coupler, two piece solid
EPDM Rubber.

Lovejoy Woods #7E or Dayton
#32ZP73.

Lovejoy #8E sleeve or Dayton
#32ZP74.

6200300-1247476

6200300-1345146

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

CAPP INC

14

LOVEJOY

$380.40

$234.00

Award Notes




Item Number

Item/Service

Insert, shaft coupler, two piece solid
EPDM Rubber.

Insulation, 1/2" thick x 3' x 4' sheet.

Insulation, 1/2" thick x 3' x 4' sheet.

Insulation, tubing and pipe, flexible

foamed plastic material.

Insulation, tubing and pipe, flexible
foamed plastic material.

Description

Lovejoy #8E sleeve or Dayton
#32ZP74.

Armaflex or equal.

Armaflex or equal.

Closed cellular structure, with
excellent insulating efficiency
and high vapor resistance. 5/8"
1D x 3/8" wall thickness.
Armaflex Il or equal.

Closed cellular structure, with
excellent insulating efficiency
and high vapor resistance. 5/8"
1D x 3/8" wall thickness.
Armaflex Il or equal.

Commodity Code
6200300-1345146

uom

Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Foot
Purchase

1-1Foot
Purchase

Quantity

Sample
Required

MFG / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Vendor Name MFG / Provider  Part Number Price Total Price Item Notes NoBid Award Status Award Notes

S.W.H. Supply LOVEJOY $162.20 $486.60
Company, Inc.

- -
S.W.H. Supply ARMACELL APS12043 $25.85 $465.30
Company, Inc.

) .
S.W.H. Supply ARMACELL APT05838
Company, Inc.




Sample MFG / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name MFG / Provider  Part Number Price Total Price Item Notes NoBid Award Status Award Notes
093 Insulation, tubing and pipe, flexible | Closed cellular structure, with 1515289-1495289 1-1Foot 25 No CAPP INC $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
foamed plastic material. excellent insulating efficiency Purchase
and high vapor resistance. 3/4"
ID x 3/8" wall thickness.
Armaflex Il or equal.
093 Insulation, tubing and pipe, flexible | Closed cellular structure, with 1515289-1495289 1-1Foot 25 No S.W.H. Supply ARMACELL APT03438 $0.44 $10.94
foamed plastic material. excellent insulating efficiency Purchase Company, Inc.
and high vapor resistance. 3/4"
ID x 3/8" wall thickness.
Armaflex Il or equal.
095 Insulation, tubing and pipe, flexible | Closed cellular structure, with 1515289-2001273 1-1Foot 300 No CAPPINC $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
foamed plastic material. excellent insulating efficiency Purchase
and high vapor resistance. 7/8"
ID x 1/2" wall thickness.
Armaflex Il or equal.
095 Insulation, tubing and pipe, flexible | Closed cellular structure, with 1515289-2001273 1-1Foot 300 No S.W.H. Supply ARMACELL APT07812 $0.66 $198.75
foamed plastic material. excellent insulating efficiency Purchase Company, Inc.
and high vapor resistance. 7/8"
ID x 1/2" wall thickness.
Armaflex Il or equal.
097 Insulation, tubing and pipe, flexible | Closed cellular structure, with 1515289-1495298 1-1Foot 50 No CAPP INC $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
foamed plastic material. excellent insulating efficiency Purchase
and high vapor resistance. 1
1/8" 1D x 3/8" wall thickness.
Armaflex Il or equal.
097 Insulation, tubing and pipe, flexible | Closed cellular structure, with 1515289-1495298 1-1Foot 50 No S.W.H. Supply ARMACELL APT11838 $0.52 $25.90
foamed plastic material. excellent insulating efficiency Purchase

and high vapor resistance. 1
1/8" 1D x 3/8" wall thickness.
Armaflex Il or equal.

Company, Inc.
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Sample MFG / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response

Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name MFG / Provider  Part Number Price Total Price Item Notes NoBid Award Status Award Notes

Insulation, tubing and pipe, flexible | Closed cellular structure, with 1-1Foot CAPP INC $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
foamed plastic material. excellent insulating efficiency Purchase
and high vapor resistance. 1
1/8" 1D x 3/4" wall thickness.
Armaflex Il or equal.
Insulation, tubing and pipe, flexible | Closed cellular structure, with 1-1Foot S.W.H. Supply ARMACELL APT11834 $1.32 $132.00
foamed plastic material. excellent insulating efficiency Purchase Company, Inc.
and high vapor resistance. 1
1/8" 1D x 3/4" wall thickness.
Armaflex Il or equal.

Insulation, tubing and pipe, flexible | Closed cellular structure, with 1-1Foot CAPP INC $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
foamed plastic material. excellent insulating efficiency Purchase
and high vapor resistance. 1
3/8"ID x 1/2" wall thickness.
Armaflex Il or equal.
Insulation, tubing and pipe, flexible | Closed cellular structure, with 1-1Foot S.W.H. Supply ARMACELL APT13812 $0.82 $164.00
foamed plastic material. excellent insulating efficiency Purchase Company, Inc.
and high vapor resistance. 1
3/8"ID x 1/2" wall thickness.
Armaflex Il or equal.




Sample MFG / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name MFG / Provider  Part Number Price Total Price Item Notes NoBid Award Status Award Notes
103 Insulation, tubing and pipe, flexible | Closed cellular structure, with 1515289-2001277 1-1Foot 150 No CAPP INC $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
foamed plastic material. excellent insulating efficiency Purchase
and high vapor resistance. 2
1/8" 1D x 1/2" wall thickness.
Armaflex Il or equal.
103 Insulation, tubing and pipe, flexible | Closed cellular structure, with 1515289-2001277 1-1Foot 150 No S.W.H. Supply ARMACELL APT21812 $1.20 $180.00
foamed plastic material. excellent insulating efficiency Purchase Company, Inc.
and high vapor resistance. 2
1/8" 1D x 1/2" wall thickness.
Armaflex Il or equal.
105 Insulation, tubing and pipe, flexible | Closed cellular structure, with 1515289-2001279 1-1Foot 5 No CAPPINC $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
foamed plastic material. excellent insulating efficiency Purchase
and high vapor resistance. 3
1/8" 1D x 1/2" wall thickness.
Armaflex Il or equal.
105 Insulation, tubing and pipe, flexible | Closed cellular structure, with 1515289-2001279 1-1Foot 5 No S.W.H. Supply ARMACELL APT31812 $1.90 $9.50
foamed plastic material. excellent insulating efficiency Purchase Company, Inc.
and high vapor resistance. 3
1/8" 1D x 1/2" wall thickness.
Armaflex Il or equal.
107 Kit, acid test, for polyester Sporlan #TA-1. NO SUBSTITUTE 7650230-2010902 1-1Each 10 No CAPP INC $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
refrigeration oil. Purchase
107 Kit, acid test, for polyester Sporlan #TA-1. NO SUBSTITUTE 7650230-2010902 1-1Each 10 No S.W.H. Supply SPORLAN TA-1 $13.43 $134.30
refrigeration oil. Purchase Company, Inc.
107 Kit, acid test, for polyester Sporlan #TA-1. NO SUBSTITUTE 7650230-2010902 1-1Each 10 No Progress Supply Inc. SPORLAN SPO-TA-1 $18.65 $186.50
refrigeration oil. Purchase




Sample MFG / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name MFG / Provider  Part Number Price Total Price Item Notes NoBid Award Status Award Notes

109 Kit, hard start, 3 in 1, relay-capacitor- | Supco #RC0410, UR#HS206 or 1120710-2010662 1-1Each 1 No S.W.H. Supply SUPCO RCO410 $9.94 $9.94

overload, 115V, 1/2 - 1/3 HP. equal. Purchase Company, Inc.
109 Kit, hard start, 3 in 1, relay-capacitor- | Supco #RC0410, UR#HS206 or 1120710-2010662 1-1Each 1 No Progress Supply Inc. SUPCO SU-RCO410 $10.19 $10.19

overload, 115V, 1/2 - 1/3 HP. equal. Purchase
109 Kit, hard start, 3in 1, relay-capacitor- | Supco #RC0410, UR#HS206 or 1120710-2010662 1-1Each 1 No CAPPINC SUPCO RC0410 $10.75 $10.75

overload, 115V, 1/2 - 1/3 HP. equal. Purchase

Motor, 5 watt, CW rotation. 115V, 34
amp.

EMS-SPFBC51 or equal.

6100003-2012620

1-1Each
Purchase

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

EMS-SPFB51

$167.50

Motor, 5 watt, CW rotation. 115V, 34
amp.

EMS-SPFBC51 or equal.

6100003-2012620

1-1Each
Purchase

CAPP INC

SPFBC51

$765.00
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Neutralizer, acid, compressor Acid Away #45009. NO 5400630-2011308 1-1Each CAPP INC $0.00 $0.00

burnout, for POE oil. SUBSTITUTE. Purchase

113 Neutralizer, acid, compressor Acid Away #45009. NO 5400630-2011308 1-1Each 10 No S.W.H. Supply ACID-AWAY 45009 $29.92 $299.20
burnout, for POE oil. SUBSTITUTE. Purchase Company, Inc.

113 Neutralizer, acid, compressor Acid Away #45009. NO 5400630-2011308 1-1Each 10 No Progress Supply Inc. RECTORSEAL RC-45009 $31.17 $311.70
burnout, for POE oil. SUBSTITUTE. Purchase

115 Nut, flare, 3/8" SAE, refrigeration, JB Industries #NS4-6 or equal. 4420850-1025938 1-1Each 10 No CAPP INC JB INDUSTRIES NS4-6 $1.00 $10.00
short type, forged. Purchase

115 Nut, flare, 3/8" SAE, refrigeration, JB Industries #NS4-6 or equal. 4420850-1025938 1-1Each 10 No S.W.H. Supply B NS4-6 $1.44 $14.40
short type, forged. Purchase Company, Inc.




Item Number Item/Service

Oil, vacuum pump, quart container.

Oil, vacuum pump, quart container.

Oil, vacuum pump, quart container.

Pad, vibration eliminator, 18" x 18" x
7/8", rubber cork fill.

Pad, vibration eliminator, 18" x 18" x
7/8", rubber cork fill.

Pipe, copper refrigeration tube,

Pipe, copper refrigeration tube,

Pipe, copper refrigeration tube,

Pipe, copper refrigeration tube,

Description

JB #DVO-12, Robinair #13203 or
equal.

JB #DVO-12, Robinair #13203 or
equal.

JB #DVO-12, Robinair #13203 or
equal.

Maline #MA-018CR, Wagner
#MP18C or equal.

Maline #MA-018CR, Wagner
#MP18C or equal.

50' coil, dehydrated seamless
soft copper, 5/

50' coil, dehydrated seamless
soft copper, 5/16" OD.

50' coil, dehydrated seamless
soft copper, 1/2" OD.

50' coil, dehydrated seamless
soft copper, 1/2" OD.

Commodity Code

5400640-1076553

5400640-1076553

5400640-1076553

6150270-1406615

6150270-1406615

7800400-1243998

7800400-1243998

7800400-1244013

7800400-1244013

1-1Quart
Container

1-1Quart
Container

1-1Quart
Container

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

Sample MFG / Provider  Unit Bid
Quantity Required Vendor Name MFG / Provider ~ Part Number Price Total Price

Progress Supply Inc.

1B-DVO-12 $249.80
S.W.H. Supply B DVO-12 $268.80
Company, Inc.

|

CAPP INC DVO-12

CAPP INC

S.W.H. Supply MALINE MA-018CR $23.56
Company, Inc.

- -
S.W.H. Supply MUELLER $70.19
Company, Inc.

- --
S.W.H. Supply MUELLER 08050
Company, Inc.
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Vendor Response
Item Notes NoBid Award Status

Award Notes




Sample MFG / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name MFG / Provider  Part Number Price Total Price Item Notes NoBid Award Status Award Notes

Pipe, copper refrigeration tube, 50' coil, dehydrated seamless 7800400-1244022 1-1Each CAPP INC
soft copper, 3/4" OD. Purchase

Pipe, copper refrigeration tube, 50' coil, dehydrated seamless 7800400-1244022 1-1Each S.W.H. Supply MUELLER $166.25 $1,330.00
soft copper, 3/4" OD. Purchase Company, Inc.

Pipe, round, galvanized 3" x 24", 30 . 1160655-1722840 1-1Each CAPPINC $0.00 $0.00
gauge. Purchase

127 Pipe, round, galvanized 3" x 24", 30 . 1160655-1722840 1-1Each 5 No S.W.H. Supply $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
gauge. Purchase Company, Inc.

Pipe, round, galvanized 4" x 60", 30 . 1160655-1722841 1-1Each CAPP INC
gauge. Purchase

Pipe, round, galvanized 4" x 60", 30 . 1160655-1722841 1-1Each S.W.H. Supply SOUTHWARK SL60426 $268.00
gauge. Purchase Company, Inc.

Rod, flame. Sellers #B-7201 or Auburn #1-2- 4700480-1094006 1-1Each S.W.H. Supply AUBURN $48.13 $144.39
2orequal. Purchase Company, Inc.
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Item Number Item/Service

Sample MFG / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name MFG / Provider  Part Number Price Total Price Item Notes NoBid Award Status Award Notes
131 Rod, flame. Sellers #B-7201 or Auburn #1-2- 4700480-1094006 1-1Each 3 No CAPPINC AUBURN 1-2-2 $69.00 $207.00
2orequal. Purchase

Solvent, degreasing, electric motor,

Nu-Calgon #4083-75 or equal.
17 oz. can.

5400660-1132205 1-17 Ounce

CAPPINC
Can

Solvent, degreasing, electric motor,
17 oz. can.

Nu-Calgon #4083-75 or equal.

5400660-1132205 1-17 Ounce

S.W.H. Supply NUCALGON 4083-75
Can Company, Inc.

$17.95 $538.50

Strap, duct, nylon. 48", natural, 175 Ib. strength,

1160655-1722808 1-50 Count
50/pack. #G95-040 or #B48HIL.

CAPPINC $0.00 $0.00
Pack
135 Strap, duct, nylon. 48", natural, 175 Ib. strength, 1160655-1722808 1-50 Count 50 No FLORENCE CABLETIE #48-175-N-50 $19.99 $999.50
50/pack. #G95-040 or #B48HIL. Pack HARDWARE EXPRESS
135 Strap, duct, nylon. 48", natural, 175 Ib. strength, 1160655-1722808 1-50 Count 50 No S.W.H. Supply GLOBAL CT48-175K9-B $21.56 $1,078.00
50/pack. #G95-040 or #B48HOL. Pack

Company, Inc.

Tape, duct, 2" x 60 yds. Polyethylene cotton cloth, good

tensile strength, min. 8 Ibs. per
inch, excellent adhesion, min. 44
oz. per inch, thickness min. 12
mils. General purpose use.
Silver-gray, excellent moisture
resistance. Nashua #345 or

7630025-1175740 CAPPINC
Roll

$0.00 $0.00

equal.
137 Tape, duct, 2" x 60 yds. Polyethylene cotton cloth, good 7630025-1175740 1-1Each 300 No FLORENCE IPG 4138 $13.99 $4,197.00
tensile strength, min. 8 Ibs. per Roll HARDWARE
inch, excellent adhesion, min. 44

oz. per inch, thickness min. 12

mils. General purpose use.

Silver-gray, excellent moisture

resistance. Nashua #345 or
equal.
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Sample MFG / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name MFG / Provider  Part Number Price Total Price Item Notes NoBid Award Status Award Notes
137 Tape, duct, 2" x 60 yds. Polyethylene cotton cloth, good 7630025-1175740 1-1Each 300 No S.W.H. Supply NASHUA 345-2 $19.59 $5,877.00
tensile strength, min. 8 Ibs. per Roll Company, Inc.

inch, excellent adhesion, min. 44
oz. per inch, thickness min. 12
mils. General purpose use.
Silver-gray, excellent moisture
resistance. Nashua #345 or
equal.

139 Tape, duct, white, 2" x 60 yds. 27 Ibs. per 1" tensile strength. 7630025-1730544 1-1 Each Roll 35 No CAPP INC $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
Nashua #398 or equal.

139 Tape, duct, white, 2" x 60 yds. 27 Ibs. per 1" tensile strength. 7630025-1730544 1-1 Each Roll 35 No S.W.H. Supply SHURTAPE 1500W-2 $8.13 $284.55
Nashua #398 or equal. Company, Inc.

139 Tape, duct, white, 2" x 60 yds. 27 Ibs. per 1" tensile strength. 7630025-1730544 1-1 Each Roll 35 No FLORENCE IPG 20C-W2 $12.29 $430.15
Nashua #398 or equal. HARDWARE

Tape, foil-scrim-Kraft (FSK), 3" x 50
yds.

Polyken #338, Shurtape #AF982,
Venture #1525CW or equal

7630025-2005739

1-1Each Roll

CAPP INC

Tape, foil-scrim-Kraft (FSK), 3" x 50
yds.

Polyken #338, Shurtape #AF982,
Venture #1525CW or equal

7630025-2005739

1-1Each Roll

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

SHURTAPE

$202.95

Thermocouple, 24". Honeywell #Q340A-1074 or 4700680-1014379 1-1Each CAPP INC HONEYWELL Q340A1074
equal. Purchase
143 Thermocouple, 24", Honeywell #Q340A-1074 or 4700680-1014379 1-1Each 1 No S.W.H. Supply HONEYWELL Q340A1074 $10.03 $10.03
equal. Purchase Company, Inc.
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Item Number Item/Service

Thermocouple, 24",

Thermocouple, 36".

Thermocouple, 36".

Thermocouple, 36".

Thermometer, 2" dial, -40 degrees to
+60 degrees F, front flange flush
mount.

Thermometer, 2" dial, -40 degrees to
+60 degrees F, front flange flush
mount.

Thermometer, 3" dial, 4" stem, 20
degrees to 240 degrees F, 1/2" NPT,
back mount.

Description

Honeywell #Q340A-1074 or
equal.

Honeywell #Q340A-1090 or
equal.

Honeywell #Q340A-1090 or
equal.

Honeywell #Q340A-1090 or
equal.

Weiss #20FB-060 or equal

Weiss #20FB-0

Miljoco #B309954-4, Trerice
#B8320405, Wika
#30040D006G4, Winters
#T30040-B7 or equal.

Commodity Code

4700680-1014379

4700680-1014413
4700680-1014413
4700680-1014413

7100500-2009750
7100500-2009750

7100500-1655805

uom

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

MFG / Provider  Unit Bid

Vendor Name MFG / Provider ~ Part Number Price Total Price

Vendor Response

Item Notes NoBid Award Status Award Notes

Progress Supply Inc. HONEYWELL MH- $10.28 $10.28
Q340A1074/U

S.W.H. Supply HONEYWELL Q340A1090 $10.99 $10.99
Company, Inc.
CAPP INC HONEYWELL Q340A1090 $11.00
Progress Supply Inc. HONEYWELL MH- $11.27
Q340A1090/U

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

Awarded based on their 3% -
20 day discount.

N - -l

B B ) B -l.-

S.W.H. Supply WINTERS T30040-B7 $28.09 $28.09
Company, Inc.
24




Sample MFG / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name MFG / Provider  Part Number Price Total Price Item Notes NoBid Award Status Award Notes
149 Thermometer, 3" dial, 4" stem, 20 Miljoco #B309954-4, Trerice 7100500-1655805 1-1Each 1 No CAPP INC TRERICE B83204-05 $99.00 $99.00
degrees to 240 degrees F, 1/2" NPT, #B8320405, Wika Purchase
back mount. #30040D006G4, Winters

Thermometer, solar 3.5" stem, -40 to
300 degrees F.

#T30040-B7 or equal.

Trerice #5X9140305. NO
SUBSTITUTE.

7100500-2012162

1-1Each
Purchase

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

Thermometer, solar 3.5" stem, -40 to
300 degrees F.

Tubing, copper, ACR, 1/2" OD x 20'.

Trerice #5X9140305. NO
SUBSTITUTE.

Nitrogen pressure packed.

7100500-2012162

7800400-1243890

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Foot
Purchase

CAPP INC

CAPP INC

TRERICE $X9140305 $47.00

$1,410.00

Tubing, copper, ACR, 1/2" OD x 20'.

Tubing, copper, ACR, 3/4" OD x 20'.

Nitrogen pressure packed.

Nitrogen pressure packed.

7800400-1243890

7800400-1243916

1-1Foot
Purchase

1-1Foot
Purchase

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

CAPP INC

MUELLER

Tubing, copper, ACR, 3/4" OD x 20'.

Tubing, copper, ACR, 1 1/8" OD x 20'.

Nitrogen pressure packed.

Nitrogen pressure packed.

7800400-1243916

7800400-1243934

1-1Foot
Purchase

1-1Foot
Purchase

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

CAPP INC
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MUELLER

$0.00

$0.00




Item Number Item/Service

Tubing, copper, ACR, 1 1/8" OD x 20'.

Valve, access, 5/16" OD x 1/4" ID
Tube extension.

Valve, access, 5/16" OD x 1/4" ID
Tube extension.

Valve, safety relief, 1 1/4" X 1 1/2" 50

PSI, 3,075,000 BTU ASME.

Valve, safety relief, 1 1/4" X 1 1/2" 50

PSI, 3,075,000 BTU ASME.

3/8" ODFx 1/2"
DM.

Valve, solenoi

Valve, solenoid, 3/8" ODF x 1/2"
DM.

Wrench, core remover and storer.

Description

Nitrogen pressure packed.

JB Industries #A-31005, Robinair

#40419 or equal.

JB Industries #A-31005, Robi

#40419 or equal.

Watts 740 #0383310. NO
SUBSTITUTE.

Watts 740 #0383310. NO
SUBSTITUTE.

Alco #200RB-453-T or #047513
or equal.

Alco #200RB-4S53-T or #047513
or equal.

Ma-Line #AF2200M.

Commodity Code
7800400-1243934

7850010-1009947

7850010-1009947

7850540-2011815

7850540-2011815

7850600-1343335

7850600-1343335

7720950-2011396

1-1Foot
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

1-1Each
Purchase

Sample

Quantity Required Vendor Name

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

CAPP INC

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

CAPP INC

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

N -- $0‘
ALCO 047513

S.W.H. Supply
Company, Inc.

CAPPINC $0.00
26

MFG / Provider

MUELLER

WATTS
WATTS

MFG / Provider
Part Number

A31005

0383310

Unit Bid
Price

Vendor Response

Total Price Item Notes NoBid Award Status Award Notes

$124.80

--

$1,625.00

B N -.-

$64.03




Sample MFG / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Item Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Required Vendor Name MFG / Provider  Part Number Price Total Price Item Notes No Bid Award Status Award Notes
165 Wrench, core remover and storer. Ma-Line #AF2200M. 7720950-2011396 1-1Each 10 No S.W.H. Supply MALINE AF2200M $3.49 $34.90 Awarded
Purchase Company, Inc.
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