HENDERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
1805 SECOND STREET
HENDERSON, KY 42420

Tabulation Sheet
Athletic Equipment and Supplies

Bid # 32352
Part A Athletic Catalog
company amoa || svren | Rl ot STANTEY O | o dancetc | s ng | 21 Fony copherspors L I e il el e LT WoJ0 Sons — P sumsion PRSI | copanmites | M on i | | corsonton s 100 SR QTN s | sy |4 SUTGE RO STt s | vty rsion
Srsco |55 Teamuna| Satog | Asiantag e g e
NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(GENERAL SUPPLIES
Discount
BASEBALL Discount. 0% 10% 0% 0-40% 0% 32% 15% - Champion Sports chool Specialty LLC 20%
BASKETBALL Discount o% 10% o% 0-40% 0% 32% 155% - Champion Sports faty LLC 20%
0% 0% 10% off uniforms 59 + Free Ground Shipping
CHEERLEADING I Varsity Sports Fashions &
Discount 0% 0-40% 32% 15% - Chamion Sports. 1! Sunnlies
[CROSS COUNTRY Discount 0% 10% 0% 0-40% 0% 10%. 32% 15% - Chamion Sports. 1!
o% 0% 10% off dance costumes 59 + Free Ground Shipping
DANCE I Varsity Sports Fashions &
Discount. 0% 0-40% 32% 15% - Champion Sports No Bid Sunolies
FISHING Discount. 0% 0% 0-40% 0% 32% 15% - Champion Sports. No Bid
FOOTBALL Discount 0% 10% 0% 0-40% 0% 32% 15% - Champion Sports iddell/All 29 LLC 20%
GOLF Discount 0% 10% 0% 0-40% 0% 32% 15% - Champion Sports No Bid 29% - School Specialty LLC
SOCCER Discount 0% 10% 0% 0-40% 0% 32% 15% - Champion Sports iddell/All 295 chool Specialty LLC 20%
SOFTBALL Discount 0% 0% 0% 32% 15% - Champion Sports
SWIMMING Discount 0% 10% 0% 0-40% 0% 32% 15% - Champion Sports 295 chool Specialty LLC
TENNIS Discount 0% 10% 0% 0-40% 0% 32% 15% - Champion Sports 29% - School Specialty LLC 20%
TRACK Discount 0% 10% 0% 0-40% 0% 10%)| 32% 15% - Champion Sports chool Specialty LLC 5% - SM Track Club
VOLLEYBALL Discount 0% 10% 0% 0-40% 0% 32% 15% - Champion Sports 29% - School Specialty LLC 20%
OTHER (LIST) Archery o o LI
Discount 0% 0-40% 32% 15% - Champion Sports Awards
Bowing Discount % o% 0%
Trap Shoot Discount % o% 0%
Weightlifting Discount 0% 0% 0%
ink Kits o% o% 0%
reak Through Banners 0% 0% 0%
ascots & Accesson o% o% 0%
oung System Portable 0% 0% 0%
ags & Backpacks o% o% 0%
o% o% 09
Flags 0% 0% 0%
Lacrosse/Wrestling 0% 0% 0%
Dril 0% 0% 0%
Color Guard 0% 0% 0%
Soorts Passes. 0% 0% 0%
o%
Other o%
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Company ABBA | Auminum | American | HOIGn0. |grands Hotding Co. 23|  S121! | Discount Dance, LLG | it sereen rining sitteats Fanly Gopner spons Howards | e reamspons[14008A Spors | wracG | Mbdest Wo30 Sports Paykiz Panellsumsnop | YamdSehootproducts 3| gt pmaics | MO e RUDiS | Corporaton dba aios SENO0! Specialty Q28GTZAMUSL 08| oy pro shop | Spotsvieansters | 4 SHorldwide PO st Trophy House varsity it Fashion
one-dbe | 63800 must be on Pos Teamusy| Caalon | Advaniag At Sports Ly
ricing e
BASEBALLS
Game Baseballs, Rawings R100
KHSAA Approve No
Substitutes) Per Dozen
Part Number WCA1100KY RI00HL 41100KY 4110015
BSN/Spalding Rawlings Spalding Spalding
Price 9148 X $84.95 8289
Part Number R100-H2 / RIOO-H3
Rawiings
Price $96.51/ $78.47
Baseballs, Worth Brand Per Dozen
Part Number WCAL101HS
BSN/Spalding
Price
BASKETBALLS
Basketball, Boys Game Ball wide seams,
Rawlings KHSAA Approved
(No substitutes) Per Dozen
Part Number 1459590 Contour-B 76-9838 Leracy 768138
Rawlings Soalding Legacy KHSAA Soalding
Price $69.24 $79.23 ea./ $950.76 dz $719.40
Basketball, Girls Game Ball wide seams,
Rawlings KHSAA Approved
(No Substitutes) Per Dozen
Part Number 1459591 Contour- W8 76:9838 Legacy 768148
Rawlings Spalding Legacy KHSAA Spalding
Price $69.24 7923 ea. /$950.76 d: $719.40
FOOTBALLS
Footballs, Leather, Rawlings ST PRO
(No Substitutes) For HCHS Each
Part Number WC727148 Discontinued 727698 / 72-7148 PROSAB
Soalding Legacy KHSAR Rawlings
Price 84.17 8899
Footballs, Leather, Rawlings ST-5
(No Substitutes) Each
Part Number WC726758 Discontinued sTSAB
Rawlings
Price 8417 8899
Footballs, Leather, Wilson TDY Midde
School (o substitutes)
Each
Part Number 1167931 Y-CHR WTF1784 (Composite)
Big Game Tearm Issue Leather Wikson
Price 56.67 $59.95 $3289
OCCER BALL
Balls, Game, KHSAA Approved Ball (No
Substitutes) Each
Part Number 1460271 3015676908
BSN/Select Select Rovale
Price $4127
Part Number
Price
SOFTBALLS
KHSAA Game Approved, 12" Optic
Yellow, Leather Cover. Wilson
ASOL1SST or KHSAA approved (No
Substitutes) Per Dozen
Part Number CCSBI2LRFFP CLaRYLAR aK1a7 an311y
BSN/Dudley. Rawlings Dudley Thunder KHSAA Dudlev
Price $82.67 $99.53 $7898
Part Number
Price
VOLLEVBALLS
Game, Leather, 18 -Panel, KHSAA
Approved. Rawlings (No
Substitutes) __Each No Bid
Part Number 1460094 VXSEC 54034 VXSEC-210
BSN/Baden Baden Perfection KHSAA Baden
Price $5717 515
TENNIS BALLS
KHSAA Approved Ball Only (Suggested
Dunlop, Wison or Penn) per
Dozen (Can)
Part Number MTDUNCAN T1001
BSN/Dunlon Wilson
price $3.65 (24 cans/case. Full case:
37 oniv)
Part Number
Price
Part Number
Price
Part Number
Price
Part Number
Price
Part Number
Price
Archery
School Practic Mat
Part Number
Price
Paper - 80cm Target Face
Part Number
Price
Touch Target 80cm - Vinyl Face
Part Number
Price
Part C- Uniform
BRAND NAME
e v 10-25% 0-40% 0% 32%
Active Ankies 20%-Yes 0% 25%
Adidas 20%- Golf 10-25% 0% 40%
Alexandra Collection 0%
Alleso 20%-Yes 0.40% 0% 32%
Antigua 10-25% 0%
Asics 25%-Yes 0% 25%
‘Atomic DNA 25%-Yes 0%
Badger v 0-40% 0% 40%
|E\ke Athietic 10-25% 0%,
Flurt < 0%
Champion 25% - Yes 7 0%
Champro 25%- Yes 0.40% 0% 35%
Cobblestone 0%
Converse 0%
20%-Yes 0%
E3 Sports Apparel 0%
Easmn 20%-Yes 0.40% 0% 28%
Fila 0%
Gator 0%
20%-Yes 10-25% 0%
GiaMia - 0%
GTM Direct 0%
Holloway 20%- Golf 25%- Yes 7 10-25% 0-40% 0% 28%
in Sport 0%
acpa 0%
FAMhIetic 0% 10%
ikasa 20%-Yes 0.40% 0%,
izuno 25%-Yes 0% 25%
olten 25%Yes 0% 25%
Igwkec\mhmg 20%- Golf 30%- Yes. 7 10-25% 0%
Nike Footwear 30% - Yes 0%
Perform Better 0% 10% - Training
Eauipment
remier 0%
uma 25% Yes 0%
Rawlings 25%Yes 0a0% 0% 32%
eebok Footwear 0%
Reebok Uniforms 0%
Riddel 0% 15%
Rip-1t 20%Yes 0%
obbins Next 0%
ussell 25% Yes 0a0% 0% 3%
chutt 20%Yes 0a0% 0% 25%
palding 25% Yes 0% 10%
cedo 20%Yes 0%
Sport Source International 0%
Tachikara =
25%- Yes
Ty 25%Yes 0%
UnderArmour 30%- Yes 10-25% 0% 28%




Sportwear ks Greok | Komey | wia
Aluminum | American | Holding, | 550 SEOrS (Varsity | cojgnel | il Heath's Family Howard's o e DpA | B930S | America Mid-West Pyramid School Products 3 Riddell 130507 School Health s | School Specialty 0-286774 must be &S Worldwide PO's must
Company ABBA | "N | e | e [rands Holding Go28|  SOOC | Discount Dance, LLC | e Sereen Prining o Gopher Sports ward meteamspors Q1000 kea | spons | weaciuie [ Mg MOJO Sports Payk12 Pannell Swim shop pank/Schoolotodici NN Rebel Athletics L ———. Ruvis | corporaon abapaos y 02 Scotty's Pro Shop | Spottsville Monsters Senchide POS u Trophy House Varsity Spiit Fashion
o (ESSOEA SR Teamues | Caalog | Abvntan Fsad por s
0% 5% + Free Ground Shipping
Varsity Spirit Fashion I Varsity Sports Fashions &
10.25% Sunnlies
wilson &3
25% - Yes
orth 25%Yes 0%
enith 0%
el Athiet 0%
core 0%
romaxima 0%
@ Apparel 25%Yes 0%
Seige Custom Apparel 0%
0%
Hi- Five 0%
New Balance 0%
Pro Luck 0%
Palos Sports 0%
Double Platinum 0%
‘A WishCome True 0%
other 0% 10%- Trophy &
10.25% - Sportec Awards
Contact T Rideout_|T W] Michelle 61| Jonathon Anderson | Chelsi Staple| Michelle Gusman | Chris Hart il Heath Sam Erickson Jaime Boh | Michelle L 1 [Jenn Lachaelle | Amie e Wichael Vick T) Markland dv Barnes Kenneth Miller Ruth Hoster Paul . Fabanich Junior Lule | Karen Acevedo Tammy Wasinack ScottFrederick Keith Hobson Erin Hemingwav | John Mitchell | Nick Clemens | Tavior Goad
Address 322 2nd st._[1000 037 € Hun 8460 Varsity Brands 840 Savi Ranch Park| 213 2nd . S14Tenthst |2525 L 4401 € {8245 Dean Road | 520 Mccall 124 Harrison Ave. | 1600 Division Rd_| 11613 Real PO Box 1172 2535 E. South Lake Bivd.Ste. 140 3330 Partner Pl suite 124 6510 N 5ath st 2554 Tarplev Road Ste 114 7501 performance Lane | 16960 Sauar{ 11 i Drive 800 Wolf s Bivd.__J Ol i 75 Wil st. 25 park Plaza Dr. | 6745 Lenox Center Ct. Ste. 300
Henderson. K heim. C X [ Yorba Linds. CA 92887 | Henderson. KY Henderson. KY | Owatonna, MN Evansille| indianapolis.N | Manhattar| Roxton. TX West WarwickRI_|Cincinnati Henderson. kY Southiake. T 76092 Lexington. KY 40503 Tamoa. FL 33610-1908 | Carroliton. TX North Rideeville. OH Marvsvile. | __Alsio. 160803 Greenvile, Wi Henderson. KY 42420] __ Soottsville_ kY Colchester, CT Owensboro.KY | Memphis, TN
1068 _azs32| 92807 a2 42420) 420 55060 45240 66502 75477 0 4241 75006 42039 54942 42420 15 42301 38115
Phone 7 [812-037.7.800-328-71] _ 800-527-7510 _[270-577-333¢| 71a-a63-7355 270-853-3361 270.626-4300 | 800-533-0a46 51, 762 or 31 | 8003344 270-631-0520 888.478-5273 270.212-03% xaazs
Fax [812-037.4714-970-90|_800-365-7653 270-8264300 | 8883157252 317.842-5631 270-631-0520 765-683-9375 8136217688 469-208-0017 8002752412 877-800-5573 800-675-1775 800-432-2842 270-684-2306
E-mail helsie.stalk tomhowar] mhk-gtmb| [ am Ti@oavkl m bid:
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mailto:ty@abbapromotions.com#
mailto:toms@aaesports.com#
mailto:sales@archerytargets.com#
mailto:mgusman@discountdance.com#
mailto:bsnbid@bsnsports.com#
mailto:chelsie.staples@henderson.kyschools.us#
mailto:mgusman@discountdance.com#
mailto:hattieelite@yahoo.com#
mailto:bhfamilysports@hotmail.com#
mailto:samerickson@gophersport.com#
mailto:tomhowardgolf@aol.com#
mailto:sales@ircteamsports.com#
mailto:mhk-gtmbids@hanes.com#
mailto:info@kbacoach.com#
mailto:matt@masa.com#
mailto:mfathletic@mfathletic.com#
mailto:team@midwestsports.com#
mailto:michael@mojosportsllc.com#
mailto:TJ@payk12.com#
mailto:cody@pannellswimshop.com#
mailto:biddept@pyramidesp.com#
mailto:ruth@rebelathletic.com#
mailto:bids@riddellsales.com#
mailto:jlule@rudis.com#
mailto:bids@palossports.com#
mailto:bidnotices@schoolspecialty.com#
mailto:smtrackclub@gmail.com#
mailto:bids@ssww.com#
mailto:johnm@swimoutlet.com#
mailto:nick@trophyhouseusa.com#
mailto:oebids@varsity.com#

