HENDERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
1805 SECOND STREET
HENDERSON, KY 42420

Tabulation Sheet

Athletic Equipment and Supplies

Bid # 1-23-5-1
Part A Athletic Catalog
Augusta
) . Sportwear . Discount Elite , Is Greek
e | et | s | e rariares | comonso | Dance. | sceen o seats gy spons| SO | MRS | e ream spons |G 0
Discount LLC Printing Teamwear
Dance
No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
GENERAL SUPPLIES Discount
BASEBALL Discount
BASKETBALL Discount
CHEERLEADING Discount
CROSS COUNTRY Discount
DANCE Discount
FISHING Discount
FOOTBALL Discount
GOLF Discount
SOCCER Discount
SOFTBALL Discount
SWIMMING Discount
TENNIS Discount up to 30% off retail
TRACK Discount
VOLLEYBALL Discount
OTHER (LIST) Archery Discount
Bowling Discount
Trap Shoot Discount
Weightlifting Discount
Ink Kits

Break Through Banners

Mascots & Accessories

Soung System Portable

Bags & Backpacks

Megaphones

Flags

Lacrosse/Wrestling

Drill

Color Guard




Sports Passes

Other

Part B - Specification on Sports Balls

BASEBALLS

Game Baseballs, Rawlings R100
KHSAA Approved (No
Substitutes) Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufacturer

1385513

Price

Rawlings

Part Number

$117.32/doz.

Manufacturer

Price

Baseballs, Worth Brand Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufacturer

Price

BASKETBALLS

Basketball, Boys Game Ball wide
seams, Rawlings KHSAA Approved
(No Substitutes) Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufacturer

Price

Basketball, Girls Game Ball wide
seams, Rawlings KHSAA Approved
(No Substitutes) Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufacturer

Price

FOOTBALLS

Footballs, Leather, Rawlings ST PRO
(No Substitutes) For HCHS
Each

Part Number

Manufacturer

Price




Footballs, Leather, Rawlings ST-5
(No Substitutes) Each

Part Number

Manufacturer

Price

Footballs, Leather, Wilson TDY
Middle School (No Substitutes)
Each

Part Number

Manufacturer

1667931

Price

Wilson

$71.35/each

SOCCER BALLS

Balls, Game, KHSAA Approved Ball
(No Substitutes) Each

Part Number

Manufacturer

Price

Part Number

Manufacturer

Price

SOFTBALLS

KHSAA Game Approved, 12" Optic
Yellow, Leather Cover. Wilson
A9011SST or KHSAA approved (No
Substitutes) Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufacturer

Price

Part Number

$102.22/doz.

Manufacturer

Price

VOLLEYBALLS

Game, Leather, 18 -Panel, KHSAA
Approved. Rawlings
(No Substitutes) Each

Part Number

Manufacturer




Price

TENNIS BALLS

KHSAA Approved Ball Only
(Suggested Dunlop, Wilson or Penn)
Per Dozen (Can)

A
A

Part Number MTWILCAN 601349
Manufacturer Wilson P Champ - Dunlop
Price $7.13/can 3.79 acan
Part Number AW 601347
Manufacturer Prix - Dunlop
Price 19 a can

001

Part Number

Manufacturer

Price

Part Number

Manufacturer

Price

Part Number

Manufacturer

Price

Part Number

Manufacturer

Price

Archery

School Practic Mat

Part Number

Manufacturer

Price

Paper - 80cm Target Face

Part Number

Manufacturer

Price

Touch Target 80cm - Vinyl Face

Part Number

Manufacturer

Price

Part C - Uniform

BRAND NAME

Ad ) - 25% 0-40%

Active Ankles 10%

Adidas 10-25%
Alexandra Collection

Alleson 25% 10 - 25% 0 -40%




Antigua

Asics

Atomic DNA

25%

Badger

Bike Athletic

25%

Capezio/Bloch/Gotta Flurt

10 - 25%

Champion

Champro

Cobblestone

Converse

DUC

E3 Sports Apparel

Easton

Fila

Gator

General Supplies

Gia Mia

GTM Direct

Holloway

In Sport

Kaepa

MFAthletic

Mikasa

Mizuno

Molten

Nike Clothing

Nike Footwear

Perform Better

10 - 25%

Premier

Puma

Rawlings

Reebok Footwear

Reebok Uniforms

0 -40%

Riddell

Rip-It

Robbins Next

Russell

Schutt

Spalding

0-40%

Speedo

0-40%

Sport Source International

Tachikara

10%

up to 30% - Tennis

up to 30% - Tennis

up to 30% - Tennis

up to 20% - Tennis

up to 30% - Tennis

up to 20% - Tennis

up to 20% - Tennis




Tyr 10%

Stocked Apparel 35%
Footwear 25%

UnderArmour

Varsity Spirit Fashion

Wilson

Worth

Xenith

Rebel Athletic

Score

Promaxima

BSN Apparel

Seige Custom Apparel

Augusta Sportwear

Hi - Five

New Balance

Pro Luck

Palos Sports

Double Platinum

A WishCome True

Other Babolat - Tennis & Tail - Tenni

Contact Tom Collins  |Cory Staples Chris Hartn Bill Heath Sam Erikson Paul Brumbaugh Jaime Bohr]

Address 4340 Southside Dr 213 2nd St} 514 Tenth St 2525 Len|4401 E. Mg 8249 Dean Road 520 McCall
brmers Bra Henderson, KY Hendersorn Henderson, KY Owatonn|Evansivlle, Indianapolis, IN Manhattan

42420 42420 42420 55060 46240 66502

Phone 610-825-65(812-937-71|800-328-71( 800-52/-7510 270-860-4672 270-860-9 270-826-4300 800-533-|812-476-4366-486-1762 or 317-849-253]800-336-44

Fax 610-825-23|812-937-41]714-970-907 800-365-7653 270-827-8 270-826-4300 888-319-7452 317-842-5631 877-610-41

E-mail toms@aaegdsales@arch|mgusman@{bsnbid@bsnsports.comcory.staples@gmail.com [orders@hégrfamilysports@hotmail.co sam.erikdtomhowarc sales@ircteamsports.com |mhk-gtmbi



mailto:toms@aaesports.com
mailto:sales@archerytargets.com
mailto:mgusman@discountdance.com
mailto:bsnbid@bsnsports.com
mailto:cory.staples@gmail.com
mailto:orders@hendersonelite.com
mailto:bhfamilysports@hotmail.com
mailto:sam.erikson@gophersport.com
mailto:tomhowardgolf@aol.com
mailto:sales@ircteamsports.com
mailto:mhk-gtmbids@hanes.com

Korney

Mid

Boards - America Mid-West Riddell School Health
KBA Sports MFAC, LLC Sports MOJO Sports Pay K12 Pannell Swim Shop Rebel Athletics | 139330 Must Appear On All RUDIS Corporation dba Palos School Specialty
Catalog Advr;nta e P POs Sports
Pricing 9
No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
0,
32% _ Riddell 13% 29%
32% Riddell 13% 29%
32% iddell 13% 29%
32% iddell 13% 29%
10% MFAC 32% 13%
32% 13%
32% 13%
32% 10% - Ri 13% 29%
32% 13% 29%
2% 13% 29%
2% 13%
32% 20% 13% 29%
13% 29%
3 10% - Riddell 13% 29%
329 10% - Riddell 13% 29%
2% 13%

10% - Riddell




10% General Training equipment

41-100KY
Spaulding
$84.95

\\e

$59.95

727698
Spaulding
$84.95

1038460-PS

Wilson

$21.74




727148

Alpha

$84.95

Y-CHR

Big Game Team Issue Leather

$59.95

1297294 - Athletic
Connection

son GSTY Composite

$45.99

3015676908

Select Royale

$49.95

5A9011BSST - Athletic
Specialties

Wilson high school softball

43199-PS

$158.36

Dudley

$104.28

VX5EC-5403A

Baden Perfection

33082-PS

Rawlings




$49.95 $62.63

41024-PS

Wilson

$5.38

32%

25% 13%

40%

32%




Our Brand

30%

40%

35%

13% - geneeral

13% - baseball, softball,
football

28%

13% - baseball

13% - general

13% - volleyball

13% - general

baseball, volleyball,
basketball, football

35% - 2023 Catalog

32%

25%

10%

3% - volleyball, basketba

20%

13% - volleyball,

basketball, soccer,




13% - volleyball,
baseball, tennis,

20% - Arena, Tyr, Dolfin,
Finis

Michelle L Matt FreenjJenn Lachapel Amie Meye Michael Vick TJ Markland Cody Barnes Ruth Hosier Paul J. Fabanich Junior Lule Karen Acevedo Tammy Wasinack
312 Harrison Ave 1600 Division R 11613 Rea( PO Box 1172 2535 E. South L3330 Partner Pl Suite 124|2554 Tarpley Road 7501 Performance Lane |16960 Squarel 11711 S. Austin Ave W6316 Design Drive
Roxton, TX West Warwick,Rl  [Cincinnati, Henderson, KY Southlake, TX 7] Lexington, KY 40503 |Carrollton, TX North Ridgeville, OH Marysville, Of Alsip, 11 60803 Greenville, WI

75477 02893 42419 75006 44039 54942
800-842-771800-264-44800-556-7464 800-334-41 270-631-0520 888-478-5273 859-272-7946 469-208-9612 440-353-8600 937-738-690( 800-233-5484 888-388-3224
87-488-3920 800-682-6950 270-631-0520 765-683-9375 469-208-0017 800-275-2412 877-800-5973 800-675-1775
info@kbachatt@mas mfathletic@mfathldteam@mid| Michael@mojosportslic.com |[TJ@payk12.corpdy@pannellswimshop.co|ruth@rebelathleti bids@riddellsales.com |[jlule@rudis.cd bids@palossports.com Hnotices@schoolspecialty.co



mailto:info@kbacoach.com
mailto:matt@masa.com
mailto:mfathletic@mfathletic.com
mailto:team@midwestsports.com
mailto:Michael@mojosportsllc.com
mailto:TJ@payk12.com
mailto:cody@pannellswimshop.com
mailto:ruth@rebelathletics.com
mailto:bids@riddellsales.com
mailto:jlule@rudis.com
mailto:bids@palossports.com
mailto:bidnotices@schoolspecialty.com

Swimoutlet.co

Varsity

Scotty's Pro Shop Spottsville Monsters S & S Worldwide m Trophy House Spirit
Fashion
No Bid No Bid No Bid

10%

% - Trophies
















Scott Frederick

Erin Hemingway

Nick Clemens

Taylor Goad

800 Wolf Hills Blvd

on SpOottsville

75 Mill St.

325 Park Plaza Dr.

6745 Lenox Center Ct. Ste. 300

Henderson, KY 424

Spottsville, KY

olchester, CT

Owensboro, KY

Memphis, TN

42420

42301

38115

270-212-0336

270-724-2218

800-642-7354

408-310-4959

270-684-2305

800-533-8022, x5921

800-432-2842

408-680-3783

270-684-2306

m

smtrackclub@gmail.com

bids@ssww.com

rory@swimouf]

Lk@trophyhouseusa.cq

oebids@varsity.com



mailto:smtrackclub@gmail.com
mailto:bids@ssww.com
mailto:rory@swimoutlet.com
mailto:nick@trophyhouseusa.com
mailto:oebids@varsity.com

