JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID: 8172

APPROVAL DATE: October 25, 2022

ITEM(S) QUOTED: FURNITURE, CLASSROOM & OFFICE (Percentage)
DATE BIDS RECEIVED: October 05, 2022

CONTRACT PERIOD: From November 10, 2022 through November 09, 2023
RENEWAL(S): No renewal option.

COMMENTS: An * indicates an award.



Vendor Response Terms

Vendor Name

Response Terms

Response Payment Terms

Creative-image technologies Full Catalog is attached for all categories Net 30
marked (#7, 17, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25) at
42% Off List Price
Discount School Supply See attached terms for exceptions/exclusions. Net 30
Drennan Equipment Company Net 30
FriendsOffice net 30
Kaplan Early Learning Company 15% discount on orders of $300 or more on Net 30
current list pricing in effect at time of order.
Free freight on orders of $300 or more per
shipping location. Some exclusions apply -
See enclosed "Exclusions From Our Offer"
statement
KDA Office Furniture Net 30
Kerr Workplace Solutions No Credit Card or Debit Card payments Net 30 Days.
permitted on bid purchase orders.
Lakeshore Learning Materials Please reference "Per Bid #8172" on all Net 30

purchase orders. Discount is not applicable to
sale items.

Munson Business Interiors

30 days from invoice

30 days from invoice

Nu-ldea Net 30 Days
Office Depot net 30
Office Resources, Inc. net 30 days

Osterman Cron Louisville LLC

Net 30 days from Invoice date

Net 30 days from Invoice date

Really Good Stuff See attached terms. Net 30
School Outfitters LLC Discount structure includes up to delivery to Net 30
the room of choice, assembly and dunnage
removal during normal working hours.
Warehousing is available for an additional
charge.
School Specialty Inc. NET30
Tom Sexton & Associates 45-60 Days Net 30 Days

Virco Inc.



ITEM NO. 1 - FURNITURE, OFFICE CHAIRS & UPHOLSTERY. ALLSTEEL (4600250-1733148)

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Munson Business Interiors 53.50 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Office Depot .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: We do not sell their products.

School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID

ITEM NO. 2 - FURNITURE, OFFICE, LOBBY, CONFERENCE, WOOD/METAL. ALLSTEEL. (4600250-1729473)

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Munson Business Interiors 62.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Office Depot .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: We do not carry their products.

School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID

ITEM NO. 3 - FURNITURE, OFFICE CHAIRS ONLY. GLOBAL. (4600250-2000752)

AWARD NOTES: The tie bid is broken by awarding to the vendor with a local representative, School Specialty Inc.
PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Office Depot 54.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Tier 1 54% off list/up to 25K Tier 2 55% off list/25K-50K Tier 3 56% off
list/50K-100K Tier 4 negotiable over 100K

School Specialty Inc. 54.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: 54% OFF MSRP PRICE LISTS

Office Resources, Inc. 51.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Tom Sexton & Associates 42.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: 30-60 Days

FriendsOffice 40.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Nu-ldea 35.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: www.globalfurnituregroup.com

ITEM NO. 4 - FURNITURE, OFFICE CHAIRS & UPHOLSTERY. HON. (4600250-1717549)

Note: * indicates a pending award. 3



PERCENTAGE

Note: * indicates a pending award.

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Kerr Workplace Solutions 59.11 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Munson Business Interiors 59.02 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

FriendsOffice 59.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Office Resources, Inc. 53.20 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Office Depot 53.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Tier 1 53% off list/up to 25K Tier 2 55% off list/25K-50K Tier 3 55% off

list/50K-100K Tier 4 59% over 100K

School Specialty Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 5 - FURNITURE, OFFICE, LOBBY, CONFERENCE, WOOD/METAL. HON. (4600250-1727822)
PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Munson Business Interiors 58.51 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Kerr Workplace Solutions 58.11 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

FriendsOffice 58.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Office Resources, Inc. 53.20 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Office Depot 53.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Tier 1 53% off list/up to 25K Tier 2 55% off list/25K-50K Tier 3 55% off

list/50K-100K Tier 4 59% over 100K

School Specialty Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 6 - FURNITURE, OFFICE CHAIRS AND UPHOLSTERY. JSI. (4600250-2015013)
PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Munson Business Interiors 54.20 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

KDA Office Furniture 52.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Kerr Workplace Solutions 50.01 %



CATEGORY NOTES:

Product Pricer File too large to submit through ESM:
https://lwww.jsifurniture.com/resources/literature/type/4

CATEGORY NOTES:

Note: * indicates a pending award.

Tier 1 56% off list/up to 25K Tier 2 57% off list/25K-50K Tier 3 58% off
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Tom Sexton & Associates 49.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: 60-90 Days

Drennan Equipment Company 48.50 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes delivery and installation

Office Depot .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: we do not carry their products

School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID

ITEM NO. 7 - FURNITURE, OFFICE, LOBBY, CONFERENCE, WOOD/METAL. (4600250-2015014)
AWARD NOTES: Reject School Specialty Inc. - substitute not acceptable.
CATEGORY NOTES: LEARNING ENVIRONMENTS GRADES 9-12. JSI.
PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

School Specialty Inc. 54.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: CLASSROOM SELECT 54% OFF MSRP

Munson Business Interiors 53.70 % *
CATEGORY NOTES:

KDA Office Furniture 52.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Kerr Workplace Solutions 50.01 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Product Pricer File too large to submit through ESM:

https://www.jsifurniture.com/resources/literature/type/4

Tom Sexton & Associates 49.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:  60-90 Days

Drennan Equipment Company 48.50 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes delivery & installation

Creative-image technologies 42.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Alternate MooreCo Catalog Attached

Really Good Stuff 3.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Office Depot .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: no bid, we do sell their products

ITEM NO. 8 - FURNITURE, OFFICE CHAIRS & UPHOLSTERY. KIMBALL. (4600250-1727818)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Office Depot 56.00 % *



list/50K-100K Tier 4 negotiable over 100K

Osterman Cron Louisville LLC 55.10 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Office Resources, Inc. 54.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 9 - FURNITURE, OFFICE, LOBBY, CONFERENCE, WOOD/METAL. KIMBALL (4600250-2013468)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Office Depot 56.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: Tier 1 56% off list/up to 25K Tier 2 57% off list/25K-50K Tier 3 58% off
list/50K-100K Tier 4 negotiable over 100K
Osterman Cron Louisville LLC 55.10 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Office Resources, Inc. 54.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 10 - FURNITURE, OFFICE CHAIRS & UPHOLSTERY. KRUEGER INTERNATIONAL/KI. (4600250-2011988)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
KDA Office Furniture 43.50% *
CATEGORY NOTES:
Office Depot 20.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: All other special order solutions, available through the Workspace
Interiors line card, will be made available to complete or enhance a
project. Contract pricing to be quoted at the time of specification.
Minimum discount of 20% to be applied.
School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 11 - FURNITURE, OFFICE, LOBBY, CONFERENCE, WOOD/METAL. KRUEGER INTERNATIONAL/KI.
(4600250-2014920)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
KDA Office Furniture 43.50% *
CATEGORY NOTES:
Office Depot 20.00 %

Note: * indicates a pending award.



CATEGORY NOTES: All other special order solutions, available through the Workspace
Interiors line card, will be made available to complete or enhance a
project. Contract pricing to be quoted at the time of specification.
Minimum discount of 20% to be applied.

School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 12 - FURNITURE, OFFICE, CHAIRS & UPHOLSTERY. NATIONAL. (4600250-1717550)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Osterman Cron Louisville LLC 57.55 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Office Resources, Inc. 55.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Office Depot 54.50 %
CATEGORY NOTES: This discount is at all volumes

School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID

ITEM NO. 13 - FURNITURE, OFFICE MODULAR. WAVEWORKS/RENEGADE ONLY. NATIONAL. (4600250-2010813)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Osterman Cron Louisville LLC 56.10 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Office Resources, Inc. 55.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Office Depot 54.50 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount is at all volumes.

School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID

ITEM NO. 14 - FURNITURE, OFFICE, LOBBY, CONFERENCE. (4600250-1717556)
CATEGORY NOTES: WOOD/METAL, (EXCLUDING WAVEWORKS/RENEGADE). NATIONAL.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Osterman Cron Louisville LLC 57.55 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Office Resources, Inc. 55.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Office Depot 54.50 %

Note: * indicates a pending award. 7



CATEGORY NOTES: This discount is at all volume.

School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 15 - FURNITURE, OFFICE CHAIRS AND UPHOLSTERY. STEELCASE. (4600250-2015015)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Office Resources, Inc. 40.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Office Depot .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: We do not carry their products.
School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 16 - FURNITURE, OFFICE, LOBBY, CONFERENCE. (4600250-2015016)
CATEGORY NOTES: WOOD/METAL, LEARNING ENVIRONMENTS GRADES 9-12. STEELCASE.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Office Resources, Inc. 40.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Discount School Supply 15.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Really Good Stuff 3.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Office Depot .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: We do not carry their products.

School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID

ITEM NO. 17 - FURNITURE, CLASSROOM TYPE. ARTCO-BELL - FULL LINE. INCLUDES SHAPE TABLES, (4600250-2013469)
AWARD NOTES: Reject Creative-Image Technologies - substitute not acceptable.
CATEGORY NOTES: ACTIVE SEATING, MAKERSPACE, COLLABORATIVE LEARNING, SOFT SEATING/LOUNGE,
MEDIA CENTER, ADJUSTABLE & CAFE HEIGHT OPTIONS.
PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Creative-image technologies 42.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Alternate MooreCo Catalog Attached

Tom Sexton & Associates 42.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: 60-90 Days

Discount School Supply 15.00 %

Note: * indicates a pending award. 8



CATEGORY NOTES:

Really Good Stuff 3.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Office Depot .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: We do not carry their products.

School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID

ITEM NO. 18 - FURNITURE, CLASSROOM TYPE. FOMCORE - FULL LINE. SOFT SEATING. (4600250-2014719)

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Munson Business Interiors 51.50 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Kerr Workplace Solutions 51.01 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Office Resources, Inc. 47.75 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Nu-ldea 35.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: fomcore.com

Discount School Supply 15.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Really Good Stuff 3.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Office Depot .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: We do not carry their products.

School Specialty Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID

ITEM NO. 19 - FURNITURE, CLASSROOM TYPE. KRUEGER INTERNATIONAL/KI - FULL LINE. (4600250-1727821)

CATEGORY NOTES: INCLUDES SHAPE TABLES, ACTIVE SEATING, MAKERSPACE, COLLABORATIVE LEARNING,
SOFT SEATING/LOUNGE, MEDIA CENTER, ADJUSTABLE & CAFE HEIGHT OPTIONS.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
KDA Office Furniture 43.50 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Creative-image technologies 42.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Alternate MooreCo Catalog Attached
Office Depot 20.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: All other special order solutions, available through the Workspace
Interiors line card, will be made available to complete or enhance a
project. Contract pricing to be quoted at the time of specification.

Note: * indicates a pending award. 9



Minimum discount of 20% to be applied.

Discount School Supply 15.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Really Good Stuff 3.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:  NO BID
ITEM NO. 20 - FURNITURE, CLASSROOM TYPE. MIEN - FULL LINE. INCLUDES SHAPE TABLES, ACTIVE. (4600250-2014718)
CATEGORY NOTES: SEATING, MAKERSPACE, COLLABORATIVE LEARNING, SOFT SEATING/LOUNGE, MEDIA
CENTER, ADJUSTABLE & CAFE HEIGHT OPTIONS.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
School Specialty Inc. 50.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: MIEN 50% OFF MSRP
Tom Sexton & Associates 46.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: 60-90 Days
Creative-image technologies 42.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Alternate MooreCo Catalog Attached
Nu-ldea 35.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: www.miencompany.com
Discount School Supply 15.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Really Good Stuff 3.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Office Depot .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: We do not carry their products.
ITEM NO. 21 - FURNITURE, CLASSROOM TYPE. SMITH SYSTEM - FULL LINE. (4600250-2014422)
AWARD NOTES: Reject Creative-Image Technologies - substitute not acceptable.
CATEGORY NOTES: INCLUDES SHAPE TABLES, ACTIVE SEATING, MAKERSPACE, COLLABORATIVE LEARNING,
SOFT SEATING/LOUNGE, MEDIA CENTER, ADJUSTABLE & CAFE HEIGHT OPTIONS.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Creative-image technologies 42.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Alternate MooreCo Catalog Attached
School Specialty Inc. 35.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: SMITH SYSTEM 35% OFF MSRP
Office Resources, Inc. 33.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Nu-ldea 25.00 %

Note: * indicates a pending award.
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CATEGORY NOTES: www.smithsystem.com

Discount School Supply 15.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Really Good Stuff 3.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Office Depot .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: We do not carry their products.

ITEM NO. 22 - EARLY CHILDHOOD CLASSROOM FURNITURE WOODEN. (4600250-2013470)

AWARD NOTES: Reject Discount School Supply and Really Good Stuff - shipping charges not acceptable per bid terms
and conditions. Awarded to Kerr Workplace Solutions on HON K-12 furniture based on highest
percentage of discount.

CATEGORY NOTES: MUST BE AGE APPROPRIATE FOR PRE-K THROUGH 2ND GRADE. INCLUDE NAME OF
MANUFACTURER YOU ARE BIDDING, OR PROVIDE CATALOG IF VENDOR FULL LINE IS
INCLUDED IN BID. (MAY BE AWARDED TO MULTIPLE VENDORS TO ENSURE ADEQUATE

COVERAGE).
PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Virco Inc. 56.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Percentage of Virco Catalog List Price in effect at time of Order

Kerr Workplace Solutions 55.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Hon: See attached Hon K-12 Product Catalog.

School Specialty Inc. 54.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: CLASSROOM SELECT 54% OFF MSRP

Creative-image technologies 42.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Alternate MooreCo Catalog Attached

Discount School Supply 15.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Kaplan Early Learning Company 15.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount applied to orders of $300 or more on current list pricing in

effect at time of order. Some exclusions apply

Office Resources, Inc. 13.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Jonti-Craft

Nu-ldea 10.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: www.wooddesigns.com

Lakeshore Learning Materials 7.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Lakeshore Learning Materials. Please reference "Per Bid #8172" on all
purchase orders to receive these terms. Discount is not applicable to
sale items. Please visit us at www.lakeshorelearning.com.

Really Good Stuff 3.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

School Outfitters LLC 3.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: www.schooloutfitters.com Discount structure includes up to delivery to
the room of choice, assembly and dunnage removal during normal

Note: * indicates a pending award. 11



working hours. Warehousing is available for an additional charge.

Office Depot .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: At this time, we do not have a wooden ONLY furniture provider
ITEM NO. 23 - EARLY CHILDHOOD CLASSROOM FURNITURE, NON-WOODEN. (4600250-2013471)
AWARD NOTES: Reject Discount School Supply and Really Good Stuff - shipping charges not acceptable per bid terms
and conditions. Reject Office Resources, Inc. - Smith System awarded on Line Iltem No. 21 based on
highest percentage of discount. Awarded to Kerr Workplace Solutions for HON K-12 furniture based
on highest percentage of discount.
CATEGORY NOTES: MUST BE AGE APPROPRIATE FOR PRE-K THROUGH 2ND GRADE. INCLUDE NAME OF
MANUFACTURER YOU ARE BIDDING, OR PROVIDE CATALOG IF VENDOR FULL LINE IS
INCLUDED IN BID. (MAY BE AWARDED TO MULTIPLE VENDORS TO ENSURE ADEQUATE
COVERAGE).
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Virco Inc. 56.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Percentage of Virco Catalog List Price in effect at time of Order

Kerr Workplace Solutions

CATEGORY NOTES:

Hon: See attached Hon K-12 Product Catalog.

55.00 %

School Specialty Inc.
CATEGORY NOTES:

CLASSROOM SELECT 54% OFF MSRP

54.00 %

Office Depot 53.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: HON: Tier 1 53% off list/up to 25K Tier 2 55% off list/25K-50K Tier 3
55% off list/50K-100K Tier 4 59% over 100K
KDA Office Furniture 43.50 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

KI Furniture (full line)

Creative-image technologies

CATEGORY NOTES:

Alternate MooreCo Catalog Attached

42.00 %

Drennan Equipment Company 40.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Flash Furniture www.FlashFurniture.com

Office Resources, Inc. 33.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Discount School Supply 15.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Kaplan Early Learning Company 15.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Discount applied to orders of $300 or more on current list pricing in
effect at time of order. Some exclusions apply

Nu-ldea 12.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: www.jonti-craft.com
Lakeshore Learning Materials 7.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Lakeshore Learning Materials. Please reference "Per Bid #8172" on all
purchase orders to receive these terms. Discount is not applicable to
sale items. Please visit us at www.lakeshorelearning.com.
School Ouftfitters LLC 5.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:
Note: * indicates a pending award.

www.schooloutfitters.com Discount structure includes up to delivery to
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the room of choice, assembly and dunnage removal during normal
working hours. Warehousing is available for an additional charge.

Note: * indicates a pending award.
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Really Good Stuff 3.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
ITEM NO. 24 - COMPUTER WORKSTATIONS, TABLES, CARTS, STUDY CARRELS. (4600250-2013467)
CATEGORY NOTES: PODIUMS, LECTERNS AND LIKE ITEMS. DOES NOT INCLUDE FULL LINE. BALT/MOORE CO.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Office Depot 50.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: Tier 1 50% off list/up to 25K Tier 2 51% off list/25K-50K Tier 3 52% off
list/50K-100K Tier 4 negotiable over 100K Freight is individually
calculated per item and will be added to quote as an extra charge.
Kerr Workplace Solutions 43.25 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
School Specialty Inc. 43.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: MOORECO 43% OFF MSRP
Creative-image technologies 42.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Alternate MooreCo Catalog Attached
Nu-ldea 35.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: mooreco.com
Office Resources, Inc. 34.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
ITEM NO. 25 - COMPUTER WORKSTATIONS, TABLES, CARTS, PODIUMS, LECTERNS. (4600250-1727824)
CATEGORY NOTES:  DRAFTING MAILROOM TABLES/SORTERS. SAFCO/MAYLINE.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Kerr Workplace Solutions 51.15% *
CATEGORY NOTES:
Munson Business Interiors 51.12 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Office Depot 44.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Tier 1 44% off list/up to 25K Tier 2 45% off list/25K-50K Tier 3 46% off
list/50K-100K Tier 4 negotiable over 100K
Creative-image technologies 42.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Alternate MooreCo Catalog Attached
FriendsOffice 40.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: SAFCO is 48.00% off list
School Specialty Inc. 38.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: SAFCO 38% OFF MSRP
Nu-ldea 25.00 %



CATEGORY NOTES:

www.safcoproducts.com

Discount School Supply 15.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
TEM NO. 26 - DISPLAY, TROPHY & MESSENGER CASES. WADDELL. (4600250-1720042)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Kerr Workplace Solutions 41.25 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Munson Business Interiors 41.12 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
FriendsOffice 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Office Resources, Inc. 36.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Office Depot 20.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: All other special order solutions, available through the Workspace
Interiors line card, will be made available to complete or enhance a
project. Contract pricing to be quoted at the time of specification.
Minimum discount of 20% to be applied.
School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 27 - PARTITION PANELS, PORTABLE, CLASSROOM DIVIDERS. COMMERCIAL GRADE. SCREENFLEX.
(4600250-1733150)
AWARD NOTES: Reject Office Depot - shipping charges not acceptable per bid terms and conditions. Reject School
Specialty Inc. - substitute not acceptable.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Office Depot 55.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: 55% discount is for all tiers. Freight is individually calculated per item
and will be added to quote as an extra charge.
School Specialty Inc. 54.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: CLASSROOM SELECT 54% OFF MSRP
FriendsOffice 30.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Office Resources, Inc. 26.50 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Kerr Workplace Solutions 26.25 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Discount School Supply 15.00 %

Note: * indicates a pending award.

CATEGORY NOTES:
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Really Good Stuff 3.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO. 28 - SEATING, PORTABLE FOLDING CHAIRS. CLARIN. INCLUDES CUSTOM LOGO AND SIDELINE CHAIRS.
(4600250-1731507)

AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this item.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Office Depot .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: we do not carry their products
School Specialty Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID

Note: * indicates a pending award. 15



