
Kenton County School Distric-t I It's a6uutjf.L£ lijas. 

DATE: 
09/22/2022 

AGENDA ITEM (ACTION ITEM): 

Issue Paper 

Consider/Approve awarding of the Snow Removal & Salting Bid to Precise Lawn Care and All 
Pro Supply as indicated on the Snow Removal & Salting bid tabulation, for the period of October 
4th, 2022 through April 30, 2023, with three mutually agreed upon annual renewals available; 
reject the proposed bid for ice melt due to budget constraints and enter into competitive 
negotiation to secure service for the remaining locations for snow removal/rock salt applications 
and to secure ice melt and bulk rock salt. 

APPLICABLE BOARD POLICY: 
Fiscal Management 04.32 AP.1 

HISTORY /BACKGROUND: 
An advertisement to accept sealed bids for Snow Removal & Salting was posted on the district 
website on September 9, 2022. Bids were publicly opened on September 21, 2022 at 2:00 PM EST. 
This bid has three optional renewals. Due to budget constraints we are requesting to reject the 
proposed bid for ice melt. 

FISCAL/BUDGETARY IMPACT: 
Service will be provided based on weather conditions. For this reason budget estimates are unable 
to be determined. 

RECOMMENDATION: 
Approval to award the Snow Removal & Salting Bid to Precise Lawn Care and All Pro Supply as 
indicated on the Snow Removal & Salting bid tabulation, for the period of October 4th, 2022 
through April 30, 2023, with three mutually agreed upon annual renewals available; reject the 
proposed bid for ice melt due to budget constraints and enter into competitive negotiation to secure 
service for the remaining locations for snow removal/rock salt applications and to secure ice melt 
and bulk rock salt. 

CONTACT PERSON: 
Jennifer Weis-Smith 

c;i,j£[;_-~_· __ _ 
Use this form to submit your request to the Superintendent for items to be added to the Board Meeting Agenda. 
Principal -complete, print, sign and send to your Director. Director -if approved, sign and put in the Superintendent's mailbox. 



KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
SNOW REMOVAL & SAL TING 

SNOW REMOVAL 

Precise Lawn Care 

Group A 1.0" -1.9" 2.0" - 4.0" 4.1" - 7.0" 7.1" -10.0" 

River Ridge Elementary I s 625.00 $ 845.00 $ 1,140.00 $ 1,540.00 

Ft. Wright Elementary No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Dixie Heights High School No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Turkey Foot Middle/Caywood Elementary No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

R.C. Hinsdale Elementary No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Group B 1.0" -1.9" 2.0" - 4.0" 4.1" - 7.0" 7.1" - 10.0" 

Beechgrove Elementary I s 490.00 $ 660.00 $ 890.00 $ 1,200.00 

Simon Kenton/Kenton Elementary No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Piner Elementary No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Twenhofel Middle School No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

White's Tower Elementary No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Group C 1.0" -1.9" 2.0" - 4.0" 4.1" - 7.0" 7.1" - 10.0" 

Summit View Academy No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Scott High School/Woodland Middle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Taylor Mill Elementary I s 225.00 $ 300.00 $ 405.00 $ 545 .00 

Ryland Heights Elementary No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Salt Rock 

Application 

$ 800.00 I 
No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

Salt Rock 

Application 

$ 630.00 I 
No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

Salt Rock 

Application 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$ 375 .oo I 
No Bid 

= Recommended as the best evaluated bidder 

* Only one bid was received. The District will now enter into competitive negotiations on the locations not awarded. 

ICE MELT 

501b Bag 

Rock Salt 

501b Bag 

Rock Salt 100% (Bulk) 

Rock Salt 50%/Sand 50% 

ICE MELT PRODUCT 
All Pro Supply 

$ 19.50 

I s 6.45 I 
No Bid 

No Bid 

= Recommended as the best evaluated bid 

*The District is requesting to reject the proposed bid for 501b bags of Ice Melt due to budget constraints. The 

proposed price is more than double of what the District paid last year. The District will enter into competitive 

negotiations to secure Ice Melt that is within budget. 


