JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID: 8125

APPROVAL DATE: June 28, 2022

ITEM(S) QUOTED: AUTOMOTIVE REPAIR PARTS & SERVICE (PERCENTAGE
DATE BIDS RECEIVED: June 02, 2022

CONTRACT PERIOD: From July 01, 2022 through June 30, 2023

RENEWAL(S): Two (2) annual renewals at the option of both parties.

COMMENTS: An * indicates an award.



Vendor Response Terms

Vendor Name

Response Terms

Response Payment Terms

Byerly Ford / Nissan

Central States Bus Sales, Inc. NET 30 NET 30
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc.
Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & ITEM NO. 1 - Captive Dealer ltems: Cummins. Net 30
Service) Cummins Inc. (dba Cummins Sales and
Service) would like to offer 26% off MSRP for
Item No. 1.
Diesel Injection Service Co. Inc. 1 day in stock, up to 2-3 days if not in stock Net 10th
item
Kentucky Truck Sales Inc.
Louisville Auto Spring & Brake Co. 3 to 5 business days net 30
Moog Louisville Warehouse
NAPA AUTO PARTS a) yes b) no 2%10net20

O'Reilly Automotive

List Less 41% or better

2% 10, Net 20

Palmer Trucks/Kenworth Of Louisville net 30
Roppel Industries Net 30

total truck parts

Truck Parts & Service Do to the Shape our country is in, We can not net 30 Days.

guarantee pricing or brand Names on any
parts at this Time

Uhl Truck Sales

Whayne Supply

1a) Yes 1b) No 2) 10001 Linn Station Rd.
Louisville, KY 40223 3) 10001 Linn Station
Rd. Louisville, KY 40223 4) 7 Days W9
attached



ITEM NO. 1 - Captive Dealer Items: Cummins. (4600020-2014824)

AWARD NOTES: Reject Whayne Supply - insufficient information supplied for evaluation purposes.

CATEGORY NOTES: To include: Engine Parts, Exhaust Parts, Manual and Power Steering Parts and Hardware (new).
Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off manufacturer's list prices for any and all items listed
in dealer's catalog(s).

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Whayne Supply 35.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: 35% off of advertised list price.

Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Service) 26.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: 26% off of MSRP

Uhl Truck Sales 20.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Central States Bus Sales, Inc. 10.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: LEADTIMES MAY VERY DEPENDING ON VENDOR

Diesel Injection Service Co. Inc. 10.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: 1 Day in stock 2-3 Days non stock

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

O'Reilly Automotive .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 2 - Captive Dealer Items: Ford. (4600020-2014825)

AWARD NOTES: Reject O'Reilly Automotive - vendor is not a captive dealer.

CATEGORY NOTES: To include: Clutch Parts, Drive Line Assemblies and Hardware, Engine Parts, Exhaust Parts,
Hydraulic Brake Parts, Manual and Power Steering Parts and Hardware (new), Manual Transmission
Parts, OEM Replacement Parts for Automatic Transmission, Relays, Suspension Parts, Switches,
and Windshield Wiper Parts. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off manufacturer's list
prices for any and all items listed in dealer's catalog(s).

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Motorcraft

Byerly Ford / Nissan 32.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Central States Bus Sales, Inc. 10.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: LEADTIMES MAY VERY DEPENDING ON VENDOR

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: no bid

ITEM NO. 3 - Captive Dealer Items: GM. (4600020-2014826)
AWARD NOTES: Reject O'Reilly Automotive - vendor is not a captive dealer. There were no other bids received for this

item.

Note: * indicates a pending award. 3



CATEGORY NOTES: To include: Clutch Parts, Drive Line Assemblies and Hardware, Engine Parts, Exhaust Parts,
Hydraulic Brake Parts, Manual and Power Steering Parts and Hardware (new), Manual Transmission
Parts, OEM Replacement Parts for Automatic Transmission, Relays, Suspension Parts, Switches,
and Windshield Wiper Parts. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off manufacturer's list
prices for any and all items listed in dealer's catalog(s).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better AC Delco, Dorman, Power Torque, Precision,
MasterPro
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: no bid

ITEM NO. 4 - Captive Dealer Items: International. (4600020-2014827)

AWARD NOTES: Reject Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. - vendor is not a captive dealer.

CATEGORY NOTES: To include: Clutch Parts, Drive Line Assemblies and Hardware, Engine Parts, Hydraulic Brake Parts,
Manual and Power Steering Parts and Hardware (new), Manual Transmission Parts, OEM
Replacement Parts for Automatic Transmission, Relays, Suspension Parts, and Switches. Enter
ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off manufacturer's list prices for any and all items listed in
dealer's catalog(s).

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Uhl Truck Sales 26.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES:

Central States Bus Sales, Inc. 10.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: LEAD TIME VERY DEPENDING ON VENDOR

O'Reilly Automotive .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 5 - Captive Dealer Items: Jeep. (4600020-2014828)
AWARD NOTES: Reject O'Reilly Automotive - vendor is not a captive dealer. There were no other bids received for this

item.

CATEGORY NOTES: To include: Clutch parts, Drive Line Assemblies and Hardware, Engine Parts, Exhaust Parts,
Hydraulic Brake Parts, Manual and Power Steering Parts and Hardware (new), OEM Replacement
Parts for Automatic Transmission, Relays, Suspension Parts, Switches, Windshield Wiper Parts.
Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off manufacturer's list prices for any and all items listed
in dealer's catalog(s).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better

ITEM NO. 6 - Captive Dealer Factory OEM Replacement Parts for Freight Liner. (4600020-2002114)

Note: * indicates a pending award. 4



CATEGORY NOTES: To meet State Specifications for school buses only. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount from
the manufactureris list price for all replacement parts. NOTE: To bid this section you MUST be a
FACTORY DEALER of the vehicle brands listed. Bid items EXCLUDED in this section are: Batteries,
Shocks, Seal Beams, Light Bulbs, Windshield Wiper Blade Inserts, Filters, Exhaust Pipes, Rebuilt
Engines, Mufflers and Drive Belts. The only exception to these items would be if an item was a
Captive Dealer only. Please refer to the ESM Solutions attachment, for the listed number of vehicle
brands that are in our fleet.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Whayne Supply 41.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: 41% discount off of advertised parts list pricing.

Kentucky Truck Sales Inc. 40.30 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Central States Bus Sales, Inc. 10.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: LEAD TIME VERY DEPENDING ON VENDOR

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: no bid

O'Reilly Automotive .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid. Do not carry.

ITEM NO. 7 - Captive Dealer Factory OEM Replacement Parts for International. (4600020-1722651)

AWARD NOTES: Reject Byerly Ford / Nissan - vendor is not a captive dealer.

CATEGORY NOTES: To meet State Specifications for school buses only. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount from
the manufactureris list price for all replacement parts. NOTE: To bid this section you MUST be a
FACTORY DEALER of the vehicle brands listed. Bid items EXCLUDED in this section are: Batteries,
Shocks, Seal Beams, Light Bulbs, Windshield Wiper Blade Inserts, Filters, Exhaust Pipes, Rebuilt
Engines, Mufflers and Drive Belts. The only exception to these items would be if an item was a
Captive Dealer only. Please refer to the ESM Solutions attachment, for the listed number of vehicle
brands that are in our fleet.

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Byerly Ford / Nissan 32.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Uhl Truck Sales 26.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Central States Bus Sales, Inc. 10.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: LEAD TIME VERY DEPENDING ON VENDOR

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: no bid

O'Reilly Automotive .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid. Do not carry.

ITEM NO. 8 - Captive Dealer Item: Air brake parts for trucks only. Ford. (4600020-2001165)

AWARD NOTES: Reject Central States Bus Sales, Inc. and O'Reilly Automotive - vendor is not a captive dealer. There
were no other bids received for this item.

Note: * indicates a pending award. 5



CATEGORY NOTES: Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off manufacturer's list prices for any and all items listed
in dealer's catalog(s).

were no other bids received for this item.

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better

Central States Bus Sales, Inc. 10.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: LEAD TIME VERY DEPENDING ON VENDOR

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: no bid

ITEM NO. 9 - Captive Dealer Item: Air brake parts for trucks only. GM. (4600020-1721627)
AWARD NOTES: Reject Central States Bus Sales, Inc. and O'Reilly Automotive - vendor is not a captive dealer. There

CATEGORY NOTES: Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off manufacturer's list prices for any and all items listed
in dealer's catalog(s).

VENDOR NAME
O'Reilly Automotive

CATEGORY NOTES:

List less 41% or better

PERCENTAGE
OF DISCOUNT
41.00 %

Central States Bus Sales, Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

LEAD TIME VERY DEPENDING ON VENDOR

10.00 %

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc.
CATEGORY NOTES:

no bid

.00 %

ITEM NO. 10 - Captive Dealer Item: Air brake parts for trucks only. International. (4600020-1721628)

CATEGORY NOTES: Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off manufacturer's list prices for any and all items listed
in dealer's catalog(s).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Whayne Supply 30.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: 30% discount of advertised list price.
Uhl Truck Sales 26.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
O'Reilly Automotive .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

No Bid

ITEM NO. 11 - Captive Dealer Item: Allison Transmission Parts (new), OEM only. (4600020-1716087)

CATEGORY NOTES: NOTE: Vendor MUST be an authorized Allison dealer. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate
off manufacturer's list prices for any and all items listed in the catalog(s) for Allison Captive Dealer

Note: * indicates a pending award.
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Items.

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Whayne Supply 35.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: 35% discount off of advertised list price.

Palmer Trucks/Kenworth Of Louisville 30.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: net 30

Uhl Truck Sales 30.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

O'Reilly Automotive .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 12 - Brass Fittings for automotive use. (4600020-1723449)

AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Truck Parts & Service as low bidder based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES: Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for items listed in your catalog
for Brass Fittings. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:

BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Weatherhead

Truck Parts & Service 65.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: COUPLINGS

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

O'Reilly Automotive .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 13 - Non-Dealer Universal Joints and Hardware (new). (4600020-1715979)
AWARD NOTES: Reject Chalks's Truck Parts, Inc - did not list pricing for evaluation. Awarded to Whayne Supply as

low bidder based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: B.C.A., Chicago Rawhide, Precision, Rockwell, and Spicer. Enter ONLY ONE
percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for
Non-Dealer Universal Joints and Hardware (new). Please respond to the following in the VENDOR

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NAPA SKF

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Note: * indicates a pending award. 7



O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better National (BCA), MasterPro, Precision, Spicer

Whayne Supply 41.00% *

CATEGORY NOTES: 41% discount off of advertised list price.

ITEM NO. 14 - Non-Dealer Engine Parts and Hardware (new) OEM Standards for Cars and Trucks, (4600020-1715985)

CATEGORY NOTES: with diesel or gasoline engine. Approved Brands: AC, Airtex, ASC, Balkamp, Borg-Warner, Carter,
Cloyes, Dana, Federal-Mogul, Fel-Pro, Fram, Hastings, Microtest, Motorcraft, Muskegon, NAPA,
Perfect Circle, Seal Power, Standard, Sterling and Victor. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount
rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Engine Parts

and Hardware (new). Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: NAPA Truflow
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better See Line card
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO. 15 - Non-Dealer Engine Gaskets (new). (4600020-1716000)

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brand: Fel-Pro. NO SUBSTITUTE. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off
published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Engine Gaskets
(new). Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND

NAME(S).
PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 50.00% *

CATEGORY NOTES: FelPro
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Fel-Pro, Victor, Mahle
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: no bid

ITEM NO. 16 - Non-Dealer Fuel, Oil and Radiator Caps for Cars and Trucks (new), OEM Standards. (4600020-2002108)

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: AC, Gates, Motorcraft, NAPA and Stant. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount
rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Fuel, Oil and

Radiator Caps (new). Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES
field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 % *

CATEGORY NOTES: Balkamp
Note: * indicates a pending award. 8



O'Reilly Automotive

CATEGORY NOTES:

List less 41% or better Dorman, Murray, Stant

41.00 %

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

.00 %

ITEM NO. 17 - Non-Dealer Thermostats for Cars and Trucks (new), OEM Standards. (4600020-2002109)

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: AC, Ford, GM, Gates, Motorcraft, NAPA and Stant. Enter ONLY ONE percentage
of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer

Thermostats (new). Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
BRAND NAME(S).

VENDOR NAME
NAPA AUTO PARTS

CATEGORY NOTES:

NAPA

PERCENTAGE
OF DISCOUNT
65.00 %

*

O'Reilly Automotive

CATEGORY NOTES:

List less 41% or better Murray, Stand

41.00 %

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

no bid

.00 %

ITEM NO. 18 - Non-Dealer Ignition Parts (new), OEM Standards. (4600020-1716017)

CATEGORY NOTES: Premium Line Only (All tune-up items). Approved Brands: Borg-Warner, Delco, Motorcraft, Prestolite
and Standard. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all
items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Ignition Parts (new). Please respond to the following in

the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

VENDOR NAME
NAPA AUTO PARTS

CATEGORY NOTES:

Echlin

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

65.00 %

*

O'Reilly Automotive
CATEGORY NOTES:

List less 41% or better Standard Ignition, Dorman, MasterPro, Import

Direct, Motorcraft, AC Delco

41.00 %

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc.
CATEGORY NOTES:

no bid

.00 %

ITEM NO. 19 - Non-Dealer Mufflers for Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks and Buses (new), OEM Standards. (4600020-1716028)

AWARD NOTES: Reject NAPA Auto Parts - did not list pricing for evaluation. There were no other bids received for this

item.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: NAPA and Walker. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published
price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Mufflers (new). Please

respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

VENDOR NAME
NAPA AUTO PARTS

Note: * indicates a pending award.

PERCENTAGE
OF DISCOUNT

65.00 %



CATEGORY NOTES: Walker

O'Reilly Automotive .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 20 - Non-Dealer Exhaust Pipes for Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks and Buses (new), (4600020-1716029)

AWARD NOTES: Reject Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. - did not list pricing for evaluation. There were no other bids received
for this item.

CATEGORY NOTES: OEM Standards. Approved Brands: NAPA and Walker. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount
rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Exhaust
Pipes (new). Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Truck EX / Auto Jet
O'Reilly Automotive .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
ITEM NO. 21 - Non-Dealer Mufflers for Cars, Light Trucks and Vans (new), OEM Standards. (4600020-1718575)
AWARD NOTES: Reject Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. - did not list pricing for evaluation. There were no other bids received

for this item.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: NAPA and Walker. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published
price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Mufflers (new). Please
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Truck Ex / Auto Jet

O'Reilly Automotive .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 22 - Non-Dealer Exhaust Pipes for Cars, Light Trucks and Vans (new). OEM Standards. (4600020-1718576)
AWARD NOTES: Reject Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. - did not list pricing for evaluation.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: NAPA and Walker. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published
price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Exhaust Pipes (new). Please
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: Walker
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Truck Ex / Auto Jet
O'Reilly Automotive .00 %

Note: * indicates a pending award. 10



CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 23 - Non-Dealer Exhaust Clamps (new), OEM Standards. (4600020-1716030)

AWARD NOTES: Reject Central States Bus Sales, Inc., Chalks Truck Parts, Inc., and O'Reilly Automotive - did not list
pricing for evaluation.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: NAPA and Walker. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published
price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Exhaust Clamps (new).
Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: Walker
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Auto Jet
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Walker, Nickson
Central States Bus Sales, Inc. 10.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: LEADTIMES MAY VERY DEPENDING ON VENDOR

ITEM NO. 24 - Non-Dealer Exhaust Hangers (new), OEM Standards. (4600020-1716031)

AWARD NOTES: Reject Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. and O'Reilly Automotive - did not list pricing for evaluation.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: NAPA and Walker. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published
price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Exhaust Hangers (new).
Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: Walker
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Truck Ex / Auto Jet
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Walker, Nickson

ITEM NO. 25 - Non-Dealer Manual and Power Steering Parts and Hardware (new), for Cars and Trucks. (4600020-1716036)

AWARD NOTES: Reject Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. - did not list pricing for evaluation. Awarded to O'Reilly Automotive as
low bidder based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: Moog, NAPA and Perfect Circle. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off
published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Manual and Power
Steering Parts and Hardware (new). Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE
ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 %

Note: * indicates a pending award. 11



CATEGORY NOTES: NAPA Chassis

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc.

50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better MasterPro, Power Torque, BrakeBest Heavy
Duty, Dorman, Cardone
ITEM NO. 26 - Non-Dealer Shocks (new), for Cars and Trucks. (4600020-1716045)
AWARD NOTES: Reject Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. - did not list pricing for evaluation. Awarded to Whayne Supply as low

bidder based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brand: Monroe. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for

any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Shocks (hew). Please respond to the
following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NAPA Shocks (Monroe)
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Monroe / Gabriel
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Monroe, KYB, Rancho
Whayne Supply 41.00% *

CATEGORY NOTES: 41% OFF OF ADVERTISED LIST PRICE.

ITEM NO. 27 - Non-Dealer Suspension Parts (new). (4600020-1716046)

AWARD NOTES: Reject Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. and O'Reilly Automotive - did not list pricing for evaluation.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: Moog and NAPA. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price

sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Suspension Parts (new). Please
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: NAPA Chassis
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Precision, MasterPro, Dorman, Moog, Import
Direct

ITEM NO. 28 - Non-Dealer Wheels and Hardware (new) for Cars, Trucks and Buses. (4600020-1716054)

AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this item.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: Accuride, Euclid, Hayes, Leland, NAPA, NWRA, National Rim, Perfect, Rema,
Schrader and Vipar. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any

Note: * indicates a pending award. 12



and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Wheels and Hardware (new). Please respond to
the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: no bid
O'Reilly Automotive .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
ITEM NO. 29 - Non-Dealer Wheel Nuts (new) for Cars, Trucks and Buses. (4600020-1716055)
AWARD NOTES: Reject O'Reilly Automotive - did not list pricing for evaluation. Awarded to Whayne Supply as low

bidder based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: Accuride, Euclid, Hayes, Leland, NAPA, Perfect, Rema, Schrader and Vipar.
Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in
your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Wheel Nuts (new). Please respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

NAPA AUTO PARTS 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NAPA Traction

O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Dorman

Whayne Supply 41.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: 41% OFF OF ADVERTISED LIST PRICE.

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: no bid

ITEM NO. 30 - Non-Dealer Wheel Studs (new) for Cars, Trucks and Buses. (4600020-2001167)
AWARD NOTES: Reject O'Reilly Automotive - did not list pricing for evaluation. Awarded to Whayne Supply as low

bidder based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: Accuride, Euclid, Firestone, Hayes, Leland, NAPA, Perfect, Rema, Schrader,
Vipar. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items
listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Wheel Studs (new). Please respond to the following in the
VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NAPA Traction
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Dorman
Whayne Supply 41.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: 41% OFF OF ADVERTISED LIST PRICE.
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: no bid
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ITEM NO. 31 - Non-Dealer Valve Stems for Tubeless Rims (new) for Cars, Trucks and Buses. (4600020-1716057)

AWARD NOTES: Reject O'Reilly Automotive - did not list pricing for evaluation.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: Accuride, Haltec, Hayes, Leland, NAPA, Perfect, Rema, Schrader and Vipar.
Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in
your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Valve Stems for Tubeless Rims (new). Please respond to the following
in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

NAPA AUTO PARTS 50.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: NAPA Tire Hardware

O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Xtra Seal

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: no bid

ITEM NO. 32 - Non-Dealer Wheel Weights (new) for Cars, Trucks and Buses. (4600020-1716058)
AWARD NOTES: Reject O'Reilly Automotive - did not list pricing for evaluation. There were no other bids received for

this item.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: Accuride, Camel, Hayes, Leland, NAPA, Perfect, Rema, Schrader and Vipar.
Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in
your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Wheel Weights (new). Please respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Perfect Equipment (PWT)

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: no bid

ITEM NO. 33 - Non-Dealer Bearings and Cups for Buses (hew). (4600020-1716059)

AWARD NOTES: Reject Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. - did not list pricing for evaluation. Awarded to Whayne Supply as low
bidder based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: B.C.A., Bower, Chicago Rawhide, Delco, Federal-Mogul and Timken. Enter ONLY
ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your
catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Bearings and Cups (new). Please respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Federal / Chicago Rawhide
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better National (BCA), Precision, MasterPro
Whayne Supply 41.00% *
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CATEGORY NOTES: 41% OFF OF ADVERTISED LIST PRICE.

total truck parts 15.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Total Truck Parts Jobber less 15%

ITEM NO. 34 - Non-Dealer Axle Seals (new). (4600020-1716060)

AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Whayne Supply as low bidder based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brand: Chicago Rawhide. NO SUBSTITUTE. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate
off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Axle Seals (new).
Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better National, MasterPro
Whayne Supply 41.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: 41% OFF OF ADVERTISED LIST PRICE.
ITEM NO. 35 - Non-Dealer Axle Seals (new). (4600020-1716061)
AWARD NOTES: Reject Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. and Louisville Auto Spring & Brake Co. - did not list pricing for

evaluation.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brand: Stemco. NO SUBSTITUTE. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off
published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Axle Seals (new).
Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Louisville Auto Spring & Brake Co. 55.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

total truck parts 55.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: Stemco List Price less 55%

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: stemco

O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better National, MasterPro

Whayne Supply 41.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: 41% OFF OF ADVERTISED LIST PRICE.

ITEM NO. 36 - Non-Dealer Windshield Wiper Blades., Arms (new) and Miscellaneous Wiper Parts for Cars (4600020-1716062)

AWARD NOTES: Reject Byerly Ford / Nissan, Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. and Moog Louisville Warehouse - did not list
pricing for evaluation. Awarded to Truck Parts & Service as low bidder based on total of evaluation
items.

CATEGORY NOTES: and Trucks, Blades (ONLY) for Buses. Approved Brands: Anco and NAPA. Enter ONLY ONE
percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for
Non-Dealer Blades, Arms (new) and Miscellaneous Wiper Parts. Please respond to the following in
the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).
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PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Moog Louisville Warehouse 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Truck Parts & Service 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: CLEAR PLUS

O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Trico, Bosch

Whayne Supply 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: 41% OFF OF ADVERTISED LIST PRICE.

Byerly Ford / Nissan 32.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO. 37 - Non-Dealer Automotive Electrical Items - Seal Beams (new) and Light Bulbs (hew). (4600020-1716068)

AWARD NOTES: Reject Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. and Moog Louisville Warehouse - did not list pricing for evaluation.
Awarded to Truck Parts & Service as low bidder based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: AC-Delco, G.E., Sylvania, Tungsol, Wagner and Westinghouse. Enter ONLY ONE
percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for
Non-Dealer Automotive Seal Beams (new). Please respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: GE / Wagner

NAPA AUTO PARTS 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NAPA Lamps

Truck Parts & Service 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: GE,PHILLIPS,EIKO

Moog Louisville Warehouse 45.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Sylvania, EiKO

ITEM NO. 38 - Non-Dealer Automotive Electrical Items - Fuses and Circuit Breakers (new). (4600020-2001169)
AWARD NOTES: Reject Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. - did not list pricing for evaluation. Awarded to Truck Parts & Service

as low bidder based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: AC-Delco, ATC, Balkamp, Bussman, Cole Hersee, Littlefuse and Velvac. Enter
ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your
catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Automotive Fuses and Circuit Breakers (new). Please respond to the
following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
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NAPA AUTO PARTS 60.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Balkamp

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Cole Hersee / Bussman / Velvac

Truck Parts & Service 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: BUSSMAN/LITTLE FUSE

O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Littelfuse, Murray, MasterPro, Standard Igniton,

Dorman

ITEM NO. 39 - Non-Dealer Automotive Electrical Items - Battery Cables and Washers (new), (4600020-1716071)

AWARD NOTES:

Awarded to Truck Parts & Service as low bidder based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES:

Wire in Rolls (new), including Fusible Link Wire, Wire Connectors, Terminals (Solderless) and
Electrical Accessories (new). Approved Brands: AC-Delco, Belden, Deka, Motorcraft, NAPA and
Velvac. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items
listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Automotive Battery Cables & Washers (new). Please respond
to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 60.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Belden
Truck Parts & Service 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: SLOAN/BEE
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better. See Line card for offered brands.
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: no bid

ITEM NO. 40 - Non-Dealer Automotive Electrical Items - Turn Signal Flashers (new). (4600020-1725512)

AWARD NOTES:

Reject Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. - did not list pricing for evaluation. Awarded to Truck Parts & Service
as low bidder based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES:

Approved Brands: AC-Delco, Echlin, Signalstat, Sorensen, Tungsol and Wagner. Enter ONLY ONE
percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for
Non-Dealer Automotive Electrical Turn Signal Flashers (new). Please respond to the following in the
VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 60.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Signal Stat
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Truck Parts & Service 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: CEC INDUSTRIES
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
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CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better AC Delco, Motorcraft, Grote, Optima, Standard,
Novita

ITEM NO. 41 - Non-Dealer Automatic and Manual Transmission Repair Parts for Cars and Trucks. Ford. (4600020-1716082)

AWARD NOTES: Reject O'Reilly Automotive - did not list pricing for evaluation. There were no other bids received for
this item.

CATEGORY NOTES: NOTE: GOOD USED AND RECONDITIONED HARD PARTS ARE ACCEPTABLE. VENDORS MUST
FURNISH PRICE SHEETS ON ALL ITEMS THEY ARE QUOTING. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of
discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer
Ford Automatic and Manual Transmission Parts. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Motorcraft, Power Torque

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: no bid

ITEM NO. 42 - Non-Dealer Automatic and Manual Transmission Repair Parts for Cars and Trucks. GM. (4600020-1716080)

CATEGORY NOTES: NOTE: GOOD USED AND RECONDITIONED HARD PARTS ARE ACCEPTABLE. VENDORS MUST
FURNISH PRICE SHEETS ON ALL ITEMS THEY ARE QUOTING. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of
discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer GM
Automatic and Manual Transmission Parts. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00% *

CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better

ITEM NO. 43 - Spark Plugs (new). (1343540-2002112)

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Product: AC Delco. NO SUBSTITUTE. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off
published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Spark Plugs (new). Please
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: MANUFACTURER'S NAME.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 55.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: AC Delco
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: no bid

ITEM NO. 44 - Spark Plugs (new). (1343540-2002113)
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AWARD NOTES: Reject Byerly Ford / Nissan - did not list pricing for evaluation. Awarded to O'Reilly Automotive as low
bidder based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Product: Motorcraft. NO SUBSTITUTE. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off
published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Spark Plugs (new). Please
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: MANUFACTURER'S NAME.

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Moog Louisville Warehouse 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better

Byerly Ford / Nissan 32.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: no bid

ITEM NO. 45 - Oil Filter Elements, Air Cleaner Elements and Fuel Filters other than original (4600020-1716090)

AWARD NOTES: Reject Uhl Truck Sales - did not list pricing for evaluation. Awarded to Total Truck Parts as low bidder
based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES: equipment. Approved Product: Luber-Finer or equal. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate
off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Oil Filter Elements, Air
Cleaner Elements and Fuel Filters other than original equipment. Please respond to the following in
the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: MAKE or MANUFACTURER'S NAME. TYPE AND
KIND OF FILTER MEDIA.

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Moog Louisville Warehouse 70.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NAPA Filters (Wix) Enhanced Cellulose Media

total truck parts 62.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: 62% off Luberfiner Jobber (Blue) Sheet

Truck Parts & Service 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: PLEATED PAPER LUBERFINER

O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better WIX, MicroGard, AC Delco, Motorcraft, others

Uhl Truck Sales 15.00 %

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: no bid

ITEM NO. 46 - Rebuilt and Exchange Starters for Tractors. (4600020-1716091)

CATEGORY NOTES: NOTE: ITEM NOS. 46 AND 47 WILL BE AWARDED TOGETHER. 24-hour turn-around-time if we
deliver items to your shop. 48-hour turn-around-time if you pick up. Requirements: 1. New starter
drives must be used in each starter. 2. The original equipment solenoid parts must be used and field

Note: * indicates a pending award. 19



windings must be at least equal to the original specifications. 3. New brushes and brush springs
must be used in each unit. 4. All bushings must be replaced. 5. Any replaced armatures of field
coils must be equal to the original specifications. 6. Commutators cannot be turned below the
diameter that will make MICA flow from extreme levels of heat. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of
discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Rebuilt and
Exchange Starters.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Wilson, Ultima
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: no bid

ITEM NO. 47 - Rebuilt and Exchange Alternators with Pulleys for Tractors. (4600020-1716093)

CATEGORY NOTES: NOTE: ITEM NOS. 46 AND 47 WILL BE AWARDED TOGETHER. 24-hour turn-around-time if we
deliver items to your shop. 48-hour turn-around-time if you pick up. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of
discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Rebuilt and
Exchange Alternators with Pulleys.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Wilson, Ultima
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: no bid

ITEM NO. 48 - Non-Dealer Air Conditioner and Heater Parts for Cars and Trucks (new), OEM Standards. (4600020-2002107)

AWARD NOTES: Reject Byerly Ford / Nissan - did not list pricing for evaluation. Awarded to Roppel Industries as low
bidder based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: Delco, Everco, Four Season and NAPA. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount
rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Air
Conditioner and Heater Parts (new). Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE
ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 55.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NAPA Temp (Four Seasons)
Roppel Industries 55.00 % *
Moog Louisville Warehouse 45.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Murray
Byerly Ford / Nissan 32.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:
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ITEM NO. 49 - Belts (Fan, Power Steering and Air Conditioning), Reinforced, (4600020-1716096)

AWARD NOTES: Reject Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. and Kentucky Truck Sales Inc. - did not list pricing for evaluation.
Awarded to Whayne Supply as low bidder based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES: First Quality Automotive Belts. Approved Brands: Dayco, Gates, Goodyear and Motorcraft. Premium
Line Only. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all
items listed in your catalog(s) for Belts (Fan, Power Steering and Air Conditioning). Please respond to
the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: MANUFACTURER. GRADE QUALITY.

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NAPA Belts and Hose (Gates)

Truck Parts & Service 63.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: PREMIUM GOODYEAR

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Gates / Dayco / Goodyear

Moog Louisville Warehouse 45.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Gates, MasterPro

Whayne Supply 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: 41% OFF OF ADVERTISED LIST PRICE.

Kentucky Truck Sales Inc. 38.50 %

total truck parts 15.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Dayco Jobber Price less 15%

ITEM NO. 50 - Non-Dealer Automotive Radiators (new) All Types. (4600020-2012741)

AWARD NOTES: Reject Central States Bus Sales, Inc., Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. and O'Reilly Automotive - did not list
pricing for evaluation.

CATEGORY NOTES: Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in
your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Automotive Radiators (new). All Types. Please respond to the following
in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S). IMPORTANT: VENDOR(S)
MUST BID ON ALL ITEMS TO BE CONSIDERED.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Roppel Industries 65.00 %
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Murray, Spectra Premium
Central States Bus Sales, Inc. 10.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: LEAD TIME VERY DEPENDING ON VENDOR

ITEM NO. 51 - Radiator and Heater Hose to include Clamps. (4600020-1716097)
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AWARD NOTES: Reject Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. - did not list pricing for evaluation.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: Dayco, Gates, Goodyear, Motorcraft and NAPA. Premium Life Only. Enter ONLY
ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your
catalog(s) for Radiator and Heater Hose. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE
ITEM NOTES field: MANUFACTURER. GRADE QUALITY.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: NAPA Belts and Hose (Gates)
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Gates/goodyear/ dayco
Moog Louisville Warehouse 45.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Gates, MasterPro, Murray

ITEM NO. 52 - Hose, Fuel and Vacuum, all sizes, 25-ft. or 50-ft. rolls. (4600020-2002122)

AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Truck Parts & Service as low bidder based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: Atlantic Pacific, Dayco, Gates, Goodyear and Motorcraft. Enter ONLY ONE
percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for
Hose, Fuel and Vacuum. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES
field: MANUFACTURER. GRADE QUALITY.

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NAPA Belts and Hose (Gates)

Truck Parts & Service 50.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: DAYCO/THERMOID GRADE- PREMIUM

Moog Louisville Warehouse 45.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better

ITEM NO. 53 - Hose, Power Steering, all sizes. (4600020-2002123)
AWARD NOTES: Reject Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. - did not list pricing for evaluation. Awarded to Truck Parts & Service

as low bidder based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: Atlantic Pacific, Dayco, Gates, Goodyear, Motorcraft and Weatherhead. Enter
ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your
catalog(s) for Hose, Power Steering. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE
ITEM NOTES field: MANUFACTURER. GRADE QUALITY.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Gates and NAPA Power Steering
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Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Truck Parts & Service 50.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: DAYCO/ATLANTIC PACIFIC grade-PREMIUM

O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better

Moog Louisville Warehouse 40.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO. 54 - Spring Work, to include making U Bolts. (4600649-1716099)

CATEGORY NOTES: NOTE: Springs and U Bolts to be picked up and delivered by vendor. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of

discount rate off parts. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES
field: LABOR RATE (PER HOUR).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Louisville Auto Spring & Brake Co. 61.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: labor rate $55.00 per hour
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: no bid
O'Reilly Automotive .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid.

ITEM NO. 55 - Services on Radiators and Heaters (to be picked up and delivered by vendor). (4600649-1717039)

CATEGORY NOTES: NOTE: Total radiator and heater repairs will be awarded to one vendor. Cleaning and repairs to
include boiling and flushing out, removal of top tank and lower tank, straighten fins, rodding core,
resoldering all tubes and header, repaint, repair or replace oil coolers and pressure testing of
transmission and oil coolers. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off materials. Please
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: LABOR RATE (PER
HOUR). Indicate turn-around time: 6 hours: Yes or No. 10 hours: Yes or No.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Roppel Industries 50.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: $75 per hour 6 hr: yes if needed 10 hr: yes if needed
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: no bid
O'Reilly Automotive .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid.

ITEM NO. 56 - Rebuilding of Injector Pumps and Injector Nozzles. (4600649-1717041)

CATEGORY NOTES: Must be factory authorized and trained personnel doing the rebuilding. Enter ONLY ONE percentage
of discount rate off parts and materials. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE
ITEM NOTES field: LABOR RATE PER HOUR (REGULAR TIME). MANUFACTURER.
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PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Diesel Injection Service Co. Inc. 25.00% *

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount off replacement parts only, Fuel Shop Labor Rate is $131.00
per hour

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: no bid

O'Reilly Automotive .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid.

ITEM NO. 57 - Rebuilding of Turbo Chargers. (4600649-1717042)

CATEGORY NOTES: Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off parts and materials. Please respond to the following
in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: LABOR RATE PER HOUR (REGULAR TIME).

MANUFACTURER.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Diesel Injection Service Co. Inc. 25.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount off replacement parts only, Turbocharger shop Labor Rate is
$131.00 per hour
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: no bid
O'Reilly Automotive .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid.
ITEM NO. 58 - Body Repair Parts for Trucks - Chevrolet (i.e., Fenders, Hoods, Doors, Panels, etc.) (4600020-2014829)
AWARD NOTES: Reject O'Reilly Automotive - vendor is not a manufacturer dealer. There were no other bids received for
this item.
CATEGORY NOTES: and Accessory Hardware (Manufacturer Dealers Only).
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: no bid
ITEM NO. 59 - Body Repair Parts for Trucks - Ford (i.e., Fenders, Hoods, Doors, Panels, etc.) (4600020-1716102)
AWARD NOTES: Reject O'Reilly Automotive - vendor is not a manufacturer dealer.
CATEGORY NOTES: and Accessory Hardware (Manufacturer Dealers Only).
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better
Byerly Ford / Nissan 32.00% *

Note: * indicates a pending award. 24



CATEGORY NOTES:

Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc.

.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: no bid
ITEM NO. 60 - Body Repair Parts for Trucks - International (4600020-1716103)
CATEGORY NOTES: (i.e., Fenders, Hoods, Doors, Panels, etc.) and Accessory Hardware (Manufacturer Dealers Only).
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Uhl Truck Sales 26.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES:
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: no bid
O'Reilly Automotive .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid. Do not carry.
ITEM NO. 61 - Body Repair Parts for Trucks - Jeep (i.e., Fenders, Hoods, Doors, Panels, etc.) (4600020-1728651)
AWARD NOTES: Reject O'Reilly Automotive - vendor is not a manufacturer dealer. There were no other bids received for
this item.
CATEGORY NOTES: and Accessory Hardware (Manufacturer Dealers Only).
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: no bid
ITEM NO. 62 - Body Repair Parts for Cars - Chevrolet (i.e., Fenders, Hoods, Doors, Panels, etc.) (4600020-1716105)
AWARD NOTES: Reject O'Reilly Automotive - vendor is not a manufacturer dealer. There were no other bids received for
this item.
CATEGORY NOTES: and Accessory Hardware (Manufacturer Dealers Only).
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: no bid

ITEM NO. 63 - Body Repair Parts for Cars - Ford (i.e., Fenders, Hoods, Doors, Panels, etc.) (4600020-1716107)

AWARD NOTES: Reject O'Reilly Automotive - vendor is not a manufacturer dealer.
CATEGORY NOTES: and Accessory Hardware (Manufacturer Dealers Only).

Note: * indicates a pending award. 25



PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME

OF DISCOUNT
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better
Byerly Ford / Nissan 32.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES:
ITEM NO. 64 - Non-Dealer Hydraulic Brake Parts and Hardware (new). OEM standards. (4600020-2010120)
AWARD NOTES: Reject Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. - did not list pricing for evaluation. Awarded to O'Reilly Automotive as

low bidder based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brand: Wagner or equal. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price
sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Hydraulic Brake Parts and
Hardware. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND

NAME(S).
PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: NAPA Brakes and NAPA United
Chalk's Truck Parts, Inc. 50.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:
O'Reilly Automotive 41.00% *

CATEGORY NOTES: List less 41% or better Wagner, BrakeBest, Bendix See attached Line
card

Note: * indicates a pending award. 26



