

HARDIN CO. SCHOOLS FY2022/2023 CUSTODIAL SUPPLY BID

	Custodial Supply Bid		HSS	PSP	Unipak	Hillyard	Ferguson	Kenway	Mersi	Leonard	CentralP	Norvex	BP
	Description	Unit											
1	Scrubbing Powder	Case	NB	\$40.98	NB	\$30.73	\$24.00	\$22.70	NB	NB	NB	\$20.92	NB
2	Liquid Hand Soap	Case	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$39.72	\$36.24	NB	NB	NB	\$33.92	\$57.59
3a	Soap	Case	NB	NB	NB	\$68.00	\$41.81	\$40.30	NB	\$36.43	NB	\$38.70	NB
3b	Bulk Dispensers	Doz.	NB	NB	NB	\$87.00	\$11.97	\$274.56	NB	NB	NB	\$199.56	NB
4	Screen	Doz.	NB	\$101.88	NB	\$15.88	\$19.20	\$19.81	NB	NB	NB	\$19.48	NB
5	Orange Tough 40	5 Gal.	NB	NB	NB	\$139.61	\$110.87	\$38.62	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$127.76
6	Spartan's Extraction II	Case	NB	NB	NB	\$68.60	\$30.24	\$71.37	NB	\$39.84	NB	NB	NB
7	Spartan Eco-Lyzer	Case	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$49.00	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$62.06
8	Spartan Consume	Gal	NB	NB	NB	\$12.28	\$9.94	\$11.90	NB	NB	NB	\$13.35	\$50.35
9	Forward G/P	Case	NB	NB	NB	\$30.07	\$82.67	\$98.32	NB	NB	NB	\$54.02	\$96.29
10	Virex II	Case	NB	NB	NB	\$33.95	\$57.61	\$71.84	NB	NB	NB	\$64.72	\$65.37
11	Stride (Neutral)	Case	NB	NB	NB	\$29.55	\$55.70	\$65.23	NB	NB	NB	\$37.54	\$61.18
12	Glance N/A	Case	NB	NB	NB	\$22.75	\$42.38	\$43.80	NB	NB	NB	\$55.72	\$45.72
13	UHS Cleaner	Case	NB	NB	NB	\$26.17	\$62.15	\$76.24	NB	NB	NB	\$43.56	\$77.63
14	SSS Red Zone 12Q	Case	NB	NB	NB	\$170.75	NB	\$137.19	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
15a	Disinfectant	RTU	NB	NB	NB	\$84.32	\$79.80	\$71.68	NB	\$42.24	NB	\$15.84	\$51.20
15b	15oz	Case	NB	\$34.08	NB	\$52.98	\$40.63	\$49.11	NB	NB	NB	\$26.88	\$53.33
16a	Lime Away Case of 4	Case	NB	NB	NB	\$39.84	\$39.22	\$48.41	NB	NB	NB	\$73.28	\$52.96
16b	Foamy Q&A of 4	case	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$43.77	\$43.07	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$54.14
17	Pumice Stone	Case	NB	\$167.94	NB	NB	\$162.24	\$27.84	NB	NB	NB	\$184.10	NB
18	Envirox H2O2	Gal.	NB	NB	NB	\$29.94	\$31.41	\$35.70	NB	NB	NB	\$14.96	NB
19	Citro-Shield	Case	NB	NB	NB	\$37.02	\$37.66	\$43.73	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$47.71
20a	Cream	Case	NB	NB	NB	\$35.10	NB	\$36.18	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
20b	Stainless Aerosol (12)	Case	NB	\$36.98	NB	\$46.54	\$52.28	\$52.60	NB	NB	NB	\$28.80	\$67.44
21	VR (12)	Case	NB	\$47.04	NB	\$44.10	\$50.24	\$48.36	NB	NB	NB	\$40.32	NB

NTS - NOT TO SPECS NB - NO BID

HARDIN CO. SCHOOLS FY2022/2023 CUSTODIAL SUPPLY BID

	Custodial Supply Bid	Unit	HSS	PSP	Unipak	Hillyard	Ferguson	Kenway	Mersi	Leonard	CentralP	Norvex	BP
22	NCL Bare Bones (5G)	Gal	NB	NB	NB	\$133.71	\$47.46	\$34.60	NB	NB	NB	\$64.40	NB
23a	Vectra (5G)	5 Gal.	NB	NB	NB	\$85.21	\$71.72	\$74.90	NB	NB	NB	\$72.14	\$87.61
23b	Basecoat Gym Floor 2.5	5 Gal.	NB	NB	NB	\$305.59	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
23c	Hillyard 1907 2.5g	Gal.	NB	NB	NB	\$343.37	NB	\$195.81	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
23d	Hillyard Pre-Game	Gal	NB	NB	NB	\$13.46	NB	\$31.35	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
24	Div. Revive (5G)	Gal	NB	NB	NB	\$107.20	\$73.37	\$77.68	NB	NB	NB	\$98.43	\$90.52
25a	Unger #LH12C 48in	10/Box	NB	\$211.90	NB	\$262.10	\$239.10	\$213.10	NB	NB	NB	\$263.80	NB
25b	Unger #RB-10c 4in	10/Box	NB	\$8.19	NB	\$97.10	\$8.64	\$8.72	NB	NB	NB	\$99.10	NB
25c	Red Devil #4823 1.5in	10	NB	\$18.90	NB	NB	\$29.30	\$3.90	NB	NB	NB	\$46.80	NB
26	Gum Remover	12/Case	NB	\$31.99	NB	\$33.60	\$32.04	\$36.27	NB	NB	NB	\$26.76	\$63.38
27	Spartans CX-3 (4G)	Gal	NB	NB	NB	\$84.79	\$44.81	\$60.37	NB	\$61.16	NB	NB	\$58.77
28	Spartan Contemp Rinse	Case	NB	NB	NB	\$88.00	\$40.65	\$57.32	NB	\$52.32	NB	NB	\$40.70
29	Snapback (4G)	Case	NB	NB	NB	\$82.67	\$76.60	\$101.19	NB	NB	NB	\$39.32	\$90.91
30	Vinegar (4G)	Case	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$9.63	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
31	Dust Mop Treatment (5G)	Gal	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$34.95	NB	NB	\$44.99	NB	NB	\$43.23
32a	Combo 35QT	Each	NB	\$89.98	NB	\$94.22	\$68.64	\$103.01	NB	NB	NB	\$62.28	NB
32b	Combo 44QT	Each	NB	\$110.98	NB	\$120.55	\$123.72	\$131.80	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
32c	RM 44QT Drain kit	Each	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
32d	RM Finish System	Each	NB	\$169.98	NB	\$162.00	\$166.26	\$177.12	NB	NB	NB	\$289.36	NB
32e	RM Finish Bucket	Each	NB	\$79.99	NB	\$77.66	\$79.71	\$32.54	NB	NB	NB	\$86.10	NB
33a	Push Brm. 18"	Each	NB	\$9.98	NB	NB	NB	\$14.82	NB	NB	NB	\$11.24	NB
33b	Push Brm. 24"	Each	NB	\$11.98	NB	NB	\$23.19	\$21.50	NB	NB	NB	\$15.11	NB
33c	Push Brm 36"	Each	NB	\$15.98	NB	NB	\$36.88	\$28.55	NB	NB	NB	\$23.43	NB
34a	Corn Broom	6Pk	NB	\$23.94	NB	\$143.52	\$56.28	\$41.36	NB	NB	NB	\$35.34	NB
34b	13" Angle Brm	6PK	NB	\$35.94	NB	\$166.08	\$62.28	\$117.12	NB	NB	NB	\$37.20	NB
35	Dust Pan	Doz	NB	\$20.28	NB	\$20.88	NB	\$108.58	NB	NB	NB	\$46.68	NB

NTS - NOT TO SPECS NB - NO BID

HARDIN CO. SCHOOLS FY2022/2023 CUSTODIAL SUPPLY BID

	Description	Unit	HSS	PSP	Unipak	Hillyard	Ferguson	Kenway	Mersi	Leonard	CentralP	Norvex	BP
36a	Combo Kit	Each	NB	\$16.99	NB	\$47.17	NB	\$32.54	NB	NB	NB	\$22.46	NB
36b	Dust Pan	Each	NB	\$8.25	NB	\$67.90	NB	\$12.29	NB	NB	NB	\$11.12	NB
36c	Impact Lobby Broom	Doz	NB	\$99.48	NB	\$60.60	\$48.00	\$136.08	NB	NB	NB	\$36.24	NB
36d	Impact Broom clip	Per	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$7.52	\$12.50	NB	NB	NB	\$9.99	NB
37a	Floor Squeegee 18"	Doz.	NB	\$106.68	NB	NB	\$96.48	\$308.32	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
37b	Floor Squeegee 30"	Doz	NB	\$155.76	NB	NB	\$196.68	\$347.72	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
38	Window Squeegee 14"	Doz	NB	\$107.88	NB	NB	\$166.80	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
39	Doodlebug Pad Holder	10/pk	NB	\$49.90	NB	\$90.12	\$132.00	\$57.52	NB	NB	NB	\$68.14	NB
40a	Doodlebug Pads Color	Case/20	NB	\$12.99	NB	\$42.10	\$32.08	\$16.15	NB	NB	NB	\$19.20	NB
40b	Black/Hi-Pro	Case/20	NB	\$13.99	NB	\$63.96	\$69.26	\$26.37	NB	\$53.00	NB	\$19.20	NB
41a	60" Quick Release	Doz.	NB	\$83.88	NB	\$267.24	\$132.72	\$138.34	NB	\$15.45	NB	\$114.24	NB
41b	60" Jaw-Style	Doz.	NB	\$79.08	NB	\$204.24	\$169.44	\$176.57	NB	\$17.76	NB	\$109.80	NB
41c	Handle	Pack	NB	\$53.94	NB	\$34.46	\$36.24	\$48.92	NB	NB	NB	\$39.90	NB
41d	Frame	Pack	NB	\$95.94	NB	\$82.83	\$87.06	\$78.94	NB	NB	NB	\$94.20	NB
41e	FGQ80000 Pads	Pack	NB	\$65.94	NB	\$69.66	\$73.20	\$85.20	NB	NB	NB	\$114.96	NB
42a1	20oz	Doz.	NB	\$47.88	NB	\$32.49	NB	\$44.06	NB	NB	NB	\$40.68	NB
42a2	24oz	Doz.	NB	\$56.28	NB	\$44.76	NB	\$51.60	NB	NB	NB	\$45.84	NB
42b1	16oz	Doz	NB	\$49.08	NB	\$40.20	\$47.28	\$51.40	NB	NB	NB	\$47.28	NB
42b2	24oz	Doz	NB	\$55.08	NB	\$60.48	\$62.28	\$60.20	NB	NB	NB	\$62.16	NB
43	Sponges	Doz	NB	\$17.88	NB	\$108.29	NB	\$23.10	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
44	Spnoge Scrubber	Case	NB	\$17.99	NB	\$18.44	\$47.60	\$30.46	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
45a	Scrub pad Green (60)	Case	NB	\$14.99	NB	\$38.78	\$40.23	\$21.30	NB	NB	NB	\$17.79	NB
45b	Stainless Steel pads (6doz)	Case	NB	\$34.99	NB	NB	\$48.90	\$68.20	NB	NB	NB	\$48.00	NB
46a	Pot Brush Short	Doz	NB	\$44.28	NB	\$15.66	\$33.72	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$59.88	NB
46b	Long Handle	Doz	NB	\$59.88	NB	\$25.17	\$54.24	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$83.04	NB
47a	Toilet brush #3605	case	NB	\$94.50	NB	\$59.00	\$40.50	\$197.02	NB	NB	NB	\$44.50	NB
47b	#334 Scratchless	Doz	NB	\$46.68	NB	NB	\$19.20	\$13.71	NB	NB	NB	\$23.99	NB
48	Measuring Cup	100	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$247.00	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
49	Tile & Grout Brush	Doz	NB	\$41.88	NB	NB	\$16.44	\$27.88	NB	NB	NB	\$25.68	NB

HARDIN CO. SCHOOLS FY2022/2023 CUSTODIAL SUPPLY BID

	Description	Unit	HSS	PSP	Unipak	Hillyard	Ferguson	Kenway	Mersi	Leonard	CentralP	Norvex	BP
50	Hi Duster	Doz	NB	\$95.88	NB	\$105.12	\$111.72	\$141.60	NB	NB	NB	\$79.80	NB
51	Wall Washer Pads	10	NB	\$149.90	NB	\$197.71	NB	\$108.97	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
52a	long 30"	Doz.	NB	\$119.88	NB	NB	\$511.68	\$487.29	NB	NB	NB	\$224.04	NB
52b	short grabber	Doz	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$465.36	NB
53a	Tool Holder Single	Doz.	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$50.16	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
53b	Triple	Doz	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$271.80	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
54a	Flashlight	Doz.	NB	\$23.88	NB	NB	\$55.08	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
54b	D Batteries	Doz	NB	\$10.92	NB	NB	\$21.31	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
55	Rubber gloves	Doz	NB	\$15.99	NB	\$70.24	\$20.16	\$8.16	NB	NB	NB	\$11.82	NB
56a	Disp. Gloves Latex (10)	Case	NB	\$69.90	\$68.00	\$58.30	NB	\$97.14	\$71.92	NB	NB	\$68.40	NB
56b	Vinyl (10)	Case	\$53.52	\$49.90	\$68.00	\$28.40	\$43.40	\$34.51	NB	NB	NB	\$34.10	NB
56c	Nitrile (10)	Case	\$83.78	\$89.90	\$68.00	\$70.20	\$96.60	\$84.89	\$58.57	\$76.00	NB	\$74.90	NB
57a	Triangle brush #36196614	case	NB	NB	NB	\$287.12	\$217.56	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
57b	Deck Brush #3619714	Case	NB	NB	NB	\$134.49	\$104.40	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
58a	Toilet Tissue (Single Ply)	Case	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$40.74	NB	NB	NB	\$28.24	NTS
58b	Two Ply	Case	NB	NB	NB	\$26.22	\$37.16	\$58.70	NB	NB	NB	\$33.82	NB
59a	Bounty Paper towels	Case	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$26.75	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$30.84	NB
59b	Equal To Bounty	Case	NB	NB	NB	\$30.13	\$23.67	\$42.67	NB	\$28.75	NTS	\$25.96	NTS
60a	Multi-fold Towels	Case	NB	NB	NB	\$25.61	\$18.94	\$17.64	NB	\$22.67	NTS	\$19.95	NTS
60b	Multi fold Disp.	Each	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$21.40	\$21.53	NB	NB	NB	\$18.45	NTS
61a	Single Fold Towels	Case	NB	NB	NB	\$22.54	\$18.45	\$26.40	NB	NB	NTS	\$20.95	NTS
61b	Dispen.	Each	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$21.53	NB	NB	NB	\$19.97	NTS
62a	Sanitary Napk Recep	Each	NB	\$19.99	NB	\$49.66	\$49.23	\$22.86	NB	NB	NB	\$19.64	NB
62b	Waxed Bags #RM6141(250)	Case	NB	\$14.99	NB	\$21.26	\$19.68	\$17.17	NB	NB	NB	\$16.87	NB
63	Vo-Ban 15lb	Case	NB	\$89.98	NB	\$31.83	\$36.55	\$41.68	NB	NB	NB	\$58.75	NB
64	Trigger Sprayer & Bottles	Gross	NB	\$216.00	NB	\$1.81	\$309.60	\$234.53	NB	NB	NB	\$260.00	NB
65a	Pump-up Sprayer 1/2 G	Each	NB	NB	NB	\$36.68	\$48.30	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$24.32	NB
65b	Two Gallon	Each	NB	\$16.99	NB	\$57.52	NB	\$14.83	NB	NB	NB	\$22.45	NB

NTS - NOT TO SPECS NB - NO BID

HARDIN CO. SCHOOLS FY2022/2023 CUSTODIAL SUPPLY BID

	Description	Unit	HSS	PSP	Unipak	Hillyard	Ferguson	Kenway	Mersi	Leonard	CentralP	Norvex	BP
66a	3M Floor pads 13"	Case	NB	\$6.99	NB	\$7.61	\$6.80	\$8.46	NB	\$7.50	NB	\$9.75	NB
66b	Buffer Pads 14"	Case	NB	\$8.99	NB	\$8.74	\$7.84	\$9.71	NB	\$8.09	NB	\$10.20	NB
66c	Buffer Pads 20" Standard	Case	NB	\$12.79	NB	\$14.49	\$12.88	\$16.10	NB	\$13.30	NB	\$15.20	NB
66d	Buffer Pads 20" Eraser	Case	NB	\$12.98	NB	\$36.52	\$29.49	\$16.41	NB	\$14.90	NB	\$15.85	NB
66e	20" Hi-Productivity	Case	NB	\$17.99	NB	\$18.94	\$49.33	\$22.26	NB	\$20.18	NB	\$25.95	NB
67	Ice Melt (50lbs)	Bag	NB	NB	NB	\$13.18	NB	\$10.67	NB	NB	NB	\$13.86	NB
68a	32 G Can	each	NB	\$30.99	NB	\$22.51	\$23.66	\$24.61	NB	NB	NB	\$46.22	NB
68b	55 Gal Can	Each	NB	\$46.98	NB	\$118.28	\$41.30	\$42.96	NB	NB	NB	\$104.64	NB
68c	41/1/4Qt (12)	Doz	NB	\$83.88	NB	\$93.95	\$98.76	\$102.72	NB	NB	NB	\$114.72	NB
68d	32/55 Gal 2 pk	Case	NB	\$49.96	NB	\$53.56	\$56.28	\$35.22	NB	NB	NB	\$68.18	NB
68e	Mega Brute	Each	NB	\$599.98	NB	\$495.33	\$520.60	\$553.63	NB	NB	NB	\$593.62	NB
69	Big Wheel Trash Can	Each	NB	\$95.98	NB	\$78.58	\$82.58	\$80.31	NB	NB	NB	\$129.87	NB
70	Browb Jersey Glove	Doz	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$7.92	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
71a	Wet floor sign	Each	NB	\$6.99	NB	\$8.06	\$8.47	\$8.81	NB	NB	NB	\$8.74	NB
71b	Hanging closed sign	Each	NB	\$18.99	NB	\$234.00	\$10.81	\$11.24	NB	NB	NB	\$27.29	NB
72	Plunger	Doz	NB	\$47.88	NB	\$201.24	\$78.72	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$58.80	NB
73a	Custodial Cart	Each	NB	\$139.98	NB	\$132.17	\$147.82	\$144.51	NB	NB	NB	\$164.90	Nb
73b	Replacement bag (2)	Case	NB	\$57.98	NB	\$111.56	\$62.38	\$65.15	NB	NB	NB	\$49.56	NB
74a	24x32" Trash Can liner	1000	NB	NB	\$42.50	\$31.32	\$18.67	\$35.22	NB	NB	NTS	\$28.68	NTS
74b	32x40"	250	NB	NB	\$29.50	\$18.02	\$19.31	\$24.01	NB	NB	NTS	\$19.85	NTS
74c	43x48"	100	NB	NB	\$39.50	\$26.04	\$25.19	\$26.88	NB	\$27.80	NTS	\$26.12	NB
75a	Safety foot wear Treads	Pair	NB	\$46.99	NB	NB	\$43.28	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
75b	Paws Strap on Treads	Pair	NB	NB	NB	\$11.89	\$49.61	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
76	Back support Belt	Each	NB	\$7.99	NB	NB	\$9.88	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
77a	Goggles	Doz	NB	\$33.48	NB	\$47.16	\$21.36	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
77b	Glasses	Doz	NB	\$28.68	NB	\$39.60	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
77c	Readers Saftey Glasses	Doz	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$71.52	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
77d	Poly-Faceshield	100	NB	NB	NB	\$745.00	\$209.00	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
78	3M 20" SB Prep Pad	Case	NB	\$27.99	NB	\$69.63	\$100.23	\$109.32	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
79	Magic Eraser	Case	NB	\$39.99	NB	\$22.29	\$34.96	\$16.91	NB	\$13.24	NB	NB	NB
80a	Micro Cloth KC#83630	Case	NB	\$18.96	NB	\$175.92	\$5.44	\$29.15	NB	NB	NB	\$138.52	NB
80b	KC#83620	Case	NB	\$21.36	NB	\$175.92	\$5.44	\$26.63	NB	NB	NB	\$11.68	NB
81	Disposable Part. Respirator	Case	NB	\$10.99	NB	NB	\$13.99	\$21.07	NB	NB	NB	\$11.68	NB
82a	Finishing Machine	Each	NB	NB	NB	\$932.01	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
82b	Ultra Thin Pad	Case	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
82c	Extra Heavy Pads	Each	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
83	Floor Buffer 20"	Each	NB	NB	NB	\$900.06	\$649.61	\$895.04	NB	NB	NB	\$896.00	\$1,419.53

NTS - NOT TO SPECS NB - NO BID

HARDIN CO. SCHOOLS FY2022/2023 CUSTODIAL SUPPLY BID

	Description	Unit	HSS	PSP	Unipak	Hillyard	Ferguson	Kenway	Mersi	Leonard	CentralP	Norvex	BP
84	High Speed Floor buffer	Each	NB	NB	NB	\$1,948.29	NB	\$1,206.58	NB	NB	NB	\$1,026.15	NB
85	Canister Carpet Extractor	Each	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$6,506.11
86a	VS18	Each	NB	NB	NB	\$823.58	\$876.14	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
86b	VS14	Each	NB	NB	NB	\$629.75	\$669.95	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$616.32
86c	SRXP15	Each	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$682.79	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$587.22
86d	V-LWU-13	Each	NB	NB	NB	\$588.71	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
86e	Model #15P	Each	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
87a	Wet Dry Vac	Each	NB	NB	NB	\$835.06	NB	\$772.79	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$705.34
87b	26" Squeegee Kit	Price	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	Included	NB	NB	NB	\$3,294.00	\$473.30
88	20" Auto Scrub	Each	NB	NB	NB	\$3,732.80	NB	\$4,904.00	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$7,131.91
89a	BackPac Vac Q Vac	Each	NB	NB	NB	\$409.51	NB	\$451.32	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$604.81
89b	GoFree Flex Pro W/ Battery	Each	NB	NB	NB	\$1,222.20	\$1,155.81	\$1,457.50	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$2,949.78
90	Tennant Ex Spot-2	Each	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$823.59	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
91	26" Auto Floor Scrubber	Each	NB	NB	NB	\$6,957.59	NB	\$7,181.60	NB	NB	NB	\$5,942.00	\$10,413.24
92	Tennant/Nobles Ex-sc-412	Each	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$2,052.95	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$3,917.07
93a	EX-SC-716 Extractor	Each	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$2,338.96	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
93b	Wand Attachment	Each	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	Included	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
94	3M Floor carpet Sweeper	Each	NB	\$49.98	NB	\$218.78	\$49.00	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$32.47	NB
95	Floor Dams #7240	Each	NB	NB	NB	\$72.82	\$45.11	\$71.05	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB

NTS - NOT TO SPECS NB - NO BID