
JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

8103BID ID:

APPROVAL DATE: May 24, 2022

ITEM(S) QUOTED: TUNICS (SCNS) . 

DATE BIDS RECEIVED: May 02, 2022

From May 24, 2022 through May 23, 2023CONTRACT PERIOD:

RENEWAL(S): Two (2) annual renewals at the option of both parties. 

COMMENTS: An * indicates an award. 
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Vendor Response Terms

Response Payment TermsResponse TermsVendor Name

Alan Hyman Enterprises, Inc. Net 30 days  There are no 6X or 7X available 

for either item

Net 30 days

ARAMARK Uniform Services Net 30

Cardinal Uniforms & Scrubs Due to supply issues, we pivoted at the last 

minute and are bidding with Cherokee 

Workwear instead of Landau.  Please see 

word attachment labeled "JCPS Proposal" for 

details.  Thank you for the opportunity to earn 

your business.

Invoices will be sent within 7 days of shipping. 

Payment is due 30 days from the invoice date 

or receive date, whichever is later.  Payment 

must be remitted by check or ACH.

Cintas Corporation

Concept Uniform co Please note two things 1-price includes the 

logo embroidered on all tops 2-Neither style 

no 8232 or 7489 is available in sizes 6XL and 

7XL

Net 30

Eagle Group

mid-america uniforms Required Vendor Response Forms submitted 

in paper form separate

Net 30
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ITEM NO. 1  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 14  -  Tunic, S - XL, Women's, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton.  Available colors: Black and Galaxy 

Blue. JCPS 502 Food Works logo on left chest.  As per specifications.  Landau #8232 or equal.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, 

Estimated Quantity - 1,300 (8800500-2011397)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Eagle Group - did not supply correct required submittals per bid terms and conditions.  

Awarded to Cintas Corporation as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 14.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*Landau  17.5000Cintas Corporation

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8231

landau  17.5000Eagle Group

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Landau  18.4500Concept Uniform co

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Landau  18.6000Alan Hyman Enterprises, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Landau  #8232 18.7800ARAMARK Uniform Services

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: L8232

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Style per request

Landau  19.3000mid-america uniforms

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

Cherokee  22.0000Cardinal Uniforms & Scrubs

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4770

See Bid TermsRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Price includes embroidery and drop shipping to each location.  Sample will be delivered 

by 5/5/22.  I only had khaki 4X in-store but am happy to send you another in the correct 

colors.

ITEM NO. 2  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 14  -  Tunic, 2XL, Women's, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton.  Available colors: Black and Galaxy Blue. 

JCPS 502 Food Works logo on left chest.  As per specifications.  Landau #8232 or equal.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 400 (8800500-2011398)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Eagle Group - did not supply correct required submittals per bid terms and conditions.  

Awarded to Cintas Corporation as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 14.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

landau  18.9900Eagle Group

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

*Landau  19.5000Cintas Corporation

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Landau  20.4500Concept Uniform co

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Landau  20.6000Alan Hyman Enterprises, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Landau  20.7500mid-america uniforms

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.

PAGE 



Landau  #8232 21.0300ARAMARK Uniform Services

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: L8232

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Style per request

Cherokee Workwear  24.5000Cardinal Uniforms & Scrubs

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4770

ITEM NO. 3  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 14  -  Tunic, 3XL, Women's, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton.  Available colors: Black and Galaxy Blue. 

JCPS 502 Food Works logo on left chest.  As per specifications.  Landau #8232 or equal.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 200 (8800500-2011399)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Eagle Group - did not supply correct required submittals per bid terms and conditions.  

Awarded to Cintas Corporation as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 14.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*Landau  19.5000Cintas Corporation

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

landau  19.9900Eagle Group

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Landau  20.4500Concept Uniform co

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Landau  20.6000Alan Hyman Enterprises, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Landau  20.7500mid-america uniforms

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

Landau  #8232 21.0300ARAMARK Uniform Services

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: L8232

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Style per request

Cherokee Workwear  24.5000Cardinal Uniforms & Scrubs

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4770

ITEM NO. 4  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 14  -  Tunic, 4XL, Women's, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton.  Available colors: Black and Galaxy Blue. 

JCPS 502 Food Works logo on left chest.  As per specifications.  Landau #8232 or equal  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 100 (8800500-2011400)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Eagle Group - did not supply correct required submittals per bid terms and conditions.  

Awarded to Cintas Corporation as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 14.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*Landau  19.5000Cintas Corporation

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Landau  20.4500Concept Uniform co

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Landau  20.6000Alan Hyman Enterprises, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Landau  20.7500mid-america uniforms
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

Landau  #8232 21.0300ARAMARK Uniform Services

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: L8232

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Style per request

landau  21.8900Eagle Group

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Cherokee Workwear  24.5000Cardinal Uniforms & Scrubs

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4770

ITEM NO. 5  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 14  -  Tunic, 5XL, Women's, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton.  Available colors: Black and Galaxy Blue. 

JCPS 502 Food Works logo on left chest.  As per specifications.  Landau #8232 or equal  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 50 (8800500-2011401)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Eagle Group - did not supply correct required submittals per bid terms and conditions.  

Awarded to Cintas Corporation as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 14.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*Landau  19.5000Cintas Corporation

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Landau  20.4500Concept Uniform co

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Landau  20.6000Alan Hyman Enterprises, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Landau  20.7500mid-america uniforms

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

Landau  #8232 21.0300ARAMARK Uniform Services

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: L8232

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Style per request

landau  22.8900Eagle Group

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Cherokee Workwear  24.5000Cardinal Uniforms & Scrubs

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4770

ITEM NO. 6  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 14  -  Tunic, 6XL. Women's, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton.  Available colors: Black and Galaxy Blue. 

JCPS 502 Food Works logo on left chest.  As per specifications.  Landau #8232 or equal  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 20 (8800500-2011402)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Eagle Group - did not supply correct required submittals per bid terms and conditions.  

Awarded to Cintas Corporation as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 14.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Not available  0.0100Alan Hyman Enterprises, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0

Not Available  0.0100Cardinal Uniforms & Scrubs
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NA

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Not available in 6X or 7X

landau  0.0100Concept Uniform co

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Size Not Available 8232 comes up to 5XL No Bid on this size

*Landau  22.5000Cintas Corporation

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 6xl made to order.  6-8 week lead time to make garments.

landau  23.8000Eagle Group

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Landau  #8232 24.4500ARAMARK Uniform Services

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: L8232

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Style per request

Landau  29.5500mid-america uniforms

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: There is a possibility Landau will cease making custom made sizes which includes size 

6XL

ITEM NO. 7  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 14  -  Tunic, 7XL, Women's, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton.  Available colors: Black and Galaxy Blue. 

JCPS 502 Food Works logo on left chest.  As per specifications.  Landau #8232 or equal  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 20 (8800500-2011403)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Eagle Group - did not supply correct required submittals per bid terms and conditions.  

Awarded to Cintas Corporation as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 14.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Not available  0.0100Alan Hyman Enterprises, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0

Not Avaiable  0.0100Cardinal Uniforms & Scrubs

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NA

Landau  0.0100Concept Uniform co

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Size Not Available 8232 comes up to 5XL No Bid on this size

*Landau  22.5000Cintas Corporation

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 7xl made to order 6-8 week lead time to make garments.

landau  25.9000Eagle Group

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Landau  29.5500mid-america uniforms

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8232

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: There is a possibility Landau will cease making custom made sizes which includes size 

7XL.

Landau  #8232 29.6100ARAMARK Uniform Services
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: L8232

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Style per request

ITEM NO. 8  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 14  -  Tunic, S-XL, Men's, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton.  Available colors: Black and Galaxy Blue. 

JCPS 502 Food Works logo on left chest.  As per specifications.  Landau #7594 or equal  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 200 (8800500-2011404)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Eagle Group - did not supply correct required submittals per bid terms and conditions.  

Awarded to Cintas Corporation as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 14.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

landau  10.8000Eagle Group

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7594

*Landau  14.7500Cintas Corporation

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7502

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Another option that has good stock would be 71221.  Sample included for both. S-XL 

$12.25 each 

Landau  15.9500Alan Hyman Enterprises, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7502

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Substitute for 7594

Landau  17.1600mid-america uniforms

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7594-7502

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

Landau  17.8500Concept Uniform co

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7489

Landau  #71221 18.7800ARAMARK Uniform Services

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 91221

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Style 7594 requested is discontinued. The 71221 is a like item

Cherokee Workwear  23.2500Cardinal Uniforms & Scrubs

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7876

To receive this special bulk pricing, post-bid POsRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Landau top requested is no longer made in galaxy.  Cherokee WW 4876 is a men's 3 

pocket top that is very similar to the original requested item. Please see catalog and 

sample for details. 

ITEM NO. 9  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 14  -  Tunic, 2XL, Men's, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton.  Available colors: Black and Galaxy Blue. 

JCPS 502 Food Works logo on left chest.  As per specifications.  Landau #7594 or equal  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 200 (8800500-2011983)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Eagle Group - did not supply correct required submittals per bid terms and conditions.  

Awarded to Cintas Corporation as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 14.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

landau  11.8000Eagle Group

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7594

*7502  16.7500Cintas Corporation

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7502

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Another option would be the item 71221 2xl $14.50 each with logo.
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Landau  17.9500Alan Hyman Enterprises, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7502

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Substitute for 7594

Landau  18.6600mid-america uniforms

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7594-7502

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

landau  19.8500Concept Uniform co

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7489

Landau  #71221 21.0300ARAMARK Uniform Services

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 91221

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Style 7594 requested is discontinued. The 71221 is a like item

Cherokee Workwear  25.7500Cardinal Uniforms & Scrubs

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4876

ITEM NO. 10  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 14  -  Tunic, 3XL, Men's, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton.  Available colors: Black and Galaxy Blue. 

JCPS 502 Food Works logo on left chest.  As per specifications.  Landau #7594 or equal  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 50 (8800500-2011984)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Eagle Group - did not supply correct required submittals per bid terms and conditions.  

Awarded to Cintas Corporation as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 14.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

landau  12.9000Eagle Group

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7594

*Landau  16.7500Cintas Corporation

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7502

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Another option would be the 71221 cobalt.  $14.50 3xl

Landau  17.9500Alan Hyman Enterprises, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7502

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Substitute for 7594

Landau  18.6600mid-america uniforms

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7594-7502

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

landau  20.4500Concept Uniform co

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7489

Landau  #71221 21.0300ARAMARK Uniform Services

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 91221

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Style 7594 requested is discontinued. The 71221 is a like item

Cherokee Workwear  25.7500Cardinal Uniforms & Scrubs

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4876

ITEM NO. 11  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 14  -  Tunic, 4XL, Men's, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton.  Available colors: Black and Galaxy Blue. 

JCPS 502 Food Works logo on left chest.  As per specifications.  Landau #7594 or equal  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 50 (8800500-2014968)
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LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Eagle Group - did not supply correct required submittals per bid terms and conditions.  

Awarded to Cintas Corporation as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 14.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

landau  13.9000Eagle Group

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7594

*Landau  16.7500Cintas Corporation

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7502

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Another option would be the 71221 in cobalt or black. 14.50 size 4xl

Landau  17.9500Alan Hyman Enterprises, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7502

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Substitute for 7594

Landau  18.6600mid-america uniforms

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7594-7502

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

landau  19.8500Concept Uniform co

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7489

Landau  #71221 21.0300ARAMARK Uniform Services

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 91221

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Style 7594 requested is discontinued. The 71221 is a like item

Cherokee Workwear  25.7500Cardinal Uniforms & Scrubs

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4876

ITEM NO. 12  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 14  -  Tunic, 5XL, Men's, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton.  Available colors: Black and Galaxy Blue. 

JCPS 502 Food Works logo on left chest. As per specifications. Landau #7594 or equal.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 50 (8800500-2014969)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Eagle Group - did not supply correct required submittals per bid terms and conditions.  

Awarded to Cintas Corporation as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 14.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

landau  14.8000Eagle Group

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7594

*Landau  16.7500Cintas Corporation

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7502

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: another option would be the 71221 in cobalt and black.  $14.50 size 5xl

Landau  17.9500Alan Hyman Enterprises, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7502

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Substitute for 7594

Landau  18.6600mid-america uniforms

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7594-7502

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

landau  19.8500Concept Uniform co

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7489

Landau  #71221 21.0300ARAMARK Uniform Services

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 91221
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Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Style 7594 requested is discontinued. The 71221 is a like item

Cherokee Workwear  25.7500Cardinal Uniforms & Scrubs

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4876

ITEM NO. 13  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 14  -  Tunic, 6XL, Men's, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton.  Available colors: Black and Galaxy Blue. 

JCPS 502 Food Works logo on left chest.  As per specifications.  Landau #7594 or equal  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 25 (8800500-2014970)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Eagle Group - did not supply correct required submittals per bid terms and conditions.  

Awarded to Cintas Corporation as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 14.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Not Available  0.0100Alan Hyman Enterprises, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0

Not Available  0.0100Cardinal Uniforms & Scrubs

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NA

landau  0.0100Concept Uniform co

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7489

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: No bid size is not avaialable

landau  15.4000Eagle Group

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7594

*Landau  19.7500Cintas Corporation

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7502

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 6xl made to order not stocked by vendor.  6-8 lead time to make garments.  Another 

option is the 71221 made to order $17.50 6-8 lead time.

Landau  #71221 24.4500ARAMARK Uniform Services

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 91221

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Style 7594 requested is discontinued. The 71221 is a like item

Landau  25.6600mid-america uniforms

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7594-7502

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: There is a possibility Landau will cease making custom made sizes which will include 

size 6XL

ITEM NO. 14  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 14  -  Tunic, 7XL, Men's, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton.  Available colors: Black and Galaxy Blue. 

JCPS 502 Food Works logo on left chest.  As per specifications.  Landau #7594 or equal  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 25 (8800500-2014971)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Eagle Group - did not supply correct required submittals per bid terms and conditions.  

Awarded to Cintas Corporation as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 14.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Not available  0.0100Alan Hyman Enterprises, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0

Not Available  0.0100Cardinal Uniforms & Scrubs

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NA

landau  0.0100Concept Uniform co
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7489

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: No bid size is not avaialable

landau  15.8000Eagle Group

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7594

*Landau  19.7500Cintas Corporation

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7502

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 7xl made to order 6-8 week lead time to make garments.  Another option is the 71221 

6-8 week lead time $17.50 for 7xl

Landau  25.6600mid-america uniforms

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7594-7502

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: There is a possibility Landau will cease making custom sizes which will include size 7XL

Landau  #71221 29.6100ARAMARK Uniform Services

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 91221

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Style 7594 requested is discontinued. The 71221 is a like item
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TOTAL BIDS - 1 - 14

AWARDED TOTAL ($)TOTAL ($)VENDOR NAME

 48,075.0048,075.00Cintas Corporation

46,051.50Eagle Group

49,103.40Alan Hyman Enterprises, Inc.

49,870.90Concept Uniform co

53,080.50mid-america uniforms

53,735.70ARAMARK Uniform Services

60,638.40Cardinal Uniforms & Scrubs

$48,075.00
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)

49,103.40Alan Hyman Enterprises, Inc.

53,735.70ARAMARK Uniform Services

60,638.40Cardinal Uniforms & Scrubs

48,075.00  48,075.00Cintas Corporation

49,870.90Concept Uniform co

46,051.50Eagle Group

53,080.50mid-america uniforms

48,075.00
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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