

Henderson County Schools

1805 Second Street, Henderson, Kentucky 42420
(270) 831-5000 Fax: (270) 831-5009
www.henderson.kyschools.us



To: Bob Lawson, Superintendent
And School Board Members

From: Cindy Cloutier
Director of Finance *C. Cloutier*

Date: May 16, 2022

Re: Bid Recommendations

Bid Recommendations:

Fire Safety Equipment Inspection 4-22-5-4

Invitations were sent to Armor Fire Protection, CertaSite Pro, Cintas, FSI Fire Safety, & Johnson Controls. We received one bid from Armor Fire Protection. We recommend you award the bid to Armor Fire Protection as highlighted on the Tabulation Sheet.

Bid Renewal Recommendations:

Courier Service Bid # 5-20-5-5

Silver Creek Transportation has the contract for Courier Service. The contract expires on June 30, 2022. We have received a signed letter agreeing to renew with us. We are recommending you renew the contract with Silver Creek Transportation for another year.

New or Retread Tires & Tubes Bid # 9-20-5-6

Best One Fleet Service have the contract for New or Retread Tires & Tubes. This contract expires on June 30, 2022. We have received a signed renewal letter. We are recommending you renew the contract with Best One Fleet Service for another year.

Henderson County Schools
Fire & Safety Equipment Inspection
Bid 4-22-5-4
Tabulation Sheet

SERVICE	Armor Fire Protection	Totals	Cintas	Totals	FSI Fire Safety	Totals	Johnson Controls Simplex Grinnell	Totals
I. FIRE EXTINGUISHERS			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
212# ABC Dry Powder (2)								
Inspection								
6 year Maintenance	\$2.50							
Hydrostatic Testing	Exchange							
Refill/Recharge	Exchange							
Total								
5# ABC Dry Chemical (61)								
Inspection	\$2.50							
6 year Maintenance	Exchange							
Hydrostatic Testing	Exchange							
Refill/Recharge	Exchange							
Total								
10# ABC Dry Chemical (233)								
Inspection	\$2.50							
6 year Maintenance	Exchange							
Hydrostatic Testing	Exchange							
Refill/Recharge	Exchange							
Total								
20# ABC Dry Chemical (3)								
Inspection	\$2.50							
6 year Maintenance	Exchange							
Hydrostatic Testing	Exchange							
Refill/Recharge	Exchange							
Total								
5# CO2 (1)								
Inspection	\$2.50							
6 year Maintenance	Exchange							
Hydrostatic Testing	Exchange							
Refill/Recharge	Exchange							
Total								
10# CO2 (7)								
Inspection	\$2.50							
6 year Maintenance	Exchange							
Hydrostatic Testing	Exchange							
Refill/Recharge	Exchange							
Total								
20# CO2 (2)								
Inspection	\$2.50							
6 year Maintenance	Exchange							
Hydrostatic Testing	Exchange							
Refill/Recharge	Exchange							
Total								
Halotron Fire Extinguishers (44)								
Inspection	\$2.50							
6 year Maintenance	Exchange							
Hydrostatic Testing	Exchange							
Refill/Recharge	Exchange							
Total								
School Bus Fire Extinguishers (125)								
Inspection	\$2.50							
6 year Maintenance	Exchange							
Hydrostatic Testing	Exchange							
Refill/Recharge	Exchange							
Total								
Kitchen K-Class Fire Extinguishers (12)								
Inspection	\$2.50							
6 year Maintenance	Exchange							
Hydrostatic Testing	Exchange							
Refill/Recharge	Exchange							
Total								
II. COOKING EXHAUST HOOD (19)								
Inspection	\$1,875.00	per inspection						
6 year Maintenance	N/A							
Hydrostatic Testing	N/A							
III. SPRINKLER SYSTEM								
Flat rate to test all risers & switches (each)								
(13)	\$95.00							
Check antifreeze HCHS to potting shed (1)	\$95.00							
Refill	T&M							
Total								
IV. PARTS AND LABOR								
Percentage Discount on Parts	1.50%							
Hourly Rate for Labor	\$120.00							
V. TRAVEL								
Mileage Charge	N/A							
Flat Fee Per Visit	\$85.00							
Hourly Rates	\$120.00							
ANNUAL TOTALS								
Contact Address	Kim Trammel 1196 5th St. Henderson, KY 42420	Jordan Evans 54 Monument Circle, Suite 807 Indianapolis, IN 46204	Geno Johnston		Chad Lane 1015 Progress Drive Clarksville, TN 37040		Dale More 2225 N Burkhardt Rd Evansville, IN 47715	
Phone	270-349-1617	616-278-3257	(443) 449-3307		913-552-7044		812-647-0059	
Fax	270-830-7616				913-552-7074		812-423-9224	
E-mail	kimberly.trammel@wvsfz.us	jevans@certastapro.com	johnston.g@ontas.com		clane@fsiresafety.com		dale.a.moore@icc.com	