
Christian County Public Schools
Bid Tabulation   Antifreeze & Lubricants
July 1, 2022 - June 30, 2023

Engine Oil Engine Oil Trans. Oil Trans. Oil Gear Oil Grease Antifreeze Antifreeze Antifreeze Antifreeze
Vendor 15W40 15W40 Mecron/Dextron III Trans/Synd 85 W 140 NLGL2 Ext Life Ext Life Ethylene Ethylene

Bulk Price 50/55 gal drum 50/55 gal drum 50/55 gal drum 120 lb cont. 50/55 gal Full Strength 50/50 Full Strength 50/50

50/55 gal 50/55 gal 50/55 gal 50/55 gal

Parman Energy Group $14.71 ($ 869.48)       ($ 855.32)               ($ 1,739.60)    ($ 283.30)     ($ 1,358.42) ($ 985.02)      ($ 532.70)      ($ 655.29)      ($ 453.80)      

* Max Arnold & Sons ($ 9.69)        ($ 642.40)       ($ 644.14)               ($ 1,729.53)    ($ 340.66)     ($ 1,087.77) ($ 563.53)      ($ 340.00)      ($ 434.12)      ($ 283.98)      

Clarke Power Service  no bid  no bid  no bid  ($ 1,340.70)     no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid 

* We recommend Max Arnold & Sons receive the bid for Antifreeze & Lubricants.

Jessica Darnell Mike Brumley,
Director of Business Director of Transportation


