
Kenton County School Dislric I It's a6out)U.£ fjd's. 

DATE: 
4/06/22 

AGENDA ITEM {ACTION ITEM}: 

Issue Paper 

Consider/ Approve awarding the Playground Mulch Bid to Central Lawn Care, as listed on the 
Playground Mulch Bid Tabulation for the contract period of June Pt, 2022 to May 3l5t, 2023 with 
two optional annual renewals available. 

APPLICABLE BOARD POLICY: 
Fiscal Management 04.32 AP.1 

HISTORY/BACKGROUND: 
An advertisement to accept sealed proposals for Playground Mulch was posted to the district 
website on March 23rd, 2022. Proposals were publicly opened on April 6th, 2022 at 2:00pm EST. 

FISCAL/BUDGETARY IMPACT: 
None. 

RECOMMENDATION: 
Approval to award the Playground Mulch Bid to Central Lawn Care, as listed on the Playground 
Mulch Bid Tabulation for the contract period of June 1st, 2022 to May 31st, 2023 with two optional 
annual renewals available. 

CONTACT PERSON: 
Jennifer Weis-Smith 

District Administrator Superintendent 

Use this form to submit your request to the Superintendent for items to be added to the Board Meeting Agenda. 
Principal -complete, print, sign and send to your Director. Director -if approved, sign and put in the Superintendent's mailbox. 



Estimated Quantity in 

Yard3 

Wood Chip Mulch 

1 yd3 
- 50 yd3 

51 yd3 
- 100 yd3 

101 yd3 
- 150 yd3 

151 yd3 
- 200 yd3 

201 yd3 
- 250 yd3 

251 yd3 
- 300 yd3 

301 yd3 
- 350 yd3 

351 yd3 
- 400 yd3 

401 yd3 
- 450 yd3 

451 yd3 
- 500 yd3 

501 yd3 
- 550 yd3 

551 yd3 
- 600 yd3 

601 yd3 
- 650 yd3 

651 yd3 
- 700 yd3 

701 yd3 
- 750 yd3 

7 51 yd3 
- 1,000 yd3 

Lead Time 

THE KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
PLAYGROUND MULCH BID TABULATION 2022 

Irvine Wood Recovery 

Unit Price Delivered Unit Price to Blow in Total to Deliver and Unit Price Delivered 
per Yard3 Including 

' 3 
Place per Yard Blow in Place per Yard3 per Yard3 Including 

Freight Including Freight Including Freight Freight 

$ 25.00 38.00 63.00 $ 21.50 .. 

$ 25.00 38.00 63.00 $ 21.50 .. 

$ 25.00 38.00 63.00 $ 21.50 .. 

$ 25.00 38.00 63.00 $ 21.50 .. 

$ 25.00 38.00 63.00 $ 21.50 .. 

$ 25 .00 38.00 63.00 $ 21.50 .. 

$ 25.00 38.00 63.00 $ 21.50 .. 

$ 25.00 38.00 63.00 $ 21.50 .. 

$ 25.00 38.00 63.00 $ 21.50 .. 

$ 25.00 38.00 63.00 $ 21.50 .. 

$ 25.00 38.00 63.00 $ 21.50 .. 

$ 25.00 38.00 63.00 $ 21.50 .. 

$ 25.00 38.00 63.00 $ 21.50 .. 

$ 25.00 38.00 63.00 $ 21.50 .. 

$ 25.00 38.00 63.00 $ 21.50 .. 

$ 25.00 38.00 63.00 $ 21.50 .. 

3 DAYS 
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Central Lawn Care 

Unit Price to Blow in Total to Deliver and 

Place per Yard3 Blow in Place per Yard3 

Including Freight Including Freight 

$ 25.00 $ 46.50 

$ 25.00 $ 46.50 

$ 25.00 $ 46.50 

$ 25.00 $ 46.50 

$ 25.00 $ 46.50 

$ 25.00 $ 46.50 

$ 25.00 $ 46.50 

$ 25.00 $ 46.50 

$ 25.00 $ 46.50 

$ 25.00 $ 46.50 

$ 25.00 $ 46.50 

$ 25.00 $ 46.50 

$ 25.00 $ 46.50 

$ 25.00 $ 46.50 
I I 

$ 25.00 $ 46.50 

$ 25.00 $ 46.50 

30 DAYS 



Estimated Quantity in 

Yard3 

Rubber Mulch 

1 yd3
- 50 yd3 

51 yd3 
- 100 yd3 

101 yd3 
- 150 yd3 

151 yd3 
- 200 yd3 

201 yd3 
- 250 yd3 

251 yd3 
- 300 yd3 

301 yd3 
- 350 yd3 

351 yd3 
- 400 yd3 

401 yd3 
- 450 yd3 

451 yd3 
- 500 yd3 

501 yd3 
- 550 yd3 

551 yd3 
- 600 yd3 

601 yd3 
- 650 yd3 

651 yd3 
- 700 yd3 

701 yd3 
- 750 yd3 

751 yd3 
- 1,000 yd3 

Lead Time 

THE KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
PLAYGROUND MULCH BID TABULATION 2022 

Irvine Wood Recovery 

Unit Price Delivered Unit Price to Blow in Total to Deliver and Unit Price Delivered 

per Yard3 Including Place per Yard3 Blow in Place per Yard3 per Yard3 Including 
Freight Including Freight Including Freight Freight 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 450.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 375.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 375.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 375.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 375.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 375.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 375.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 375.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 375.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 375.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 375.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 375.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 375.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 375.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 375.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 375.00 

I I- Recommended as the lowest and/or best evaluated bid. 
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Central Lawn Care 

Unit Price to Blow in Total to Deliver and 

Place per Yard3 Blow in Place per Yard3 

Including Freight Including Freight 

$ 30.00 $ 480.00 

$ 30.00 $ 405.00 

$ 30.00 $ 405.00 

$ 30.00 $ 405.00 

$ 30.00 $ 405.00 

$ 30.00 $ 405 .00 

$ 30.00 $ 405.00 

$ 30.00 $ 405.00 

$ 30.00 $ 405.00 

$ 30.00 $ 405.00 

$ 30.00 $ 405 .00 

$ 30.00 $ 405.00 

$ 30.00 $ 405.00 

$ 30.00 $ 405 .00 

$ 30.00 $ 405.00 

$ 30.00 $ 405.00 

45 DAYS 


