

Henderson County Schools

1805 Second Street, Henderson, Kentucky 42420
(270) 831-5000 Fax: (270) 831-5009
www.henderson.kyschools.us



To: Bob Lawson, Superintendent
and School Board Members

From: Cindy Cloutier
Director of Finance *Cloutier*

Date: March 21, 2022

Re: Bid Recommendations

Bid Recommendations

Audit RFP # Audit 22

Information regarding the bid was placed in the newspaper and on our website. We received a response from one firm, Alexander Thompson Arnold PLLC. The RFP is written with a four year cycle: the original contract year and three annual renewals. We recommend awarding Alexander Thompson Arnold PLLC the contract.

Amended 75 Ton Iron Worker with Power Link COPER NOTCHER 3-22-5-3

Invitations were sent to JPW Industries, Holston Gases, and Dailey Surplus. We received bids from Holston Gases, Paxton Patterson, and Sid Tool Co. dba Industrial Supply Co. Holston Gases meet the specification and had the best price and options for the school's needs. We recommend the bid be awarded to Holston Gases.

Lawn Mowing Services 1-22-5-3

We received bids from three vendors. Brandon's Lawn & Landscaping, River City Services, LLC., and Unlimited Lawncare. We have decided to split the bid with two companies so that our lawn care needs are covered. We recommend you award the bid to both River City Service and Unlimited Lawn Care as highlighted on the Tabulation Sheet.

Bid Renewal Recommendations

Bank Proposal # 3-19-6-3

The Bank Depository Contract with Independence Bank expires on June 30, 2022. We have communicated with Jim Davis at Independence Bank and he has agreed to renew with Henderson County Schools for another year. We are recommending you renew the contract with Independence Bank.

**Henderson County Board of Education
1805 Second Street
Henderson, KY 42420**

**Auditing Services
RFP Tabulation Sheet
AUDIT 22**

Alexander Thompson Arnold PLLC		Alexander & Company CPAS PSC	Kem, Duguid & Associates
Audit Cost			
2022	\$30,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
2023	\$30,000.00		
2024	\$30,000.00		
2025	\$30,000.00		
Contact	Brian Crafton/Malcolm Neel III	Joseph Keller	Sandra D. Duguid
Address	300 1st Street Henderson, KY 42420	2707 Breckenridge St. Suite 1 Owensboro, KY 42303	102 West Second Street Hopkinsville, KY 42241
Phone	270-827-1577	270-684-3237	270-886-6355
Fax		270-684-3200	270-886-8662
E-mail	bcrafton@atacpa.net / mneel@atacpa.net jkeller@acocpa.net		

Henderson County Schools
 1805 Second Street
 Henderson, KY 42420
 Lawn Mowing Tabulation Sheet
 Bid 1-22-5-3

Contract Dates: April 2, 2022 - November 2, 2022

	Brandon's Lawn Care	River City Service	Unlimited Lawncare & Landscaping
Cairo	\$300.00	\$315.00	\$275.00
Jefferson	\$210.00 old/ \$426.00 new	\$245.00 old/ \$390.00 new	\$200.00 old \$445.00 new
Niagara	\$250.00	\$245.00	\$225.00
Spottsville	\$425.00	\$410.00	\$455.00
North Middle	\$550.00	\$545.00	\$500.00
South Middle	\$450.00	\$395.00	\$460.00
Hend. Co. High	\$518.00	\$530.00	\$500.00
Weekly Total	\$3,129.00	\$3,075.00	\$3,060.00
Annual Total	\$96,999.00	\$95,325.00	\$94,860.00
Equipment List Provided	✓	✓	✓
References	✓	✓	✓
Number years in business	7	5	21
Personnel	6	5-6	9-10
Custodial area			
Contact	Brandon Spainhoward	Jeff Coomes	Stephen Baker - Aaron & Wendy Daugherty
Address	1210 Atkinson School Henderson, KY 42420	P.O. Box 1041 Henderson, KY 42420	132 Carlisle Street Henderson, Ky 42420
Phone	270-844-9008	270-860-5072	270-860-2376(Stephen) 270-860-0539(Wendy) - 270-860-0536 (Aaron)
Fax			
E-mail Address	spainhoward99@icloud.com	Jeff.coomes@outlook.com	Unlimitedlawncare19@outlook.com
Pre-Bid Tour 2/21/2022	✓	✓	✓

Henderson County Board of Education
1805 Second St.
Henderson, KY 42420

75 Ton Iron Worker with Power Link COPER NOTCHER
RFP No. 2-22-5-3

Dailey Surplus	Holston Gases	JPW Industries	Paxton Patterson	Sid Tool dba MSC Industrial Supply Co.	
75 Ton Iron Worker with Power Link	\$27,500.00	No Bid	\$27,656.00	\$29,509.00	
Pipe Die 1-1/4" X 6" 180 degrees	\$827.00		\$927.00	\$889.00	
Square Tube Die 1" X 6 1/2 " 180 degrees	\$1,014.00		\$1,144.00	1"x61/2" - \$1089.00 1"x5 1-2" \$1099.00	
Pipe Notcher	\$520.00		\$594.00	\$559.00	
Pipe Notcher Dies	\$902.00		No Bid	\$1,018.00	\$949.00 3-4"- \$909.00 1/2" - 849.00 1 1-4"- \$969.00 (see attached bid for details)
12 " Brake with 4-Way Die	\$1,775.00			\$1,960.00	\$1,909.00
Punch & Die Starter Set	\$427.00			\$497.00	\$459.00
10 Ton Bender	\$4,035.00			\$4,395.00	\$4,379.00
Meets Specifications	Yes			Yes	Not marked
Total:	Shipping: \$1,000.00				
Grand total:	\$38,000.00			\$38,191.00	\$45,716.00
Contact Info:	John Dailey	Chris Taber	Chad Stults	Kathleen Manders	
Address	1621 Pringle St. Henderson, KY 42420	7549 Iceland Rd. Maceo, KY 42355	427 New Sandford Rd. La Vergne, TN 37086	4141 W. 126th St. Alsip, IL 60803	
Phone	270-826-3113	270-341-9393	615-504-4702	800-323-8484	
Fax		833-985-1096		708-894-1907	
Email	daileysurplus@gmail.com	chris.taber@holstongases.com	estults@jpwindustries.com	bids@paxpat.com nicole.allen@mscdirect.com	