JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID: 8064

APPROVAL DATE: February 15, 2022

ITEM(S) QUOTED: SPECIAL EDUCATION EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES (%)
DATE BIDS RECEIVED: January 13, 2022

CONTRACT PERIOD: From February 27, 2022 through February 26, 2023
RENEWAL(S): Two (2) annual renewals at the option of both parties.

COMMENTS: Awarded to National Seating & Mobility



Vendor Response Terms

Vendor Name

Response Terms

Response Payment Terms

Discount School Supply

Please see attachments for Terms of Offer

See Attached Files

Medicaleshop Inc.

Please refer to the attached 'Exhibit #2
Deviations' for details. We have also attached
a list of other Special Education Equipment
brands available with us, for your reference.

Please refer to the attached 'Exhibit #2
Deviations' for details.

NASCO No Bid No Bid

National Seating & Mobility

Palos Sport Please reference quote 4011556 NET 30
Really Good Stuff Please see attached Files for Terms of offer Net 30



ITEM NO. 1 - EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES, ADAPTIVE IMPORTS, LLC (4600130-2013619)

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
National Seating & Mobility 10.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES:
Discount School Supply .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: N/A
Medicaleshop Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
NASCO .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
Really Good Stuff .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: n/a
ITEM NO. 2 - EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES, ARMEDICA MANUFACTURING CORP. (4600130-2013621)
AWARD NOTES: The tie bid is broken by awarding to the local vendor, National Seating & Mobility.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
National Seating & Mobility 10.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES:
Palos Sport 10.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: See exclusions document for any exclusions
Medicaleshop Inc. 2.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Shipping differs item wise
Discount School Supply .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: N/A
NASCO .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
Really Good Stuff .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: n/a
ITEM NO. 3 - EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES, HAUSMAN INDUSTRIES, INC. (4600130-2012484)
AWARD NOTES: The tie bid is broken by awarding to the local vendor, National Seating & Mobility.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
National Seating & Mobility 10.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Palos Sport 10.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: See exclusions document for any exclusions
Medicaleshop Inc. 2.00 %

Note: * indicates a pending award. 3



CATEGORY NOTES:

Shipping Charges may apply

CATEGORY NOTES:

Discount School Supply .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: N/A
NASCO .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
Really Good Stuff .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: n/a
ITEM NO. 4 - EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES, HOYER (4600130-2014441)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
National Seating & Mobility 10.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Discount School Supply .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: N/A

Medicaleshop Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Call or Email us at 866-563-6812, csteam@medicaleshop.com for Quote

NASCO .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

Really Good Stuff .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: n/a

ITEM NO. 5 - EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES, INSPIRED BY DRIVE (4600130-2014933)
AWARD NOTES: The tie bid is broken by awarding to the local vendor, National Seating & Mobility.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
National Seating & Mobility 10.00 %

Palos Sport 10.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: See exclusions document for any exclusions

Medicaleshop Inc. 5.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Free Shipping

Discount School Supply .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: N/A

NASCO .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

Really Good Stuff .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: n/a

Note: * indicates a pending award.



ITEM NO. 6 - EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES, JENX LTD. (4600130-2013623)

VENDOR NAME
National Seating & Mobility

CATEGORY NOTES:

PERCENTAGE
OF DISCOUNT
10.00 %

Medicaleshop Inc. 7.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Free shipping

Discount School Supply .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: N/A

NASCO .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

Really Good Stuff .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: n/a

ITEM NO. 7 - EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES, KAYE PRODUCTS, INC. (4600130-2013624)
AWARD NOTES: The tie bid is broken by awarding to the local vendor, National Seating & Mobility.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
National Seating & Mobility 10.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Palos Sport 10.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: See exclusions document for any exclusions

Discount School Supply .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: N/A

Medicaleshop Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: 0-5%, differs product wise. Shipping differs item wise, please call us at

866-563-6812 for details.

NASCO .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

Really Good Stuff .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: n/a

ITEM NO. 8 - EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES, LECKEY (4600130-2013625)
PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

National Seating & Mobility 10.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Medicaleshop Inc. 5.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Free Shipping

Discount School Supply .00 %

Note: * indicates a pending award. 5



CATEGORY NOTES:

N/A

NASCO .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
Really Good Stuff .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: n/a
ITEM NO. 9 - EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES, PACIFIC REHAB, INC. (4600130-2013627)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
National Seating & Mobility 10.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES:
Discount School Supply .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: N/A
Medicaleshop Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
NASCO .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
Really Good Stuff .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: n/a
ITEM NO. 10 - EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES, PRIME ENGINEERING (4600130-2012485)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
National Seating & Mobility 10.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES:
Medicaleshop Inc. 5.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Free Shipping
Discount School Supply .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: N/A
NASCO .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
Really Good Stuff .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: n/a
ITEM NO. 11 - EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES, R82, INC. (4600130-2013628)
AWARD NOTES: The tie bid is broken by awarding to the local vendor, National Seating & Mobility.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Medicaleshop Inc. 10.00 %

Note: * indicates a pending award.



CATEGORY NOTES:

Free Shipping

CATEGORY NOTES:

Free Shipping

National Seating & Mobility 10.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES:

Palos Sport 10.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: See exclusions document for any exclusions

Discount School Supply .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: N/A

NASCO .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

Really Good Stuff .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: n/a

ITEM NO. 12 - EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES, RIFTON EQUIPMENT (4600130-2012486)
AWARD NOTES: Reject Medicaleshop, Inc. - does not provide on-site service as required per bid specifications. Tie bid
is broken by awarding to the local vendor, National Seating & Mobility.
PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Medicaleshop Inc. 27.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Free Shipping

National Seating & Mobility 10.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES:

Palos Sport 10.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: See exclusions document for any exclusions

Discount School Supply .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: N/A

NASCO .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

Really Good Stuff .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: n/a

ITEM NO. 13 - EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES, SMIRTHWAITE (4600130-2014934)
AWARD NOTES: The tie bid is broken by awarding to the local vendor, National Seating & Mobility.
PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

National Seating & Mobility 10.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES:

Palos Sport 10.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: See exclusions document for any exclusions

Medicaleshop Inc. 5.00 %

Note: * indicates a pending award.



CATEGORY NOTES:

Discount School Supply .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: N/A
NASCO .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
Really Good Stuff .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: n/a
ITEM NO. 14 - EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES, SPECIAL TOMATO (4600130-2013629)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
National Seating & Mobility 10.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Discount School Supply .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: N/A

Medicaleshop Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Online Special Price, Call us for Quote at 866-563-6812

NASCO .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

Really Good Stuff .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: n/a

ITEM NO. 15 - EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES, THERADAPT PRODUCTS, INC. (4600130-2012487)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
National Seating & Mobility 10.00 %

Medicaleshop Inc. 7.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Free Shipping

Discount School Supply .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: N/A

NASCO .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

Really Good Stuff .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: n/a

Note: * indicates a pending award.



