

# THE KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

1055 EATON DRIVE, FORT WRIGHT, KENTUCKY 41017

TELEPHONE: (859) 344-8888 / FAX: (859) 344-1531 WEBSITE: www.kenton.kyschools.us

Dr. Henry Webb, Superintendent of Schools

#### KCSD ISSUE PAPER

DATE:

May 22, 2019

# **AGENDA ITEM (ACTION ITEM):**

Consider/Approve the recommendation to award Bob Sumerel Tire Company the Bus Tires Bid 2019-2020.

### **APPLICABLE BOARD POLICY:**

Fiscal Management 04.32 AP.1

#### **HISTORY/BACKGROUND:**

An advertisement was posted on April 9, 2019, to accept sealed bids for Bus Tires. Sealed bids were publicly opened and read on May 7, 2019. This is a single year award.

# FISCAL/BUDGETARY IMPACT:

Fiscal / Budgetary impact is unable to be calculated due to purchases being made on an as needed basis.

#### **RECOMMENDATION:**

Approval to accept the bid from Bob Sumerel Tire Company for the Bus Tires Bid 2019-2020 as indicated on the enclosed Bid Tabulation.

**CONTACT PERSON:** 

Cinda Roberts, Purchasing Agent

Principal

District Administrator

Superintendent

Use this form to submit your request to the Superintendent for items to be added to the Board Meeting Agenda.

Principal –complete, print, sign and send to your Director. Director –if approved, sign and put in the Superintendent's mailbox.

# THE KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION BUS TIRES BID 2018-2019

**BEST ONE TIRES BOB SUMEREL TIRE COMPANY GEM CITY TIRE NEW HIGHWAY TREAD NEW HIGHWAY TREAD** NEW HIGHWAY TREAD CONTINENTAL BRIDGESTONE CONTINENTAL BRIDGESTONE CONTINENTAL BRIDGESTONE RECAP TIRE RECAP TIRE RECAP TIRE **GENERAL** GOODYEAR FIRESTONE MICHELIN GOODYEAR GENERAL **FIRESTONE** MICHELIN GOODYEAR GENERAL FIRESTONE TIRE SIZE RANGE **HWY TREAD HWY TREAD** MICHELIN **HWY TREAD** 285/75R 24.5 (14 PLY) FS-FD663 125.00 N/A N/A N/A LT265 75R16 130.00 N/A 132.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A D 129.39 LT245 75R16 113.50 N/A 109.50 118.97 Ś N/A 118.00 LT235/85R16 Е N/A 115.36 116.85 N/A 265/75R22.5 295.00 79.00 268.00 78.50 295.00 G 90.00 275/80R22.5 XZE MICHELIN NO BID 87.50 NO BID 95.00 295/75R22.5 G399 OR FS591 OR BRIDGESTONE R280 Н 262.50 87.00 249.05 87.50 \$ 300.00 95.00 TYPE OF SERVICE RATE **EXCEPTIONS** RATE EXCEPTIONS **EXCEPTIONS** RATE RIM PAINTING (sand blast, primer coat, 24.00 price per rim price per rim 30.00 price per rim PRICE INCLUDES VALVE STEM baked on enamel paint) 8.25 x 22.5 ACCURIDE, two (2) hole new RECON BLACK POWDERCOATED WHEEL 109.00 108.00 115.00 rim-powder-coated black paint price per rim price per rim price per rim **AVAILABLE** 8.25 x 22.5 ACCURIDE, five (5) hole new 108.00 rim-powder-coated black paint 109 00 price per rim price per rim 115.00 price per rim \$80.00 WITH NEW VALVE STEM INSTALL NEW VALVE STEM (Myers 23-153) all rims determined to scrap due to N/C N/C price per rim price per rim price per rim condition will be returned to KCSD for SEE ABOVE REMOVAL OF SCRAP TIRES - scrap tire removal shall be done in compliance with all State and Federal / EPA Guidelines 7.00 price per tire 8.00 price per tire 5.50 price per tire MEDIUM TRUCK MOUNTING OF NEW TIRES - Commercial 5.00 8.00 flat rate 8.00 flat rate flat rate Bus MOUNTING OF NEW TIRES - Light Truck 8,00 flat rate 5.00 flat rate 6.00 flat rate MOUNTING OF RECAP TIRES - Commercial 5.00 8,00 flat rate flat rate 8.00 flat rate 8.00 5.00 6.00 MOUNTING OF RECAP TIRES - Light Truck flat rate flat rate flat rate DISMOUNTING OF TIRES - Commercial / 8.00 flat rate 5.00 flat rate 8.00 flat rate 8.00 flat rate 5.00 flat rate 6.00 flat rate DISMOUNTING OF TIRES - Light Truck NEW VALVE STEM (Myers 23-153 - part 3.95 3.95 per valve stem 4.00 per valve stem per valve stem only) ADDED COST OF TIRE MOUNTING WHEN N/C REPLACING NEW VALVE STEM 55,00 flat rate flat rate flat rate 74.95 price per hour 55.00 price per hour price per hour LABOR (for items not listed above)

STORE DISCOUNT

Recommendation:

The Kenton County Board of Education award the bid on a Complete Tire Program basis as indicated in highlighted cells