
Henderson County Schools

1805 Second Street

Henderson, KY  42420

Refuse Pick-up Tabulation Sheet

Bid # 10-21-5-12

COST FOR REFUSE PICKUP PER WEEK

SITE OF PICKUP Container

Size of 

Container

Regular 

Session 

Pickup 

Times

Summer & 

Intersessions 

Pickup Times

Cost For Regular  

Session Per Week        

(38 weeks)

Cost For Summer & 

Intersession Per Week 

(14 weeks)

Cost For Regular  

Session Per Week        

(38 weeks)

Cost For Summer & 

Intersession Per 

Week                        

(14 weeks)

Cost For Regular  

Session Per Week        

(38 weeks)

Cost For Summer & 

Intersession Per 

Week                        

(14 weeks)

Bend Gate Trash 2-6 YD 5/week 1/week

920 Bend Gate Road

Henderson

Cairo Elementary Trash 2-6 YD slant 5/week 1/week

10694 Hwy. 41-A

Henderson

Central Academy Trash 1-6 YD 5/week 1/week

851 Center Street

Henderson

Chandler Elementary Trash 2-6 YD 5/week 1/week

11215 U. S. 60 West

Corydon

East Heights Trash 2-6 YD 5/week 1/week

1176 Adams Lane

Henderson

Jefferson Elementary Trash 2-6 YD 5/week 1/week

315 Jackson Street

Henderson

Niagara Trash 2-6 YD 5/week 1/week

13043 Hwy. 136 East

Henderson

South Heights Elementary Trash 2-6 YD 5/week 3/week

1199 Madison

Henderson

South Middle School Trash 2-6 YD 5/week 2/week

800 South Alves Street

Henderson

Spottsville Elementary Trash
Enclosure fits 

12 YD total 5/week 1/week

9190 U.S. 60 East

Spottsville

No Bid No Bid

$175.62$878.12

$175.62

$175.62$878.12

$526.87$878.12

$351.25$878.12

$175.62$878.12

$175.62$878.12

$87.81$439.06

$175.62$878.12

$175.62

Advanced Disposal Services (Formerly 

Veolia Environmental Services)Republic Services

$878.12

$878.12

Madisonville Disposal



Henderson County Schools

1805 Second Street

Henderson, KY  42420

Refuse Pick-up Tabulation Sheet

Bid # 10-21-5-12

COST FOR REFUSE PICKUP PER WEEK

Advanced Disposal Services (Formerly 

Veolia Environmental Services)Republic Services Madisonville Disposal

North Middle School Trash 2-6 YD 5/week 2/week

1707 Second Street

Henderson

Henderson Co. High School Trash 3-6 YD & 1 YD 5/week 2/week

2424 Zion Road

Henderson

Henderson Co CTE 1-8 YD 5/week

2424 Zion Road

Stadium, HCHS Trash 1-8 YD 5/week 1/week

Zion Road

Board of Education & Support 

Services Trash 2-6 YD 1/week 1/week

1805 Second Street

Henderson

Buildings & Grounds Trash 1-6 YD 1/week 1/week

5704 Airline Road

Henderson

Bus Garage Trash 1-8 YD 1/week 1/week

5675 Airline Road

Henderson

Thelma B Johnson Early Learning 

Center Trash 1-8 YD 5/week 1/week

631 North Green Street

Henderson

TOTAL  WEEKLY $13,259.84 $3,922.23

Fuel Surcharge
N/A N/A

(Describe how calculated)

Henderson Co. Fee 3%
$397.80 $117.08

Total + fee + surcharge per month
$13,657.64 $1,039.90

No Bid No Bid

$87.81$87.81

$117.08$117.08

$117.08$585.42

$585.42

$175.62$878.12

$351.25$878.12

$761.04$1,902.61

$117.08$585.42

$175.62$175.62



Henderson County Schools

1805 Second Street

Henderson, KY  42420

Refuse Pick-up Tabulation Sheet

Bid # 10-21-5-12

COST FOR REFUSE PICKUP PER WEEK

Advanced Disposal Services (Formerly 

Veolia Environmental Services)Republic Services Madisonville Disposal

ANNUAL COST $116,089.94 $14,139.65

Price for a requested non-scheduled 

pickup
How many vehicles are available in 

your company fleet?
How many people do you have 

employed

Are your vehicles properly insured?
Are your employees properly 

insured?

 

Contact

Phone

Fax

E-Mail

115

Yes

Yes

75

812-598-0140

$80.00

Diana L . Trimborn
Address

dtrimborn@republicservices.com

2017 N. Fares Ave.

Evansville, IN 47711

mailto:dtrimborn@republicservices.com#

