
THE KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION 
1055 EATON DRIVE, FORT WRIGHT, KENTUCKY 41017 

TELEPHONE: (859) 344-8888 / FAX: (859) 344-1531 
WEBSITE: www.kenton.kyschools.us 

Dr. Henry Webb, Superintendent of Schools 

KCSD ISSUE PAPER 

DATE: 
01/23/19 

AGENDA ITEM (ACTION ITEM): 
Consider/ Approve awarding of the Lawn Mowing, Bush Hogging, and Weed Control Bid to A Cut 
Above, Alton's Trenching, Fender Groundskeepers, GrassCor, Merkle Lawn Care, NKY Lawn, and Tru 
Green as indicated on the Lawn Mowing, Bush Hogging, and Weed Control Bid Tabulation for the 
period of February 5, 2019 through December 31, 2019. 

APPLICABLE BOARD POLICY: 
Fiscal Management 04.32 AP.1 

HISTORY/BACKGROUND: 
An advertisement to accept sealed bids for Lawn Mowing, Bush Hogging, and Weed Control was posted 
on the district website on December 13, 2018. Bids were publicly opened on January 14, 2019 at 2:00 pm 
est. This bid has three optional mutually agreed upon annual renewals. 

FISCAL/BUDGETARY IMPACT: 
Prices are estimated to increase by 6.69% compared to prices paid in fiscal year 2017 and 2018. 

RECOMMENDATION: 
Approval to award the Lawn Mowing, Bush Hogging, and Weed Control Bid to A Cut Above, Alton's 
Trenching, Fender Groundskeepers, GrassCor, Merkle Lawn Care, NKY Lawn, and Tru Green as 
indicated on the Lawn Mowing, Bush Hogging, and Weed Control Bid Tabulation for the period of 
February 5, 2019 through December 31, 2019 with three optional mutually agreed upon annual renewals. 

CONTACT PERSON: 
0

B] i Q 
Principal ~ 
Use this form to submit your request to the Superintendent for items to be added to the Board Meetin genda. 
Principal -complete, print, sign and send to your Director. Director -if approved, sign and put in the 'Superintendent's mailbox. 

Kenton County Board of Education 
Board Members: Carl Wicklund, Chairperson Karen L. Collins, Vice Chairperson Carla Egan Shannon Herold Jesica Jehn 

"The Kenton County Board of Education provides Equal Education & Employment Opportunities." 



LOCATION 

OPTION #1 - MOWING INDIVIDUAL SITES 
Dixie Heights High 
Ft. Wright Elementary 
RC Hinsdale Elementary 
River Ridge Elementary School 
Turkey Foot Middle School/J.D. Patton Voc./J.A. Caywood Elem 
Beechgrove Elementary 
Piner Elementary School 
Simon Kenton High/Kenton Elementary Campus 
Summit View Elementary and Summit View Middle 
Twcnhofcl Middle School 
Ryland Heights Elementary 
Scott High/Woodland Middle 
Taylor Mill Elementary 
White's Tower Elementary 

Total/Mowin~ 

Annual Total (assumes 22 mowings) 

INDIVIDUAL SITES MOWING- EVALUATED 
Dixie Heights High - Mowing Price - Annual 
Dixie Heights High - Cost Score 
Dixie Heights High - Reference Score 
Dixie Heights High - Total Score 

Ft. Wright Elementary - Annual Mowing Price 
Ft. Wright Elementary - Cost Score 
Ft. Wright Elementary - Reference Score 
Ft. Wright Elementary - Total Score 

RC Hinsdale Elementary - Annual Mowing Price 
RC Hinsdale Elementary - Cost Score 
RC Hinsdale Elementary - Reference Score 
RC Hinsdale Elemental")" - Total Score 

River Ridge Elementary School - Annual Mowing Price 
River Ridge Elementary School - Cost Score 
River Ridge Elementary School - Reference Score 
River Ridge Elemental")· - Total Score 

Turkey Foot Middle/The Academies/J.A. Caywood Elem - Annual Mowing Price 
Turkey Foot MiddlefI'he Academies/I.A. Caywood Elem - Cost Score 
Turkey Foot Middlerrhe Academics/I.A. Caywood Elem - Reference Score 
Turkey Foot Middle/The Academies/J.A. Caywood Elem - Total Score 

Beechgrove Elementary - Annual Mowing Price 
Bcechgrovc Elementary - Cost Score 
Becchgrove Elementary - Reference Score 
Beechgrove Elemental")' - Total Score 

Piner Elementary School - Annual Mowing Price 
Piner Elementary School - Cost Score 
Piner Elementary School - Reference Score 
Piner Elemental")' School - Total Score 

Simon Kenton High/Kenton Elementary Campus ~ Annual Mowing Price 
Simon Kenton High/Kenton Elementary Campus - Cost Score 
Simon Kenton High/Kenton Elementary Campus - Reference Score 
Simon Kenton High/Kenton Elementary Campus - Total Score 

Summit View Elementary and Summit View Middle - Annual Mowing Price 
Summit View Elementary and Summit View Middle - Cost Score 
Summit View Elementary and Summit View Middle - Reference Score 
Summit View Elementary and Summit View Middle - Total Score 

A&A 
Lawncare 

650.00 
160.00 
356,25 

335.00 
800.00 
265.00 
170.00 

1,220.00 
930.00 

l.387,50 
300.00 
875.00 
250.00 

14,300.00 
51.00 

9.00 

3,520.00 
50.27 

9.00 
59.27 

7,837.50 
88.65 

9.00 
97,65 

7,370.00 
-8.44 
9.00 
0.56 

17,600.00 
20.00 

9.00 
29.00 

5,830.00 
69.07 

9.00 
78.07 

3.740.00 
80.87 

9.00 
89.87 

26.840.00 
47.39 

9.00 
56.39 

20,460.00 
53.18 

9.00 
62.18 

THE KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
LAWN MOWING, BUSH HOGGING, AND WEED CONTROL BID TABULATION 

Fender 
A Cut Above Alton's Trenchin; Central Lawn Greenskeepers GrassCor 

453.50 No Bid No Bid 520.00 468.00 
150.75 No Bid No Bid 160.00 143.00 
385.75 No Bid No Bid 425.00 358.00 
265.25 No Bid No Bid 160.00 289.00 
600.75 No Bid No Bid 450.00 603.00 
280.50 No Bid No Bid 215.00 235.00 
200.25 No Bid No Bid 163.00 172.00 

1,056.75 No Bid No Bid 1,300.00 828.00 
757.25 No Bid No Bid 850.00 660.00 

1,375.75 No Bid No Bid 1,237.00 1,350.00 
280.50 NoBid No Bid 275.00 224.00 
900.00 No Bid No Bid 950.00 844.00 
220.50 No Bid No Bid 170.00 229.00 
220.50 No Bid No Bid 250.00 

9.977.00 I 1.440.00 10.296.00 
90.00 76.80 87.12 
10.00 10.00 9.00 ., " 

3,316.50 3,520.00 3,146.00 

57.77 50.27 64.05 
10.00 10.00 9.00 
67.77 60.27 73.05 

8.486.50 9,350.00 7.876.00 
81.09 71.03 88.21 
10.00 10.00 9.00 
91.09 81.03 97.21 

5,835.50 3,520.00 6,358.00 
30.80 90.00 17.44 
10.00 10.00 9.00 
40.80 100.00 26.44 

13,216.50 9,900.00 13,266.00 

59.85 90,00 59.40 
10.00 10.00 9,00 

69.85 100.00 68.40 

6,171.00 4,730.00 5.170,00 
62.58 90,00 81.63 
10.00 10.00 9.00 
72.58 100.00 90.63 

4,405.50 3,586.00 3,784.00 

63.23 84.95 79.70 

10.00 10.00 9.00 
73.23 94.95 88.70 

23,248.50 28,600.00 18,216.00 

65.14 38.70 90.00 

10.00 10.00 9.00 

75.14 48.70 99.00 

16.659.50 18,700.00 14,520.00 

76.74 64,09 90.00 

10.00 10.00 9.00 

86.74 74.09 99.00 

Pagelof4 

fl Kenning Lawn Merkle Lawn fl - Nature's Touch NKYLawn fl - Neltner Lawn Tru Green 

525.00 495.00 635.00 623.84 
142,00 270.00 165.00 111.00 
362.00 435.00 385.00 351.00 

305.00 645.00 325.00 275.25 
625.50 615.00 695.00 605.00 
240.00 245.00 475,00 225.75 

345.00 345.00 154.34 
1.045.00 1,305.00 1,072.00 

725,00 I.I 15.00 790,00 852.00 
1,250.00 1,450.00 1,362.70 

265.00 275.00 220.84 
895.00 1,145.00 858.00 

245.25 245.00 250.00 
245.25 345.00 285.00 

ll.550.00 10.890.00 13.970.00 13,724.48 
75.81 81.76 53.98 56.19 
10.00 9.75 9.50 ... , ... , .,.. 

3,124.00 5,940.00 3,630.00 2,442.00 
64,86 -38.92 46.22 90.00 
10.00 9.75 9.50 
74.86 -29.17 46.22 99.50 

7,964.00 9.570.00 8.470.00 7,722.00 
87.18 68.46 81.28 90.00 

10.00 9.75 9.50 
97.18 78.21 81.28 99.50 

6.710,00 14.190.00 7,150.00 6,055.50 
8.44 -182.81 -2.81 25.17 

10.00 9.75 9.50 
18.44 -173.06 -2.81 34.67 

13,761.00 13,530.00 15,290.00 13,310.00 
54.90 57.00 41.00 59.00 

10.00 9.75 9.50 
64.90 66.75 41.00 68.50 

5,280.00 5.390.00 10,450.00 4,966.50 
79,53 77.44 -18,84 85.50 
10,00 9.75 9.50 
89.53 87.19 -18.84 95.00 

7,590.00 7.590.00 3,395.48 

-21.18 -21.18 90.00 

9.75 9.50 
-11.43 -21.18 99.50 

22.990,00 28,710.00 23,584.00 

66.41 38,15 63.48 

9.75 9,50 

76.16 38.15 72.98 

15.950.00 24.530.00 17.380.00 18,744.00 

81.14 27.95 72.27 63.82 

10.00 9.75 9.50 
91.14 37.70 72.27 73.32 



THE KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
LAWN MOWING, BUSH HOGGING, AND WEED CONTROL BID TABULATION 

A&A Fender 
LOCATION Lawncare A Cut Above Alton's Trenchin° Central Lawn Greenskeeners GrassCor * Kenninv Lawn Merkle Lawn * -Nature's Touch NKYLawn * - Neltner Lawn Tru Green 

Twenhofel Middle School - Annual Mowing Price 30,525.00 30,266.50 27.214.00 29.700.00 27,500.00 31.900.00 29,979A0 
Twenhofel Middle School - Cost Score 79.05 79.91 90,00 81.78 89.05 74.50 80.85 

Twenhofel Middle School - Reference Score 9.00 10.00 10.00 9.00 9.75 9.50 

Twenhofel Middle School - Total Score 88.05 89.91 100.00 90.78 98.80 74.50 90.35 

Ryland Heights Elementary - Annual Mowing Price 6,600.00 6,171.00 6.050.00 .J,928.00 5,830.00 6.050,00 4.858.48 

Ryland Heights Elementary - Cost Score 57.74 65.69 67.93 9.00 72.00 67.93 90.00 

Ryland Heights Elementary - Reference Score 9.00 10.00 10.00 9.75 9.50 
Ryland Heights Elementary - Total Score 66.74 75.69 77.93 9.00 81.75 67.93 99.50 

Scott High/Woodland Middle - Annual Mowing Price 19,250.00 19.800.00 20.900.00 18,568.00 19.690.00 25,190.00 18.876,00 

Scott High/Woodland Middle - Cost Score 86.69 84.03 78,70 90,00 84.56 57.90 88,51 

Scott High/Woodland Middle - Reference Score 9,00 10.00 10.00 9.00 9.75 9.50 
Scott High/Woodland Middle- Total Score 95.69 94.03 88.70 99.00 94.31 57.90 98.01 

Taylor Mill Elementary - Annual Mowing Price 5,500.00 4.851.00 3,740.00 5.Q38.00 5,395.50 5.390,00 5.500.00 4.733.52 

Taylor Mill Elementary - Cost Score 47.65 63.26 90.00 58.76 50.16 50.29 47.65 66.09 

Taylor Mill Elementary - Reference Score 9,00 I0.00 10.00 9.00 10.00 9,75 9.50 

Taylor Mill Elementary - Total Score 56.65 73.26 100.00 67.76 60.16 60.04 47.65 75.59 

White's Tower Elementary - Annual Mowing Price 5,500.00 4,851.00 5.500.00 5,236.00 5,395.50 7,590.00 6.270.00 5,060.00 

White's Tower Elementary - Cost Score 77.96 90.00 77.96 82.86 79.90 39.18 63,67 86.12 

White's Tower Elementary - Reference Score 9.00 10.00 10.00 9.00 10.00 9.75 9.50 

White's Tower Elementary - Total Score 86.96 100.00 87.96 91.86 89.90 48.93 63.67 95.62 

OPTION #2 - GROUP PRICES 
Group #1 
Dixie Heights High 650.00 453.50 No Bid No Bid 520.00 468.00 735.00 495,00 625.00 223.84 

Ft. Wright Elementary 160.00 150.75 No Bid No Bid 160.00 143.00 142.00 270.00 155.00 111.00 

RC Hinsdale Elementary 356,25 385.75 No Bid No Bid 425,00 358.00 362.00 435.00 375,00 351.00 

River Ridge Elementary School 335,00 265.25 No Bid NoBid 160.00 289.00 305.00 645.00 315,00 275.25 
Turkey Foot Middle SchooUJ.D. Patton Voc./J.A. Caywood Elem 800.00 600.75 No Bid No Bid 450.00 603.00 850.50 615,00 685.00 605.34 

Total 2J01.25 11856.00 No Bid No Bid 11715.00 11861.00 2.394.50 2,460.00 21155.00 1~66.43 

Group #2 
Bcechgrove Elementary 265.00 280.50 No Bid No Bid 215.00 235.00 245.00 465.00 225.75 

Piner Elementary School 170.00 200.25 No Bid No Bid 163.00 172.00 345,00 335.00 154.34 

Simon Kenton High/Kenton Elementary Campus 1.220.00 1,056.75 No Bid No Bid l.300,00 828,00 1.045.00 1,295.00 1.072.00 

Summit View Elementary and Summit Vie-w Middle 930.00 757.25 No Bid No Bid 850,00 660,00 115.00 780,00 852.00 

Twenhofel Middle School 1.387.50 1,375.75 No Bid No Bid 1.237.00 1,350.00 1.250.00 1.440.00 1.362.70 
Total 3 972.50 3 670.50 No Bid No Bid 3 765.00 3 245.00 3 000.00 4 315.00 3 666.79 

Group #3 
Ryland Heights Elementary 300.00 280.50 No Bid No Bid 275.00 224.00 265,00 265.00 220,84 

Scott High/Woodland Middle 875.00 900.00 No Bid No Bid 950.00 844.00 895.00 1.135.00 858,00 

Taylor Mill Elementary 250.00 220.50 No Bid No Bid 170.00 229.00 245.00 240.00 215.16 

White's Tower Elementary 250.00 220.50 No Bid No Bid 250.00 238.00 345.00 285.00 230.00 
Total l 675.00 1621.50 No Bid No Bid I 645.00 l 535.00 l 750.00 l 925.00 l 524.00 
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LOCATION 

OPTION #3 - BUSH HOGGING 
Group #I 
RC Hinsdale Elementmy 

Group #2 

Sub-Total 

Simon Kenton High/Kenton Elementary Campus 
Summit View Elementary and Summit View Middle 

GROUP#3 
Ryland Heights Elementary 
Scott High/Woodland Middle 
White's Tower Elementary 

Sub-Total 

Total Annual Bush Hogging 

Bush Hogging Cost Score 
Bush Hog~ne Reference Score 

Bush Hogging Total Score 

OPTION #4 - ADDS/DEDUCTS 
Dixie Heights High School - Baseball Field: 
Dixie Heights High School - Softball Field: 
Turkey Foot Middle School - Multi-Sport Field 
Scott High School - Baseball Field: 
Scott High School - Softball Field: 
Scott High School - Soccer Field: 
Simon Kenton High School - Baseball Field: 
Simon Kenton High School - Multi-Purpose Field: 
Simon Kenton High School - Softball/Soccer Field: 
Summit View Campus - Multipurpose 
Twenhofel Middle School - Football Field 

Sub-Total 

Stripe: 
Summit View Campus - Multipurpose 
Twenhofel Middle School - Football Field 
Dixie Heights High School - Softball Field: 
Dixie Heights High School - Baseball Field: 
Scott High School - Baseball Field: 
Scott High School - Softball Field: 
Scott High School - Soccer Field; 
Simon Kenton High School - Baseball Field: 
Simon Kenton High School - Multi-Purpose Field: 
Simon Kenton High School - Softball/Soccer Field: 

OPTION #5 - WEED CONTROL 
Dixie Heights High 
Ft. Wright Elementary 
RC Hinsdale Elementary 
River Ridge Elementary School 

Sub-Total 

Turkey Foot Middle School/J.D. Patton Voc./J.A. Caywood Elem 

Beechgrove Elementary 
Piner Elementary School 
Simon Kenton High/Kenton Elementary Campus 
Summit View Elementary and Summit View Middle 
Twenhofel Middle School 
Ryland Heights Elementary 
Scott High/Woodland Middle 
Taylor Mill Elementary 
White's Tower Elementary 

Sub-Total 

3 Times Per Year (Annual) 

Weed Control Cost Score 
Weed Control Reference Score 

Weed Control Total Score 

A&A 
Lawncare 

630,00 
630.00 

380.00 
285.00 
665.00 

125.00 
475.00 
330.00 
930.00 

6,675.00 

27.95 
9.00 

36.95 

100.00 
100,00 
200.00 
100.00 
100.00 
200.00 
100.00 
200.00 
200,00 
200.00 
200.00 

1,700.00 

250.00 
250.00 
100,00 
150,00 
150.00 
100,00 
250.00 
150.00 
250.00 
100.00 

1,750.00 

No Bid 
NoBid 
NoBid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
NoBid 
No Bid 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

No Bid 

THE KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
LAWN MOWING, BUSH HOGGING, AND WEED CONTROL BID TABULATION 

A Cut Above Alton's Trenching Central Lawn 

No Bid 340.00 No Bid 
No Bid 340.00 No Bid 

NoBid 255,00 No Bid 
NoBid 127.00 No Bid 
No Bid 382.00 No Bid 

NoBid 170,00 No Bid 
NoBid 255.00 No Bid 
No Bid 170.00 No Bid 
No Bid 595.00 No Bid 

3,951.00 

90.00 
9.67 

99.67 

100.00 No Bid No Bid 
100.00 No Bid No Bid 
220.00 No Bid No Bid 
100,00 NoBid No Bid 
100.00 No Bid No Bid 
220.00 No Bid No Bid 
120.00 No Bid No Bid 
275.00 No Bid No Bid 
100.00 No Bid No Bid 
175.00 NoBid No Bid 
220.00 No Bid No Bid 

1,730.00 No Bid No Bid 

320.00 No Bid No Bid 
320.00 NoBid No Bid 
320,00 No Bid No Bid 
320,00 No Bid No Bid 
320.00 No Bid No Bid 
320.00 No Bid No Bid 
320.00 No Bid No Bid 
320.00 No Bid No Bid 
320.00 No Bid No Bid 
320.00 No Bid No Bid 

3,200.00 No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 298.80 
No Bid No Bid 68.40 
No Bid No Bid 244.80 
No Bid No Bid 322.20 
No Bid NoBid 343.80 
No Bid No Bid 112.50 
No Bid No Bid 82.80 
No Bid No Bid 320.40 
No Bid No Bid 655.20 
No Bid No Bid 1.146.60 
No Bid No Bid 149.40 
No Bid NoBid 292,50 
No Bid No Bid 163.80 
No Bid No Bid 217,80 
No Bid No Bid 4,419.00 

No Bid No Bid 13 257.00 

69.22 

69.22 
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Fender 
Greenskeepers 

850,00 
850.00 

425.00 
560,00 
985.00 

220.00 
320.00 
390,00 
930,00 

8,295.00 

-8.95 
10.00 
1.05 

117,00 
115.00 
115.00 
115.00 
115.00 
225.00 
115,00 
275,00 
115.00 
185.00 
225.00 

1,717.00 

325,00 
325.00 
325.00 
325.00 
325.00 
325,00 
325.00 
325,00 
325.00 
325.00 

3,250.00 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
NoBid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

No Bid 

GrassCor 

No Bid 
No Bid 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

100.00 
100,00 
220.00 
100.00 
100.00 
220.00 
100,00 
250.00 
150,00 
180.00 
220.00 

1,740.00 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

No Bid 

* Kenning Lawn Merkle Lawn * - Nature's Touch NKY Lawn 1r - Neltner Lawn Tru Green 

675.00 445,00 555.00 651.00 
675.00 445.00 555.00 651.00 

No Bid 445.00 395.00 150.00 
516.00 395.00 285.00 376.34 

NIA 840.00 680.00 526.34 

235.00 295.00 125.00 
335.00 480.00 446.25 

375.00 235,00 395,00 475,00 
NIA 805.00 1.170.00 1,046.25 

6 270.00 7,215.00 6 670.77 

37.18 15.65 28.05 
9.75 0.00 9.50 

46.93 15.65 37.55 

105.00 50.00 250.00 90.00 
105.00 50.00 225.00 90.00 
225.00 60.00 225.00 200.00 

50,00 225.00 90,00 

40.00 225.00 90.00 
50.00 250.00 200.00 
50,00 225.00 90.00 
50,00 250.00 250.00 
40.00 225.00 90.00 

220.00 60.00 225,00 175,00 
50.00 225.00 215,00 

NIA 550.00 2,550.00 1,580.00 

220.00 80,00 275.00 300.00 
80.00 275.00 300.00 

105,00 70.00 295,00 300,00 

105.00 70,00 295,00 300.00 
70.00 295.00 300,00 

70.00 295.00 300.00 
70.00 295.00 300.00 
70.00 295.00 300.00 
70,00 295.00 300.00 
70,00 295.00 300.00 

NIA 720.00 2,910.00 3,000.00 

346.50 363.00 580.00 711.45 575,00 190,00 
46.00 145.00 185.00 75.76 200.00 70,00 

155.00 290,00 225.00 165.20 200.00 115.00 
214.50 435,00 390,00 278.11 425.00 250.00 
577,50 575.00 440,00 365,00 525.00 250,00 

145.00 290.00 235,00 125.67 275,00 125.00 
290.00 285.00 58.67 225.00 55.00 
609,00 370.00 329.31 575.00 280,00 

676.50 708,00 815.00 756.62 525.00 250,00 

987.00 1,575.00 235,00 575.00 1,100.00 

319.00 185.00 112.49 175.00 80,00 
653,00 470.00 310,85 475,00 600,00 

135.00 218.00 185,00 135.90 250,00 75,00 
264.00 218.00 230.00 195.26 300.00 150.00 

NIA 6.100.00 6,170.00 3,855.29 5.300.00 3,590.00 

NIA 18 300.00 18,510.00 11.565.87 15.900.00 10,770.00 

27.08 25.32 83.35 47.13 90.00 
9.75 9.50 10.00 

36.83 25.32 92.85 47.13 100.00 



LOCATION 

OPTION #6 - Monthly Round-Up Applications 
Dixie Heights High 
Ft. Wright Elementary 
RC Hinsdale Elementary 
River Ridge Elementary School 
Turkeyfoot Middle School/J.D. Patton Voc/J.A. Caywood Elem 
Beechgrove Elementary 
Piner Elementary School 
Simon Kenton High/Kenton Elementary Campus 
Summit View Elementary and Summit View Middle 
Twenhofel Middle School 
Ryland Heights Elementary 
Scott High/Woodland Middle 
Taylor Mill Elementary 
White's Tower Elementary 

Sub-Total 

7 Times Per Year (Annual) 

Round Up Control Cost Score 
Round Up Control Reference Score 

Round Up Control Total Score 

ADDITIONAL LABOR RATES (Rates per Hour & Weij:!ht as noted) 
Hourly Rate Lawn Weed Control Treatment 
Weed Treatment per gallon 
Hourly Rates for Round-up Treatments 
Material Rate for Round up Treatment per gallon 

OPTION# Additional Labor Rates 
Crew Member 
Supervisor 
Operator 
Laborer 

A&A 
Lawncare 

No Bid 
NoBid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

No Bid 

45.00 
1.20 

50.00 
2.50 

45.00 
50.00 

Recommended as the best evaluated bid - '-------' 

THE KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
LAWN MOWING, BUSH HOGGING, AND WEED CONTROL BID TABULATION 

Fender 
A Cut Above Alton's Trenching Central Lawn Grecnskeepers GrassCor 

No Bid No Bid 600.00 No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 150.00 No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 200.00 No Bid NoBid 

No Bid No Bid 400.00 No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 600.00 No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 300.00 No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 150.00 No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 600.00 No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 500.00 No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 1,000.00 No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 150.00 No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 500.00 No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 150.00 No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 250.00 No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 5.550.00 No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 38 850.00 No Bid No Bid 

-22.23 

-22.23 

45.00 
5.00 

45.00 
5.00 

35.00 30,00 

50.00 
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* Kenning Lawn Merkle Lawn * - Nature's Touch NKYLawu * - Neltner Lawn Tru Green 

155,00 495,00 480.00 
95.00 175.00 100.00 

155,00 175.00 150,00 

115.00 150.00 250,00 

249.00 390.00 480,00 

115.00 150.00 100,00 

189.00 150.00 100.00 
285.00 490.00 450.00 
265.00 325.00 385.00 
297.00 495.00 450,00 

95.00 150.00 100,00 
265.00 495.00 400,00 

95.00 150.00 100.00 
95.00 150.00 150.00 

2,470.00 3.940.00 3 695.00 

17.,290.00 27,580.00 25.865.00 

90.00 36.44 45.36 
9.75 9.50 10.00 

99.75 45.94 55.36 

35.00 85.00 185/acre 65.00 35.00 
IO.OD 0.50 included 7.00 3,00 

35.00 85,00 65.00 75.00 35.00 
IO.DO 0,60 included 11.00 3.00 

35.00 
40,00 

85.00 
45.00 45.00 


