Henderson Caunfy Sehools

1805 Second Street, Henderson, Kentucky 42420
(270) 831-5000 Fax: (270) 831-5009
www.henderson.kyschools.us

To: Bob Lawson, Superintendent
And School Board Members

From: Cindy Cloutier W
Director of Finance

Date: July 19, 2021

Re: Bid Recommendations

Bid Recommendations:

Fleet Vehicles 8-21-5-7

Invitations were sent to Bob Hook Chevrolet, Fly Ace Aviation, Gillie Hyde Ford, and Town &
Country Ford. Bids were received from Gillie Hyde Ford, and Town & Country Ford. We
recommend you award the bid to Gillie Hyde Ford for two Ford F-250 trucks and Town & Country
Ford for one F-250 truck. We also recommend the purchase of a dump truck from Gillie Hyde
Ford. We will not be recommending the purchase of any SUV’s at this time.

Equal Educational and Employment Institution



2 - 2021 Regular Cab 4X4 Truck 3/4 Ton 142" Wheelbase

Henderson County Board of Education
1805 Second Street
Hendeson, KY 42420

Fleet Vehicles
Bid # 8-21-5-7

Tabulation Sheet

Meet
‘61 Fly Ace Gillie Hyde Town &
S f Bob H " .
General Vehicle Specifications zzzlsl;:a ah Habk Chavidlet Aviation Ford Country Ford
6-Speed automatic transmission v v
8' Bed v v
6.2 V8 gas engine v v
XL Trim v v
Power Steering Vi v
Power locks v v
Cruise control vl v
Air conditioning 2 v
Trailer tow package i ;
Limited axel : ;
Rubber Floors No Bid No Bid v v
Anti-lock brakes 7 7
AM/FM stereo ¥ v
Vinyl seats v v
Cab steps v v
Rear-view Camera v v
Knapheide 8" Service body with flip top il e
|Spray-in bed liner v v
TOMMY GATE w/1600# capacity 7 v
Exterior color - White v Vi
Model of Vehicle Bid Ford F250 (2022) F-250
Trim Level of Vehicle Bid XLNH\im 'G(IIA
Rated MPG: City : :
Rated MPG. Highway No Bid No Bid N/A N/A
Warrantv: Basic Yes - included in
Y 36 mo/36K BtB specs.
Delivery Time from Date of Order 30+ Weeks 130 -160 days
Bid Pricing
Description Price
; $40,835.00
WESRP Fiice 3 (truck only) |  $41,105.00
i included in  [$13,275.00 (bed
Dealer Installed Options - 5 B MSRP & lift gate)
Other Up-fit Included
Less: Discount $867.00 $13,830.00
Net Bid Price (must include all costs) $ $39,959.00 ea | $40,550.00 ea.




2 - NEW 2 Ton-4 Door SUV 4x4 Third row Seating

Meet

: Fly Ace Gillie Hyde Town &
General Vehicle Specifications s'aiz‘:"i',; at| Bob Hook Chevrolet Aviation Ford Country Ford
6-Speed automatic transmission v v
; ; 3.5L Ecoboost
5.0 V8 gas engine(ar equivalent) Excaption V6
|Hands Free Talking v v
Power Steering v v
Power locks and windows . _ v v
Cruise control No Bid No Bid 7 7
Air conditioning v v
Trailer tow package(with Trailer Brakes) v v
Anti-lock brakes v v
AM/FM/CD stereo v v
Rear-view Camera v v
Exterior color - White v v
Model ; ,
auel or vehiste: Bid Ford Expedition| Expedition Max
Trim Level of Vehicle Bid XL Trim XL 101 A Pkg |
Rated MPG: City . ; 16 18 mpg
Rated MPG: Highway N Bid No Bid 57 3T mpg
. : Yes - included in
yharrary; Besis 36mo/36K BtB specs
Delivery Time from Date of Order 18 weeks 90 -120 days
Bid Pricing
Description Price
MSRP Price $ $57,370.00 $58,980.00
Dealer Installed Options
Other . :
Less: Discount No Bid No Bid $14,044.00 $14,710.00
Net Bid Price (must include all costs) $
$43,326.00 ea| $44,270.00 ea.




NEW REGULAR CAB 4X4 1 TON DUALLY 142 WHEELBASE

Meet

Fly Ace Gillie Hyde Town &
General Vehicle Specifications s':;eozi:; st} Boh Honk Chevralet Aviation Ford Country Ford
6-Speed automatic transmission o Y
6.0 V8 gas engine(or equivalent) % 6.2 Liter V-8 gas |
Hands Free Talking v v
Power Steering v v
Power locks and windows & v
Cruise control v v
Air conditioning No Bid No Bid v v
Trailer tow package(with Trailer Brakes) v v
Anti-lock brakes v v
AM/FM/CD stereo 7 v
|Rear-view Camera % v
Exterior color - White v v
Kanpheide Drop Side Dump Bed 9ft 12in drop v v
Snow Plow 8 Y2 Ft Pro-Plus v v
Model of Vehicle Bid Ford F350 CC F-350
Trim Level of Vehicle Bid XL Trim XL
Rated MPG: City N/A Not rated
Rated MPG: Highway No Bid No Bid N/A th rated _
Warranty: Basic Yes - included in
36mo/36K BiB specs
Delivery Time from Date of Order 30+ Weeks | 120 - 160 days
Bid Pricing
Description Price
. $43,965.00
MSRP Price B {truck only) $44,675.00
$18,300.00
Dealer Installed Options No Bid No Bid $19,_602.00 Up{ dump bed &
fit included plow
Other
Less: Discount $14,053.00 $12,545.00
Net Bid Price (must include all costs $ $48,514.00 $50,430.00
Contact Info: Roger Hoon Zach Baugh | Rick Ausbrook [Terry Hendricks
Address 4144 Bardstown Rd. [1590 Altorac Way| 610 Happy Valley Rd.|7720 E. Division St
Louisville, KY 40218 |Lexington, KY 40509|Glasgow, KY 42141|Evansville, IN 47715
Phone 502-499-0800 317-412-4797 | 270-791-7953 |812-401-1160
Fax 502-657-3352 270-842-4057 |812-401-1162
zachbaugh321@y [rick.fleet.sales@o |hendrickstcford.
Email rhoon@bobhook.net ahoo.com utlook.com aol.com




“Henderson County Schools

1805 Second Street, Henderson, Kentucky 42420 _
(270) 831-5000 Fax: (270) 831-5009
www.henderson . kyschools.us '

fi®vo

J.uly 192021

To: Hendersqn County Board of Education

Frdm: Wes Alexander, Direct.or of Transportation
RE: Request to purchase new maintenance vehicles

| am requesting that the board approve the purchase of three(3) 2021 4X4 %4
ton trucks & one(1) 2021 regular cab 4X4 dually with a drop side dump bed.
- Two(2) % ton trucks will be purchased from Gillie Hyde Ford at a price of
$39,959.00 and one(1) % ton truck from Town and Country Ford at a price of
$40,550.00. The 1 ton dually dump truck will be purchased from Gillie Hyde
Ford at a price of $48,514.00. These vehicles will be used to insure prompt,
safe, and high quality service to the district schools and offices to ensure
student safety.

Thank you for your consideration of this request.

Respectfully,

K . g

Wes Alexander _
Director of Transportation

/ﬁ =S

I!IJI[ILN AEEFFER GRAEU&TE .

The mission of Henderson Counly Schools is to provide extraardinary
educational opportunities for every student:

Equal Educational and Employment Institidion



2 2021 Regular Cab 4X4 Truck 3/4 Ton 142" Wheelbase

Henderson County Board of Education
1805 Second Street

__Hendeson, KY 42420

Fleet Vehicles
Bid # 8-21.5.7 -
Tabulation Sheet

Meet . : ‘
, o Fly Ace - Gillie Hyde Town &
: kC
General Vehicle Specifications Szzt:::a Bob.Hoo heyrolet . Aviation Ford Country Ford
5-Speed automalic fransmission v v
3' Bed v v
6.2 V8 gas engine v v
XL Trim v v
Power Steering v v
Power locks v v
Cruise control v 7
Alr conditioning v v
Trailer tow package :; v
Limited axel . . v
Rubber Floors No Bid No Bid v v
Anti-lock brakes vy 7
AM/FM stereo v v
Vinyl seats: v v
Cab steps v v
Rear-view Camera v v
Knapheide 8" Service body with flip top v v
Spray-in bed liner v v
TOMMY GATE wi1600# capacity v v
Exterior color - White ___ v 7
Moaodel of Vehicle Bid Ford F250 (2022) F-250
Trim Level of Vehicle Bid XL Trim XL
Rated MPG: City . . N/A N/A
Rated MPG: Highway No Bid No Bid N/A N/A
) . Yes - included in
Warranty: Basic 36 mo/36K BtB|  specs.
Del:verv Tlme from Date of Order 30+ Weeks 130 -160 days
Descrlptlon A L P L L B ] g
‘ . $40,835.00
MSRP Price ' :
{truck only) $41,105.00
Dealer Installed Options ' Included in $13’2.75'00 (bed
No Bid No Bid MSRP & lift gate)
- . [Other Up-fit Included .
Less: Discount $867.00 $13,830.00
Net Bid Price (must include all costs) $39.959.00 ea | $40.550.00 éa.




' NEW REGULAR GAB 4X4 -1 TON DUALLY 142 WHEELBASE - - 117

"Town &

Delivery Time from Date of Order

. Fly Ace = | Gillie Hyde . .
- General Vehicle Specifications - Bob Hook Chevrolet | ., iotion | Ford - . | CountryFord |
8-Speed automatic transmission y A
6.0 V8 gas engine(or eguivalent) v 6.2 Liter V-8 gas |
|Hands Free Talking v v
Power Steering v v
Power locks and windows _ v v
Cruise control : ' _ v v
Air conditioning "No Bid No Bid v v
Trailer tow packaqe(WIth Tra:ler Brakes) . v v
Anti-lock brakes v v
AM/FM/CD stered 4 v
Rear-view Camera 4 v
i |Exterior color - White - v v
" |Kanpheide Drop Side Dump Bed 9t 12|n drop [ v v
Snow Plow 8 2 Fi Pro-Plus v v
.. IModet of Vehicle Bid Ford F350 CC F-350 -
* ITrim Level of Vehicle Bid XL Trim XL
Rated MPG: City N/A Not rated
Rated MPG: Highway 'No Bid No Bid N/A Not rated .
Warranty: Basic - Yes -included in) .
) 36mo/36K BtB specs '
30+ Weeks

120 - 160 days

Bld Pricmg
Descrlptlon B ey S
: $43,965.00 | . S
MSRP Price {truck only) | $44.675.00
_ : $18,300.00
Dealer Installed Options No Bid No Bid $19,602.00Upy dump bed &
‘ - fit included plow
" 1Other ' : ; .
Less: Discount $14,053,00 $12,545.00

Net Bid Price (must include all costs

Contact Info:

Roger Hoon

Zach Baugh

$48,514.00

Rick Ausbrook

$50,430.00°

Terry Hendricks

Address

| 4144 Bardstown Rd.

1580 Altorac Way

810 Happy Valley Rd.

7720 E. Division St

Louisville, KY 40218

Lexington, KY 40509

Glasgow, KY 42141

Evansville, IN 47715

Phone \

502-499-0800

317-412-4797

270-851-2125

812-401-1160

Fax -

270-842-4057

812-401-1162

'Email

- |502-657-3352

& rhooh@hbobhook.net

zachbaughl32l@y

rick.fleet.sales@o

ahoo.com

uticak.com

hendrickstcford.
aol.com




