
Issue Paper 
Kenton County School District I It's a6outJU,£ lijas. 

DATE: 
May 28, 2021 

AGENDA ITEM (ACTION ITEM): 
Consider/ Approve awarding the Photography and Yearbook RFP as indicated on the attached 
tabulation, for the period of August 1, 2021, through July 31, 2022, with three (3) optional 
mutually agreed upon contract extensions. 

APPLICABLE BOARD POLICY: 
Fiscal Management 04.32 AP.I 

HISTORY/BACKGROUND: 
An advertisement was posted to the KCSD website on May 5, 2021, to accept sealed bids for 
Photography and Yearbook services. Sealed bids were publicly opened and read via a Google 
Meets meeting on May 19, 2021, at 2:00 PM. 

FISCAL/BUDGETARY IMPACT: 
None 

RECOMMENDATION: 
Approval to award the Photography and Yearbook RFP as indicated on the attached tabulation, 
for the period of August 1, 2021, through July 31, 2022, with three (3) optional mutually agreed 
upon contract extensions. 

CONTACT PERSON: 
Cinda Roberts, Purchasing Agent 

ti' a4,A2~ 
Principal/Administrator Superintendent 

Use this form to submit your request to the Superintendent for items to be added to the Board Meeting Agenda. 
Principal -complete, print, sign and send to your Director. Director -if approved, sign and put in the Superintendent's mailbox. 



TOTAL 
POSSIBLE 

POINTS 

-

L 

PRICING 

45.00 

KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION 

PHOTOGRAPHY AND YEARBOOKS 2021-2022 RFP 

OPTION1-PHOTOGRAPHY 

PERCEIVED 
QUALITY OF 

SERVICE 

25.00 

PERCIEVED 
QUALITY OF 

PRODUCT 

20.00 

REFERENCES TOTAL SCORE 

10 100 

JOSTENS ...................... t.~l!A~ ........................................... 1..7.J.?................................ 17.50 . N/A** . 35.25 
LIFETOUCH O.OO·······················'· 11.75 , 7.50 ! 3.67 i 22.92 
STRAWBRIDGE ........... 45·:oo ··· ········ ·······2·1··:2s····················1······ ········ ·· ··1·"s"_·60····· ········· ···r ·····················1:·5··········--············ :··· ······· ······ ···~ 

*JOSTENS DID NOT BID OPTIONS B THROUGH E. JOSTENS PHOTOGRAPHY PRICING WAS NOT EVALUATED. 

U:SL~ 

POINTS 

BALFOUR 

HERFFJONES 

PRICING 

45.00 

38.80 

0.00 

OPTION 2- YEARBOOKS 

PERCEIVED 
QUALITY OF 

SERVICE 

25.00 

19.75 
. 16.75 

PERCIEVED 
QUALITY OF 

PRODUCT 

20.00 

17.25 

14.25 

REFERENCES TOTAL SCORE 

10 100 

10 

i N/A i 
JOSTENS ..................... 3i76··············· ···-- i····················2·2·:66··········· . 17.50 j 9 j 82.26 

.... L-IF_E_T_o_u_cH--........................... NtA·······················L.········ ········1·1·_.oo ................... J... ...... ....... .... 7·50 ... .. ............ ..J. ..................... NtA ...................... : ...................................... 1lLfill 
STRAWBRIDGE 45.00 i 17.75 i 14.25 i 10 . 87 .00 

*LIFETOUCH DID NOT BID HIGH SCHOOL YEARBOOKS. LIFETOUCH YEARBOOK PRICING WAS NOT EVALUATED. 

OPTION 3- PHOTOGRAPHY & YEARBOOK 

PERCEIVED PERCIEVED 
QUALITY OF QUALITY OF 

PRICING SERVICE PRODUCT REFERENCES TOTAL SCORE 
TOTAL 

POSSIBLE 45.00 25.00 20.00 10 100 
POINTS 

JOSTENS 16.83 19.75 17.50 .................................. . .................................................................... 
: LIFETOUCH 0.00 11.38 7.50 

·························i··········· ·················9 .......................... : ........................................ ?~.:.~~. 
3.67 j 22.55 

STRAWBRIDGE 45.00 19.50 16.13 8.75 

NOTE**: REFERENCES WERE NOT CONTACTED FOR VENDORS THAT WERE MORE THAN 10 PTS AWAY FROM THE LEAD BIDDER 

Recommendation: 

The Kenton County Board of Education award to Strawbridge Studios to 
provide Photography and Yearbook services as indicated in the highlighted 
cells. Awarding Option C gives the district an additonal 10% discount with 
Strawbridge. 

1 



Item Description 

OPTION A-Fa/I/Spring Student Portraits 

PACKAGE A 

PACKAGES 

PACKAGEC 

PACKAGED 

ADD-ON OPTIONS 

KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION 
PHOTOGRAPHY BID TABULATION 

Lifetouch Studios Jostens 

Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total 

Strawbridge 

Unit Price Total 

406 $ 14.99 $ 6,085.94 $ 10.00 $ 4,060.00 $ 3.75 $ 1,522.50 

1,41s $ 29.99 $ 42,465.84 $ 20.oo_f--$~2_8~,3_2_0._o_o-$ ___ 7._oo-+_$_9~,_91_2_.o_o_, 

1,724 $ 29.99 $ 51,702.76 $ 40.00 t--$_6_8~,9_6_o._o_o+-$ ___ 8_._o_o+-$_13~,_79_2_.o_o_, 

1,665 $ 59.99 $ 99,883.35 $ 60.00 t--$_9_9_,9_0_0._o_o+-$ ___ 1_2._50___,__$_20_,_81_2_.5_0_, 

Name & Year Printed in lower right comer 100 $ 14.99 $ 1,499.00 $ -~-- -t-$ ____ ,_$ _____ 50_GO $ 500.00 

Basic Retouching 100 $ 14.99 $ 1,499.00 $ - $ $ 6.00 $ 600.00 

1-8"X10" 100 $ 14.99 $ 1,499.00 $ 10.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 4.00 $ 400.00 

t-2_-5_"X_7_'_' --------------+----_1_0
7
0,_$_1_4_.99_~ __ 1,499.00 $ 10.00 $ 1,000.00 _$ ____ 4_.0_0----+--$ __ 4_0_0._0---;0 

l-4_-3_"X_5_" _____________ --+ _____ 10_0+--'-$----'-14-".9C,9, ___ ~ 1,499.00 $ 10.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 

,_8_-2_"_X3_" _____________ -+ _____ 1_00_, $ 14.99 $ 1,499.00 $ 10.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 

,_D_ig~i_ta_l F_i_le_D_o_w_n_lo_ad __________ -+ _____ 1_0_0 $ 14.99 $ 1,499.00 $ 25.00 $ 2,500.00 $ 

Class Composite Picture (5" x 7") 200 NO BID NO BID $ 

Class Composite Picture (8" x 1 O") 200 $ • $ NO BID $ 
!----~----~=~------+-------------

TOTAL OPTION A $210,630.89 $207,740.00 
t-----------------+-----+----i======!---- --

OPTION B-HIGH SCHOOL PROM & HOMECOMING 

4.00 $ 400.00 -·--
4.00 $ 400.00 

15.00 $ 1,5Qll,_()()__ 

3.50 $ 700.00 

6.50 $ 1,30_Q,_QQ_ 

$ 52,239.00 

PACKAGE A 100 $ 38.00 $ 3,800.00 NO B_ID_,_ ____ ,___$~ __ 2_0.00 $ 2,000.00 

,_P_A_C_KA_G_E_B _____________ +-____ 1_0_0,_$_2_8_.0_0----+--$~_2~,8_0_0_.o_o_,___N_O_BID $ 18.00 $ 1,800.00 

PACKAGE C 100 $ 16.00 $ 1,600.00 NO BID $ 12.00 $ 1,200.00 

ADD-ON OPTIONS 

1-8"X10" 100 $ 12.00 $ 1,200.00 __ J\l()_BID----+------+-$ ___ 8._0o___,__$ __ 80_0_.o_o_, 

l-2_-5_"X_7_'_' --------------+-----1_0_01--$_1~2~.0_0--+$~_1~,2_0_0_.oo_ NO BID $ 8.00 $ 800.00 

,-4_-3_"X_5_" _____________ --+ _____ 10_0+-$_12_.0_0---+--$~_1~,2_00 __ ._00-I--_N_O_B_ID----+-----___,~$ ____ 8_.0_0+--'--$ __ 8_00_.o_o_, 

8-2"X3" 100 $ 12.00 $ 1,200.00 NO BID $ 8.00 $ 800.00 

TOTAL OPTION B $ 13,000.00 $ 8,200.00 

OPTION C-SPORTS PICTURES 

PACKAGE A 350 37.00 $ 12,950.00 NO _B_ID+------1-$~- 17.00 $ 5,950.00 

,_P_A_C_KA_G_E_B _____________ +-_____ 3_5_0,___3_7_.0_0+-$_12~,9_5_0_.o_o ..... _N_O_B_ID..j $ 20.00 $ 7,000.00 

PACKAGE C 350 45.00 $ 15,750.00 NO BID $ 20.00 $ 7,000.00 

PACKAGE D 350 45.00 $ 15,750.00 NO BID ______ __,_$ ___ 2_5_.0_0+-$ __ 8,_75_0_.o_o___, 

I-P_A_C_KA_G_E_E _____________ +-____ 3_5_0t-----'2~4~.0~0-$_8~,4_0_0_.o_o+-_N_O~BIDl-------1-~$ ___ 1_2._o--jo $ 4,200.00 

,_P_A_C_KA_G_E_F _____________ +-____ 3_5_o,__1_8_.0_0+-$_6~,3_0_0_.o_o ..... _N_O~BID $ 10.00 $ 3,500.00 

INDIVIDUAL OPTIONS 

Photo Keychain 

3 1/2" Button 

Magnet 

Retouching 

Name & Year on Wallets 

Digital Download 

TOTAL OPTION C 

OPTION D-SENIOR CLASS COMPOSITES 

50 NO BID NO BID $ 5.00 $ 250.00 

50 16.00 $ 800.00 NO BID $ 5.00 $ 250.00 ------+------------+-------, 
50 16.00 $ 800.00 NO BID $ 7.00 $ 350.00 

---1---------,>-----t---------; 
50 7.00 $ 350.00 NO BID $ 6.00 $ 300.00 

100 6.00 $ 600.00 NO BID $ 6.00 $ 600.00 

100 0.00 $ NO BID $ 20.00 $ 2,000.00 

$ 74,650.00 $ 40,150.00 

,-D_IX_IE_H_E_IG_H_T_S_H_IG_H_S_C_H_O_O_L ______ --+-----+-$ __ -_+------·-•---NO BID $ 

SIMON KENTON HIGH SCHOOL $ - NO BIDt---------+--$~----+-------; 
SCOTT HIGH SCHOOL $ NO BID $ 

------<1----------+-------1 

TOTAL OPTION D 

>-----------------• --------t-------+----·---•---
OPTION E-SENIOR PICTURES 

1-------------------+------l------+-----f-- ---+--------jl------------1-------.1 
,-Y_e_ar_b_oo_k_S_i_tti_ng_Fe_e ___________ , _______ 1_, 1_0_0,_ __ 0._0_0+---$ ___ __,_N_O_B_ID--+--------t-$ ___ 10_.00 $ 11,000.00 

PACKAGE A 300 22.49 $ 6,747.00 NO BID $ 19.00 $ 5,700.00 

~P_A_C_KA_G_E_B _____________ ~ ____ 3_0_0~_1_4_.9_9~$_4~,4_9_7_.o_o~_NO_B_ID -----~_$ ___ 29_._00~_$_8_,7_0_0_.o_o~ 



Lifetouch Studios Jostens Strawbridge 

Item Description Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total 

PACKAGEC 300 29.99 $ 8,997.00 NOBID $ 39.00 $ 11,700.00 

PACKAGED 300 74.99 $ 22,497.c00 NOBID $ 59.00 $ 17,700.00 

ADD-ON 

Name & Year Printed in lower right comer 100 N/A NOBID $ 8.00 $ 800.00 

Basic Retouching N/A NOBID $ $ . 

1-8"X10" 50 14.99 $ 749.50 NOBID $ 15.00 $ 750.00 

2-5"X7" 50 14.99 $ 749.50 NOBID $ 15.00 $ 750.00 

4-3"X5" 50 14.99 $ 749.50 NOBID $ 15.00 $ 750.00 

8-2"X3" 50 14.99 $ 749.50 NOBID $ 15.00 $ 750.00 

Digital File Download 50 0.00 $ . NOBID $ 50.00 $ 2,500.00 

TOTAL OPTION E $ 45,736.00 $ 61,100.00 

···- --
TOTAL • All Pictures $ 344,016.89 $207,740.00 $ 161,689.00 

--

-----
TOTAL PRICING SCORE 0.00 N/A 45.00 -~ 

Both 0% 3% ---- 10% .. 
TOTAL WITH DISCOUNT $344, 016.89 N/A $145,520.10 

REFERENCES 

REF1 REF2 REF3 TOTAL 
,u,,, ... ...,., .. 1.:, 

POSSIBLE 10 10 10 10.00 

JOSTENS N/A N/A lli6 lli6 
LIFETOUCH 3 5 a Ml 
STRAWBRIDGE 9 6 ~ 

Perceived Quality of Service-WRITE-UP SCORE 
IVlliL _., 

POSSIBLE 25 25 25 25 25 

JOSTENS 10 20 20 21 17.75 

LIFETOUCH 8 12 10 17 11.75 

STRAWBRIDGE 23 25 20 17 21.25 

Percieved Quality of Product-SAMPLES SCORE 
IIVlliL _., 

POSSIBLE 20 20 20 20 20 

JOSTENS 12 20 20 18 17.5 

LIFETOUCH 5 12 10 3 7.5 

STRAWBRIDGE 19 20 15 18 18 

PRICING PQS PQP REFRENCES TOTAL 

SCORE 45 20.00 25 10.00 100 

LIFETOUCH 0 11.75 7.5 3.67 22.92 

STRAWBRIDGE 45 21.25 18 7.50 91.75 



EST.QTY. 
(AVG 

PURCH• 
EXTRA. CURRENT 

PRICE FORll'"'.';.~~ERI 

PAGES (4 EVENTS 
IIASEO OVER II BASE PRICE IITOTAL BASEII PAGE INSERT 

PER BOOK PRICE MINIMUM) (SEWN IN) 

225 

FORT WRIGHT 
ELEMENTARY 200 

KENTON 
ELEMENTARY 300 

~ 
ELEMENTARY 
RCHtNSDALE 
ELEMENTARY 

RIVERRIOOE 
ELEMENTARY 

~ 
ELEMENTARY 

TAYLORMiu:' 
ELEMENTARY 

~ 
ELEMENTARY 

SUMMITVIEW 
ACADEMIC 

TURKEYFOOT 
MIDDLE 

~ 
MIDDLE 

~ 
MIDDLE 
-----;'i5i'A[ 

C;iKANU IUIAL 

D1scouritfor 
Photography& 

Yearbook Award 

POINTS OUT OF 
POSSIBLE45 

36.Jol s 16~Jss.oo I s2so.oo I s 

442sts1J,Jss.00J s2so.oo ts 

3sso1s22_,_J1s.001 s2so.oo Is 

6.55IS 1,473.751 s100.001s 

soe1s 1,210.001 s100001s 

1.13IS 2.139001 s100001s 

S 2.138.501 s100.001s 

2.579.501 s100.001s 

1.400.00( S100.00(S 

2,041.251 s100.001s 

s 1,101.151 s100.001s 

2,395.251 s100.001s 

3,400.001 s100,001s 

2,100001 s100,001s 

2,040.001 s100.001s 

WA 

= 
'-'-"'-

Pari:alvadQuotltrofSarvl~• 

TOTAL POINT 
POSSIBLE 

Jomns I 

Slr.Jwbrld;• I 

1sl ,,j ,,1 
191 ,,1 2si 

ml ,.1 101 

,,1 ,,J ml 

PRICE PER 
EACH 

CURRENT 
EVENTS 
INSERT 
(WITH 

AOHESJVE 
STRIP! 

PRICE PER BOOK 
OF OVERRUN 

{OVERRUN NOT 
TO EXCEEDS% 
OFTHEORDER 

QUANTITY 
SPECIFIED: 

1soons 45.Jo 

THE KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION 
YEARBOOK BID TABULATION 

'RICE PER BOOKI 
OF OVERRUN 

(OVERRUN NOT 
TOEXCEED5% 
OF THE ORDER 

:i,~:~~J lls::::i6~EIITo~';!j, 
19.6511 NOBID 

22.2811 NOSID 

19.8311 NOBID 

EACH IIPRICE PER BOOK 'RICE PER BOOK' 
OF OVERRUN 

(OVERRUN NOT 
TO EXCEED 5°/4 
OFTHEORDER 

CURRENT 
EVENTS 
INSERT 
(WlTH 

ADHESIVE 
STRIP] 

" 
" m 

" 

OF OVERRUN 
(OVERRUN NOT 
TOEXCEE06% 
OF THE ORDER 

QUANTITY 
SPECIFIED! 

--

:2.00 IS 17,86 IS 

2.so Is 1e.00 Is 4~410.00 Is 141.75 Is 2.20 Is 2.35 11s 

2.001s 1e.3ols 3,8eo.oots120.oots 220Js 2.35\IS 

3.0011s 20.151s 0,225.001s114001s 2.201s 2.3511s 

3.531.501s120151s 2201s 2.35IIS 

2.0011s 11.451S e.101.501s1e4.5ols 2.201s 235IIS 

35011s 20.e11s 1,3o4.5ols1s1.001s 2.201s 2.35IIS 

2,00llS 18.44($ 4.610.00(S14500(S 220(S 2.3511S 

2.0011s 17.751s 5,768.75IS146.25ls 2.201s 2.35IIS 

2.5olls 18e1ts 5,2002sts113.25ls 2201s 2.35IIS 

3.sons 21.791$ 7,081.75IS185.25IS 2.201s 2.35IIS 

400 Is 2150 Is 8,00000 Is 184.oo Is 220 1s 2.35 11s 

3.25ls 20.2e1s 1,0os151s112.5ols 2201s 2.35IIS 

3.2s1s 21.331s 6,3ee.001s174,001s 2.201s 2.3511S 

TOTAL POINT 
25IPOSSIBLE 

1675 HarffJonos 

22JOffilns 

11 L~etoll~h 

17.75 Str.Jwllrld;o 

S82,065,00 

~ 

11.Jlll. 

Pari:lavadQualltyofProduct 

,,r-7~ ,,j 
181 20! ,,1 I 

"' ,! 12: 

16! I 
"I 

19,60IIS 

19,30IIS 6.871S 1,374.08JS13.00IS 2.501 S 

20,7511S 8061S 2,417071S15001S 2.501 S 

$ 1,121.241$13.00IS 2.501 S 

11.45 Hs r.02Js 2,455001s15.oo Is 2501 s 

20.87IIS 8331S 2,914841S15.00IS 2,501$ 

18.44llS 6.42(S 1i304,60(S13.00(S 2,50($ 

1775IIS S 2,137401S13.00IS 2501 S 

189111$ 7.25IS 1,995.02fS13.00IS 2501 S 

21.7911$ 8.54IS 2,809.461S15.00IS 2.501 S 

21.5011S 9711S 3,882.68IS1600IS 2.501 S 

20.29IIS 8.241S 3,089.14IS17.00IS 2.501 S 

21.33IIS 1.1s1s 2.32893ls1s.ools 2.so1 s 

20l13a1r_011r 
·11:2SIHorffJon.s 

1425IJostens 

175I_L_lf~_touc~ 

7.51Strawllr1dga 

$31.817.99 
$87.92399 

l)_fil_ 

"" 
= 

Pagelofl 

ll2 .,_ 

.,_ 

!~~~~~) !le::;:~6~EIITo~~-
7.4111S 15541S 1.9ols 1.eo11s 

9.0S!IS 18.32($ 4,122001S 18.93IS 190IS ,eons 

8os11s 11101s 3,420.001s 11.111s 1.901$ 19011s 

8,7511S 19.181S 5,754001S 19.261S 1.90jS 190IIS 

732IIS 18.09IS 3,165.75($ 18.751S 1901$ 19011$ 

7.8111S 15201s 5,320.oots 1569Js 1.9ols 1eo11s 

9.92lls 1e.111s 6,688.5ofs 19.891S 1,9ols 19011S 

9.6711$ 16.56(S 4,140.00IS 17.13($ 1,90($ 190llS 

7.1011S 15591S 5.066.75IS 16101S 1,90IS 1.90IIS 

8.24IIS 17.54Js 4.823.5ols 15.111s 1.901s 1.9olls 

10.1611$ 19.68IS 6.396.00IS 19.891S 1.901S 1.9011S 

10.1111s 19.011s 1,s28.001s 19.s91s 1.901s 19olls 

9.SOIIS 1814IS 6.802.SOIS 18.611S 1.901S 1.9011S 

10.2011S 19,261S 5,778DOIS 20331S 1.901S 19011S 

TOTAL 
POSSIBLE 

Str..wbrldqe 

s·73)57·:A 

WA 
~ 

"" 

PERCE!VEDIPERCIEVEO 
QUAL!TYOF QUALITYOF 

SERVICE PRODUCT !REFERENCES 

I 
~5.00 I 

! 
I ,9--:-t~ 

,s.7~ I 

11.00 ! 
,1.rs l 14.25 

PRICE PRICE PER 

E II~~~~ i:::R~~ ~CH EVENTS (OVERRUN NOT 
CURRENT INSERT TO EXCEED 5% 
EVENTS (WITH OF THE ORDER 
INSERT AOHESIVE QUANTITY 

:sEWN INl STRIP) SPEClFlEO: 

s13,soo.001s o.35Js 2001s 2.oofs 

s e,000,001s o.351S 2.oofs 2001s 

155411$ 

o.351s 2.001s 20011s 

0.3SIS 200I$ 20011$ 

o.3sls 2.001s 2.0011s 

0351$ 2.001$ 2.0011s 

03SI$ 2.001s 2.0011s 

1656!iS 7.81IS 1,952.SO(S 0.35($ 2.00($ 2.00l\S 

1559!ls 1.811s 2,s3825IS 03s1s 2.001s 20011s 

17.5411S 8.131S 2,235.751S 0351S 2.001s 2.0011s 

196811S 10001s 3,250001S 0.351S 2001s 2.00\1S 

19,0111s 10.s31s 4,25200Js o.35IS 2,001s 20011s 

1814)1S 969jS 3,63375)$ 0.351S 2001S 2,00JIS 

19,2s11s 969IS 2,901.001s 03s1s 2001s 2.0011s 
s·3e)i'iFi5 
$78,16775 

IF DUAL 
AWARD MINUS 10% l"o,J 

"-"I 
31.0A 

Wl2 

oz.o, 


